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Tile Drainage In the Saginaw Valley
By EARL P. ROBINSON

Countv Farm Agent, Saginaw County
IN the development of a farm, from 

the raw, Wild state to the improved 
condition, improvements usually 

come about in this order: erection of 
house and barn, clearing of land, build­
ing of fences, erection of other farm 
buildings, such as silo, chicken house, 
hog house, granary, tool house and 
finally the replacing of the original 
house and barn with new structures 
equiped with all the modern conven­
iences. So far as the farms of the 
Saginaw Valley are concerned, the task 
is not completed at this point. Few, if 
any, farms in this territory are pre­
pared for the most profitable produc­
tion until they are tile drained. In 
fact, so important is this matter that 
in the case of the more fertile soils of 
this area after the erection of a house 
and barn, the most important improve­
ment is tile drainage.

The Relative l/mportance of Tile 
Drainage.

It has been proven by the experience 
of successful farmers that the fertility 
Of a farm can be maintained without 
stock. Furthermore the raising of 
crops on productive soils and dispos­
ing of them at the present prices is 
fully as profitable as selling these 
crops through the medium of live 
stock. It therefore follows that the 
logical order of improvement on farms 
having soils of this character is tile 
drainage immediately after the erec­
tion of necessary buildings and the 
clearing of the land. Heavy, wet soils 
will be greatly injured by tramping of 
stock. Furthermore the purchase of 
stock will require capital that should 
be invested in tile. Therefore fences 
are not necessary at this stage in the 
process of development, and the mon­
ey required for the same can be put 
into soil improvement. The soil is the 
foundation of agriculture; the build­
ings, fences, live stock, etc., are super­
structure, or accessories. Until the 
foundation is secure the wise farmer

A  Splendid Grade was Obtained -by 
Careful Hand-work as Shown Above»

will not put more money than is actu­
ally necessary into other improve­
ments.

The Cost and Returns.
Money spent in tile drainage is mon­

ey well invested. The average cost of 
tile draining an acre of land in North­
eastern Michigan is about $15. Inter­
est on this sum at six per cent is 90 
cents. The maintenance of drains 
properly constructed will not amount

to more than two per cent of the cost, 
so the total expense will be about $1.20 
per annum. In other words, if an acre 
of tile drained land can be plowed, fit­
ted, sown to a crop and the crop be 
harvested as cheaply as an acre of un­
tiled land, then at least $1.20 worth 
more of produce must be grown in or­
der to make tile drainage a profitable 
investment. That it will do this and 
much more is the opinion of thousands 
of farmers who have tiled. In fact, I 
have heard many of the best farmers 
in Saginaw, Gratiot and Isabella coun­
ties state that tile will pay for them­
selves in the first and second years af­
ter being laid. I know, from bitter ex­
perience in the season of 1914, which 
was a pretty good year, that the loss 
of a bean crop on a certain field of my 
own farm amounted to more than the 
cost of tiling an area twice that size. 
I have in mind a farmer who last 
spring laid nine miles of tile. He was 
offered $15 per acre cash rent for 40 
acres of this tiled land on which to 
grow sugar beets. The farmer decid­
ed not to accept the offer, and he put 
in this field and 30 acres in addition 
to beets “himself, because he figured 
that he could make better money. He 
has made big money, but the results 
would have been quite different had 
this land not been tiled.

Tile Drainage is Insurance.
Tile drainage is more than an invest­

ment, it is insurance. Every other in- 
yestment on the farm increases the 
risk. If the farmer erects a fine barn 
he is not safe until he has it covered 
by insurance. If he invests in blooded 
stock he must protect his investment; 
but tile drains are a protection in

themselves. The seasons of 1913 and 
1914 were both very satisfactory, on 
the whole, and bumper crops were 
promised, until along in August there 
came a couple of extremely heavy 
rains that destroyed or badly injured 
thousands of acres of crops on untiled 
land, while crops on well tiled land 
were, for the most part, little injured. 
These two or three heavy rains were 
all that stood between hundreds of

farmers and profitable crops. These 
cases are parallel in many respects 
with the single bolt of lightning that 
wipes out the profits of years. Such 
cases strongly impress upon us the 
fact that there are many chances of 
failure, and the maximum success can 
be obtained only by reducing these 
hazards.

Among those unacquainted with tile 
drainage it is generally supposed that 
the only benefits received are in wet 
years. As a matter of fact, crops on 
tile drained land are, on an average, 
better every year than on untiled land 
of the same type. When one considers 
what actions take place because of 
the presence of tile in the ground he 
will not be surprised that crops are 
better on tile drained land.
Tile Drains Increase Length of Season.

Surplus snow and ice water is quick­
ly removed in the spring so that rain 
water, which is generally much warm­
er, penetrates the soil to a consider­
able depth and warms it. The result 
is that the soil is in condition for sow­
ing crops sooner.

Without tile the soil remains water 
soaked a long time and becomes pud­
dled and soggy. This condition which 
is very unfavorable to the growing of 
crops, is common in undrained soils, 
and is as detrimental in dry years as 
in wet. The fact is that when the dry 
weather sets in the puddled soils that 
were previously water soaked, become 
hard and dry sooner than soils that 
have not been too wet at any time. 
Well drained soils are generally in fit 
condition for cultivation when they 
need it, while soils not tile drained fre­
quently are not.

The man on the tile-drained farm 
has a great advantage over the man on 
the untiled farm in the matter of get­
ting his work done. I find that the 
farmers in the better drained areas of 
Saginaw county get to work on the 
land a week or ten days earlier than 
those living on the undrained areas.

Then there are fewer days wasted 
from time to time throughout the sea­
son oir account of the condition of the 
soil. When it comes to harvesting in 
a wet season like the present one, 
there are fields which cannot be en­
tered with teams and machinery on 
account of the excessive moisture. The 
result is that the necessary labor can­
not be performed and severe losses oc­
cur with crops that might be harvest­
ed had there been a good tile system 
to quickly carry away the surplus 
water.

Object Lessons Important.
Years ago a good-deal of tiling was 

done in Frankenmuth and Blumfield 
townships and more recently the farm­
ers have been active in making this 
improvement in Buena Vista township 
and the extreme western part of this 
county. Some other  ̂parts of the coun­
ty needing tile drains fully as much as 
the areas mentioned have tiled little 
or none at all. This, like many other 
things, is largely a matter of example. 
Somebody must start the ball rolling. 
When this improvement is introduced 
on some of the farms, the neighbors 
are not slow in appreciating the ad­
vantages. They will soon notice that 
their progressive neighbor gets onto 
his land earlier in the spring, gets 
along better with his work through 
the summer, suffers less from floods 
and secures better crops. I find in 
this situation a strong argument for 
farm demonstration. The county agent 
will have accomplished a good work if 
he gets drains properly installed on 
some farm as a demonstration of their 

(Continued on page 270).

The First Beet Crop Grown on this 70 
Acres After Tiling Brought $6,250.

Modern Tile Ditching Machines do Rapid and Effective Work.
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ALWAYS SIGN YOUR NAME.

Inquiries are often received from 
parties who desire information, but 
who neglect to sign their name to the 
communication. Such inquiries are 
not given consideration under our rule. 
The name of the inquirer will be with­
held from publication when this is re­
quested, but it must accompany the in­
quiry as an evidence of good faith, or 
same will not be answered through 
our columns.

THE FARM GARDEN.

Our next issue will contain several 
special articles relating to the farm 
garden, which will be of special inter­
est to every reader who would make 
the1 farm garden contribute its full 
share of delicacies to the farm table.

CURRENT COMMENT.

A subscriber asks 
Judging Live Stock for the discussion 

at the Fairs. through these col­
umns of whether 

it is better to have the judging of live 
stock at local fairs and in other show 
rings done by a single judge or by 
three judges acting together, and why?

By way of opening this discussion let 
us recount briefly the advantages of 
having a single judge, as is the almost 
universal practice in all show rings at 
the present time. In the first place; 
the judging of any breed of live stock 
in the show ring should be done by a 
judge or by judges who have a thor­
ough knowledge of the desirable points 
of the breeds which they judge. It is 
ordinarily quite difficult to get even a 
single judge who is thoroughly compe­

tent frohi a technical standpoint to 
place the awards in accordance with 
the merits of the respective animals 
entered in conformation with the scale 
of points established by the record as­
sociation of the breed. Too often the 
officials of local fair associations do 
not give the matter of selecting judges 
the attention which it merits.

The very best plan of selecting the 
judges for this' work is through corres­
pondence with the officers of the state 
breed associations. These officers will 
gladly suggest the names of men who 
would make competent judges in the 
different breed classes who are so lo­
cated that the cost of securing their 
services would not be large. When the 
awards are placed by competent judg­
es the show ring becomes of greater 
educational value to the patrons of the 
various breeds who show their animals 
in same, as well as to that portion of 
the public which may have sufficient 
interest in the competitive exhibits to 
watch the placing of the awards.

The plan above suggested is the one 
followed in all the larger show rings of 
the country where the competition is 
open to the world or to the breeders of 
several states, except that in this case 
the national breed associations are 
asked to suggest names of men who 
would make good judges in these 
events. It is the usual custom to ask 
for the suggestion of several names so 
that the officers of the fair or other ex­
hibition may have the opportunity of 
choosing from among those whom it 
may be easiest to obtain, or who for 
any reason they may prefer to ask. 
Where it is attempted to have more 
than one judge, the problem of secur­
ing competent men to place the awards 
is multiplied. There is also a greater 
chance of dissatisfaction in the man­
ner in which the awards are placed 
whenever the judges may not be unan­
imous in their opinion as to the man­
ner of placing them.

It is unfortunate 
A Fine Point in Farm for them, and 

Management. for the business
in which they 

are engaged, that most farmers, and 
particularly those who are developing 
new farms, are unable to properly 
finance their business during the proc­
ess of its development. It becomes 
necessary for them to choose which 
one" of several needed improvements 
or investments they will first make. 
Naturally it is to tfieir advantage to 
choose the investmënt which will add 
to the producing or earning capacity 
of their business rather than one which 
satisfies a real need which can, how­
ever, be'deferred until a later date 
without hindering the immediate de­
velopment of their business plant.

The leading article of this issue em­
phasizes the fundamental fact that the 
soil is the foundation of agriculture, 
and that until this foundation is made 
secure, the wise farmer will not put 
more money than is actually necessary 
into other improvements; in other 
words, when there is an opportunity 
for choice between investments, one of 
which will add to the fertility or possi­
ble producing power of the soil, that 
investment should be considered a fun­
damental or basic one and be given 
preference over a more superficial 
need. The article above mentioned em­
phasizes the fact that in the territory 
described tile drainage is a basic or 
fundamental investment which should 
be made as early as possible in the de­
velopment of a farm plant.

In another soil fertility article writ­
ten with a particular view to the needs 
of the farmers of another section of 
the state, the writer, also a county ag­
ricultural agent, emphasized the para­
mount importance of adding vegetable 
matter or humus to the soils of that 
community. In that case the invest­
ment required in the fitting of the 
land, the sowing of supplementary 
crops for green manure, and in many 
cases the application of lime to pro­
mote the vigorous growth of soil im­
proving legumes, was pointed out as 
the most urgent heed of the average

farm and the best investment" which, 
the farmers of that section could make.

This matter of choosing between 
needed expenditures for the improve­
ment of the farm plant is a point in 
farm management which should be 
given the most careful consideration 
by every farmer in the state. The 
fact that the fertility of the farms of 
most sections of the state has become 
somewhat depleted rather than improv­
ed with the passing years, is proof 
that this point has not been given the 
attention which it merits in every* case 
and probably not in a majority of cas­
es. Truly the soil is the basis of suc­
cessful agriculture, and in conserving 
and increasing its fertility the home­
owning farmer is starting right in the 
solution of the vexed questions of farm 
management.

The leading article of this week will 
not interest every reader of this paper 
from a technical standpoint, yet we 
trust that it may at least suggest à 
careful study of this basic question of 
farm management, to the end that 
such steps as are needed to conserve 
and increase the fertility of the soil on 
each and every farm may be given 
proper consideration, and in so far as 
they require an investment of labor or 
money that they be given the prefer­
ence over other and less pressing 
needs.

In the columns of a 
Value Received, recent issue will be

found a report of a 
discussion held at the meeting of a 
farmers’ organization, at which the 
question of taxation was the subject 
under consideration. As is the case in 
most discussions, the speakers aligned 
themselves on opposing sides in this 
discussion. One side expressed great 
dipleasure at the increase in taxation 
and vigorously criticized public offi­
cials responsible for such increase. 
They believed in the liberal support of 
state institutions as a general propo­
sition, but thought the farmers should 
not be oppressed thereby. Another 
faction took another point of view and 
advanced the proposition that increas­
ed taxes were not a calamity, provided 
the public got value received from the 
investment, and that the public- could 
choose other officials if not satisfied 
with present incumbents.

This idea affords a suggestion upon 
which every taxpayer might act to ad­
vantage. Just put in a half-hour study­
ing the tax receipts to determine in 
what general manner the money con­
tributed was expended. If this is done 
the average tax-payer will find—doubt­
less with some surprise—that the larg­
er items are due to the expenditures 
with which he is most closely acquaint­
ed. Generally the school tax will be 
found to be the largest, and very few 
thinking men believe that our local 
schools are either too numerous or too 
good. The next largest item of cost 
under normal conditions will be the 
tax for highway improvement. There 
is undoubtedly a growing feeling on 
the part of the farmers of the state 
that they are getting value received 
for expenditures of this kind. Under 
normal conditions the cost of running 
county and township municipalities 
will about equal the amount of the 
state tax, and a little time devoted to 
ascertaining the cost of various items 
of township, county and state admin­
istration will be time well expended.

It will be easy to begin this investi­
gation with the township by carefully 
looking over the printed statement of 
township expenditures whieh is avail­
able to every elector on town meeting 
day. Later follow the report of the 
proceedings of the county hoard of su­
pervisors carefully, and next year 
when the Legislature is in session, 
make a study of the appropriations 
made for various state purposes. In 
this way every tax-payer will be bet­
ter informed as to whether he is get­
ting value received for this compulsory 
expenditure, and such criticisms as 
are made will be more effective by be­
ing given concrete rather than general 
application. The pendency toward

higher taxation is regrettable, and it is 
most impotant that the taxpayers 
should get value received for their tax 
money. ^

HAPPENINGS OF THE WEEK.

Foreign.
The European War.—What appears 

to be the most important event of the 
past week in the great conflict was 
the capture by the Russians of Erzer- 
um, a strongly fortified Turkish city 
located a hundred miles south of the 
eastern extremity of the Black Sea. 
The Russian forces are continuing 
their advantage by conquering smaller 
places to the right and left of this 
city and now the port of Trepizond on 
the Black Sea is threatened by both 
land forces and the'Russian fleet, and 
also Diarbekr which is far inland and 
near the Bagdad railway. Should the 
Russians be favored with victory in 
the latter instance it will go far to­
ward relieving pressure against Eng­
lish troops surrounded near the lower 
Tigris river. Allied forces have taken 
over most of the railroad lines of 
Greece. Italians and Austrians are 
dose together near Durazzo, Albania, 
and a battle is impending. There have 
also been minor .engagements along 
the fronts of Northern Italy. Violent 
artillery fighting occurred in the 
Dvinsk district on the Russian front 
and in Galicia there is greater activ­
ity between Russians and Austrians. 
Germans captured 350 yards more of 
trenches from the English north of 
Ypres on the Yser Canal. Frequent 
artillery duels have occurred at other 
points on the western front, with nom­
inal results.

The executive authorities of Berlin 
have decided to limit the sale of but­
ter to a quarter of a pound for each 
person weekly. ✓

A ' munition plant at Monckton, N. 
B., was destroyed by fire last Sunday 
night.

In order that she may maintain her 
neutral position, Roumania has offered 
to sell wheat to all belligerents, upon 
the condition, however, that none be 
exported from her territory.

Wheat in Liverpool sold at $2.11 per 
bushel last week, which is the highest 
price since the Franco-Prussian war in 
1871. High ocean freight rates which 
amount to 48 and 50 cents per bushel 
from America to Liverpool, and 75 
cents per bushel to Mediterranean 
ports are responsible for the wide mar­
gin between prices in England and 
continental Europe, and the United 
States.

Conditions are apparently improving 
in Mexico. Although Gen. Villa, the 
rebel chief, has thus far escaped his 
pursuers, his forces are so small and 
poorly equipped that operations by him 
are not being so seriously considered 
ds a short time ago.

National.
Legal controversy over the owner­

ship of the prize ship Appam at New­
port, Va., is now in the hands of the 
Federal District Court. The develop­
ment of the proceedings is being 
watched with great interest, owing to 
the international questions involved.

Mystery surrounds the illness of 35 
persons who were compelled to ask for 
medical aid af£er partaking of a church 
dinner given at Carnegie, Pa.

The defendants in the famous East- 
land tragedy case were acquitted by 
the United States court in the recent 
trial.

The request for a war ship to carry 
a supply of milk to infants in Germany 
and Austria has been declined by Sec­
retary of the Navy Daniels.

Relief work around Newellton, Lou­
isiana, where high water has flooded 
practically all of the low country, 
must be continued for perhaps a week, 
as many outlying district^ must be 
reached by steamers. The condition 
of the marooned refugees is still un­
certain.

The census bureau at Washington 
estimated the population of the United 
States on January 1 at 102,017,036.

The fifty-sixth annual convention of 
the National Educational Association 
is being held in Detroit this week. Ful­
ly 5,000 delegates will be in attend­
ance.

An epidemic of distemper among the 
horses in upper Michigan is seriously - 
hampering lumbering and wood cutting 
activities.

New York state is seeking to have 
the treasury department at Washing­
ton enforce an order to Stop the im­
portation of anthrax into this country 
from China and South America. The 
disease is brought in on hides and can 
be destroyed by proper disinfection.

Fort Wayne at Detrdit will not be 
abandoned as an army post. The in­
crease that is certain to result from 
the present agitation for a larger 
standing army will make necessary 
the use of all army posts now avail­
able for the training and housing of 
the soldiers.
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The Bean Disease Situation
Address given by Prof. J. H. Muncie, Specialist in Bean Diseases at M. A. 

C., before the* recent meeting of the Michigan Experiment Association.

M ICHIGAN, as every grower well or besyn manure applied to the soil as 
knows, ranks first as a bean a fertilizer. To solve this problem we 
growing state. During the past have carried on some experiments, 

ten years, this state has planted annu- Diseased. bean fodder was fed to a 
ally an average of about 400,000 acres cow and the dung collected. Sterile
to this crop alone. The average yield soil was fertilized with the dung and
for this period is approximately 4,500,- the disease-free beans planted in it. No 
000 bushels of dry edible beans. evidence of these diseases was found

As beans came to be grown on a on the plants. A solution of this dung
larger scale, the farmers realized more was also made and sprayed upon dis-
fully, the peculiarities of this crop and ease free plants. In this case, also, no 
its limiting factors. evidence of these diseases appeared.

During the past season, due to ad- From the results of this experimnt we 
verse weather conditions and diseases, may conclude that the casual organ- 
only about 40 per cent of a total crop isms of anthracnose and blight do not 
was harvested in the state. This survive passage through the alimen- 
amounted to approximately 3,800,000 tary tract of cattle and are not trans­
bushels of beans. mitted to the soil in the dung.

The Department of Botapy is con- In a second series of experiments 
cerned with one factor in bean produc- sterile soil was inoculated with diseas-, 
tion, the control of bean diseases, ed bean stems, leaves, pods and dust, 
These diseases are known as the bean from the thresher and left out of doors 
anthracnose and bean blight.

Anthracnose.
Bean anthracnose is caused by a 

very minute' parasitic plant, called a 
fungus. The root-like threads pene­
trate the seeds and thus the disease
organism is carried to the field on the .
seed beans. The moisture in the soil lle sod- Later in the seasbn tbe bllSht 
necessary for the germination of the also appeared on the plants on inocu- 
seed, causes the dormant threads or lated soil and spread to the plants on 
mycelium to grow. When the diseased sterile soil. The results of this ex­
seedling pushes its way above ground, Periment point rather conclusively to 
the anthracnose is readily seen as red- the fact that these organisms can live 
dish brown or black sunken spots on over in the soil on diseased bean trash, 
the seed leaves. From the seed leaves Hence, the trash should not be plowed 
it spreads to the stems and leaves. under and beans Planted on this soil

all winter. Disease-free seeds were 
planted in the summer in this soil and 
in uninocuiated sterile soil. The an- 
thracnose made its appearance upon 
the lower leaves of the plants in the 
inoculated soil while there was no dis­
eases found on the plants upon the ster-

The disease is easily recognized on the 
leaves by the reddening of the leaf 
vines. And later it spreads from the 
leaves to the pods. On the pods the

the following season.
Clean Seed the Only Insurance. 

For the past two seasons we have 
planted bean seeds treated with var-

characteristic reddish brown or black ioas chemical solutions, dry heat and 
sunken spots are formed. After the b°t water. So far these treatments 
pods become diseased the fungus push- have failed.to control the anthracnose 
es its way through this tissue into the and blUS&t- Spraying, with bordeaux

free from disease had they not been 
planted in the same field with our own 
home-grown seed which produced bad­
ly diseased plants.

We have found, from data collected 
during the past three seasons, that 
early maturing varieties of beans have 
a smaller amount of diseased seeds 
per bushel than those of later matur­
ing varieties.

Because of the early ripening and 
consequent drying of the pods, the pro­
gress of the disease organisms through 
the pod into the seed is greatly check­
ed. The variety upon which these data 
were collected is known as the Early 
Wonder.

A Possible Solution of the Seed 
Problem.

F©r the past two seasons we have 
grown Early Wonder beans in the state 
of Washington. The seed sent out 
there in 1914 picked two pounds. Sam­
ples of the beans from this seed show­
ed a smhll percentage of diseased, dis­
colored beans. Samples of the plants 
from the 1915 crop pulled at random 
from the field and sent back to ’ us, 
showed minute blight blotches on the 
pods and no anthracnose. There was 
no evidence of either disease on the 
seed from these pods.

It may be possible to grow Michigan 
beans under dry weather conditions in 
western states and bring the seed back 
for planting.

An anthracnose-resistant red kidney 
bean has been found in New York, but 
iso far no disease resistant white pea 
bean has been discovered. However, 
it is possible that such a resistant 
white pea bean may be found and it 
would repay one’s efforts to keep on 
the lookout for disease-resistant bean 
plants.

We recommend that early maturing 
varieties of a known high yield and 
low pick be planted.

Beans for a small seed plot should 
be selected while in the pods. Select 
for seed, from the field, the beans in

has not given satisfactory

seed within. On the seed it produces 
a reddish brown and black circular 
spot.

Blight.
The bean blight is caused by a bac­

terium. It also is carried into the field 
upon or within the seed. The progress 
of the blight is very similar to that of 
the anthracnose. Its first appearance 
above ground is as amber-colored 
blotches on the seed leaves. Spread­
ing to the leaves it first produces a 
wgtersoaked, area usually on the mar­
gin of the leaf. This water-soaked area 
later drys out, becoming brown and 
papery. On the pod it produces am­
ber-colored flecks or blotches. The 
bacteria penetrating the pod produces 
yellowish blotches on the seed. These 
yellowish blotches on the seed are
commonly mistaken for frost injury.

How these Diseases Spread.
The growth, spread* and severity of mixture 

these diseases depend to a great ex- results.
tent upon weather conditions. Wet Much can be done to eliminate these 
weather during the growing season diseases by carefully hand-picking the 
causes an increase in the amount of bean seed, but this does not entirely 
disease present. Continued dry weath- control them. All clean appearing 
er during this season checks these dis- • seeds are not free from these diseases, 
eases. Moisture is absolutely essen- It is a good plan to save for seed the 
tiál to the growth and spread of both beans in pods relatively free from 
diseases. • these diseases. The grower can go

Since the spores of the anthracnose through his field and pull up the vigor- 
organism and the bacteria of the blight ous plants showing little disease on 
organism are present on the dew or the pods. In this way vigorous seed 
moisture on the diseased spots, beans with little disease can be secured for 
should not be cultivated while, the planting the following season, 
plants are wet. To do so will spread This plan has been tried by Mr. A.
the diseases. It is very frequently the B. Cook, of Owosso, and is very satis-
case that beans on heavy undrained factory in reducing the amount of dis- 
land are much worse affected by these ease on the crop, 
diseases than the beans on light or Some Experimental Knowledge, 
well drained soils. The relatively high- Since wet weather is necessary for 
er amount of moisture in the heavy or the development of these diseases, it 
undrained land and consequent great- was thought advisable to try out seed 
er humidity of atmosphere immediate- from regions having a dry growing sea- 
ly surrounding the plants are more son. White Navy Beans were obtain- 
conducive to the growth of these dis- ed from Idaho, Arizona, California, and 
ease organisms. Bean land must be planted in the tewt plots. The plants 
well drained. from this native western seed were
Diseases do not Live Over in Manure, not only badly diseased but failed to 

The question has often been asked mature during our growing season, 
as to whether these organisms live ov- It is very possible that these plants 
qr from year to year in the bean trash would have remained comparatively

The Ultimate End of the Old Rail Fence.

the cleanest pods on the most thrifty 
and productive stalks. Carefully hand­
pick the seed thus obtained. While 
hand-picking does not entirely elimi­
nate these diseases, it decreases the 
amount of disease put into the field on 
the spotted soil.

The outlook for next year is encour­
aging. In spite of the bad season, it 
seems likely that a grade of beans bet­
ter than that of previous years will be 
planted. This is due to the widespread 
and vigorous attempts which are be­
ing made by bean jobbers and farmers 
to get seed of low pickage from the lo­
calities where the weather conditions 
were not conducive to the spread of 
the diseases. Such clean seed, if thor­
oughly repicked to eliminate all stain 
and spot will constitute as safe seed 
for next year as can be had.

THE BEAN CROP FOR 1916.

In the bean growing sections the 
question foremost in the farmer’s mind 
is, “Shall we, after the disastrous sea­
son of last year, grow beans, and if we 
do what about seed?” Weather condi­
tions were primarily responsible for 
the spread of bean diseases as well as 
blight in potatoes. The best advice

from the plant pathologists in the em­
ploy of the Federal government is that 
with normal weather during the grow­
ing season there would be a normal 
crop in its freedom from disease, with 
as good seed as, possible for planting. 
Continued wind and rain last year mul­
tiplied many times the spread of the 
spores, even when apparently good 
seed was planted.

Hot dry weather will, inversely, de­
stroy many millions of spores, even 
when not over good seed is planted. 
When the seed bean germinates the 
anthrax, or pustule, is bared by the 
white skin, left behind, to the rays of 
sunlight.

The Michigan-grown bean seed, with 
an average percentage of diseased 
stock, comes back from its sojourn of 
a year’s cycle in the irrigated sections 
of the west with the white clean pods 
of the'days known in Michigan in past 
years.- Sunshine and weather condi­
tions have been the agents of regener­
ation. In fact, this is the method of 
the regeneration of the various grades 
of garden beans by some of the large 
seed houses. From these facts one can 
draw their own conclusions as to a 
normal season for the crop of 1916.

Another interesting observation was 
last year, in what is called the sheep 
feeding district of Shiawassee county, 
on clover sod covered with sheep ma­
nure after the hay crop was removed 
and the land well prepared, the crop 
was normal, both in quality and quan­
tity. In the same sections with sim­
ilar seed on land less well prepared 
the crop was sub-normal in yield and 
badly spotted with anthracnose.

One of the interesting contributions 
to bean growing is by George Ricker, 
of Huron county, who for several years 
has grown an early variety of Flint 
corn put in at the time of planting 
beans at the rate of 16 quarts of beans 
to two quarts of corn. Mr. Ricker grew 
above an average crop of beans in 1914 
and 804 baskets of ears of corn. In 
1915, 18 bushels of red kidney beans 
and 60 bushels of corn per acre, A 
very early type of corn must be used 
to mature within the period of bean 
growing.

Beans in Hungary.
Mr. Strauss, of Buda Pesth, Hun­

gary, described bean growing in his 
home country, at the recent meeting 
of the bean jobbers and growers in De­
troit, mentioning that beans were 
grown as a border crop along hedges 
and among the corn, for the reason 
that the bean thrived best with corn 
for a shade. The bean in Hungary is 
not a field crop in the sense used in 
Michigan, but is grown by old men 
and women, planted, cultivated and 
threshed by hand, with an annual ex­
port prior to the war of approximately 
2,500,000 bushels. And this quantity, 
gathered in not to exceed five or eight 
bags from an individual grower, shows 
the Michigan bean raisers are compet­
ing with a grade of labor that makes 
for low prices.

For the past two years this has not 
been a factor nor will it be for several 
years at least after the close of the 
war, because no beans will be avail­
able for export.

Commercially, prospects are exceed­
ingly bright for bean prices of the 1916 
crop. There will be none of the 1915 
beans on the market and a scarcity 
will exist before the crop is grown. Eu­
rope will need beans for 1916, whether 
it may be war or peace. One of the 
largest dealers in beans hazarded the 
opinion that the basis to the farmer 
would not be below $2.50 per bushel. 
Even with a very large crop.

The dealers say that compensatory 
prices and price maintenance are all 
up to the farmer by conservative mar­
keting, and that the bean market this 
year has been well handled.

The Michigan bean growers will 
meet at the Agricultural College dur­
ing the week of the Farmers’ Roun-up 
Institute, on Thursday, March 2, Ques­
tions of seed diseases and marketing 
will be embraced in their discussions.

Shiawassee Co. J!as. N. McBbide.
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Get More 
POTATOES
From Every Hill

PO T A T O E S  yield  better 
when planted at even, 
uniform depth, ’'¡¡Tou’li 

get better potatoes and m ore 
of them if you ’ ll plant with a

Giant Potato Planter
H as a new, im proved type 
hopper. N o  bruising or crush­
ing— no choking or skipping 
possible. Feed is under per­
fect regulation and is visible.

tJHE OHIO RAKE CO.
Makers 

o f  Full Line o f  
Potato Machinery

1 5 0 0
Albany S treet

Ask for 
fre e  c ircu la r  
of O. R. C. Line

cures your Horse 
w hile he works

Ga lls and sore shoulders reduce the effici­
ency  o f your horse—skp his stren g th - 
down his spirit. Cure him  without the 
use o f  m edicine—while he does his heavi­
est work, with the L ankford Collar.

We guarantee a cure 
when properly fitted. Be 
careful and get the genuine 
Lankford Collar—made o f 
best white sail duck, trim ­
med in  extra heavy leather 
and stuffed with clean and downy curled 
cotton, m edicated, which w ill not pack or 
harden. Im itations are filled with unsan­
itary  straw, and are dangerous to use.

Tlie Lankford fits any shape neck 
—easily put on or  removed—al­
ways soft and pliable. W ill not 
sweeny. Hame straps attached. 
Prices *1.25 and up. See your 
dealer.

O v e r  1 2 ,0 0 0 ,0 0 0  sold  
Lankford Collars prevent 
galls and sore shoulders, as 
well as cu re them. Get one 
today—one fo r  each horse, 
but be sure It’s a Lankford.

Buy a Lankford 
Send postal fo r  copy and o f  
our literature on Lankford 
Horse Collars.

Powers Mfg. Co. 
Dept. 2 7  .  Waterloo, Iowa

A Fa r m e r ’s  Ga r d e nWAMIII •liiiliiiiil>lll||ll||llllllUIIIIINIII| •MMMM*.«IIIMIIIiM**ll«li*|l
Helps his wife to plan her table in busy times. Saves work 
and worry, saves buy in g so much meat, gives better satis- 
faction to the help. A  good garden will be almost 
l>ie in your busy life without proper tools. They cost little 
and save much hard work,

M t i i ih l  > | / » r  WHEEL KQESlMm AhL and drills
will sow, cultivate, ridge, furrow, etc., better than you can 
with old-fashioned tools and ten times quicker. A  woman, 
boy or girl can do it. Can plant closer and work these hand 

tools while the horses rest. 38 combinations 
from which to  choose at $2.50 to  $12. One 

L combined tool will d o  all o f the Work, 
Wo. Ask your ¡dealer to  show them and
D ri write us for booklet, * Gardening
and With MQdera Tools'* Free. \

^  V  B A T E M A N
M ’ F ’ 6  C O . 1 
Box 242 3

G r e n lo c h .N .J .—HiiiimmuuHUi

Solving the Tramp Problem

PRICES JLMiffiEf)/
My new, 1916 low pnces and selling plans, cash 
or time, are fully described in my new 
260-page nook. Do not buy a spreader o f  any 

| make or kind until you get this book. Ask for 
my special proposition on spreaders from now 

until seeding time, Which ought to sell 25,000 
.machines. My new model spreader with all 

__jel beater, all steel V-rake, low down, light, 
draft, double chain drive, cut under front wheels, 
channel steel frame, trussed 
like a steel bridge, steel, 
tongue, endless apron and ' 
force feed makes a finer 
and wider spreading ma- r 
chine than ever. Shipped I 
from Waterloo, Kansas 
City, St. Paul, Council 
Bluffs and Chicago. All styles 1 
and sizes o f  spreaders and 
spreader boxes fully described 
in this big, new book. Ask for i t . '

W M. C A LLO W A Y  C O . ------
Box Waterloo, Iowa

Mention Michigan Fanner when writing te advertisers

A N article on the tramp nuisance, 
contributed to these columns by 
the writer, some weeks ago, has 

called forth considerable comment. 
The subject is not a new one, indeed, 
it is as old as the race. The profes­
sional idler has always been with us. 
The ideas expressed in the article men­
tioned, were not new, and probably in 
some form, have been put in print 
many times. But like many other ills, 
the tramp problem becomes more com­
plicated and perplexing as time ad­
vances and conditions change. A few 
words at the opportune time, on a 
question that is vital to the life of a 
people, set readers to thinking, even 
though they may have known and held 
similar views for years.

In reopening this question, the writ­
er wishes to set forth a few local facts 
and conditions not- available when the 
first article was written. These facts 
prove conclusively, the contention that 
the great majority of our tramps are 
men who are seeking idleness rather 
than industry. And when you admit 
this fact, the whole fabric of support to 
tramps through hand-outs and other 
methods, falls to the ground. But to 
state the facts:

In two villages in the writer’s sec­
tion, a novel experiment Iras been tried 
during the last, eight or ten weeks. 
These villages, like many others in 
Michigan, have been of late literally 
over-run with tramps. The first cold 
wave was sure to blow in fifteen or 
twenty hoboes who applied to the vil­
lage marshal for a night’s lodging and 
breakfast; and this state of affairs 
would continue day after day, through 
most of the colder months. Obviously, 
the expense was an important item. 
The two villages under consideration 
decided to feed no more tramps unless 
they were willing to give labor in re­
turn. The plan was this:

A Town Wood-pile.
A town wood-pile was reared, and 

when a man applied at the station for 
a meal or a night’s lodging, he was giv­
en an axe and a saw, ahd escorted to 
the wood-pile. Here he was invited to 
earn his keep, and the good old adage, 
“He who will not work can not eat,” 
was enforced. The scheme proved ef­
fective beyond all expectations. The 
number of visiting tramps grew fewer 
and fewer as the bad news spread 
throughout hobo land, and at the pres­
ent writing, tramps in these villages 
are rare.

In one of the towns, at least, a sec­
ondary benefit has come from the ex­
periment. During the late summer and 
early autumn, the many beautiful 
shade trees of the village were treated 
to a much-needed trimming. The limbs 
thus cut off composed the town wood- 
pile. As this wood was cut into proper 
lengths by tramps, it was distributed 
among the needy families of the vil­
lage. And let it be said in this con­
nection, that the right kind of charity 
is a blessing and blesses him who gives 
as well as him who receives. The 
needy families of any locality who, 
through sickness or death or other 
misfortune, have come to want, are 
proper channels through which to ex­
ercise the charitable spirit. But to 
feed an army of able-bodied, indolent, 
shiftless idlers, is not charity—it is a 
crime. It is a crime against the indi­
vidual and against society.

The Effective Remedy.
In the facts and conditions existing 

in these villages, then, we have a rem­
edy for the tramp evil. All that is 
needed is to give this plan universal 
application. Let individuals and com­
munities adhere strictly to the rule. 
Let a pretense at work be ground of 
refusal of food, for many of these gen­
tlemen of the road are master hands 
at pretending to work. In any com­
munity where a village or community 
has arranged the matter, let individu­
als refuse altogether to feed vagrants 
under any consideration. Send them 
to the town wood-pile or whatever it

may be, and they can get'work. Work 
or starve. Let this be the motto. This 
is true kindness both to the tramp and 
to those deserving of help. Misapplied 
charity is worse than none at all. Why 
should any man who is well and strong 
be led to think he can live on the hard- 
earned means of his fellows ? Devoid 
of responsibility, careless, shameless, 
indolent, lacking in the primal princi­
ples of manhood and good citizenship 
—these are the attributes which apply 
to the professional tramp. In nine cas­
es out of ten, he is a professional bum 
as well. Cases are all too numerous 
in which a tramp in a half-drunken 
condition has asked for a hand-out, 
and thrown away what was given him, 
before he was out of the dooryard.

In conclusion, let us repeat the sen­
timent of a former article referred to in 
the beginning. The farmer has his 
part to play in solving this question. 
He, as much as any class, will benefit 
from the obliteration of the tramp nui­
sance. Fear, false sentiment, religious 
superstition, mistaken philanthropy— 
all must go. Greater security for prop­
erty, more labor available' on the 
farms—these are some of the direct 
benefits to the farmer. Lend a hand, 
and benefit yourselves while you are 
benefiting the tramps and society.

Hillsdale Co. J. A. K a i s e r .

CROP AND FERTILIZER QUES­
TIONS.

Best Field for Sugar Beets.
Will you please advise, me which 

field to put in sugar beets? I have 
four acres of good soil; had beets on 
it last summer but the beets drowned 
out; only got 12 tons. The weeds were 
well kept down and the land was plow­
ed seven to eight inches deep last fall. 
Or I have a piece of old sod that was 
plowed six inches deep last fall.

Sanilac Co. W. E. .
As both fields are fall plowed I think 

you would stand a good chance with a 
favorable season to get a good crop of 
beets on either field.

Usually I would not recommend to 
plant beets after beets, but this field 
owing to too much rain, did not pro­
duce a crop and I should expect a bet­
ter crop here than on the old sod 
field. A heavy sod is not recommend­
ed for beets, surely not if spring-plow­
ed, but it will do very well when fall 
plowed.

Sowing Alfalfa in Growing Wheat.
We have a side hill field in wheat 

which we would like to seed to alfalfa 
as soon as possible. Now this field al­
ways produced fine crops of clover, 
but washes when a cultivated crop is 
grown. The field is not steep in any 
place but the slope 40 rods or more 
and the natural drainage is perfect. 
We have nine acres of alfalfa which 
has been seeded six years. It always 
was good color and has yielded better 
every year, being the best this year. 
Now I am top-dressing this wheat this 
winter with the manure made .-from the 
feeding of this alfalfa once a day to 
my cows. Would you think I would 
be successful if I seeded this field to 
alfalfa, same as one would red clover, 
in the spring? We inoculated our nine 
acres six years ago when we seeded it, 
with sweet clover soil. Would not this 
manure inoculate this wheat field? I 
top-dressed a field of wheat last win­
ter and seeded to clover, mixing in a 
little alfalfa. The growth of clover 
was very heavy and I did not notice 
much alfalfa the first cutting. But 
when the second crop came on there 
was much alfalfa scattered all through 
it, and of very good color. This field 
had never grown alfalfa before.

Macomb Co. D. H.
I have been experimenting with this 

same object in view for a number of 
years, and am not ready to make any 
definite report or give advice as yet. 
At first I mixed only a little alfalfa 
seed with the clover. One year quite 
a bit of the alfalfa grew, but usually 
only a very little, and very little for a 
second crop. Last spring I mixed a 
little clover with the alfalfa, (just the 
reverse in seed), and seemingly had a 
fair catch of alfalfa, but there was 
more clover even then, than alfalfa. 
This land was covered with stable ma­
nure and one and a half tons of good

limestone applied in spring and plant­
ed to corn. The corn stubble was disk­
ed and sown to wheat. The clover 
seed was sown last March. I think I 
have a stand of alfalfa, but can tell 
better next summer. The wheat had 
250 pounds of fertiliser. I would inoc­
ulate the alfalfa, it costs but little. Al­
falfa doesn’t seem to be as vigorous 
to start as clover.

How to Use Hardwood Ashes.
Am making a fine lot of pure hard­

wood ashes, (beech and maple). I 
thought of using them instead of com­
mercial fertilizer in my corn planting, 
putting a handful in each hill; or had 
I better mix the ashes with muck, half 
and half? Please state best disposi­
tion to make of them,

Oakland Co. W. L. L.
Unleached hardwood ashes contain 

five to six per cent of potash and one 
per cent of phosphoric acid and over 
30 per cent of lime. I would advise 
against putting in hill, as it is liable 
to injure the germinating power of the 
seed. Better screen them and apply 
with fertilizer drill at the rate of 200 
to 250 pounds per acre. I think it 
would be better to mix them after 
screening with acid phosphate. Mix 
equal parts and apply 200 to 250 lbs. 
This will give you a two to three per 
cent potash mixture, and the phosphor­
us will be of great benefit.

It is best not to mix too long before 
sowing. Mix in the morning what you 
will sow during the day.

Selling Sweet Corn to Canning 
Factory.

In your paper some time ago you 
printed an article written by Colon C. 
Lillie on crops raised for canning fac­
tory. He speaks of sweet corn as'a  
profitable crop, but he does not state 
how it is marketed, whether in the 
husk or not, or what they' pay for it; 
whether they buy by the hundred 
pounds or by the bushel. Now if he 
will be kind enough to tell me-just 
how he markets his sweet corn and 
how much he gets for it, I shall be 
very grateful.

Barry Co. C. C.
The sweet corn is picked or snapped 

from the stalks when in the proper 
condition for canning, that is, when in 
best condition for eating green, or 
when the majority of the ears of the 
field are in that condition. It is hauled 
at once to the factory and sold by the 
ton. Our factory pays $8.00 per ton 
for Evergreen, $9.00 for Country Gen­
tleman and $17 for Golden Bantam. If 
one wishes to he can draw the husks 
and cobs back home for feed.

Speltz vs. Oats.
What time of year is it sown, how 

many bushels of seed, and what is „the 
yield of speltz per acre on light sandy 
land? Are there any drawbacks to it?

Muskegon Co. R. J. P.
Speltz (or emmer) usually does bet­

ter on dry, sandy soils than oats. 
Many farmers on this kind of soil are 
now growing it in preference to oats.

It should be sown early in the spring 
at about the usual time of sowing oats, 
and about the same quantity per acre. 
There are no particular drawbacks to 
growing this crop successfully. As 
with all crops, the better the land the 
better the crop. While this crop will 
do better on dry sandy land than oats, 
it will do better on rich ground than 
on poor ground. It will make good 
use of manure or fertilizer.

Growing Lima Beans.
I am thinking of putting in lima 

beans. Would you kindly tell me what 
variety is best, what soil they require, 
just what time they should be planted 
and what time they are harvested; 
also, is there a good market for them, 
and are they hard to grow and do they 
require a lot of work?

Macomb Co. S u b s c r ib e r .
I know nothing about growing Limas 

as a market garden crop, hut have had 
experience growing the dwarf Limas 
for the canning factory. They are not 
as reliable nor as easily grown as our 
common beans. They ripen very un­
evenly, and are seriously affected by 
cold, bad, wet weather, and are not 
very hardy. They do best on a sandy 
loam or warm dry soil. They can be 
sold green or as ripe beans. I do not 
know the market price. Factories pay 
about two and a quarter cents a pound 
for the green shelled beans.

C o l o n  C. L i l l i e .
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TRYING TO BEAT NATURE.

The laws of nature were made long 
before farming became a recognized 
vocation and the laws were on nature’s 
statute bodk long before man found 
that the book existed. In the farming 
business, we .are Constantly bumping 
up against the laws of nature and as 
long as we try to fight those laws our 
farming will be inefficient. The soil 
contains certain elements which are 
valuable in producing a certain crop. 
Year after year if this crop is produc­
ed on the same soil the necessary ele­
ments are gradually exhausted and the 
crops become less abundant. The 
farmer who uses his soil without re­
placing any of the fertility is robbing 
his farm, he is trying to buck nature’s 
laws. One of these laws states that 
you cannot get something for nothing 
and that is what we do, or try to do, 
when we crop our land and give noth­
ing back. By assisting nature in the 
working out of her laws we are bene­
fited. Increasing the fertility of the 
soil increases the crops grown on that 
soil and nature’s laws are obeyed to 
the advantage of the farmer and his 
farm.

Some Examples.
A flock of pullets are ready to lay 

in the winter but do not lay because 
of poor feeding methods. Short ra­
tions are given them and what is the 
result? Nature uses the little food ma­
terial that is available to kedp the bod­
ies of the fowls in as good a condition 
as possible.

The dairy cow is a delicately con­
structed animal of the greatest value 
to man. Nature has given her great 
powers but man must assist nature to 
produce the best results. Short ra­
tions are not an economy. The Cow 
that is half fed and furnished ice wa­
ter to drink will not be a good produc­
er, as nature will use the food as 
much as possible to conserve the en­
ergy of the animal.

The peach orchard that is not thin­
ned may produce a large quantity of 
small peaches. The trees are devital­
ized and the next year the crop may 
be very small. Nature knows that the 
tree must have some time to recuper­
ate. When man assists nature the 
tree does not overbear, its annual 
crops will be of better quality and the 
orchard will be longer lived.

The farmer who tries to beat nature 
by excesses of any kind will meet 
with the same fate as the soil and the 
tree. He will lose in efficiency. There j 
may be some places where man can 
beat nature and not pay the bill. I 
have never heard of the place and it 
is certainly not on the farm.

In g h a m  Co. R . G . K ib b y .

ROAD BUILDING IN MICHIGAN.

Road building operations will be ac­
tive in Chippewa county this year. The 
Chippewa commission has let contracts 
for over 33 miles of state reward high­
way, to be finished by December 1.

Mecosta county has started work on 
15 miles of trunk road, as links in a 
main line from Grand Rapids to Cadil­
lac, and will complete same this year. 
The State reward on these roads will 
be $1,600 per mile.

Jackson county has let contracts for 
building six pieces of road as follows: 
Parma trunk line, one mile, to W. S. 
Hoag, Springport, $6,800; Sandstone 
trunk line, one mile, to Lowery Gravel 
Co., $6,303; Grass Lake trunk line, one 
mile, to Greenville Gravel Co., $6,995; 
Rives trunk line, one mile, to A. C. 
Mitchell, $4,698; Henrietta, one and a 
half miles, to W. E. Fleming, $3,449.30.

The Ottawa county road commission 
has let the contract for building two 
miles of concrete road on the Holland- 
Grand Haven stretch to Klaas Bolens 
and D. M. Cline of Spring Lake, the 
price being 99c per square yard.

Ingham county has been investigat­
ing the plan of bond issues as followed 
in Genesee, Kent, Ottawa and Berrien 
counties. Only 44 miles of the 250 
miles of road planned for Ingham have 
been completed.

Kent Co. A l m o n d  G r if f e n .
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John Deere Corn Planter
The Accurate ‘ ‘Natural Drop”  Planter

ACCURATE—because it Has the “ Natural-Selec­
tion”  drop— an improvement over all other 

methods.
Kernels do not have to be tipped on edge to enter 

the cells. Surface of hopper bottom and openings 
to seed cells are oblique, or sloping. The kernels 
naturally move toward and fill the cells.

A full—variable drop planter. Plants two, three 
or four kernels as desired—all you do to change num­
ber in the hill is to move foot lever.

Drilling distances varied, and change from hilling 
to drilling or back to hilling made just as easily.

All corn plates for this planter have 16 cells. There­
fore, the same drilling distances are obtained with one 
plate as can be secured on other planters that require 
8, 12 and 16 cell plates.

The gears are always in mesh and can be shifted at 
any time (even when in operation) to change drop or 
drilling distances.

Investigate the John Deere tip-over hoppers, quick 
detachable furrow openers, underhung reel and disc 
marker without rope.

Write for free booklet, “ More and Better Com.”

W* V  - a* :*

John Deere Syracuse Plows
The Plows with Perfect Fitting Parts

C  YRACUSE shares fit perfectly—extra shares go on 
easily. A  smooth joint is formed between share 

and moldboard and share draws up snugly to its place.
Remember that Syracuse cast shares are chilled 

throughout their entire cutting edge and point. The 
under side of point and cutting edge is also chilled—  
of vital importance in preserving the proper pitch 
and extending the period of usefulness.

Two bolts in the share instead of one and there is 
a rib on back of share that strengthens share! and 
standard. Lug holds moldboard and share closely 
together.

In addition John Deere Syracuse Plows are built 
with long handles, which produce steady running 
qualities and make the plow handle easily in the 
furrow.

Write for free literature on the 31 series, combina­
tion plows, for use where land is somewhat rolling 
or where it is desired to turn furrows smoothly up 
or down on sloping land.

Also the p42 series, combination plows, for use in 
sandy or gravelly soil, turf or stubble; the 26 series 
hillside plows, light weight, clean turning plows that 
do excellent work in hillside or level land.

John Deere Spreader
The Spreader with the Beater on the Axle

kNLY hip high to the top. Wheels out of way
O '
axle is patented. Write for Spreader booklet.

Three exclusive John Deere Spreader features:
[1] Beater on the axle——nothing else like it.
[2] Revolving Rake— load moving back to beater 

revolves the rake. Draft actually less. .Even 
spread certain—no bunching.

[3] Ball Bearing Eccentric Apron Drive— requires 
no attention. Performs wonders in the 
working of the spreader.

HI

[2]

13]

o
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John Deer© Two-W ay Plow
Steel Frame—Patent Auto Foot Frame-Shift

HIGHLY practical and convenient for working soil.
all in one direction on hillsides or elsewhere. Also 

adapted for plowing irregular shaped pieces of land 
or any other kind of plowing.

Auto foot frame shift works with great exactness. 
Slight foot pressure swings frame and moves work­
ing plow the degree required. Patented.

Automatic horse lift—no work for operator. Each 
plow independent of other—each has own depth 
regulating lever and lifting device.

W r it e  f o r  b o o k le t .

Am. 4*.' rVAdT.- a s S F * •
John Deere Plows for Light Tractors

High and Level Lift

PRACTICAL—the right size for the average farm.
Work with any standard tractor. Controlled by 

the man on the tractor.
Pull the rope and all bottoms raise high and level. 

Another pull lets them down. Plows do not clog or 
gather trash on the turn.

Extra beam and bottom, readily attached, in­
creases regular two bottom plow to three, or regular 
three bottom to four, as desired.

Equipped with Quick Detachable Shares—save 80% 
time changing shares. Write for free booklet.

S tern i1m i
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John Deere Dealers Everywhere
Better Farm Implements and How to Use Them

BOOK FREE—168 page reference book—tells all about a complete line of farm imple­
ments and how to adjust and use many of them. A practical encyclopedia of farm 

implements. Worth dollars. Describes and illustrates: Plows for Light Tractors; Steel 
and Chilled Walking and Riding Plows; Disc Plows; Cultivators; Spring Tooth and Spike 
Tooth Harrows; Lister.Plows and Cultivators; Disc Harrows; Alfalfa and Beet Tools; 
Farm and Mountain Wagons; Teaming Gears; Manure Spreaders; Inside Cup and Port­
able Grain Elevators; Corn Shelters; Hay Loaders, Stackers, Sweep Rakes, Mowers, Self- 
Dump Sulky and Side Delivery Rakes; Hay Presses; Kaffir Headers; Grain Drills and 
Seeders; Grain Binders; Corn Binders; Gasoline Engines. This book sent free to every 
one who states what special implements he is interested in and asks for Package 
No. X-5.

%

John Deere, Moline, Illinois

quality J  mark of

INTERNATIONAL AGRICULTURAL CORPORATION

2  FEED

C IN C IN N A T I W O R K S ! 
Manufacturers o f the Popular

High Grade Buffalo Fertilizers
Dealers In

FERTILIZER MATERIALS
Satisfied Customers Everywhere. Ask your dealer 

for prices, or write direct to
International Agricultural Corporation
Cincinnati Works, Lockland, Ohio, or Mr. Fred D. 

Hubbell, Wentworth Hotel, Lansing, Mich, 
State Agent.

RELIABLE AGENTS WANTED.

HELD SEEDSAf Wholesale Prices
We save you money on your Seed BUI. Write 
for our Special Money-Saving Price List and get

. P H — ~ —  ___ . _ _ _  _ our reduced prices on Best Quality GuaranteedSeed. You should know about our low prices. Wi“  ‘  ~
Guaranteed Satisfactory or money refunded. Don' 
sold subject to Government test. Have new recleant_____
89.30; Sweet Clover, 85.40; Alsllce and Timothy. $5.00. Have" tow prices on Seed Corn, Oats, 
Wheat, Speltz, Barley, Cane, MUlet, Cowpeas, Rape, Vetch, Sudan Grass, Potatoes, Artichokes, and 
all Farm and Garden Seeds. Write today for 100-page catalog. Free samples and special low prices on 
seeds you require. Will send Free 60-page book on Growing Alfalfa to those who wish it. Write at 
once, as we can save you money. A . A . BERRY SEED CO.. BO X 231 CLARINDA, IOWA

ALFALFAOur s e e d  i s  
genuine North* 
w e s t e r n , dry. 
land, non-irn- 
gated, from old 

fields and of exceptional purity. It grows strong, 
hardy, permanent plants. Beautifully illustrated 
catalog containing full description and samples FREE.

THE C. E. DePUY COMPANY
P O N T IA C , M IC H .

S W E E T  C LO V E R
Waite Blossoms; the greatest money-making crop o f

today. Wonderful opportunities fo r  the farmer who 
starts growing it. Builds up worn land rapidly and pro­
duces heavy, money-making crops while doing it. Ex­
cellent,pasture and hay; inoculates your land for  alfalfa. 
Easy to start: grows on all soils. Our seed all best scar­
ified hulled, nigh-germinating and tested. Quality guar­
anteed. Write today for  our big, Profit-Sharing Seed 
Guide,^circular and free samples. American Mutuai. 
Seed Co., Dept. 931 43d and Roby St., Chicago, Illinois.

WEB
_ ____,k out f o r  B u okhom  and oth er
weeds in olover this year. Very little pure 

seed to be had. Ours ie practically free from weed seeds and waste. Muoh the cheapest 
to sow. All other varieties of field seeds. Ha»

_  I  pie. and 1 na t r uetion.“  H o w to Know good Seed”  Free.
Writ« today. O.M.SCOTT *  SORB CO., 135 Mala St,Mary»TlUe,0.
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C  a s h -  F .O .B .  L a  P o r t e
Com plete With Plows
And here’s what you get—a tractpr especially 
designed for the small farm—tractor and plows 
combined in one machine—control o f  entire out­
fit from operator’s seat— an all purpose machine, 
as good for belt work as on the draw-bar.
The R um ely will p low  your truck patch as w ell as your 
hundred acre field. It prepares your ground, pulls your 
binder, does you r hauling and belt work.
Our catalog explains the ease o f  control, the steel gears 
all en cased  and running in oil, roller bearings through­
out, heavy duty four-cylinder engine and rigid frame 
construction.
Same design in three-plow  tractor, “ 12-24,”  $975.00 
f.o.b. La Porte. Address nearest branch for catalog.

A d v a n c e - R u m e l y  T h r e s h e r  C o .
La Porte (incorporated) Indiana

B a ttle  C r e e k . M i c H .

R U M  E L Y "8 -1 6 '
All P u rpose T ra c to r

■ ’I T .p;,Ti-rrrTt-w-irY-rri-»Triii'¥iri;i.i';.t..g:ixìia:g:i:i:i:8:ti3oanui.iiLijaDotxaxiiaanDni3Ci]

I  You can clear from 10 to 50
^ acres in ten days with the Faultless Stump Pulle", and
then decide whether you want to keep it or not—Hofere yon pay us 

any money. The Faultless Stump Puller develops greater power,
M  ‘  * with less strain on the team and the machipe, andis easier 

and safer tohandlethan any other stump 
pulier made. Backed by the strongest guarantee.

Right Now We Are Making 
A Special Low Price Offer
It means a slash in stump puller prices that 
trill surprise you. Write for full Infor 
m otion  at once and save money.
Our Free Book gives much valuable and pin “

You Get e  
Complete 

Outfit 
Ready S 3 & -

reliable information on clearing 
, stump land, with numerous 
| illustrations. Write for it today.

Faultless Stump Puller Co. 
Dept. M  Creseo, lewe

Just tear out this advertisement, write your name and address .on the margin, and mail to us, we’ll send you, tree, the Bllberzahn
—   - ■ Book, which te llsyou  w hy the

low down steel frame con* 
■traction of theŜj/òeriéhn

e n a b l e s  you  t  
econom ically. 
8sU 1rs«. Mfg. Co.

28 Rose St.
iGrand Rapids,M ich.

M ore D ollars From  Y ou r Silo

AGRICULTURAL LIME
The Strongest in Ohio

S e e  O h io  O ff ic ia l R e p o r t .
The Scioto Lime & Stone Co.,

D e la w a r e , O h io .
F R E E  SA M PLE S A N D  B O O K L E T  u p o n  request.

F O R  S A L E

CARBONATE OF LIME
Running 98$ pure. This lime is in ideal condition for applying to the soil, either mechanically or by hand. Write for prices in car lots or in small quantities.E. I. du Pont de Nemours & Go., Bay City, Mich,
■  i b i  —  —You should get the highest grade 
I  I B H  L  o f  lim estone m anufactured. Buy 

I  | f |  it upon the basis o f  analysis. W e 
■ ■  |  ■ ■ ■  H U  m anufacture the highest grade pul­

verised lim estone sold in M ichigan. 
L et ns prove it. Ask fo r  sam olo and analysis. 
CAMPBELL STONE CO.. Indian River, Mieli.

r . _  O - i .  A Bates a ll steel 36 horse tractor and
ru l U  e  UnCBP. plowing outfit, made in  Lansing. 

J . W . R O B IN SO N , H O L T , M IC H .

f  our salés
office near- H f l W A l a  

est yon for f c aBHHU SjHBB 
prices and

terms on fertil- THKgBBBBgp 
izers adapted to  ejfl/BÿeQjfc 
yonr soil andcrops.

Send fo r  B ook let • F ree
The American Agricul- 

l turai Chemical Co.
k  New York, Baltimore, Phil-

adelphia, Buffalo. C In - A  
cannati, Cleveland. 

Detroit,etc.

LIME
Pulverised lim e rook fo r  “ sour”  
soils. W rite fo r  LO W  PR ICES 
D IRECT TO YOG and we wiH 
send sample and fu ll particu­
lars. W rite to  office nearest you. 

L A K E  S H O R E  S T O N E  C O M P A N Y . 
M u s k e g o n , M ic h .,  a n d  B e n to n  H a r b o r ,  M ich

N  F A R M E R

Farm Notes
Seeding Clover in Oats.

I have a field that I would like to 
sow to oats and seed it, but it is un­
certain seeding with oats. Do you 
think I could be more sure of getting 
a good catch if I waited until the oats 
were harvested, and then disked the 
ground and harrowed it good and sow­
ed it to timothy and clover? How 
would alfalfa do sown after oats were 
harvested? The soli varies from sand 
to heavy clay.

Newaygo Co. B. J. O.
It is a far better plan to seed clover 

in oats, using only a thin seeding of 
oats, (say not more than one bushel 
per acre), than to depend on seeding 
after oat harvest. If the land is in a 
fair state of fertility and is not in an 
acid condition, there is a better chance 
of getting a seeding which will with­
stand the winter than to sow on the 
fitted stubble after the oats are har­
vested. This plan works all right in 
some seasons when there is sufficient 
moisture to make the plan successful, 
but is a much more uncertain proposi­
tion than seeding to clover in a moder­
ately thin stand of oats. Alfalfa would 
stand an even less chance of success 
than would clover on ground which 
had never grown alfalfa before, if the 
same is seeded after the oat crop is 
harvested.

If difficulty has been experienced in 
getting a stand of clover on this land, 
it would be profitable to have a test 
made to determine whether lime is 
needed to correct an acid condition, 
and in case the soil shows acid reac­
tion, it would be profitable to apply 
lime when fitting the ground for oats 
in the spring. In a great many cases 
where the loss of clover seeding is 
attributed to dry weather, the loss is 
at least in part due to an acid condi­
tion of the soil which can be removed 
by a liberal application of lime.

Sweet Clover for Heavy Land.
Which is the best kind of sweet 

clover to sow on heavy land to build 
up the soil, and about how much per 
acre?

Lapeer Co. A. G.
Unless it is very deficient in vege­

table matter, we do not advise the use 
of sweet clover on heavy land. The 
chief value of sweet clover as a soil 
improver lies in the fact that it will 
succeed on soil containing less organic 
matter than almost any other of the 
legumes which can he used for that 
purpose.

On heavy soil as a forage crop and 
soil improver alfalfa is very much su­
perior to sweet clover and will be a 
more profitable crop to grow. Where 
it is necessary to add a considerable 
quantity of vegetable matter to the 
soil quickly, sweet clpver may possibly 
find a profitable use on such soil where 
the land is used for wheat in the crop 
rotation, so that it would be undesir­
able to introduce vetch, although some 
other legume, as peas or cowpeas, 
could he used to advantage for this 
purpose and the results could be se­
cured more quickly than with sweet 
clover.

Sweet clover is best adapted to the 
improvement of sandy, gravelly soils 
which are very low in their humus 
content and upon which other legumes 
cannot he made to succeed as well. 
White sweet clover is the most valu­
able variety for forage or soil improve­
ment purposes.

TILE DRAINAGE IN THE SAGINAW 
VALLEY.

(Continued from first page), 
value. He can also help'the farmer 
avoid some serious mistakes when he 
undertakes this improvement.

Follow a Definite Plan.
In the first place not a tile should be 

Jaid until the farmer has a more or 
less definite plan of the system for the 
whole farm. To run tile hit or miss 
through the farm to drain out certain 
“low spots” is a piece of bad manage­
ment that is almost sure to result in 
needless expense of time and mate­
rial. Most of the soils of the Saginaw 
Valley are comparatively level and

generally require tile laid out in par­
allel strings from four to eight rods 
apart. Any makeshift of tiling that 
does not conform to this general plan 
is likely to be unsatisfactory and to re­
quire changing sooner or later. It is 
a mistake to suppose that tile are re­
quired only on the low land, since ex­
perience has taught hundreds of farm­
ers in this part of the state that fully 
as much benefit is secured from tile 
on the higher portions of their farms 
as on the low lands.

A second mistake that beginners are 
likely to make is to use tile that are 
too small. Tile one and a half to two 
inches in diameter were formerly us­
ed, but I am informed that most of the 
tile factories in Ohio no longer make 
anything smaller than four inches, and 
I know that few factories in Michigan 
make sizes less than three inches. In 
those sections where farmers have had 
the most experience with tile the ten­
dency Is to use the larger sizes, noth­
ing less than four inches being used 
except for short branch strings and 
the majority o f farmers, think .that 
three-tinch tile are too small for any 
condition.

Tile drainage is an opportunity that 
is knocking at our door. It is the key 
that will unlock stores of plant food 
for our crops. It is the first number 
on the farmers' program of efficiency. 
Anything that will increase the num­
ber of prqperly tile-drained farms will 
immediately increase profits of farm­
ing and permanently benefit the com­
munity.

GETTING READY FOR MICHIGAN 
. FAIRS.

The Michigan Association of County 
and District Fairs met in Grand Rapids 
and elected these officers: President, 
F. A. Bradish, Adrian; vice-presidents, 
Perry F. Powers, Cadillac; Don L. 
Beardslee, Greenville; Chas.E. Ander­
son, Hartford; secretary and treasurer, 
Frank Rathsburg, Imlay City. The 
next-meeting will be held in Detroit.

The Fruit Belt Agricultural Society 
met at Empire, Leelanau county, and 
elected the following officers: Presi­
dent, E. R. Dailey; vice-president, H. 
L. Nessen; secretary, Andrew John­
son; treasurer, Frank S. Hardy. Plans 
were made to increase live stock ex­
hibits at the coming fair.

The Clinton County Society met at 
St. Johns and voted to bar' out all 
gambling at the fair this year, includ­
ing the cane racks, candy wheels and 
other mild forms of chance, as well as 
the more serious offenders. The soci­
ety is in good shape financially, with 
a balance of $902.69 on hand. The new 
officers are: President, R. L. Bixby; 
viee-president, C. J. Sowle; secretary, 
C. S. Clark; treasurer, Merritt Ride­
nour.

The Cass County Society asks the 
supervisors for $1,000 in support of 
this year’s fair at Cassopolis and if the 
request is not granted no fair is likely 
to be held. The new officers are: Pres­
ident, James Springsteen; vice-presi­
dent, Milo Cook; secretary, Ralph W. 
Hain; treasurer, Leo A. Parker.

The Chippewa County society will 
provide a race track and grounds for 
base ball, foot ball and lacrosse at the 
Sault Ste. Marie grounds. The new 
officers are: President, S. T. Handy; 
secretary, L. S. Holden; treasurer, A. 
W. Clarke.

The Isabella County Society met at 
Mt. Pleasant and reports showed cash 
receipts of about $5,500 for the past 
year and a balance after debts were 
paid, of oyer $200. Officers for 1916 
are: President, Dr. J. J. Walkington; 
vice-president, Robt. Wardrop; secre­
tary, T. W. Ayling; treasurer, C. J. 
’Myers.

Reports read at the annual meeting 
of the Hillsdale County Association 
show funds on hand of very close to 
$5,000. The officers elected are: Pres­
ident, Loren R. Eagle; secretary, C. 
W. Terwilliger; treasurer, Wm. Mer­
chant.
' Kent Co. ... Almond Griffen,
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Everbearing Strawberries
SN April, 1915, we set 1000 plants of ners from our fruiting patch we will 

the Superb variety of fall, or ever- have more than enough plants for an 
bearing, strawberries. The plants acre, 

were obtained at $15 per thousand;. While the ever-bearing strawberries 
practically every plant grew, and all have not paid expanses the first sea- 
proved true to name. son, yet they have done more than the

The ground had been previously ma- Warfield and Dunlap, or other ordinary 
nured; during the summer cultivation types, which, of course, bring no re- 
was kept up thoroughly, and by fall turn whatever the first season. The 
the rows of plants were continuous, al- income from fruit has been $14.39; if 
though originally set two by three feet, we put a value of $10 per thousand on 

Blossoms appeared on these plants the undug new plants, and estimate 
soon after they started growing, but their number at eight thousand, then 
they were kept picked off until the the investment has indeed been a prof- 
first of July. The first full quart of itable one.
assorted berries was picked on August Given proper climatic conditions for 
12, and taken to the local hotel, where ripening, the Superb berries are in- 
it was bought by one of the guests for deed well named. The fruit is quite 
twenty-five cents. From that time on uniform in shape, being round-conical; 
our troubles in supplying the market well filled and colored to the tip; firm 
demands were surprising. People from fleshed, with a pleasing aroma and 
the hotel called us up on the phone flavor.
two or three times a day, asking us to Our experience proved, however, 
be sure and save them some berries. that as with peaches and grapes, so 

When the wet weather came in Sep- with the berries; given a fall with 
tember, the strawberries cracked op- much cloudy and wet weather, and the 
en; othrewise, we could have shipped fruit fails to develop a sufficient sugar 
quantities of them to the resorters content, and gets filled with a surplus 
who had returned to their homes in of juice which is flat in flavor. The 
the city, leaving orders and checks in berries, too, decay rapidly in such 
payment for same. weather, and become splashed with

The season’s experience has demon- sand. A large part of our late fall 
strated that the problem in the ever- crop was fit only for cooking, under

Everbearing Strawberries Promise Increased Revenue from this Fruit.

bearing strawberry trade is not to find such conditions of weather as prevail- 
a market for the fruit, but fruit for ed. However, the very rains which cut 
the market. Probably the coming sea- down the production of berries served 
son will provide a much larger crop to increase the production of new 
from these same plants; during the plants, so that we have no complaint 
present season we harvested 58 quarts to make.
of fancy fruit, and 14 quarts of second Others who have tried the ever-bear- 
grade fruit. We fixed the price at 25 ing strawberries claim that they will 
and 15 cents respectively, most of the produce almost continuously the sec- 
sales being made direct from patch to ond year. We expect to watch results 
consumer. No doubt a higher price with the early crop of Superb in corn- 
might have been realized by seeking parison with Warfield and Dunlap next 
out a special market, but that would year, and feel sure of one thing; that 
require a supply of berries for filling while a late frost may destroy the 
orders, which, of course, we did not blossoms of the latter varieties, the 
“ ave- Superb will keep on blossoming after

Only eight hundred of our plants the frost 
were allowed to fruit; the blossoms' Benzie Co. E. H. B r o w n .
were removed from the other two hun- ___________'
dred, so that all the energies of the PLANNING THE GARDEN, 
plant might go to forming running —— —
plants for an increase plot for next By laying out the garden intelligent- 
year. Twice during the summer these ly and considering carefully the nature 
runners were pinned down with soil, and requirements of each vegetable, 
so that they might root early in the much labor may be saved in the sum- 
season. Fully two thousand plants mer cultivation and the production of 
have resulted from this practice. 'One the garden may be materially increas- 
plant has approximately sixty runners ed. Before the time for planting ar- 
attached and all rooted. Other plants rives, a plan should be drawn. Vege- 
have no runners at all, but an enor- tables requiring the same cultivation 
mous development of crown. One can- should be planted together; those 
not help but wonder if it would not needing the same length of time to 
pay to improve the variety by select- reach maturity should also be placed 
ing for propagation only those plants side by side. It is much better to have 
which produce a moderate amount of the planting plan made up well in ad- 
runners, storing up considerable ener- vance than to do it by a hit-or-miss 
gy in reserve for fruit production the method. Garden planning in winter 
next year. _  means economy of time, labor and

At two cents apiece, however, there money in spring and summer, 
should be a good profit in selling the Plan to keep the garden busy. This 
plants; we figured that our plants cost may be done by arranging one crop to 
us that by the time we paid express follow another in close succession, 
charges, and trimmed them up, so that Plant spinach, radishes and early let- 
when the neighbors come asking for a tuce side by side and set tomato and 
few plants for the home garden, we let pepper plants to follow the spring 
them go at that figure. We are sav- crops. The early crops will be ready 
ing the plants, however, for an increas- to take off before the‘middle of June 
ed acreage next year. It requires and in mil ing them out, spaces may 
about 7,200 plants for an acre, setting be made to set the plants. Thus the 
two by three feet; by using the run- early crops may be used until July and

Red Ball on 
“Ball-Band”  
I s  r i g h t  w h e r e  
y o u  c a n  s e e  it

All over America men look for the Red Ball when 
they buy rubber footwear. Eight and one-half mil­
lion men won’ t buy any other kind. They know 
that the Red Ball stands for value that- they cannot 
get in any other kind.

Begin to figure the cost of rubber footwear on its 
cost per days wear, and you will see that “ Ball-Band* 
gives greatest service at lowest cost.

"B A L L H B A N D T
is made right and stays right. Ball-Band* * boots are vacuum cured. 
During the vulcanizing this process causes a tremendous pressure on 
the fabric and rubber, and makes the boot one solid piece.

More than 50^000 stores sell “ Ball-Band** Rubber Footwear. 
I f  you have any difficulty getting “ Ball-Band,** write us, giving the 
name of your merchant. W e  will see that you are supplied.

Write anyway for our free booklef, “ More Days Wear’9
Tells how to treat rubber footwear so as to get the full worth o f it.

---------- *----------- Something New— ....
“ Ball-Band** Light W eight Rubbers for street wear in 

Men’ s, W om en’ s and Children’ s sizes. Theyare“ Ball-Band”  
Quality and Value. Look for the Red Ball on the ¿ole.

MISHAWAKA WOOLEN MFQ.C0., 319 Water St., Mishawaka, Ind.
"The House That Pays Millions for Quality "

P l a n e t  J r . t o o îS"
W cut down work and boost your crops
V Old-time farming no longer pays-*-these scientific tools do the work 
I of 3 to 6 men, give bigger yield, and save their cost in a single season. 

Invented and made by a practical farmer and manufacturer, with half 
a century’s experience. Planet Jrs are strong and 
lasting. Every tool fully guaranteed.

72-page Catalog (184 illustrations) free!
Describes over 70 tools, including 12 entirely new ones and improve« 
ments to our Seeders, Wheel-Hoes, Horse Hoes, Harrows. Or- 
chard-(and Beet-Cultivators. Write postal for it!
S L Allen &  Co Box 1107M Philadelphia

No. 25 Planet”Jr Combined Hill and Drill Seeder. Double and 
Single Wheel-Hoe, Cultivator and Plow is a splendid combi- 

nation for the family garden, onion grower, or large gar­
dener. Is a perfect seeder, and combined double and 

single wheel-hoe. Unbreakable steel frame. Capacity—
2 acres a day.

Planet Jr 12-tooth Harrow. Cultivator and Pulverizer 
is stronger, steadier in action, and cultivates more 

thoroughly than any other harrow 
made. Non-clogging steel 

wheel. Invaluable to the 
market-gar-

K '^ \ d en er , trucker,1 
t o b a c c o  or  
small-fruit 

grower. _
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WHY PREPARE Y#UR SM I 
FOR POOR SEED WIEN—

the later crops are at the same time1 
Being developed. Early peas will come 
off the land the latter part of June 
and beets for winter use may follow. 
By planting Detroit Dark Red beet by 
the first of July, nice vegetables for: 
winter use may be had. These- will not; 
be large But they will be of much bet-1 
ter quality than spring-plan„ed beets.: 
Between the rows of dwarf peas or 
early potatoes Green Pod and Golden 
Wax Snap beans may be planted. 
These will develop quickly and occupy 
the ground; when the first crop is re»1 
moved.

Plan successions of such vegetables

as peas, sweet corn and snap beans. 
By planting Alaska, Nott's Excelsior 
and Telephone peas on the same day 
green peas may be enjoyed for several 
weeks. Another planting of Telephone 
two or three weeks later will add still 
farther to the- season. In the same 
manner'Cory, Golden Bantam and Sta- 
well Evergreen: sweet corn will afford 
a succession.

Finally, in planting the garden or­
der the necessary seeds and supplies 
early. Do this before the time for 
planting arrives that there may be no 
delay in getting the seeds into the 
ground at the right season. C. Hi Q

Y O U  C A N  G E Y
i O C  Ideal Seed & Grain <M 9  5 0  
y J v  SEPARATORS AT —
AND SOW GOOD SEED

The Ideal is a Combination Fanning Mill 
and Grader that insures the sowing o f plump 
grain that is free of; weed’seed and is offered 
at a price below manufacturer’s cost.

Don’t  envy your neighbor's big yield nor 
deny yourself and your family the pleasure 
from money so earned- for the price of this 
cheap convenience. Better buy an Ideal and 
have no regrets.

The small lot o f machines offered in this 
sale were forfeited- in payment- o f a loan-, 
when the Ideal Company went out of busi­
ness.. We were able to buy the lot at a1.very 
low price and are closing them out rapidly.

‘Range o f  Work Covered
The Ideal machine does work under special 

patents that no other machine can do. It 
cleans and separates such seeds as wheat, 
oats and clover- It cleans and separates 
Buckhem from first grade clover, doddèr and 
other foul weed from alfalfa-; clover and tim­
othy from Red Top; mustard from oats: 
grades wheat and oats into three grades and 
cleans and grades broom corn seed.

Ideal Users Enthusiastic
“ I am glad to find in the Ideal a really 

satisfactory seed and grain separator. It gets 
rid o f the ruinous, foul "seed and grades up­
ward. the quality of seed planted.”

E. P. MITCHELL, Tipton, Ind.
“ T saw this mill demonstrated at Wabash. 

Ind» I bought because it did the finest work 
of’ any mill I have ever seen.”

WALTER CURTIS,
R. F. D, Ko.10, Wabash, Ind.

“  I  have tried this mill on wheat and tim­
othy seed. It surely does good work. My 
neighbor, Bert Mooie, says, his Ideal is ideal 
for grading oats.”  T. B. DAVIS, .

R. R- No, 2, Pennville, Ind.
Further information if desired.

C . ; ,  W a m in o J  These ideal Separators r a iT  »v « r u iu j j . ealinot last much longer. 
Prompt action means you will get a complete 
$85 machine at $12.50. Delay means disap­
pointment. Send cash or check with order. 
The margin is-close and we cannot afford to 
open accounts.

REFERENCE : Dunn or Bradstreet reports at 
your local bank. .
T uni an RpfiC 227 East Ohio Street, 
l s y i l i a i l  Ü 1 U J »  INDIANAPOLIS, IND.

Winter Meeting of Fruit Growers

MTftars in Business
■00,000 Custom ers1
It pays to boy from a house that is well es­
tablished and known to be reliable. Espe­
cially is this true of seeds and trees.
Garden Book Free. Write for your copy of 
our 1916 illustrated Garden Book. It will 
help 
char
and — —  — ----- I
Trees, Shrubs and Vines.

GERMAN NURSERIES AND SEED HOUSE 
Box 241 Beatrice. Nebraska,

SEEDS & TREES THAT GROW
k G A R D E N  
m  F IE L D  ^

1^ / F L Q W E t tÏSIEDS
^vehelpedcaremltiant«« tob^er £****
r ft* over , BrinOTr? Seed» are famed tar Purity, 

this by writing to-day for our

FR E E  Farm amt Garden Guide
XlSMculture

with true-to-nature tilnstrations. It a t 
S e e  fo r  the asking, please write fa r  

, it today” * postcardwul “°- ,
The Page-Philipps Seed Co. j  
Box 170 Toledo* Okie/-

“ H O LC O ”  Seed Book
Tells What, How. When to plant Your 
Vegetable and Flower Garden. Sent 
Free on Request
The HoimesrLtihennae Seed Go.

S E E D  G R O W E R S  
D r a w e r  D .  C A N T O N ,  O H I O .

KANT-KLOG. SPRAYER-i
• alieaof spray a from  one nozzle. Start* 
o r  stops instantly—saves solation and 
work. S m d farca ta lóéi Agents wanted. 

R oohaatar Spray Pum p C o .RSîBnoedwmt «---I-----1 TTl Tj

|‘A HE Oakland County fruit grow­
ers again demonstrated the fact 
that they were live wires, when. 

the Oakland County Horticultural So­
ciety entertained the Michigan State 
Horticultural; Society at its annual: 
mid-winter meeting. The meeting was 
held at Pontiac, February 15-16 and* 
was well attended by fruit growers 
from all parts of the state. The large 
local attendance and the great interest 
shown in; all the subjects indicate that 
fruit growing in Michigan is by no» 
means confined to the western part of 
the state. In welcoming the state so­
ciety to Pontiac, C. A. Bingham, presi­
dent of the Oakland County Society, 
spoke of the rapid development in fruit 
growing among the farmers of this sec­
tion of the state. It is only a few years 
ago when the state meeting which was 
held at Pontiac drew a very slight 
crowd, but two years ago a summer

that they may maintain their places 
among the activities of the world. 
The development of the automobile 
business was- cited and fruit growing, 
especially apple growing, was compar­
ed with it. Suggestions with reference 
to the improvement of cultural meth­
ods, including cultivation, spraying and 
pruning, were given, and with refer­
ence to marketing the value of co-oper­
ation, honesty and advertising were 
brought out. In a future issue of the 
Michigan Farmer these will be given 
in detail.

The Keifer Pear Question.
The first subject taken up at the af­

ternoon session was “ The Growing of 
Pears and Cherries,” by Robert Craw­
ford of Armada. Mr. Crawford brought 
up the perennial discussion of the 
Keifer pear. He said he found this va­
riety valuable because it was practical­
ly an annual bearer and did not cost

Vineyard of R. A. Smythe, Secretary of State Horticultural Society.

meeting at which the Oakland county 
people were hosts, was one of the most 
successful ever held by the state soci­
ety. In spite of the fact that Oakland 
county was becoming the playground 
of Detroiters, Mr. Bingham said that 
fruit growing was and would continue 
to be one of the foremost lines of ac­
tivity in Oakland county.

Efficiency in Fruit Production.
The first morning session was given 

over to the discussion of “Efficiency 
Methods in Fruit Growing,” by F. A. 
Wilken. The thought brought out was 
that, due to the fact that fruit grow­
ing has been so profitable in the past, 
many orchards have been set, and con­
sequently there will be a great in­
crease in production, making the com­
petition for markets stronger. This 
would necessitate improvement in the 
methods of fruit growing in- such a 
manner as to lower the cost of produc­
tion and marketing so that fruit grow­
ing would continue to pay a profit, and 
at the same time enable the consumen 
to buy the fruit at lower cost. All 
thriving industries pas« through a pe­
riod of growth during which crude and 
extravagant method« are- generally us­
ed, but as these industries mature .the; 
work must become more efficient so

very much to raise. If one has other 
good varieties of fruit, such as the Spy 
or the Red Canada apples, he can usu­
ally sell his Keifer pears to advantage 
because these quality varieties would 
“sugar coat” the Keifer, but if the 
Keifer was grown exclusively Mr. 
Crawford thought there would be 
many years in which it would be diffi­
cult to sell the fruit. With reference 
to growing cherries he favored a more 
extensive planting of this fruit in the 
southeastern part of the state because 
the market was. good. He thought it 
was practically the only fruit adapted 
to city yard growing because it needed 
comparatively little syFaying on ac­
count of its freedom from scale.

Horticulture as an Occupation for 
Women.

“Women in Horticulture” was dis­
cussed by Miss Addie Sly, who has 
been very successful in conducting a 
fruit farm at Birmingham. Miss Sly 
has become active in farming because 
she wished, to keep intact the old 
homestead which has been in the fam­
ily for more than eighty years. Miss 
Sly saw no r’eason why a woman 
should not take as active an interest 
in farming, as a. man. By employing 
men %ha work tor Her interests) and

by systematically carrying on the 
work, Miss Sly has found that farming 
is no more difficult than other- lines of 
activity. She valued the man who 
would go - about the farm Sundays look­
ing over the. work that has been done 
during the past week, or the one who 
would willingly stay up all night car­
ing for a sick animal, because when: a 
man* did these things she was sure he 
had the interests of the farm at- heart. 
Miss Sly had no difficulty with help 
because of the- good treatment, she 
gives them, and because of the syste­
matic way in which the work is ar­
ranged. Each day every man know« 
what work he is ex-pected to do. The 
day’s work is started promptly on 
time, meals are also ready at certain 
stated times, and after the day’s work 
is over the men have for their own use 
a comfortable building in which they 
may smoke- or play games as they 
choose. Miss Sly commented on the 
carelessness of farmers in leaving 
their tools unprotected, and she wan­
dered. haw many of the farmers pres­
ent had their tools in the field ready 
to begin next spring’s work. One hard 
and fast rule on the Sly farm is that 
each tool should be put in its proper 
place after the work is done. Miss Sly 
did not think it necessary for the wom­
an farm manager to do any of the 
manual work; for the managerial, dut­
ies properly taken care of would, be 
enough to keep her busy.

Suggestions air Peach Growing.
Mr. Roland; Morrill; one of Michi­

gan's most prominent peach growers, 
spoke on “The Peach Industry.”" Mr. 
Morrill's long experience in this work 
makes his advice on the problems of 
the peach grower nluch sought after. 
He said that in the future we would 
give, more attention to the unseen 
things in peach growing; we would 
give more attention to the effect of 
cultivation and fertilization upon the 
root system of the tree and our under­
standing of root edvelopment would be 
better. After several years of careful 
investigation he found that at the time 
of the hardening of the pit of the 
peach there were formed many small 
hairlike roots which would come close 
to the surface to come in contact with 
the light and air, but which, after the 
pit was thoroughly hardened, would 
die. He was sure that these roots had 
some relation to the hardening of the 
pit, and on account of their apparent 
value he said shallow cultivation was 
very important at that time, as deep 
cultivation would destroy them. He 
never started cultivation until after 
blossoming time, as experience has 
shown him that cultivation makes the 
blossoms more susceptible to frost in­
jury. He believed in thorough cultiva­
tion until late in August ,and if the 
season, iis especially dry, even later. 
He did not feel very enthusiastic about 
the summer spraying of peach trees 
because of the susceptibility of peach 
foliage to injury. He thought it very 
important to keep the foliage in heal­
thy condition. The peach industry has 
developed so that the peach grower 
has not as broad a market as he used 
to have. Every large consuming cen­
ter now has a good-sized peach pro­
ducing section near it, which supplies 
it with fruit. The large peach grow­
ing sections of the south will compete 
with Michigan fruits on the larger 
markets. This will make it necessary 
for the Michigan grower to develop 
more efficient marketing methods and 
to advertise to put before the public 
the quality of Michigan peaches.

Orcharding on a Large Scale.
Under the title of “From Start to 

Finish,” Mr. J. E. Merritt, of Manistee, 
told of His extensive operations in 
clearing land and setting it to-orchard. 
The stumps were all pulled by machine 
and then put in; large piles for burning. 
After burning,, the land is gone over 
several times to pick up the smaller 
brush; It is then plowed and gone ov­
er again to pick up what brush is un­
covered. in plowing. The work of clear­
ing: is. done so thoroughly that after
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Loadin3Minutes

WÊÈBtBfrS Rows
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That means a saving of half your time and a saving on machinery and horseflesh. 
It means that with the New Idea you can do two days spreading in a single day. Our wide 
spread saves you half a mile of travel on every acre.

You need a spreader because it’s the only method of preventing the loss which comes 
from improper spreading. Manure has a fertilizing profit of $8 to $ io  per acre. You are 
losing a great part of this when you try to spread by the fork and wagon method. The 
manure lying pil$d in the barnyard loses by leaching and firing and you lose in the field 
because it’s not spread right. When too thick the soil is burned and when too thin, or when 
patches of ground are missed, there is not the proper fertilization.

The only sure way is to use a spreader.^ Not just any spreader but one that spreads 
wide and evenly, does not choke and can always be depended on to do its work right. 
You ’ll find such a machine in the low down, scientifically built

W e also build the “ N1SCO”  
— a special low down 

type with narrow 
front truck.

r<?/^

It spreads 6 inches beyond the wheels and gives a total spreading width of 7 feet, covering 3 com rows. 
Can be loaded as high as a wagon box,— the double cylinders insure thorough pulverization and prevent 
choking. Light draft. n .

# The two cylinders pulverize all the manure, and the whirling distributor throws a fine even spray of pul­
verized manure across three corn rows. It spreads beyond the wagon tracks, and you don’t have to drive 
over the spread manure.

The N ew  Idea has a variable spread o f 3, 6, 9, 12, 15, 18 loads per acre.
Spread is controlled by convenient levers or can be entirely thrown off by conve­
nient foot latch. The variable feed enables you to give each part of the soil 
exactly the amount of manure needed.

Wheels track but front wheels turn under for easy turning. Endless chain 
conveyors with steel bars scrape the spreader bed clean. No manure shreds 
left to freeze in winter and rot in summer.

The New Idea is built like a wagon box, solid bottom with heavy cross 
pieces supported by the full width of the side. Rear end properly braced 
to  prevent spreading of the bed and cramping of the bearings.

A  Really Successful Chain-Drive Manure Spreader
A  simple mechanism that can’ t strip, break, freeze or get out o f order. The 

N ew  Idea heavy chains will not break even under unusual pressure. D irect axle feed 
prevents loss o f power. Sprocket at one end drives cylinder and cams at other end 
operate feed. We guarantee the New Idea to spread without choking when 
operated according to directions. W e also guarantee it  for one year against 

breakage from any cause and guarantee it indefinitely 
against defective material or workmanship.

“ Helping Mother Nature“  ) f D  C l ?
Big Special Book J A ExlZiJCi

N o matter how much you  know about farm­
ing the book will present to you  some new 
facts on fertilizing. Ask the Dealer for a 
copy  and free demonstration o f the New 
Idea. I f  there is no New Idea dealer 
near write us for free copy and 
illustrated catalog.

NEW IDEA SPREADER CO.

Spreading 
Area of 

Ordinary 
S p rea d er

This 
is the
FREE 

B O O K  
Write for

. . .  ______ ______ * Spreader Specialists”
181 FIRST STREET COLD WATER. OHIO it or ask 

the N ew  
Idea Dealer
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Sm ooth P ota toes
W ith usually a tfrirty to  forty per cent, 
increase yield assured to  every grower if 
he wilt rid  his seed potatoes o f  potato 
scab and black-leg by using

the official Standard seed cleanser to 
prevent smuts and fungus; flax wilt. Po­
tato scab and blade-leg once in  the 
ground may persist for many years. 
The U. S , Department o f Agriculture rec­
ommends cleansing seeds with Formal­
dehyde solution to prevent spread o f no­
tate diseases and smuts o f  grain. For­
maldehyde in pint bottles at your dealer, 
35 cents. Big illustrated book sent free.

P E R T H  A M B OY C H EM IC A L W ORKS 
100 WILLIAM STREET NEW YORK 5

FRUIT TREES
| Ornamentals, Evergreens, Shade 

Trees. Tested Seed, Vines, Berry Bush­
es, Everblooming Roses, Cannas and 
gorgeous bedding plants. Hardy Per­
ennials that last fo r  years— all offered d i­
rect to  yon from  A m erica ’ s largest growers.

Select, robust stock; over 120U acres along | 
Lnke Erie, 7 kinds o f  soil, 48 greenhouses. 
Up to 460 carloads sold yearly. N o risk. 
Safe arrival and satisfaction guaranteed.

Photo-Catalog FREE!
T ells  a ll about p lanting and care.

Prices and accurate descriptions o f  
thousands o f  ch o ice  varieties. Spe­
cia l offers on  high  grade collection s.
Seed, P lant, R o s e .T r a it  and Orna­
m ental T ree  Catalog. 192 pages fu lly  
illustrated, sent F R E E ! W rite  today.
The StorTs &  Harrison Co^
D ept. 207  Painesville, |

FRUIT TREES AND HOW WE 
M A K E  T H E M

For 30 y ears our True to Label Trees have been find­
ing their way into Michigan Orchards. They have 
made good as proven by men who are Fruiting 
Them. Our book on Spraying, Pruning, Selection 
o f  Varieties, etc., will interest you. It’s free with 
- catalog.

H . S. WILEY &  SON, Main S t.,

the ground is well cultivated it looks 
as if it had been under cultivation for 
several years, it is so clean. It has 
cost Mr. Merritt from. $40 to $50' an 
acre to do the clearing and to get the 
ground in shape for setting the trees. 
This high cost is due to the fact that it 
is more costly to clear pine stump land 
than any other, and also because the 
work was done so thoroughly. Mr. 
Merritt’s talk was illustrated by a- 
large number of slides showing the 
land before and after clearing, and al­
so the various operations necessary to 
clear it.

The evening meeting was an open 
one and was well attended by both 
country and city people. Mr. John I. 
Gibson gave an illustrated talk on 
“Making Michigan Win,” in which he 
told of the good work that the Western 
Michigan Development Bureau has 
done in the development of the .north­
western part of the state. Aside from 
doing a large amount of publicity work 
to get new settlers, the Bureau does 
everything to encourage the farmers 
to use modern methods. It also uses 
its influence in improving the rural 
social conditions, and the rural school. 
It has done much toward fostering the 
good roads idea and has worked up a 
market for high-class fruit under its 
trade name,, “Sunny Ripe.”

Improving the Home Grounds.
Prof. Thos. Gunson, of M. A. C., 

spoke on a subject dear to his heart, 
“Home-making and Surroundings.” 
One of the chief reasons why farm life 
is not attractive to many is the unat­
tractive surroundings that most farm 
homes have. Too little, attention is 
given to beautifying the grounds which 
the farm buildings occupy. In this age 
of commercialism we have also cut 
away all shrubbery and brush along 
the roadsides, thus making the public 
highways barren and unattractive. One 
of the most important things in rural 
progress is the development of the 
aesthetic side of country living. There 
is nothing we can do which will do this 
and make the farm attractive to a good 
class of people than to give attention 
to beautifying the rural community.

The Wednesday morning session 
was opened by Mr. Geo. Low, of Ban­
gor, who talked on “Orchard Heating.” 
Mr. Low and several other prominent 

j fruit growers of Bangor have had prac

E V E R G R E E N S
. 3 8  Hardy Tested Varieties 
Best fo r  windbreaks, hedges and lawn 
planting. Protect buildings, crops, stock, 
gardens and orchards. Hill’s Evergreens 
are N u rsery  grow n  and hardy every­
where. From » 1  t o * 10M r  hundr«d. - -
Hill’s Evergreen book ana50Great Bargain sheet sent 
free. Write today. W orld’s largest growers. Est.1865. 
D . H ILL ^  N U R S E R Y  C O ., D U N D E E , IL L IN O IS

B ox E vergreen S pecia lists

CONDON’S N E W B  A | ) |  Q  | |  
LIGHTNING R A V I OH
Finest Early Radish in Existence. Ready 
t o  o a t  In 1 4  d ays . T o  introduce Our 

Northern Grown * ‘Sure C rop " Live Seeds 
w e will mail you B ig  Paekngn "C o n d o n ’ s  
N ow  I H d i m c  R a d ish "  and our Mam­
moth Illustrated 1916 w o w .  w e n s  
Garden and Farm Guide. A l ' U  U  B4 
Send name and address f  B  *  ■  i n  J 

on postal today sure. ■ , __ „
« ____. ■ ________________ Rock River Valley Seed FinnCondon HrOS.,seea*m#n,Bol ¡-,77 Rockford, m.

APPLES ml
You MUST h&ve our new cata­
logue it you want to know real 
value*in nursery stock. Apples» 
Peaches, Pears, Barries, Orna­
mentals, etc. It is F R E E . 
Write fbr it today» SURE, and 

compare the values with others. 
L will save you money. Drop a 

postal NOW to 
Progress Nursery C o .,T ro y ,O .

APPLE TREES
To introduce our enormous nurseries to you we are making this exceptional offer-10 good apple trees» many choice varieties, at this low priée., write. 
Big Seed and Tree Book 

Free. Qallswsy Bros. A  
C o.. Box 186 Waterloo, la.

PEACH&APPLE 
TREES 2c & up
Pear, P lum , C herry, Sm all Fruits, Strawberry Vi..ea. 
N uts. e tc . GENUINE HALB BUDDED from  Bearing. J. 
H . HALE TREES. Genuine D elicious Apples. C aL F res 
TENN. NURSERY CO. Box 44 Cleveland. Venn.

Trees—  Roses —Vines
¡ B l n  small o r  large lots at wholesale 

Trices. Catalog and Green’s  Fndt
Ok—FREE. Green’s Nursery 

29 Wall SL, Boches ter. V , I ,

Cayuga, N. Y . tical experience along this line, and 
believe that orchard heating is prac­
tical for "this state and has come to 
stay. He told of his methods of ac­
complishing his work and the arrange­
ments he had for storing the oil and 
filling the heaters in the orchard. An 
article on this subject by Mr. Low will 
appear in our columns soon.

Controlling the Aphis.
Mr. G. F. Leonard, a former M. A. C. 

man who has had considerable experi­
ence with tobacco extracts for spray­
ing purposes, spoke on “Aphis Con­
trol.” He gave the results of work 
along this line that various experiment 
stations have been carrying on. The 
conclusions reached as a result of 
these experiments are that the most 
effective time to spray for aphis is 
when the leaf buds are about ready to 
burst, the best spray to use being a 40 
per cent tobacco extract. This can 
either be used alone or with the lime- 
sulphur solution. It has been found 
that lime-sulphur is most effective in 
the control of scale if the spraying is 
delayed until this time, therefore it is 
becoming a common practice for fruit 
growers to wait as late in spring as 
possible with their, scale spraying. The 
addition of the tobacco extract at this 
time will keep the aphis in check if 
the work is done thoroughly. If to­
bacco extract is used alone the addi­
tion of soap improves its spreading 
and sticking qualities. All tobacco ex­
tracts are commercial products, there­
fore it is advisable for the grower to 
follow the directions given by the man­
ufacturer. There has been no method 
found of making tobacco extract at 
home, which would produce a satisfac­
tory mixture.

Prof, C. P. Halligan gave an instruc-<J

tive talk on "Spraying.” He said that 
in improving our methods of fruit 
growing, we should take into consider­
ation the limiting factor in fruit pro­
duction. This factor varies; in one or­
chard it may be cultivation, in another 
it may be fertilization, and not infre­
quently it is spraying. He urged the 
importance of timeliness in spraying 
and the necessity ot doing thorough 
work, if good results are expected. 
There are several new kinds of spray 
material which are proving very effi­
cient, and there is a rapidly growing 
use of these newer sprays: The pow­
dered form of sulphur spray has given 
very good results in the control of the 
scale, but has not proven entirely sat­
isfactory for summer spraying on ac­
count of causing some foliage injury. 
The use of the oil sprays is also in­
creasing very fast. The advantage in 
using a spray of this kind is that it 
spreads on the tree and therefore does 
not make necessary as exacting work 
to insure covering the tree thoroughly 
as does lime-sulphur. The use of a 
dust method of spraying is again claim­
ing attention, but the results of experi­
ments carried on in this state do not 
warrant the recommendation of this 
method. There has been much inquiry 
regarding a substitute for Bordeaux 
mixture on account of the high price 
of copper sulphate, but nothing has 
been found which will take the place 
of Bordeaux in the control of fungous 
diseases of the grape.

Prof. L. R. Taft recommended late 
spraying for scale with lime-sulphur 
at the strength of one gallon to eight 
and the summer use of lime-sulphur 
on all tree fruits except peaches and 
apples at one to 50. For apples strength 
should be one to forty. TEe use of 
arsenate of lead with lime-sulphur in 
summer sprays would control practi­
cally all of the chewing insects which 
attack the fruit and the use of the to­
bacco extract in the .scale spray would- 
make quite certain the control of the 
aphis. The scale spray when applied 
to the peach before the middle of 
Mareh would also keep in control the 
curl leaf. It has also been found that 
a fall spraying for curl leaf has been 
very effective.

Mr. Albert Griggs, of Pontiac, told 
of “The Development of Horticulture 
in Oakland County.” As Mr. Griggs’ 
experience extends to the early days 
of this development, his talk was an 
interesting account of Oakland county 
horticultural history,

Marketing Fruit.
In his talk on “Packing and Market­

ing Fruit,” Mr. Roland Morrill spoke 
of the value of co-operation in making 
marketing methods more economical. 
Honesty is one of the most important 
factors in the development of a good 
market. One should never pack fruit 
which he would not care to buy him­
self. The uniformity of grades and 
the use of a trade name or some dis­
tinguishing mark will help one greatly 
in establishing a reputation for his 
goods. When this reputation is estab­
lished, one will have no trouble in find­
ing a good outlet for his fruit.

Mr. Luther Hall, of Ionia, who has 
one of the most profitable Spy or­
chards in the state, spoke on “Produc­
ing Apples.” He said one of the chief 
essentials in getting good production 
was to have vigorous trees. He believr 
ed in liberal fertilization, but his meth­
od of doing this is somewhat unus­
ual. He found that the best fertilizer 
for his orchard was good Illinois corn. 
This was made in available form by 
the pigs which were pastured in the 
orchard. Mr. Hall’s method of or­
chard soil care is briefly as follows: 
He plows as early in spring as possi­
ble and after thorough cultivation the 
orchard is sowed to peas and oats in 
August. After this is harvested he 
turns in the hogs and feeds them corn. 
He has found that hogs will never 
bother the trees or root up the ground 
to any extent as long as they have 
plenty of feeding material. Shortly 
before harvesting time he mulches the 
trees by putting 150 to 200 pounds of

straw around each tree; this js done 
to conserve the moisture and also* to 
prevent the fruit which drops to the 
ground from bruising. He has a local 
sale for this fruit at 50* cents a bushel 
in the orchard. Mr. Hall believes in 
shaping his trees so that they can car­
ry a large load. He is a firm believed 
in the high heading of trees, especially 
of the Spy, because after bearing a 
few crops the limbs bend down so that 
they are easy to pick. His trees have 
borne an average of seven barrels each 
a year. He has found that when trees 
have a light bloom the fruit will be 
large, hut if the blossoming is heavy 
the fruit will be small, even if the tree 
is thinned! This is because the tree is 
weakened by producing so much bloom 
and pollen. With reference to his un­
usual methods of orchard culture, he 
did not claim that they would be adap­
table to all conditions, but said he was 
entirely satisfied with, them and had 
no thought of changing, as he thought 
it was not wise to change bait as long 
as the fishing was good.

WITH THE MICHIGAN FRUIT 
GROWERS.

The Mason CoUnty Fruit and Pro­
duce Association held its first annual 
meeting in Summit, and re-elected of­
ficers as follows : President, Jesse 
Houk; vice-president, Theodore' Er­
win; secretary, Guy Hawley; treasur­
er and sales manager, Martin Abra- 
hamso; director, C. D. Kistler. The 
society was successful beyond expec­
tations during the year, with apples 
and peaches the leading crops handled 
in earlots. The former membership 
of 12 will be largely increased this 
year.

Van Buren county members of the 
Hartford Fruit Growers’ & Farmers’ 
Exchange met at Hartford and elected 
the following officers: President, J. 
T. Wilkinson; vice-president, C. H. 
Mowry; secretary, Edward Corrette; • 
treasurer, G. W. Merriman. Two 
standing committees were appointed 
as follows: Arbitration, E. W. Ewald, 
Jacob Geisler and Edward Skinner; 
orchard inspection, Arthur Dowd, J. 
T. Wilkinson and Chas. S. Johnson. 
The Exchange has already placed an 
order for 300 barrels of spray mate­
rial for use of members.

Preparations are being made to 
raise large quantities of cranberries 
in the bog south of Alpena city, in Al­
pena county. Marked improvements 
have been made in clearing up the 
ground and an extensive acreage has 
been plated to vines. The Lakeside 
Cranberry Company is back of the ex- 
périment and has engaged E. V. Shaw, 
formerly of the Cape Cod cranberry 
belt in the east, to manage operations 
for another year. Mr. Shaw believes 
that Alpena cranberries will in time 
be as well known as the Cape Cods.

W. H. Pratt and Sons, who recently 
bought the Bo we farm of 160 acres in 
northern Berrien county, will set out 
the farm, except 10 acres of river bot­
tom land, to fruit. They will set 40 
40 acres of apples, 10 of peaches and 
10 of strawberries, adding other fruit 
later. A l m o n d  G r i f f e x .

CATALOG NOTICES.

Isbell’s seed annual for 1916 sent on 
request by S. M. Isbell & Co., Jackson, 
Mich., is a 120-page illustrated catalog 
listing a complete line of farm, garden 
and flower seeds offered by this firm. 
It •contains many illustrations of the 
produet of Isbell seeds.

The 1916 spring catalog of Paines- 
ville Nurseries will be sent upon re­
quest by the Stores & Harrison Co., ot 
Painesville, Ohio. This is a profusely 
illustrated catalog of 192 pages listing 
a complete line of farm, garden and 
flower seeds and plants, together with 
ornamental trees and shrubs for spring 
planting.

Hayes power sprayers manufactured 
by the Hayes Pump & Planter Co., 
Gaiva, III., are fully illustrated and de­
scribed in a 48-page art catalog sent 
upon request to interested readers of 
the Michigan Farmer. It illustrates 
and describes every detail of construc­
tion of the full line of sprayers manu­
factured by this company.
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IT 'S  A  CO M M O N -SEN SE C A R  TO  D R IV E — TH IS 3400 R. P. M. C H A L M E R S

Great energy ¿ in an engine will do one of 
two things.

It will either deliver great power or great all­
round performance. But it won't do both.

It was up to Chalmers engineers to decide 
which o f  the two would be the more desirable 
in the new 3400 r. p. m, Chalmers.

In early road and laboratory tests of this 
phenomenal engine's energy they found that it 
developed superfluous power.

The might o f this small engine was amazing; 
the temptation to let it deliver its full measure 
o f  might was tremendous.

But Hugh Chalmers said: “ Might isn’t 
everything. W e can't afford to sacrifice per­
formance to power. Keep her horse - power 
down. Get long mileage on gas—quicken her 
acceleration. Make her perform.’ '

So it was decided that the headlong power 
o f  the 3400 r. p. m. Chalmers must be held in 
check—by the curb-bit o f  fuel-economy.

Thus it added mileage to might, made every 
gallon o f gas kick in with 18 miles o f wonderful 
flight, with an uninterrupted flow of silken, 
miraculous acceleration, and speed up to sixty 
miles an hour.

But bore, stroke, and engine speed remained 
unchanged. It still recorded its 3400 revolu­
tions per minute.

As long as motor cars run on gasoline, ex­
treme racing speed will be as prohibitive in cost

to the average user as extreme racing speed in 
a horse.

A  Dan Patch is not for the average stable— 
an interesting sort o f beast, but pretty useless 
when it comes to the prosaic requirements o f  
the day's work in town or country.

W hen Mr. Chalmers refused to O. K. the 
sacrifice o f all-round performance to mere brute 
might, he saved the owner o f the 3400 r. p. m. 
Chalmers from $150 to $200 per year in cost o f gas.

And so it's a common-sense car for a farmer 
to drive, because thrift is the first law o f scien­
tific farming. This car does not require a big 
burnt offering on the altar o f useless might.

Its pick-up and ease of control will astound 
you the moment you set foot on the accelerator 
button. You can shoot ahead o f another car's 
dust at will. No jar or sidesway—always four 
wheels on the road—you slip up the hills on 
high—your direction is straight and true.

Big and roomy; 115 inches o f wheelbase; 
Westinghouse starting and lighting; deep, rich, 
genuine full-grain leather upholstery; stunning 
color options.

The next time you go to town, go and see 
this car; you feel already that this is the car 
you must own.

$1050 Detroit 
$1475 in Canada

Chalmers Motor Company, Detroit, Michigan

Quality FUnt
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Let the Olds 
Do It

f  i f ?
Let the OLDS engine do your 

f a r m w o r k :  your 
pumping, churning, 
sawing, run your 
electric light plant, 
etc.

Let the OLDS give you satisfaction under our liberal guar­
antee—Jasts'you a lifetime, always ready to run, easy to start 
in coldest weather, develops full rated horsepower.

Let the OLDS save you money in fuel expensé. The OLDS
doesn’t eat up gasoline. It is known all over the world for 
the small amount of fuel it uses.

Let the OLDS save you trouble. The OLDS is so built that
it is easy to repair. The cylinder is cast separate from 
the bed; you don’t have 
to tear down the engine 
when you want to repair 
the cylinder. The valves 
are vertical and in sepa­
rate cages; you don’t 
have to take off the cyl­
inder head when you 
need to have the valves 
reground. These fea­
tures save you trouble, 
cost of expert help and 
loss of time.

Let the OLDS mixer prove to you
the quality of the engine.
It is an exclusive, pat­
ented feature. It has no 
moving parts to wear out: no plunger to keep 
in repair: no pump to repack. The OLDS 
mixer will never wear out.

Cattle Feeding In Michigan
Please give us an article on “Dry Feeding of Cattle in Michigan.” What 

I  woulcHike is the personal experience of a practical feeder. S u b s c r ib e s .

ST is impossible to give a complete dition. For this reason the steers 
treatise on cattle feeding within which showed evidence of having been 
the limits 6f a single article, on scant pasture were fed on a choice 

which might be published in these col- grade of alfalfa without grain for the 
umns. So much depends upon the sit- first three or four weeks, after which 
uation in which the prospective cattle they were gotten onto a ration of eight 
feeder finds himself as to the kind and pounds of corn per day per head and 
quantity of feeds on hand, the cattle the second grade alfalfa hay, a bunch 
available for feeding purposes, the of hogs being run in the same yard
barn room which may be devoted to 
the enterprise, and the manner in

with thV steers. They are fed loose 
in a large stable with tight bottom

which it is equipped, the market in mangers around the outside for feed- 
which the cattle must be sold when ing both grain and hay, with access at 
finished and last, but not least, the all times to an automatic drinking 
kind of labor to be employed in the fountain. The manure is hauled from
feeding operation. the stable directly to the field with a

a m o n gLet the OLDS number you
150.000 satisfied users.

R E LIA N C E  E N G IN EER IN G  COM PANY
9 9 7  W a ln u t S t. L a n s in g , M ich igan

Increases Value of Horses 
and Mules to Clip
When thè heavy coat that holds the w et sweat and 
dirt is removed they get more good from  their feed, 
are healthier aad work better. They are more easily
kept clean and their improved appearance greatly 
adds to «hair eel I ing pries. It  also pays to  el ip the 

and udders or your oown 
Clip them with the famous

tlanka and udders ol 
«■ilk.

sur oown yew gat dean

Stewart Bearing Machine
I t  tarns easier, d ips faster and closer and stays sharp 
longer than any other. Gears are cot from  solid 
steel bar. They are enclosed, protected mid run in 
oil: little friction, little wear. Has six feet o f  new 

style easy running flexible shaft and the cele- 
k brated Stewart single tension clipping head, 

highest grade. Price complete, o n ly  $ 7 .5 0 .

As a general proposition it may be manure spreader as it accumulates, 
said without fear of successful contra- whenever weather conditions are fav- 
diction that the principal object of fat- oratole for this work, 
tening cattle in Michigan or elsewhere Handled in this way the labor cost 
should be considered as the marketing of feeding these cattle is reduced to 
of home-grown feeds or available by- the minimum, being less in fact, than 
products at a fair price, at the same would be the dost of marketing the 
time retaining the fertilizing value of hay in any other manner. The steers 
the feeds consumed upon the farm, for cost $5.75 per cwt. in the Detroit mar­
ks enrichment to thè benefit of future ket, and if they bring $7 per cwt, or 
crops. Given these conditions, that is more in the spring, we figure that they 
to say, a supply of available feed, eith- will return a fair profit, aside from the 
er grain or roughage, for which it is value of the feed consumed, 
desired to furnish a home market and The above facts are related simply 
suitable stable room in which to con- to illustrate the attitude which the 
duct the feeding operation, if the feed- prospective cattle feeder should take 
ers are purchased wisely and the feed- toward the feeding business in order 
ing operations conducted intelligently, to make it a profitable enterprise. Un­
cattle feeding offers a very good solu- der different circumstances an entirely 
tion for the home marketing of these different plan should be carried out,

I surplus products in an advantageous depending upon the premises which 
manner and the possibility of making obtain. If, for instance, the feeder has 
a fair profit on the transaction from a a surplus of corn silage on hand, this 
commercial standpoint. The inexperi- can be profitably utilized in cattle feed- 
enced man who attempts cattle feeding ing but the plan of feeding should be 
in Michigan with the idea of reaping altogether different. If a different 
large profits on the feeding operation class of feeders are more cheaply 
itself is more than likely to be disap- available, then the plan of feeding

Get one from  yonr dealer or send 92 and we 
will ehip C. O. D. fo r  balance. Money and 
transportation costs back if  not satisfied. 

CHICAGO P L i n i L I  SHAFT CO. B614 N. LaSalle St. CHICAQO, IU .J

T his L even  C on trols E n tire  Row
With West Bend Automatic 

I Swinging Stanchions you can 
I lock up or release a to 50 cows 
I at eae throw of a lever as easy as 

you can operate one stanchion 
with other equipment. This 
is only one of the many value 

1 able, time- n— .. Co

T h e W est Bend line Includes Steel and Wood Stanch!on»(antomstically 
and Individually operated), Feed aad Litter Carriers, Watering Bowls 

and complete systems. W rit* today for fro* catalog thawing ontirr Uou, | 
W est Bend B am  E quipm ent C o. 263 S o. W ater S t., W est Bend, W is.

E Q U IP M E N T

Feeding Capacity, 
, 59 te SO .Pigs

Self-Feeder for Pigs and Lambs
Karas Its cost first month—Sold on 3fl Days' trial 

MSeif-fed pigs gain faster”  says Iowa Experiment Station., This new self- 
feeder meets all their requirements. Endorsed by breeders. Saves feed and 
labor. Six separate bins for salt, corn, tankage, middlings, oil meal, etc. Water proof. 
Keeps feed dry and sweet. Strong, handsome, well built. Has adjustable trough 
made of 2 in. lumber. Sliding bar to keep out larger pigs. Automatic agitator.

MAKE MORE MONEY IN HOGS THIS YEAR
by having this self-feeder. Sold on 80 DAYS’ TRIAL. Write today for full particulars. 
J  A. C. HOYT A  CO.._________  Dead. M FOSTORIA, OHIO

CAN T  PLAY POSSUM 
WITH A SABO TRAP

Here Mr. Trapper, is a trap which is placed in the 
animal’s burrow; requires no| bait and is positively sure-catoh first trip in or out.

Our free  b o o k le t  explains this wonderful trap; 
shows how to increase your toatch and profits with 
saving of time and labor; shows how to make trapping a bu sin ess p rop os it ion .

Write for booklet today. Agents wanted.
SABO TRAP MANUFACTURING CO.,
3120 W. 25th St., Cleveland, Ohio

When Writing to Advertisers Please 
Mention The Michigan Farmer.

T H I S
B U G G

*  8 0

Jerfnl buggy for the money end we ■hip it one h  d a y s
w w  Free Trial 
Subject to your approval. It** another proof o f Elkhart 
Quality and the aaving made you by our factory to user plan.

Write for Big Buggy Bargain Book
and read how 48 years experience naa taught ua how to give the moot for the money in wearing quality, appearance and general satisfaction ana by cutting out agenar ana dealers' profits save you $25 or more on each buggy.
175 Styles Buggies and 15 Styles Harness
are illustrated and described. Don't buy without seeing 
our book. ▲ postal brings it free. Better write today. 
ELKHART CARRIAGE A  HARNESS MFC. CO. 

714 Beardsley Ave., Elkhart, led.

CULL BEANS FOR FEED. 2 ? í & ,S i2S
YOUNG-RANDOLPH SEED CO, Owoeso, Mich.

pointed.
An illustration.

A3 above noted, the first considera­
tion in an enterprise of this kind

should be varied accordingly. If a lo­
cal market is available in which the 
feeding cattle can be marketed to ad­
vantage in any particular stage of fin-

should, in the writer’s opinion, depend ish, then that fact should be taken in- 
upon the supply of feeds for which it to consideration and a plan adopted 
is desired to create a home market. To which will make the venture most 
illustrate: the writer found himself profitable under those conditions, 
this winter with a considerable quan- The Choice of Methods,
tity of alfalfa hay on hand, much of The writer has fed cattle of many 
which had been so damaged by the ex- market grades under a variety of con- 
ceedingly unfavorable weather during ditions and is firmly convinced that 
the haying season as to be saleable the man who would make a profit in 
only at a price which was considerably cattle feeding in Michigan must give 
below its actual feeding value. As a careful consideration to all of the fac- 
means of creating a home market for tors above noted and use good judg- 
this product, a bunch of fairly good ment in every phase of the operation 
feeding steers was purchased in the from the purchase of the feeding stock 
Detroit market during the heavy runs to the final marketing of the finished 
which occurred in November when product. Under present market condi- 
they eould be purchased at a price tions and present feed costs, two meth- 
which seemed to offer a fair opportu- ods may be profitably considered with 
nity of making a margin of profit on the grade of feeding cattle ordinarily 
the feeding operation besides supply- available. One is the warming up 
ing a profitable home market for this process above described which will 
quantity of second-grade alfalfa hay. permit the lengthening of the feeding 
In order to utilize the hay in this man- period if market conditions are not 
ner it was necessary to purchase the favorable at the time when it was orig- 
grain to be fed with it. After a care- inally intended to dispose of the cat­
ful study of the market good number tie without entailing a necessary loss 
three corn was purchased before re- upon the feeder. Where cattle are put 
cent advances in the gram market, upon full feed and crowded through a 
costing 73 cents per bushel delivered, five or six months’ feeding period they 

Sizing up the Situation. cannot be held after a desirable finish
In view of the general situation, it is obtained without entailing such loss, 

did not seem reasonable to expect a and at present prices of feedstuffs they 
high market for finished cattle of the must be a very desirable grade of 
grade which these steers would make feeders which will finish into a product 
next spring, for several reasons. First of exceptional quality and must be 
among these was the badly frosted sold in an appreciative market, to re­
corn in the northern sections of the pay the cost of feed consumed, to stHy 
corn belt which, together with the nothing of making the feeder a profit 
high price which grains of all kinds above that cost.
How command, seemed certain to cause 
heavy marketings of cattle from all 
sections of the country. On this ac-

The other plan which affords a pos­
sibility of profit, is a short feed on a 
full ration which will quickly put the

count, after a careful survey of the cattle into fair market condition and 
situation and in view of the fact that thus reduce the length of the feeding 
the primary object in this feeding ven- period to the minimum. This is a plan 
ture was to market as much alfalfa which finds favor with experienced 
hay through these steers as could be feeders who desire to find a profitable 
profitably done, we decided not to un- home market for a surplus grain pro- 
dertake to finish them in a manner to duct, rather than of highly nutritive 
make market toppers but to feed them forage, as was the case with the writ- 
fairly well and market them in what is er this season, 
technically known as a warmed-up con- (Continued on page 278).
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CABBAGE FOR SHEEP.

I would like some advice about the 
value of cabbage for feeding sheep, 
and what could one afford to pay for 
them for that purpose? I have 42 head 
of high-grade Shropshires and raise 
early lambs, that is, from the first of 
February Jto the first of April. The 
present season they will drop from 
February 20 to March 15. I have clo­
ver hay, bean pods, and cornstalks for 
roughage and oats for grain. Would 
like to know about cabbage as a green 
food as I have no turnips or silage to 
feed for milk producing. Cabbage are 
selling at threS cents per head, or less 
in large lots. What are they worth 
per pound to feed in my case?

Newaygo Co. O. C. W.
By comparing the food analysis of 

cabbage with that of rutabagas, sil­
age, etc., one can get a good idea of its 
value. Cabbage is certainly just as
palatable and as digestible as any
green succulent food.

Crude
Protein.

Carbohy­
drates. Fat.Turnips ........ 0.9 6.4 0 .1Cabbage ........ .. 2.3 8.9 0 .1

Rutabagas ... . 1 .0 8.1 0.2Corn silage .. . 1.4 14.2 0.7
Corn silage does not contain so much 

. water as either rutabagas or cabbage, 
in fact only about one-half as much, 
and this must be taken into consider­
ation. It will be noticed that cabbage 
is comparatively rich in protein which 
is valuable. It contains more than 
twice as much as rutabagas, nearly as 
much starch and sugar and half as 
much fat. The analysis will show that 
cabbage_is worth more than rutabagas.

When ohe considers that silage is 
much drier, containing 26 pounds of 
dry matter to 100 pounds of silage, 
and cabbage contains only 10 pounds, 
then 100 pounds of silage would con­
tain as much protein as 100 pounds of 
cabbage. It would contain five times 
as much starch and sugar, and 17 
times as much fat. I would estimate 
from this analysis that cabbage is 
worth only about half as much as 
corn silage and fully as much as ruta 
bagas or turnips. Corn silage is usu 
ally figured at $3.50 to $4.00 per ton. 
This would make cabbage worth $2.50 
to $3.00 per ton, but as you have no 
succulent feed, you can afford to pay 
more than that.

C o l o n  C . L t l l t r

More Cash From
The Same Cows«-

■ IM £  is m oney and it costs’* time to take care o f  cow s. 
And the profit com es from the milk they yield. So— 
S T A R  B A R N  E Q U IP M E N T  b y  cutting labor cost in 

half, sa v es  you  money. And by making the animals give 
tn o re  milk, and b e t te r  milk, it in c r e a s e s  your profits. Inci­
dentally, don’t forget it offers health insurance as well. That’s 
how  S T A R  B A R N  E Q U IP M E N T  gives you  “ more cash 
from  the same cow s.”

It 8 about time you looked into this matter o f  cutting costs and rais- 
ing profits in the dairy business. * W e l l  show  you how. A n d — there’ s 
no theory about things that are dow n in cold , hard figures on the record 
books o f  the best dairymen in America.

lieel Stalls.

The STAR
Curb Clamp

(PATENTED)

T H IS device, now  used on  
all S T A R  S T A L L S , marks 
a revolution in stall setting. 

Sixty seconds w ill set a stall—  
the same length o f  time will re­
m ove one. A nd you  can finish 
u p  your curb right alongwith the 
rest o f  the concrete work without 
the use o f  templets or anchors 
and know that the stalls will fit 
when they arrive.

And the Star Curb Clamp holds 
a stall as Solid as a Rock.

LIVE STOCK NEWS.

Several new high winter records for 
prime lambs, wethers, ewes and year­
ling wethers have been made recently, 
and no one appears to tliink the limit 
has been reached, jjp great is the 
shortage in feeding districts. Most of 
the winter feeding is being carried on 
in Colorado, Utah and portions of Ne­
braska, and the Utah flocks will find 
their way when finished to the Pacific 
coast markets. With such a lack of 
live muttons in the United States, it is 
no wonder that there is a wide-spread 
desire to get in the industry, and the 
few flocks of breeders and feeders that 
are offered on the markets of the coun­
try are sure to bring fancy prices. The 
range is steadily contracting, and little 
danger exists of overdoing the produc­
tion of sheep or lambs in the next few 
years. In- Idaho* early lambing is find­
ing general favor, and it is stated that 
sheepmen are looking for a good many 
spring lambs in March and April. Re­
cently a sale was reported of 8,000 
lambs in Montana for $8 per 100 lbs. 
laid down in Billings, the owner ship­
ping them to his feed lots in Colorado, 
and about the same time a band of four 
thousand head of stock ewes was pur­
chased by an Idaho sheepman at the 
unheard of price of $10.75 per head. 
They were just good range stock, not 
pure-breds, all bred and bought for de­
livery the first day of March. The 
ewes are expected to produce at least 
an average of one lamb per ewe, and 
to shear in the coming spring about $2 
worth of wool per head.

In a feeding trial with 159 pigs, some 
fed during the summer and some in 
winter, on the average 4.13 pounds of 
corn meal were consumed to produce 

N one pound of live weight, the maxi­
mum being 5.2 pounds and the mini­
mum 3.24 pounds of meal, says a re­
port from an agricultural station in 
Ireland. It was found that the aver­
age daily gain in weight made T)y a 
large number of pigs fed on barley, 
bran, or corn was practically the same. 
The pigs fed on barley produced a bet­
ter quality of pork than those fed on corn.

The next best thing to seeing the goods is reading our catalogues. T h ey  are free on 
request and well worth owning. Send for them. S T A R  S T E E L  S T A L L S  are built in ourfac- 
tory instead o f  your barn— they are sold on the Unit System— the Arched Construction 
gives strength the Alignm ent D evice is simple and positive— the Star Curb Clamp en­
ables you  to finish up the curb with the rest o f  the concrete work. Our stalls are 
equipped with the w ood-lined G IA N T  S T A R  ST A N C H IO N — it adjusts to fit all size 
necks— has the One Hand Lock, and the quiet Double Chain H anging— has a  Sure Stop 
that s automatic and is the strongest stanchion made. T he biggest labor saver in the 

,  | ■ . # barn 'is the Star Litter Carrier— we have the
H arvester H a y  C arrier most. com plete line o f  litter and feed carriers 

~ in this country. Roller Bearing— D ouble L ock­
ed Tubs and Swinging B oom  to free barnyard 
o f  obstructions. W rite for our catalogues today.

B iggest in size and value. Roller 
Bearing and Built for H eavy Duty. 
Ask your dealer or write us for details.

C D C C  B A R N  • n e t  P L A N S
Let us help you design your new barn or remodel 

your old one. Our Barn Plan Department is at your 
service and Blue Prints are free. Let us know your 
wants.

In  w riting, stale wliether interested in Stalls, L itter 
Carriers,Stanchions,H ay Tools o r  Barn D oor H angers

Stair G oods Siold By Best D ealers Everyw here

HUNT, HELM , FERRIS &  CO.
1 3  H u n t  S t r e e t  H a r v a r d ,  I l l i n o i s

_ . Write for Literatures FREE 
— a 169 page, profusely 
illustrated book o f  valu­
able barn data i f  you 
write, mentioning the 
number o f  cows you 
keep, whether you intend 
to build or remodel your 
barn # and when. Also 
mention what you are 
interested in. Litter ear­
ners, Hay Tools, Barn 
Door Hangers, and we 
will include catalog of same.

FRUIT TREES and FRUIT PLANTS, ORNAMENTAL TPETQ
_  iinirim  S H R U B S  o f  a ll k in d s . S e n d  fo r  C a ta lo g . 1
T . B. WEST, MAPLE BEND NURSERY, Lock Box 108, PERRY, 0 .

LEARN AUCTIONEERING
and becom e independent with no capital invested, 
"v e ry  o f  the business taught in  5 weeks*
W rite today fo r  free catalog.
JONES* N AT*L SC H O O L O F  A U C T IO N E E R IN G ! 
28 N. Sacramento Blvd., Chicago, 111.. Carey M. Jones, Pres*

Stumps O ut- Quick and Easy
Here at last is the land clearing device you have been looking for—the Kirstin One-Man Stump Puller—a simple, 

powerful, practical Puller that one can handle and operate with ease. No big, expensive, cumbersome outfit—no 
horses to drive—no extra work of any kind. With the Kirstin, one man alone clears land quickly, easily, economi­
cally. Costs little to begin with—nothing for upkeep—and costs far less to operate than any other hand 

■■ mm m - A  or horse power puller on the market. In the• ___ , ^ 0  or horse power puller on the market. In the

lrs lm  One-Man Stump Puller
11 alltV TIPPil pH fnt* land d o n  r ! n — ».L Th* V1 ref}»» ran ho nra4 an.m.lioao_ n i l M j j . .  »___________you get every quality needed for land clearing—strength, 

The Kirstin is the only stump puller with vari­
able speeds. This gives you a big ad vantage—saves much 
time. Tostartthe tough stumps, you have enormous towers 
then when the stump breaks loose, a turn of a wrench gives 
greater steed. Any and all kinds of stumps— big, little, green, 
ary, tough—also trees and hedges—are pulled quick and 
easy. The Kirstin holds the record for lowest cost of 
operation. Prove our claims by

Ten Days Try-Out on Y our  Farm
With the Improved Double Leverage Kir­

stin you can clear over an acre from one anchor. 
Also no time wasted in frequent re-setting of 

puller. The Kirstin is designed to save time. 
When you get a Kirstin you get a complete, 

practical Stump Pulling Outfit at little 
test—-end you are protected by the 

K irstin  Iron -C lad  G uarantee.

The Khstin can be used anywhere—on hillsides, in swamps and 
On tough ground or in thick timber where no other puller could 
be used. The Government uses Kirstins—so do several of the 
State Experiment Stations—and thousands o f land owners front 
Maine to  California and from Canada to the Gulf are loyal 
boosters for the Kirstin .because ft has demonstrated 
its superiority as a land clearing device. If you have 
only a couple of acres of stump land you can't afford 
to let it lay idle. Get a Kirstin now—clear out those 
stumps—make youridle land pay you a profit.

Get the Kirstin Catalog—Today!
Any one having stump land should get this 

valuable free book at once. It tells all about 
the wonderful Kirstin One-Man Stump 
Fuller« the Kirstin Service Bureau, t h e  
Payment Plans and fully explains easiest« 
best, cheapest way to clear your land*

Fill outthe coupon or mail 
• postal—today—now 1

A «  3m K I R S T I N  C O . ,  5 9 2 9  L o d in ftoo  St*
I E. Morrison St. Emuka. Midi. 4236 Dennis St. 
Portland, Oregon SaultSte. Marie« Oat.

FREE] _ Book! 
C o u p o n

J. KIRSTIN CO.,
'  5929 Ludington S t., 

Escanaba, Mich. 
Please send me yonr f r e e  

book on Stump pulling.

™ ..................... ....................... J
f .D .o r
) . Box.. . . . . .  S t a t e . _ |
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CATTLE FEEDING-. IN NUCHIGAN.

Expert Builders 
Specify Natco

Profit by the ex­
perience o f the 
w orld 's  greatest 
architects. The man 
who designed'the build­
ing shown here, the Com­
mercial National Bank 
Building; of Chicago, knew 
that he was' using the most 
lasting and safest of all mater- 

Follow his splendid example.

feuild WithNatco HollowTile?
Best for the city—best for the farm. Erect a Natc°
Imperishable Silo—“ The Silo That Lasts For Gener- JlMM  YiD.Ji.lU 
ations.”  Catalog sent for the asking. Build a hom e. - 

you'll be-proud o f — use Natco tile 
make it warm in winter, cool in sum­
mer, safe, healthy and comfortable.
Build a Natco Cbm Crib, Milk /
House, Garage, Barn, etc. W e r,v\\ 
have plans for all kinds of farm 
buildings — Free. Write for 
our new book “ Natco On 
The Farm,”  and tell us 
what kind, o f a build­
ing you are planning to 
build. We will help 
you save m oney by 
building permanently.
Write today.Natco Corn Crib -==

National
Fire Proofing Company

1115 Fulton Building
Pittsburgh, Pa.
23 Factories—Short hauls— 

Prompt shipments.

(Continued from page 276).
Cattle feeding is a business which 

the novice should grow into rather 
than go into on a large scale. Itris a 
business in which experience counts 
and in the prosecution of which good 
business judgment must be used on 
the part of the feeder. The man who 
adopts a method or plan of cattle feed­
ing simply because some successful 
feeder has found it profitable, when 
the conditions under which he oper­
ates may be altogether different, is 
well started on the road to disappoint­
ment. On the other hand, cattle feed­
ing does afford a remunerative market 
for home-grown products or cheaply 
available by-products and has proven 
a profitable specialty for many farm­
ers and a valuable side line for very 
many more. Th£ average Michigan 
farmer should, in the writer’s opinion, 
however, look upon cattle feeding as 
a possibly profitable side line rather 
than as a specialty.

stimulated for- a few days. Give the 
sow plenty of water as she is in a fev­
erish condition, but take the chill off 
of it if the day is cold. It is not nec­
essary to feed the sow fôr a day or 
two and the first feed given should 
consist of a small amount of thin slop, 
which should be gradually increased 
as the pigs become able to take more 
milk. In two weeks tîïne she should 
be on full feed which should consist of 
a good, laxative, milk-producing feed. 
There is no better way of feeding the 
pigs than through the mother, so feed 
the sow for the greatest amount of 
milk.

Mo. Agri. Col. L. A. W e a v e s .

MAKING PROGRESS IN HORSE 
BREEDING.

CARE OF THE SOW AT FARROW­
ING TIME.

Two 1 4 x 3 2  Natco Imperish• 
able Silos on farm of James 
A , Lowe, Algonquin, IÜ,

G U A R A N T E E D  Glazed tile or (our
I  I  kinds wood stave. Haul

a *  I  ■  |  f i f i “  and easily erect Kala-
I  I  I  | NSi mazoo Silos when farm
I  1 J  O  labor is most plentiful 
™ and cheap. Freight

T i l e  o r  S t a v e  |0  y OUI. home
town - Red wood doors, continuous opening 
door frame. Tile silos anchored by weight. 
Fire and frost proof. Superior to cement. 
Save money, too, by early-in-year shipments 
direct from nearest kiln, on factory to farm 
co-operation sales plan. Ask for booklet 
and details. Silo users make best local agents.

Write today— Dept. 621. 
K A L A M A Z O O  T A N K  &  S IL O  CO. 

K A L A M A Z O O , MICH.

NY silo is better than no silo, 
L  but no silo is better than the

in
Get our catalog and the book that tells 

what owners o f the Indiana Silo think 
about it. ,

Write today for early buyers’  money-saying 
proposition. Address nearest office.

THE INDIANA SILO CO., 582 Union Bldy„Andermon,Ind. 
Kansas City, Mo. D m  Moines. lie Fori Worth, TOx. 
£39 Exoheogo Bldg. gg2 Indian* Bide» 682 H**®10** **•

HIPPED ON 
APPROVAL

The INDE­
PENDENT SILO is 

manufactured of the best 
material. Splendid workmanship, 
dependable anchoring system and 
you can examine your suo at your 
station before you accept it.
Send fo r  free  
catalog. p K e/B»

g  • ^ ^ ^ A T A L O G U E

Independent silo co.
2316 TTnivevsity Ava 

8U I . O. O .F . B ldg.,
, St. Paul, M inn. 
Indianapolis; lad .

MAPLE SYRUP MAKERS
The Grimm Evaporator

TJfod by principal 
maple syrup makers 
everywhere. Saving 
of time and fuel alone 
will pay for the out­
fit. Writ# foe cata­
logue and state num* 
bear of trees you tap.

GRIMM MANUFACTURING CO. 
619-821 Champlain kn., I. W. Cleveland, Ohio,

T H E  T I M E ,  N O W !
All the winter long, the troubled owner 
of a lame horse reads our advertise­
ments. Then, day after day slips away 
while he talks, laments, listens, takes 
advice and hesitating—FAILS TO A CT—  
till the Springtime is on him and his horse 
is not yet able to work. Meantime the 
thrifty, prosperous, resolute man reads, 
considers the e v id e n c e  carefully — 
Decides Prom ptly— and his horse is quickly 
cured, worked, too, if  needed. That’s 
exactly what happens every winter.

“ I  W o n t  the W h o le  W o r ld  to  K n ow  What It Haa 
Done For Me.” — Frank Stevens, o f  Greenwood, Ind., 
and adds : “  Save-The-Horse has cured bone spavin, 
thoroughpin, and one with a sprained stifle.”

O ur Charges fo r  T reatm ent A R C  M O D E R A T E . 
But write for  our 9 6  page “ S A V E -T H E -H O R S E  
BO O K  ” —it is the last word on the U P -T O -D A T E  
treatment o f  68 kinds o f  L a m e n e s s —R in g b o n e  — 
Thoroughpin — S P A V IN  — and A L L  Shoulder, Knee, 
Ankle, H oof, and Tendon Disease, — Fully HiIiUBTBATBD, 

WE ORIGINATED the plan o f  giving a Signed 
Contract Bond to return money if remedy fails.

B u t w rite. B O O K , Sam ple Contract and A D V I C E -  
A L L  F R E E  (to Htorse O w ners and M anagers), A ddress 
TROY CHEMICAL CO., 20 Commerce Ave., Binghamton, N.Y.
Druggists Everywhere sell Save-The-H orse with CQ N - 
TR A C T. or w e send by Parcel Post or Express paid.

#n O O S IE R s'io
EXTENSION-ROOT

Th e H OO SIER ROOF w ill make your silo 100% 
efficient. No lost space by your ensilage settling. 
I t  is the kind o f  silo roo f you have been looking 
for. W rite nearest office fo r  catalogue and learn 
why H OOSIER customers say that the “ H OO SIER 
ROOF ought to be on every silo.”

SHEET METAL SPECIALTY COMPANY
802 New Y ork Street, Goshen, Ind.
302 Ann Arbor Savings Bank, Ann Arbor, M ich.

N e w  E d it io n  (pages) o f  V  
Modern Silage Methods /Á

T7NTIRELY a  n e w  book—n e w  
chapters—tells facts about every 

type o f  silo—home made, stave, 
bri ck. cement, tile .metal ,pit, 
etc.Tells bestfor your needs 

. —impartial suggestions fo r  
fnakihg most profits.264 pages 

. —10 page index—Copyrighted 
.Nov.1914,covers 41 silage crops. 

. Send for new book; it  Deats all 
previous editions. Write today, 
■Mailed for  10c. Mention this 
paper. Silver M fg . C o., Salem, 0,

Farrowing time is one of the most 
important times of the year for the 
breeder of swine. Often a man de­
stroys his chances of success by neg­
lect at this time. While the number 
of pigs a sow farrows is important, the 
number she raises determines whether 
she is being kept at a profit or loss. A 
sow that farrows five pigs and raises 
all of them is more profitable than one 
which farrows fifteen but raises only 
two or three. The disposition of the 
sow has much to do with the number 
of pigs she will raise, but proper care 
at farrowing time is also an important 
factor.

A week or so before she is due to 
farrow the sow should be removed 
from the other sows and placed in the 
quarters where she is to farrow. It is 
best to feed her a ration high in pro­
tein and rather laxqtive in its nature, 
similar to the feed she is to receive 
while suckling her pigs. At the Mis­
souri Agricultural Experiment Station 
good results have followed the use of 
a ration of corn, 50 per cent; shorts, 
25 per cent; bran, 15 per cent; and 
linseed oil meal, 10 per cent—all by 
weight. As the farrowing date comes 
closer the ration should be reduced 
somewhat. This will bring thè sow up 
to farrowing time in good condition. 
She will not be so feverish and rest­
less, so there will be less danger of 
her mashing her pigs when she far­
rows. .

An important precaution to be ob­
served in caring for the farrowing sow 
is not to supply her with too much 
bedding; a bushel of wheat chaff or 
cut straw is good. If the place where 
the sow is to farrow is warm it will 
not be needed for warmth. The dan­
ger of supplying too much bedding is 
that the pigs will be covered by it and 
be smothered or crushed. It may be 
necessary to change the bedding after 
the sow farrows but the amount should 
not be increased.

The less a sow is disturbed at far­
rowing time the better, and for that 
reason she should be kept separate 
from the other hogs. While someone 
should be on hand, unless s)ie needs 
assistance it is best to keep away from 
her. If it does become necessary to 
help her, do it as quietly as possible.

The pigs should not be chilled before 
they have dried off and suckled, so if 
the weather is cold a lantern hung in 
the top of the cot will be of service. If 
the sow is gentle it is well to take 
each pig away from her as soon as it 
is farrowed and place it in a box or 
barrel containing some hot bricks cov­
ered with old sacks. After the pigs 
have dried off and are lively enough, 
they may be put with the -sow. In case 
the pigs do become chilled, the best 
way to revive them is to dip them in 
hot water.

As the pigs are not able to take 
much milk, the flow should not be

No noticeable progress can be made 
in breeding animals of any species so 
long as the breeding stock consists of 
unsound individuals or is of unknown 
breeding. The country is over-run with 
grade and scrub stock of all kinds, and 
in the breeding of horses there has 
been much misunderstanding regard­
ing the real requirements. A definite 
plan for breeding has been lacking. 
Some farmers have attempted to im­
prove their stock by grading up with 
pure-bred sires, but oftentimes unsuit­
able types have been used and all sorts 
of crosses have been made. The result 
has been naturally unsatisfactory.

Looking upon breeding as a business 
proposition, why do some farmers per­
sist in allowing $5 or $i0 in service 
fee to make a difference of $100 in the 
value of the colt? The higher service 
fee, with a pure-bred sire, has always 
proved profitable. There is a ready, 
appreciative outside market for a good 
grade colt, while the scrub goes to a 
local buyer at a low figure.

Although some farmers have come 
to appreciate the importance of using 
sound, pure-bred stallions, many farm­
ers have not comprehended that sound 
mares are important. When a-mare 
has closed her usefulness as a work 
horse, because of a weakness, she is 
ofttimes set aside for breeding. So 
long as this is continued, unsound 
horses will beget unsound horses, and 
value in horse flesh will not increase 
as it could be made to with a little 
thought in the selection of the best 
mare for the purpose.

By gradual processes the farming 
communities of Europe replaced their 
scrub stallions with pure-breds. They 
learned by experience that the greatest 
profits were gained by the production 
of pure-bred and high-grade stock, and 
in many breeding centers they would 
not keep or patronize a non-registered 
sire. In Great Britain practically all 
farmers recognize the importance of 
using pure-bred sires, and only such 
as are used in various districts whence 
come the many well-known British 
breeds of horses.

The great war will devastate Europe 
of her prize stock, which will mean 
that countries such as the’ United 
States, will need to supply the future 
world’s supply of horses. It would be 
a good move in the proper direction if 
every community should organize a 
horse-breeders’ association, on the co­
operative basis. Granges and other 
societies should see to it that the horse 
receives his due attention along with 
the other farm animals. Most farmers 
do not appreciate the value of a horse 
until they come to purchase one. And 
why should any farmer buy horses? 
Every farmer* in America should be 
breeding his own stock.

New York. E a r l  W. G a g e .

CATALOG NOTICE.
“Will they Freeze?” This question 

is answered in a booklet sent upon re­
quest by the Canton Culvert & Silo 
Co., Canton, Ohio, manufacturers of 
Zyro metal silos. It contains testimon­
ials of many users on this point.

Du Pont Magazine, published month­
ly by I. E. Du Pont de Nemours & Co., 
Wilmington, Del., contains much valu­
able information on the use of ex­
plosives for the various industrial pur­
poses to which they are adapted; Send 
for a copy, mentioning this paper.
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The Man, the Cow and the Farm
By W . M IL T O N  K E L L Y

ILK, cream, butter and cheese plement his pastures, feeds regularly 
jLVA have long been recognized as and with good judgment, has an abund- 

among the best of the material ance of pure water and salt at hand at 
good things of life. Natural, then, and all times and keeps the mangers and 
not strange, is “it that man has com- feeding places clean and sanitary. The, 
mercialized the dairy cow. In all coun- dry cows are given special-attention 
tries where, the dairy industry has so that they may build up their bodies 
made its greatest progress we find the and nervous systems for the great 
highest type of civilization. Scientists strain of the next lactation period. In 
have no difficulty in tracing the rise addition he studies the question of j 
of civilization as concomitant with the economy of transport and the best 
growth of the dairy industry; hence I methods of buying and selling dairy 
offer no apology for linking the man foods and dairy products. Efficient 
with the cow at the present time. The buying and selling is essential to suc- 
man represents the highest type of cessful dairy farming; its profits de- 
evolutionary forces which have been pend on this, 
and still are at work, but the dairy cow The Cow.
holds a very high place in the scales Several breeds of dairy cattle have 
of development below man. By work- been developed under widely different 
ing together they have been able to environments and slightly different 
achieve marvelous results on the farm, ideals. The Jerseys, Guernseys from j | 

Successful dairy farming depends the Channel Islands give rich milk 
largely on hitching up, or as scientists adapted for a high-class milk and 
would say, correlating, three entirely cream trade or for butter making. Hol- 
different things—the man, the cow, land has given us the Holstein-Frie- 
and the farm. There is no sort of use sians, the greatest milk-making ma­
in trying to achieve success with a chines in the world. From Scotland 
cow not adapted to the farm or par- come the Ayrshires with their perfect 
ticular line of the business pursued, udders and rugged constitution. Some-

High-bred Cows and Low Dairy Ideals do not go Together, 
nor with a man not capable of caring what variant in type, there is a gen- 
for her, nor with a farm not adapted eral similarity and a well-defined rela- 
for growing the food crops necessary tion between form and function in 
for compounding a reasonably well- these breeds from different countries, 
balanced ration. In the older dairying Then come the Brown Swiss with a 
localities long experience has forced type so modified that our dairy farm- 
dairymen to give their cows the best ers were skeptical about the first im- 
of care and grow a variety of crops portations, so widely did they depart 
adapted to their needs, or a cash crop from our accepted standards. But pro- 
that may be sold advantageously and duction records prove that these big- 
the fertility removed replaced by pur- boned mountain cattle are entitled to 
chased concentrates. Either directly recognition from our dairy farmers 
or indirectly the farm must support With these breeds the work of grading 
the cows if the business is to pay sat- up the native stocks into profitable 
isfactory profits. dairy herds has proceeded very rapidly

Improve the Dairyman First. in many localities in this country, with 
The better dairyman must precede satisfactory results where the work 

the better dairy cow. If possible he has been conducted in the intelligence 
should take a course at an agricultural of the present era. 
college.^ If this is not possible he Various seven-day,. thirty-day and 
should read dairy literature that may yearly tests, conducted with the most 
now be had for a small sum. The man careful scrutiny, have afforded con- 
who is seeking information can obtain vincing demonstration of the fact that 
it at little expense in these days of ex- the milk, cream, butter and cheese of 
pansion of agricultural thought and commerce need not be made by the 
practice. He must also be a student of cow whose annual yield of milk is lim- 
econoiny and efficiency. He must think ited to 4,000 pounds, but that cows 
deeply and act wisely. Knowledge is producing from 6,000 to 10,000 pounds 
power only when a man can employ it are within the possibilities, the com- 
to set natural materials and forces to paratively easy possibilities It re­
work in such a way as to achieve prac- mains in large part for the dairy farm- 
tical results on his farm. It is at thi's ers throughout the country to avail 
point that many clever business men themselves of the improved blood pro­
turn tricks that put their business on duced by enterprising breeders who 
a, money-making basis where a . dairy have made two pounds of milk flow 
expert would fail. The dairyman not from an udder where only one pound 
only needs knowledge, but he must was wont to be produced Years ago 
have the ability to put his knowledge improved blood was not at his com- 
mto practice. mand, but today good blood may be

The successful dairy farmer houses had at reasonable prices and if the 
his cattle comfortably, treats them 4,000 pound of milk per year cow out- 
kmdly, studies them individually as numbers the 6,000 and 10 000 pound 
well as collectively and keeps a record cow in the herds of the country it is 
of the amount of milk produced and the fault of the farmer, it is the price 
food consumed. He provides succu- of his ignorance or indifference 
lence for winter by putting up silage, Form and Function,
plans to use¡up all of the cheap, bulky Just how much importance to place 
feeds possible and regulates the upon the relationship of form and func- 
amount of gram according to the milk tion, or production records is a rather 
flow. He plans for summer drouths difficult thing to decide. Some men 
by having some silage left over in the think if you get a cow with a wedge 
spring, or grows soiling crops to sup- shape, very prominent backbone, a

©
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It costs less to buy a

than to buy experience
EACH  year some 40,000 farmers, who have bought at one 

time or another “ cheap’* cream separators, discard their 
inferior, cream wasting machines and replace them with 

clean skimming D e Lavals.
These men bought the “ cheap”  machines because they 

thought they were “ good enough”  or “ just as good”  and that 
by purchasing such machines they could save a little money. 
They actually would have been better off in most cases had 
they bought no separator; for they lost most of the money 
they spent for the “ cheap”  machines, besides all the cream 
these machines have failed to get out o f the milk.

N o one ever saved money using a “ cheap”  cream wasting 
separator or an old or half worn-out machine. N o one ever got 
back the money spent for such a machine by  continuing to use 
it. Those who bought “ cheap”  machines and got out of the 
difficulty best are the ones who quickly discovered their mistake, 
discarded the inferior machines and put in real cream separators 
— D e Lavals.

* There are nearly 2,000,000 farmers who have bought De 
Lavals, and every one of these had just as many opportunities 
to buy “ cheap”  separators as any one else. They did not do it 
and are now money ahead. They have avoided paying the high 
cost of experience, and their D e Lavals have paid for them­
selves many times over. It  always pays to  buy a separator of 
proved, known superiority.

nearest D e Laval agent will be glad to let you see and 
try a D e Laval on your own farm, without obligating you in 
any way. It  is better to take advantage o f this opportunity 
than to  pay dearly for your own cream separator experience. 
I f  you don t  know the local D e Laval agent, simply address the 
nearest main office as given below.

The De Laval Separator Co.
165 Broadway, New York 29 E. Madison St., Chicago

50,000 BRANCHES AND LOCAL AGENCIES THE WORLD OVER

70 lbs. Milk Cost 36 cts.
Elsie, Mich., H. F. Lewis, has a herd of 16 pure bred Holsteins that 
are doing fine on Unicorn. He has a 2 year old that is giving 56 
lbs. per day with no other grain ration but Unicorn. Also a 5 year 
oW that averaged 70 lbs. per day through January on 14 lbs of 
Unicorn feed a.<* a grain ration. These are facts I  obtained of him 
this morning. A. R . LE V E Y.

Hundreds of UNICORN feeders are doing as well,

UNICORN DAIRY RATION
is equally profitable for tests or every day dairying, TRY IT.

F O R  F A C T S  A N D  F IG U R E S  W R I T E ,

CHAPIN & C O ., Dept. M , Hammond, Ind.

W hen W riting to  advertisers p lease state that 
you saw  their ad. in The M ichigan Farmer.
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endslap over similar to 
I a “ ship-lap”  joint—braces 

tile against tile—gives you 
the maximum durability of tile 
— the ideal silo material — defies 
age, fire, winds, winter frost and 
summer heat.

W r ite  f o r  L ite r a tu r e
a n d  le t n s  te ll y o u  a b o u t  th is  s u p e r io r  
c o n s t r u c t io n  in  th e  L a n sin g : V itr ified  
T i le  S ilo .  R e in fo r c e d  th ro u g h o u t  w ith  
twisted s tee l—10% ' stronger than steel not 
twisted. New fluted end keeps mortar from  
■lipping before it hardens—prevents air leaks 
—gets stronger grip. Extended shoulders top 
and bottom leave only thin mortar line exposed 
inside and ou t—silage settles better — less 
chance fo r  frost — silo has better 
appearance. Steel hip roof gives 
extra footage. Doorway is con­
tinuous — ladder is easy to 
climb. W rite today for  
catalog.

J. M . PRESTON CO.
Dtp**309 Lansing, Mich.

dairymen. Some men who are breed*- 
ing pure-bred cattle will give much at­
tention to a fine horn or a certain col­
or; and they will weed out all cows 
that have not the horn just so; or a

the place where the opportunity for 
the greatest profits is found.

There is another way in which the 
country dairyman can greatly improve

Market the Milk
Raise your calves 

and get the bigger 
money to w h i c h  yoa 
are entitled. But do not 
feed the ca lf whole milk, 
with- b u t i e r  fat worth 
$600 a ton.

You can sail all 
the mother cow’s  
mllkor butter and 
make your calf pay 
you a big profit on

. 1  
ot 1  
lk. }Eyi fm

¡CAL

RAISE
Y0UP
CALVES

bright eye, and- air the- ether points, mer. With land, that will supply an. in the vicinity of the larger cities and 
she will prove a good milker, but I  abundance of grasses and rich protein towns were educated along these lines, 
want to say from my own experience forage as a basis, the cost of efficient so that the robbing of the country 
buying, breeding and raising cows dairy rations.-is minimized and the dairies may be prevented. Dairymen 
that the dairy farmer should not place cow’s health, is better maintained than in the country must become as wise 
too much importance upon dairy form; when too much concentrated grain and as the city buyers and refuse to sell 
The fact that so many cows without by-products are fed. the animals that they should depend
the true dairy form have madé very Where the farm is , situated a con- yP°n to help them toward greater prof- 
creditable advanced registry records giderable distance from the railway its- ’̂ tle Practice of this plan would 
is practical proof that the form theory station he will of necessity produce his add greatly to the worth of hundreds 
is of little use to the great mass of own feedstuffs as the expense of haul- herds that are nearby the cities,

ing a. long distance will be, if not pro­
hibitive, yet so great that such a 
course will be inadvisable. Where 
this is the case he will find it advan­

ce  xiuiii v,*. »  tageous to practice summer dairying Ms herd and that is to make arrange-
black switch. The chances are that an(j plan to carry his bows through men ŝ with the city dairymen to pur- 
the men who are doing that are de- winter with such feeds as silage, chase all of their heifèr calves. He 
stroying in many cases animals which ^ay, home-grown grain and a very can reaUy afford to pay a little more 
have the power to. produce the most small quantity of purchased feedings than the market price for the calves 
milk and butter. They have sacrificed materials. On the other hand, if the inherit qualities that will practically 
them to that fad called form. It is all farm is situated near a railway station insure their becoming good cows. It
right in itself for skillful breeders to can find more profit in buying con- is never much work to get these or-
maintain dairy form within certain lim- centrated feedstuffs to balance his Phans to growing nicely and there is 
its, but the average dairy farmer will home-grown roughage and produce usually plenty of pasturage which can 
succeed better to breed his cows upon milk during the winter moiiths. Un- be supplemented by such feeds as are
lines of production as determined by fier ordinary circumstances it pays bet- to be had cheaply. When these be-
the scales and the Babcock test. ter to plan the herd management so come milkers the better ones may be

The Farm. that it will yield a steady income selected to add to the hqrd and the
The dairy farmer must bear in mind throughout the year. surplus f ld; «¡J  onl* * * * * *  »

that he is a farmer as well as a dairy- The s.ze of the Da.ry Farm. affords am op.
man. I ds fundamentally wrong o The 8l 0 the farm, the proportion n, extra pr<lflt
assume that one can build up a highly cf tillable lands to rolling pasture ■ Qhio 
specialized dairy business that will ianfis> the kinds of soil, the value of 
pay profitable rétums without growing the buildings, and numerous other fac- 
an abundance of palatable and nour- tors, influence the value of the dairy 
ishing food for the cattle. In many farms. The question of whether it is
parts of the oountry where daily farm- better to buy a farm near a market or An teature of ^  rec(mt
ers have attempted ^  railroad station or go further back and of th8 Michigan Dairymen’s
producing end of their business above buy Reaper land depends upon the Assoolation at Kalamazoo was the
the crop-producmg amount of capital one has to invest in u ( e8timatlng conte8t
with failure. IMn^cows a*d the busmess, his ability to make it on Thursd evenlng, February
duction are economically inseparable yield large profits and the particular pure.bred Holstein bull calf was
on tte weU-managed daio-fa™ . branch of the  ̂business he is to pur- awarded ^  competition.

The selection of the faun is per- 8Ue. Some of the veiy best money- Williams,
haps, of less importance to the major- making farms are situated further MMvl« C.

back, but, as a rule, it is better to in­
vest in a farm that is situated in close 
proximity to good markets and near 
transportation lines, even though the 
original cost is considerably greater.

S. C.

AN INTERESTING CONTEST AT 
THE DAIRY MEETING.

W IT H  «t ■

C A L F  M E A L
its feed t by raising it on
B la tc h  f o r d 's  C a l f  M e a l

The R ecogn ized  Milk Equal 
Yoa get 100 gallons or rich milk feed from 100 pounds o f  

Blatchford’e  Calf Meal, and it costa r<w only one-fourth 
aa much. It will make your calf grow fast and well.-  “  ■* “ '  *'■* composed 0

most trying penoa 01 ns m e; 
prevents bowel troubles and

I ff  ina uuo w w.aJll Substitutes. .Blstchford's Pig Meal insures quick, sturdy growth o f 
young pica at weaning time, without setback or falling off.

dm  Write ua for our Free 
Book oa How to Basis« 
Calves Cheaply and Suc­
cessfully. W ithout Milk. *

r .,JOO Blatchford Calf Meal Factory
% 4d82 JMadison St.. Waukegi

»Tcr^ägrdT^Sgera; 
tow n, M d .. w r itêt: • I 
can say Blatch ford a 

^  .  Calf Meal will pay
anyone 100 Pet. that 

* * ‘* “ - ‘ r  h u o ln a t o r a iH .7'

PRICESCHOPPCD!
Four sizes o f  Galloway Sanitary bath-in-oil 
separators for  1916 and four new low.
1916 prices. Six easy selling plans— 
cash or. terms These new separators 
skim from  375 to 950 lbs. per boar. They 
are built in my great chain o f  factories 
from  the highest quality materials by 
skilled workmen and sold to you di­
rect to you at one small profit.
I f  you buy a  separator in .the next twelve 
months you should have my
N E W  250  P A G E  1916  B O O K  mum stu
It tells you how I build Galloway Sanitary 

separators and gives each o f  my, 
kfour new low prices and all my <|
’ new easy selling plans. A -
{jostal gets it. Separators shipped from Water- 
oo, Chicago, St. Paul, Omaha and Kansas City. 
Wm. Galloway Co., Box 183 Waterloo, Iowa

! I0DS1ER HANGES \rRE¡E
im

yon live. 8how your friends. Send jt back at our ex­
pense i f  you do not want to keep it. Hundreds o f  thou­
sands in daily use. Perfect bakers, efficient heaters, made 
o f  high grade material, beautifully finished, smooth de­

sign, guaranteed for  years by 
our Two Million Dollar Bond.

Ask your dealers to  show 
you Hoosier Stoves. Write 
fo r  our big free book show­
ing photographs, describing 
large assortment o f  sizes 
and designs to  select from, 
explaining our free trial. 
Send postal today. Write 
[your name ana address 
¡plainly. No obligations.

H O O S IER  S T O V E  C O .
131 Ststr It., Mftrton, bid.

V a n i t o s i —A  "good sober D airy M an w ith two- good VTallim boys able to  m ilk. By the Year.
B. C. B an fle ld , O w endale, M ich igan.
When writing advertisers mention Milchgan Farmer

ity of readers than the selection of 
some particular branch of the industry 
that is adapted to their present sur­
roundings. It is possible, however,
that a, brief discussion of the advan- WR„ w __ ________ 4 0----- -
tages and the disadvantages of certain Well-located farms always find a more 
soils and locations may be of value to ready sale, which is many times an im- 
those who are contemplating buying a portant thing to consider before in­
farm and going into the dairy busi- vesting in a farm.
ness. ------------------------

Dairying has so far made its great­
est progress in the more northern, 
colder climates very largely because 
the handling of milk and its products 
was cheapened by low temperatures a 
portion of the year and by cheap ice 
refrigeration for the summer season.
This in the main is the fundamental 
reason why the northern states lead in 
dairying, together, perhaps, with one 
more reason—that northern farmers

STANDARD OF THE 
HERD.

FARM DAIRY

It seems to be true that the quality 
of the farm dairy herds is of a much 
lower standard in practically every 
way than those of the city dairyman. 
This really works to the detriment of 
the farmer and yet he is to blame for 
the whole thing.

of Allegan county, and Marvin C. 
Haight. He was a grandson of Friend 
Hengerveld DeKol Butter boy on sire’s 
side and a great grandson of Pontiac 
Aaggie Korndyke on dam’s side; On 
the date of the contest the calf weigh­
ed 167 lbs., 15 ozs. He was won by 
James Van Aug, of Kalamazoo, who 
sold the calf at auction, Prof. A. C. 
Anderson officiating as auctioneer. 
John M. Larsen, of Chicago, an exhib­
itor at the show, purchased the calf 
for $75.00, and will present him to a 
friend at Omaha, Neb.

MILKING METHODS.

In tests made in Germany with the 
Hegelund method of milking, it is 

ne is to Díame ior claimed that one cow gave seven 
,. , . pounds of milk daily three weeks after

The city dairyman caiVing when milked three times a 
who must buy all of his feed knows ¿ay, and on the same ration when

have learned to care for the cow in. that he cannot afford to keep a cow milked eight times a day, 2*0 pounds.
winter better than those in the south ._____After three weeks she was restored to
have learned to do in hot weather.
While dairy farmers in different local 
ities face local problems of climate
and soil, yet the same general princi­
ples of crop growing and cow feeding 
hold good everywhere.
B«st Location for Profitable Dairying.

Location plays an important part in 
the dairy business as regards markets 
and classes of production intended. For 
milk or cream selling the farm must 
necessarily be located near the mar­
ket, or near some shipping station. For

LllctL u c  Viauuui/ a u v i u  w  u  w »»  -------------' —   ——  ,  * 9 —7 “
- unless she is a real producer, therefore After three weeks she was restored to t . '. ‘ * , * . the three times a day milking and con-I. he goes out into the country and per- tinued to give the higher amount of 

suades the farmer to part with the milk. Another cow gave from 10 to 12 
very best cows in his herd. The cow pounds of milk per day on three times 
is taken to the city and worked as milking and 29 pounds when milked . . , ... . . .  . seven times per day, which amounthard as possible until she begins to sbe continued to give when returned 
fail, when she is sold to the butcher, to three times milking.
All of her calves have gone to the ___________ .
same place and thus we see that noth- NORTHERr^PEmNSULA DAIRY- 
ing. whatever has been done toward _____
building up the standard of the dairy The first annual meeting of the 
animals of the country. NorUiern Peninsula Dairymen’s Asso-

'  . ciation was held at Stephenson, Tues-
. . . . .. -p, Circumstances- make it necessary day, February 15. Much enthusiasm

ket, or near some shipping station. p or the city dairyman should make a was shown over results and prospects 
producing butter or cheese, or raising s of the business and of dairying in the Upper Peninsula
dairv stock to sell, it may be located • , . .. _ ____ , ,  , . Addresses were delivered by President

r f i lL f l  or market- in fact knowIedge thus acquired enables him F. H. Vandenboom, Marquette; W. F. far from a ra o_V _oa L to take advantage of the average farm- Raven, Upper Peninsula Extension
for these purposes, the advantages r er when he s QUt into the country Specialist for Michigan Agriculturaler when he goes out into the country Specialist for Michigan Agricultural 

in search of cows to add to his herd,
Very seldom does he consider buying McCormick, of Menominee. Discus- 
the cows that the farmer is willing to slons of co-operative cattle buying 
dispose of but he ferrets out those were led by County Agents R. G. Hoop- 
U,at he is confident are the real pr>
ducers and, be it said to the credit of Stephenson. County Agent Geismar, 
his shrewdness, he usually gets what of Houghton County, read a paper pre- 
he wants. pared by W. S. Prickett, proprietor of

■ , ... , . , , the Roycroft Dairy Farm upon the
Such sales are bound to keep any Northern Peninsula as a dairy section, 

«mu »  herd down to a mediocre standard be- The officers elected for the ensuing
amounts oi  ̂ fresh cause the cows that really produced a year were: President, F. IL Vanden-pondingly insatiable appetite tor ,g .. . , , ,, boom, Marquette, (re-elected); vice­
green grass and forage to suply the profit are gone, also mere is but small preg^ eil^ r  l . Nye, Menominee; sec- 
needs of their digestive systems they likelihood of any improvement because retary-treasurer, C. V. Ballard, Iron 
. . „ hpnpfit from these calves from poor cows seldom prove Mountain, (re-elected). Board of Di-
derive the S r t S S  more valuable than their dam. Such rectors; U. F Asslin Norway, Mich.;crops. Hay and corn suage iurmwi ai ,,__  ___ . L. G. Holden, Sault Ste. Marie, Mich.;
most as important a part of the winter methods usually allow the quality of j. ^  gyers, Iron River, Mich. ;• W. B; 
ration for the dairy herd as natural the herd to deteriorate. Tromas, Manistique, Mich.; C. B. Peck,
grass and green forage do in the sum- It is certainly time, that the farmers Oontonagon, Mich.

a farm, remote from market or public? 
conveyance, may be more favorable 
than near, as land is much higher and 
help more expensive near a market or 
railroad line.

An ideal dairy farm should support 
luxuriant growths of pasture, meadow 
grasses and forage crops. Grass is 
the natural food for dairy cows. With 
their great capacity for handling large 
amounts of bulky feed and a corres
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DAIRY PROBLEMS.

The Ration Lacks Protein.
I am milking grade Holstein cows, 

giving 30 lbs. of milk a day. L wish 
you would give me a balanced ration. 
Right now we are feeding corn, oats 
and barley, equal parts, for roughage; 
corn stover, bean straw, clover and al­
falfa. Bran is $26 a ton; middlings 
$29; cottonseed and oil meals $36 a 
ton. We have wheat and cull beans. 
The cows are not doing the way they 
ought to. W. N.,

Corn, oats and barley do not contain 
quite enough protein to properly bal­
ance a roughage ration of cornstalks 
and clover and alfalfa hay. If the 
cows had all the alfalfa hay they would 
eat, also silage, then ground oats would j 
properly balance. I suggest that you 1 
feed wheat bran in place of bats and ( 
barley. Mix corn meal equal parts by ' 
weight, with wheat bran. This will ( 
give you more protein, and by feeding | 
liberally I think you will get results, j 

Cottonseed Meal Not Necessary.
Will you give me a balanced ration 

for my Cows? I am feeding good en­
silage twice a day, good alfalfa hay ’ 
twice a day. Cornstalks, not frosted, j 
twice a day; grain two-thirds; sound ! 
grain: two-thirds sound bats, one-third 
ground rye, one pound cottonseed 
meal, fed twice a day. Would it pay 
me to feed bran at $26 per ton? 

Hillsdale Co. T. T. H.
This is a good ration. You can do 

away altogether with the cottonseed 
meal and rye by feeding one-third bran 
with the ground oats. I think it would 
make a better ration.

Probably Skin Disease.
What is the trouble with my two- 

year-old registered Holstein bull. He 
is always licking himself and I can’t 
find any lice on him. I feed cornstalks, 
hay, straw and silage, and for grain, 
ground buckwheat and oil meal. I 
would like to know what to do for 
him. Could I better my grain by mix­
ing some wheat bran and not so much 
of the other grain? What is the best 
grain for calves when skim-milk and 
alfalfa hay are fed? Would a wash of 
castile soap do good or harm to the 
bull? H. L.

No one can tell the trouble with this 
bull without making an examination.
I suggest that you consult your. local 
veterinarian. He ought to be able to 
tell you the trouble and also to pre­
scribe a successful treatment.

Perhaps too heavy a feed of buck­
wheat might cause irritation of the 
skin. Discontinue the buckwheat for 
a time and give him wheat bran. It 
would take several days for this to 
produce any results.

I would not wash him with soap un­
til I consulted a veterinarian. If you 
wet his skin you must rub till thor­
oughly dry.

Can the Ration be Cheapened?
How can I reduce the expense of- 

feeding my cows? I am feeding wet 
brewers’ grains at $6.50 per ton at the 
rate of half a ton per week to 14 cows, 
and silage and clover hay for rough- 
age. " It is almost impossible to get 
good corn this year. I am a gardener 
and am buying everything but the

Ŝeparator Extraordinary

A c h i e v e m e n t  o f
H

e

Here’s 
that new 
model Reliance- 
the separator that 
so perfectly “ hit the 
mark ”  on just what farmers 
wanted that over 100,000 were 
sold within two years’ time. if Two 
years ago we decided to use our 20 years 
of experience and our knowledge of what 
farmers really need and want in a separator, and 
produce a new model separator—one that would meet 
every wish. No ordinary machine would do— it must be 
a SEPARATOR EXTRAORDIN ARY; absolutely self-oiling, 
the greatest cream-getter, and biggest profit-maker yet built*

T h e  N ew  |  •Reliance
Cream  Separator

met with such instantaneous success, such a tremendous demand, thafi 
we could hardly keep up with orders.

This machine has twelve big, important features. Write for book 
showing pictures and giving full description. Learn about the self-oiling device-— 
the latest automobile splash system. Machine oils itself, every time it is turned. 
N o cups— no lubricators. Learn about the wonderful Reliance 
bowl guaranteed to skim to ^  of 1 per cent or better, no matter 
what the density-of cream. Get full information regarding all 
the splendid ft atures of this fine, money-maker. Write today.

Reliance Engineering Company
LANSING - B ox 563 - MICH.

Send Vor 
Free 
Book

SS, SENT ON TRIAL

SEPA RA TO R
Thonsands In Use
tifies investigating ou r  wonderful oiler: 0  
b ra n d  n e w , w e ll m a d e , easy running, easily 
cleaned, perfect skimming separator o n ly  

. $ 1 5 .9 5 .  Skims o n e  q u a rt  o f  m ilk  a  m in .Can you advise anything ate. warm or cold. Makes thick or th in cram . Differentfrom 1“̂ ^ “ w hichflh«- 
nTI nriwa 9 TXT o  I trates our low priced large capacity machines. Bowl is a sanitary marvel and em-

oodies all our latest improvements.
V ___Our wonderfully __ .1 |______1 all sizes and gen-

roughage.
for the pox on cows? W. S.

If we reduce the wet brewers’ grains . n  _  
to a dry matter basis, it will make a IUur. Twenty-Year Gnarantee Protects You
g r a in  r a t i o n  o f  S P V P n  t o  p i V h t  n n n n r lQ  41-1V1 Wl^  astonish you. Whether your dairy is large °r  small, ° r  if you have a n  o ld  s e p .g l  d ill  r d t i o n  o r  s e v e n  t o  e i g n t  p o u n d s  o f any make you wish t o  e x ch a n g e , do not fail to get our great offer. Our richly illustrated
D e r  d a v  w h i e T l  w h i l e  l i h P T i i l  ic* n n t  p y -  tn-f *r e e  on re(lhest, is the most■ complete, elaborate and expensive book on Cream Separa-U dy, WHICH, W H lie I i o e r a i ,  IS n o t  e x  “ «J®d by any concern in the world. Western orders filled from western points. Write
cessive. Again, the ration can be fair- ^ 7 1015** catalog and 8ee what a Wf money saving proposition we w ill make you. Address:

ly well balanced by substituting corn- j Am erican Separator C o., Box 1061» Bainbridge, N . Y . 
meal and wheat bran equal parts by 
weight for the brewers’ grains. In 
other words, the brewers’ grains fur­
nish protein a little in excess when fed 
in connection with clover hay. But 
corn meal and bran are little, if any, 
cheaper than the brewers' grains, so 
there would be no reduction in the 
cost, and as there is no harm in a 
small excess of protein as long as it 
does not add to the cost, I see no rea­
son for changing. I can suggest no 
better or cheaper ration.

Variola, or “Cowpox,” is not very 
' pleasant to handle, but it is not usually 
serious. Wash the teats and udder 
before milking, with tepid water, use 
a little soap if necessary, to get it 
clean. Then apply’carbolized vaseline 
or iodoform ointment. If it does not 
bring relief, use a two and a half per 
cent solution of chloride of zinc. If 
this does not readily bring relief then 
consult your veterinarian.

TheR O S S

F i f t y  Y e a r s  E x p e r i e n c e
ui building &ood m ilk cans is represented in

STURGES “ Guaranteed Correct 
Capacity” MILK CANS

A  seal on the wrapper of every can bears a guarantee 
that the can is “ true to measure” and free from leaks. 

This big feature makes Sturges Cans worth more to you 
—but they cost no more.

a  your deftler hun’t The Cans of Guaranteed Capacity “  —  
write and we’ll direct you to one nearby who baa.

W ant Catalog No* 4 5 ?

Sturges & Burn Mfg.Co.,508 S. Green St., Chicago, III

E arT ags
™  S T O C K TR

L
Tag your stock—best and cheapest means of 
identification fo r  Hogs. Sheep and Cattle. 
Name, address and number stamped on tags. 
Catalog and samples free on request.
■ . S . B urch A  C o ., 189 W . Harm Si. Chios

NAPPANEE SILOS
S A T I S F Y

40c/c o f Corn Crop Saved 
by using the Nappanee Silo.
It holds more thon others.

Silo pays for itself every year. No 
orop failure with a Nappanee Silo 
on your farm.
Many exclusive features. Nap. 
panes quality means a satisfied 
custom er.
Write for the Ola free Silo booh 
today. It explains all.

Nappanee Lumber & Mfg. Co.WILLIAMSPORT, PA. NAPPANEE, INOk
15 Linck Block 315 S* Madison St.

m

ftl flVFR
H o a  U  i K  H u b  I  ■  Crop very short.

Urn ■  ■  Buy before ad­
vance and save money. Get our special low prices and 
free samples o f  our pure,Iowa Grown,New Crop Recleaned 
Tested Clover and Tim othy Seed, Also Alfalfa, Alsike, 
Sweet Clover. All kinds grass seed. 100-page catalog free, 
quoting all field seeds. Save money by writing at once. 
A ..A . B ER R Y S E E D  CO . Bex 181 CLA R IN D A , IO W A

Keeps ensilage' fresh and sweet. 
ManyexclusivefeatureL 
Doors on hinges; triple, 
bevel refrigerator type  door and 
fram e; aval door frame to f it  exact 
circumference o f  silo: extra heavy 
hoops and luge bent to f it  silo; con­
tinuous door frame.

Thoroughly Manufactured 
Our 66 jrrs. o f  manufacturing exper­
ience is valuable to  you. Write fo r  
instructive Silo Book. We also make 
Eqameled Metal Silos. Agents wanted 

T H E  £ .  W . R O S S  C O .
B ox  1 4  Springfield, O.

V T - S i l o
“ The Gibraltar of Silos’* will 

withstand the storms and destroy­
ing influences of ages. Built of 
vitrified Brazil fire clay tile, im­
pervious to air and moisture. Re­
inforced with steel. The strongest 
and most permanent silo in the 
world. Absolutely air-tight and 
1009b efficient. Never needs paint­
ing, repairing or rebuilding. Write 
today for illustrated Silo Book £>
Brazil Hollow Brick & Tile Co., Brazil, Ini

When writin g to advertiser please mention 
The Michigan Farmer.
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NOTE: Evan after its experience of nearly a century, Case is not content to publish advertisement̂  unless based on the very latest 
authoritative information. This is one of a series of messages to farmers prepared after visiting tractor demonstrations, talking to hundreds 
of farmers and1 carrying on a national' investigation through our sales organization and by mail to find the gas tractor needs of the farmers*

Your Grandfather Knew Case
W hen you com e to  reason it out, it is natural that a concern 

like the Case Com pany, founded in 1842, should take first rank. 
F or back o f  each Case tractor lies tradition, history and valued 
reputation— w orth m illions. Each tractor is made to  add to 
this world-wide reputation. W e built our first tractor 24 years 
ago  and have since spent hundreds o f thousands in perfecting it. 
W e d o  all the experim enting before placing our tractors on  the 
market. W e could not afford to  put forth an experimental machine.

“The Good Tractors Can 
be Counted on One Hand”

So says a well-known agricultural authority in 
The Country Gentleman. (There are 152 tractors on the
m arket.) Then he goes on to  say: “ Emphatically, the light tractor 
has been made practical, but not a ll the light tractors on  the mar­
ket are practical. There is special danger in the tractor made 
by a concern that lacks experience in either this o r  the farm 
implement field.”

T h e makers o f  Case tractors believe in spreading such sound 
advice as this. W e think it is the kind o f inform ation being 
sought by knowing farmers. It is keeping our faith with thou­
sands o f  custom ers.

Farmers want to know who leads in the tractor world. Many 
make com parison with autom obile history. Many realize the 
large number o f autom obile com panies w ho have fallen by the 
wayside. M ost farmers do not want to be  caught with an orphan 
tractor on  their hands. This is why so many lean towards Case.

Quality Comes First with Most Farmers
Over 9,000 dealers tell us farmers are com m encing to  rebel 

at mere cheapness. “ Quality is the m ost important thing for 
the farm er to  consider,”  says The Farm ers* M ail and Breeze. 
“ This is especially true with the smaller tractors, fo r  the greatly 
increasing interest in th e  smaller engines has encouraged many 
com panies to produce engines that are not up to  the quality o f  
the b ig  machines. It is extrem ely important to  consider the 
reputation behind the tractor. Is the com pany o f  which you  
are buying the machine well established ? Has it been  success­
ful in making tractors?

“ In other w ords, care should be taken to guard against 
tractors built oh half-baked ideas. W hen you buy a tractor 
from  the standard com panies you are certain o f  getting an 
engine that has received thought and study by specialists 
w ho know the problem  o f  farm engineers.”

fro m  an actual photograph o f  a  Case 10-20

How You Benefit
The very foundation o f  our continued success depends on good  

tractors. The honor o f the Case name has been built on the 
reliability o f Case products— and accepted the w orld over as the 
standard b y  which others are judged. W e are determined to 
stand by the faith that has given us this name. W e may appear 
selfish in doing so. But if making wholly-worth products is essen­
tial to our preservation, if  it is necessary to thus jealously guard 
our reputation— you benefit, too . Y ou  profit in our selfishness.

Ten Construction Details in the Case 10-20
1. Larger shafts—all high carbon steel, heat treated. Also larger 

bearings.
2. Steel channel frame speciallv braced and stayed to prevent 

deflection.
3. Ample cooling for motor by same type radiator as used, on 

heavy-duty trucks.
4. Transmission gearing completely housed; runs in an oil bath.
5. Bull pinion of steel. Case hardened.
6. Next to bull pinion is a high-duty Hyatt tRoller Bearing,
T. Rear axle carried in cannon bearing provided with 3 Hyatt

Roller Bearings, X of them being on each side of drive wheel. 
8. Extra bearings provided and located next to the belt pulley 

and clutch, which takes the strain due to pull of belt away 
from engine bearing,

9» Only cne clutch is used for both operating in the belt or for 
traction.

10. Hitch is so arranged as to do away with alL side draft.
Each Case tractor in its class has its own special features.

The Sign o f
M ech a n ica l 

E x c e lle n c e  th e  
W orld O ver

From an actual photograph o f a Oaae 10-20

Case Commands International Admiration
Case has always stood for quality. For 74 years men 

and their children and their children’ s children have placed 
their confidence in Case— an unviolated trust. Its reputa­
tion for honesty is indeed enviable. It is a standard com ­
pany, m aking standard products, nothing freaky or experi­
mental. It has an unmatchable corps o f  tractor engineers 
and experts, backed by unlimited resources ia fac­
tory and field laboratories. So evidently it is the 
one concern which is'destined to lead the tractor 
world. Case gas tractors come in four sizes:
10-20, 12-25, 20-40 and 30-60.

Leaders in Other Lines o f 
Agricultural Machinery

Case steam engines, Case threshing machines.
Case road machinery, Case automobiles, and 
each Case product is a dominant factor in its 
own field. Write today for our complete Case 
Catalog. It is an album of. information that 
should be under the reading lamp in every farm 
sitting room. It is beautifully printed, with many 
interesting scenes and reproductions in color. No farmer should miss 
having it. Especially when it costs you only one penny for a postal card 
to get it. Merely write, "Send me your general machinery catalog.”

J. I. CASE THRESHING MACHINE COMPANY, Inc. RACINE, WIS.
Founded 1842
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B VERYONE familiar with the his­
tory of the American revolution 
knows of the military activity in 

the beautiful Mohawk valley. Here 
British agents incited the Indians to 
commit all sorts of depredations capture the place, their roving bands 
against the settlers. Their frequent did many things to make the life at 
incursions finally forced the settlers the garrison unpleasant. They kept 
to forsake their farms and the valley constant watch along the trail for mes- 
became deserted except for small ma- sengers traveling between the post 
rauding bands who wandered about and the outside world and anyone fall­
seeking for some luckless traveler. ing into their hands was almost cer- 

At the time of this story one of the tain to lose his life, 
important outposts of the colonists The life of the garrison was certain- 
was Fort Stanwix the route to which ly not to be envied. The tactics em- 
lay through Mohawk valley. The post ployed by the enemy rendered the se- 
was a veritable thorn in the side of the curing of supplies from the outer world 
British and, although they did not uncertain and the same cause made it 
seem able to raise a force sufficient to difficult to hunt game in the surround-

many dangers. When volunteers were 
asked practically every man who was 
at all fit, physically, stepped forward.

One by one the volunteers were 
eliminated for one cause or another un- 

ng forests, which would have helped til there remained but one—Reuben 
out on the rations greatly. There was Hart— a lithe, clean-limbed youth but 
a time when the soldiers found them- eighteen years of age. It was certain- 
se ves m a desperate situation. The jy an important mission to entrust to 
supp les arranged for had failed to a mere lad but his superiors had al- 
come and an epidemic rendered so ready learned that his courage and en- 
many of the men unfit for duty that it durance were to be relied upon and if 
was not possible to send a large force anyone could make his way through 
for the food and munitions. After con- the dangers that beset the forest trail 
sidering the matter thoroughly the offi- it was Reuben Hart, 
cers decided that their only hope lay At midnight following his selection 
m dispatching a messenger, trusting Reuben quietly slipped forth from the 
to Providence that he would be able stockade and disappeared into the 
to make his way safely through the shadows of the nearby forest. When

A Messenger From Ft. Stanwix
By E U G EN E E. E W IN G

W O RLD  EVENTS IN  PICTURES
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During the Recent Great Floods in San Diego Valley many Fine Bridges were
Completely Swept Away.
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the sun arose that morning he had 
safely covered many miles of his 
route. But daylight increased rather 
than diminished his dangers for at 
any moment some Indian was likely to 
come across his trail and Reuben well 
knew that this would mean pursuit. He 
felt confident that the enemy could not 
be far away for he had come across 
camp sites that had been recently oc­
cupied. Indeed; he once fancied that 
he could distinguish the forms of In­
dians moving along the top of a hill 
across the valley.

But the first day passed without any 
excitement and as night was drawing 
near Reuben cast about for a suitable 
place to spend the night. Mbunting a 
small elevation to view the surround­
ing territory he stepped from behind a 
clump of bushes and found himself 
facing a camp of half a dozen British 
soldiers and ten or twelve Indians. 
They appeared to be busily engaged in 
preparing their evening meal and the 
lad quickly stepped back among the 
trees, hoping that they had not seen 
him. He was not to be so fortunate, 
however, for by their shoiits he knew 
that he had been spied' and his only 
hope for safety was in flight. Sparse 
undergrowth made running easy but 
the Indians were probably fresh and 
Reuben fully realized that a great ef­
fort would be necessary to outdistance 
the pursuers.

For a time Reuben seemed to be 
able to hold his own against all but 
one of the savages, who was slowly 
drawing away from his companions. 
As the Indian continued to shorten the 
distance between them the lad realiz­
ed that he must resort to strategy or 
the race would soon end.
. Luckily for Reuben the Indians had 

started in such haste that they Were 
unarmed and the Britishers were so 
far outdistanced that he had no fear 
of their guns. The first of the pursu­
ers was now almost upon him whioh 
made immediate action necessary. 
Turning quickly and swinging his gun 
Reuben gave the savage such a hard 
blow that he fell to the ground, stun­
ned. While this put one of his pur­
suers out of the running the others 
had been able to make gains and his 
plight was even more uncomfortable 
than before.

Reuben realized that unless he was 
able in some way to regain his breath 
he must soon drop from exhaustion so, 
facing about, he raised his rifle tu his 
shoulder as if to fire. The Indians 
quickly sprang behind trees in quest of 
safety. While this gave him a slight 
opportunity for resting it did the same 
for his pursuers and when, after a few 
moments the race was resumed he 
found himself not only unable to make 
any gain but even to hold his lead up­
on the savages.

Night was now falling and it had 
grown quite dark among the trees so 
that both Reuben and the Indians were 
compelled to slacken their pace. More 
than once the lad stumbled and fell 
but his agility made it possible for 
him to regain his feet without loss of 
time. By the noise that the savages 
were making he knew that they were 
meeting with difficulties, also. He 
knew that the darkness offered his on­
ly opportunity for safety but to elude 
his pursuers was not so easy as might 
be imagined for the ground was cov­
ered with sticks and twigs which snap­
ped beneath his feet, making it possi­
ble for them to follow him by the 
sound;

By the noise of their running Reuben 
could tell that the Indians had now 
changed their tactics for they had 
formed into an extended line, probably 
expecting to encircle him. Their plan 
seemed likely to succeed when his feet 
struck a plot of ground that was moist 
and free from litter. Noting that his 
footsteps were making no sound by 
which they could follow him the lad 
grasped a low-hanging limb and swung 
himself up into a tree. After a few 
seconds the Indians went trotting by 
and as soon as they were a few rods 
away he dropped to the ground and

quietly made his way in the other di­
rection.

The Indians soon found, however, 
that they had been tricked and they 
retraced their course, carefully search­
ing among the brush and fallen trees; 
Running quite a distance Reuben then 
climbed into another tree and remain­
ed there for several hours while the 
Indians beat up and down through the 
woods several times, once even passing 
beneath the tree where he was hidden. 
Judging by their talk he imagined that 
they were angry with each other for 
allowing him to elude them. They fin­
ally gave up the search and returned 
to their camp.

After waiting for some time to sat- 
lilllllll

isfy himself that the savages had de­
parted Reuben descended and by care­
fully picking-his way, was soon out of 
hearing. He pressed onward for sev­
eral .miles before he ventured to spread 
his blanket to rest his exhausted body.

Early the following morning Reuben 
was up and on his way and; being 
spared further trials, reached his des­
tination in good season, where he ac­
quainted the officials with the situa­
tion at Fort Stanwix. An abundance 
of supplies, accompanied by a strong 
force, were soon on the way to the re­
lief of the garrison. Thus the bravery 
and endurance of youthful Reuben 
Hart were instrumental in saving that, 
important post to the Colonists.

Land O’ Nod Stories.
By H O W A R D  T . KNAPP

The Wedding Trip Completed
*  LTHOUGH the plain surrounding 

the ant hill was already black 
with winged ants, young prin­

cesses and their mates starting out on 
their wedding journey, ever increasing 
numbers of excited insects continued 
to pour from the city gates until it 
seemed to Billy Be By Bo Bum that 
the inside of the earth must be one 
vast ant hill which now was pouring 
out its entire population. Faster and 
faster they came, arising from the 
gates in dense swarms that swirled 
and eddied about Billy’s head like a 
living cloud, a cloud that buzzed and 
hummed with the rustle of innumer­
able wings.

Then Billy saw that the same thing 
was going on in the next field where 
another big ant hill reared its crest 
above the tangle of the grass forest. 
Farther on there was another ant city, 
and this, too, was pouring forts its 
countless thousands of winged males 
and young queens.

“Did the inhabitants of all these dif­
ferent cities arrange before hand to 
start their wedding journeys today so 
they could all go together?” asked 
Billy Be By Bo Bum.

“No, sir, they did not,” replied Tink­
er Teedle Tee. “There is never any 
Communication between the different 
cities, and the inhabitants of one col­
ony never have anything to do with 
their neighbors, except when they go 
to war with each other.”

“Then how does it happen that they 
are all starting on their wedding jour­
ney at the same time?” demanded 
Billy.

“How do you know when it is time 
to spin tops or that kite flying time 
has arrived?” retorted the elf. “Does 
anyone tell you when marble season 
opens ?”

“ Of course not,”  replied Billy.
“Well, one boy will start spinning 

his top and that reminds the others. 
So each fellow gets out his top and the 
next day everyone is spinning tops.”

“It is the same with the ants,” re­
plied Tinker. “The inhabitants of one 
city will start on the marriage flight 
and their neighbors, seeing what is 
going on, catch the excitement and 
make up their minds it is time for 
them to do the same thing. The re­
sult is that when one flight starts, sev­
eral others generally join it and start 
off in one big swarm.”

A stiff breeze was now blowing, and 
as the ants arose from the various hills 
they drifted with the wind until they 
were united in one vast swarm that 
darkened the sky like thunder clouds.

Flying before the wind, the ants 
drifted farther and farther from their 
home cities, until at last Billy and 
Tinker found themselves alone on the 
plain except for the worker ants, who 
now seemed to have forgotten their 
royal brothers and sisters and had 
turned their attention to closing up 
the openings made in the sides of the 
hill to help along the exit.

“By night every one of these young 
queenB will have come to earth,

and after pulling off her wings with 
her feet, started the work of building 
a home city of her own,” said Tinker 
Teedle Tee as the swarm disappeared 
in a clump of trees. “But I can’t help 
feeling sorry for their poor mates, for 
by this time tomorrow or the day after 
at the very latest, not a male will be 
left alive. Their one mission in life is 
to marry the young queens, and when 
they have fulfilled their mission, old 
Mother Nature has no further use for 
them. One by one they will drop out 
of the swarm and fall to the ground 
where they will fall easy victims to 
the birds and insects that prey on 
ants. Even if they escape this fate, 
they will perish of cold and hunger, 
for they do not know how to forage 
for themselves but have always de­
pended on others to feed them.”

“That certainly does seem a shame,” 
said Billy Be By Bo Bum. “So many 
thousands of ants born only to die 
after one short day of liberty.”

“Yes, it does seem too bad,” agreed 
Tinker Teedle Tee. “But you must re­
member, Billy Boy, that after they 
have married the princesses they are 
of no further use in the world. If they 
lived, the worker ants would have to 
support them, .and whaD with caring 
for the thousands of baby ants and 
providing food for the unmarried males 
and females, it would be too great a 
task for even the industrious little 
workers. Then it wouldn’t be any 
time at all before the city became so 
overcrowded that there wouldn’t be 
room enough to turn around. So, on 
the whole, Mother Nature, has taken 
the wisest course, as she always does, 
in dooming the males to death as soon 
as they have fulfilled their life mis­
sion.”

“Oh, look, Tinker, what are those 
ants doing?” cried Billy, pointing to a 
group of workers who were dragging 
a princess, who had already pulled, off 
her wings, back toward the city gate.

“They are taking her back to help 
the Queen Mother,” replied the elf. 
“You see, Billy Boy, the regular Queen 
is getting old and is not able to lay 
enough eggs to keep the city supplied 
with workers. So her children, who 
are always thinking of the future wel­
fare of their city, adopt* one of their 
married sisters and bring her back 
home where she is installed as an aux­
iliary queen and helps her mother lay 
eggs-.”

“How does the old queen like that 
arrangement?” asked Billy. “I should 
think she would object to dividing the 
honor with another, even one of her 
own children,” ‘ v...

“ Oh, they get’ along fine together,” 
replied the elf. "in fact, the mother is 
glad of the help, for then she doesn’t 
have to work so hard. Now, with bees 
it is different, for the Bee Queen is the 
most jealous person alive. If the work­
ers dared bring a young queen into 
the hive, the Royal Mother would fly 
into a rage and attack the intruder 
and sting her to death.”

J u n i o r  C l u b  W o r k

■  HE boys and girls who succeed 
in life are those who plan ahead. 
Following are a few suggestions 

for wide-awake club members:
1. First of all have youi* club organ­

ized and leader selected.
2. Send in your enrollment to the 

Agricultural College, Bast Lansing.
3, Begin studying the project you 

are going to take up.
Corn Club Boys should:

1. Test their seed corn.
2» Decide on location of their plot*
3. Study corn culture.
4. Study fertilizers.

Potato Club Boys should:
1» ¡Secure bulletin No. 2.
2. Be familiar with treatment for 

scab.
3. Decide on variety they are to 

grow.
4. Decide on localtion of their plot. 
5. Study fertilizers.

Garden Club Boys and Girls should: . 
1. Decide what vegetables are to be 

grown.
2. Study loca market.
3. Study soils and fertilizers.
4. Make plans for saving wastes by 

canning.
Pig Club Boys should:

L Arrange for securing a pig.
2. Study types.
3. Study feeds.
4. Plan for housing pig.

Poultry Club Boys and Girls should:
1. Decide on variety they are to 

raise.
2. Plan for setting hens or incubator. 
3. Plan for housing chickens.
4. Study egg testing, hatching, brood­

ing and feeding. 
Garment-making Girls should:

1. Decide on garments to be made 
this year.

2. Study cloth and materials.
3. Study report blanks.
4. Begin learning stitches. 

Housekeeping Club Girls should:
1. Decide on problems to be worked 

this year.
2. Study of foods and food values.
3. Begin keeping a note-Jbook. 

Canning Club Girls should:
1. Study bulletins on cold-pack proc­

ess.
2. Make a list of products to be can­

ned during the season.
3. Make plans for selling canned 

goods. .
4. Study jars and containers.
Your club meetings will bring out 

other phases of the work to be stud­
ied.

EPH’M JONES.

B Y  IfA G G IE  A . CIÎOMLICH.

Dah goes lazy Eph’m Jones— 
Good-fo’-nuffln’ bag o’ bones!
Got his bait in dat ole can.
Got his fish pole in his han’.
Huh! Des look at Eph’in’s hat.
Ever see de beat o’ dat?
Dat’s de on’y one he owns—
Lazy, loafin’ Eph’m Jones.
Why*nt he wuk lak folks lak me?
Why’nt he let dem fishes be?
Whut he s-’pose he cornin’ to?
Ain’t he nuffln’ else to do?
Look at him, des slouchin’ ’long. — 
Hummin’ some ole sort o’ song; 
Lawd! FSe got ter dig an’ scratch 
In dis blame’ ole tater patch!
Huh! I reckon he’s su gwine 
Some’re wid dat pole en line—
Way a-past de druck down mill 
Whah de crick runs roun’ de hill;
Dat de wilier tree is madp—
Den he’ll set down in de shade 
Good-fo’-nuffln’ Eph’m Jones!
Lawd ! Hit’s hot hyuh in de sun! 
Wisht dis tater patch ’uz done. 
Reckon Eph’m he’ll des lay 
In de shade dah all dis day.
’Th’owin’ in an’ pullin’ out 
Bass en’ sunflsh—mebbe trout!
Den he’ll come a sloucin’ home 
Grinnin’ lak a curry comb!
Oomph! Dis sun am not: My lan’. 
Dis is mo’ dan I can stan’.
Dah go Eph’m thoo de wood— 
Um-m-m! I bet dat shade feel good, 
Lawd! I guess nobody owns 
Me mo’ dan. dey do Eph’m' Jones, 
Tâter patch, I  sets you’ free— 
Eph’m! Ebh’in!' Wait fo’ mej

V *
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THIS VERY BEAUTIFUL, STALLION PICTURE IN 14 COLORS

M A I L E D  T O  Y O U  
PO STAG E P R E P A I D

Here is My NEW, Large, Beautiful Stallion Picture, in 14 Colors 
that will Strongly Appeal to Every Horse Lover in the World. The 
Original $500.00 Painting, was made from Life and is as True as if My 
World Famous,. Champion Stallions, Dan Patch 1:55,—Minor Heir 
1:58^,—and George Gano 2:02,—stood Right Before You in Actual life. 

This Splendid, 14 COLOR PICTURE is on 
Extra Heavy, Superfine, Enamel Stock, and 
is Worthy to Hang in Any Home or Office, 
because it is one of the Finest, and Most 
Attractive Horse Pictures in the World;

I Mail Them in Extra Heavy, Double X  
Mailing Tubes so as to INSURE Safe delivery.

YOU MUST ANSWER THREE QUESTIONS
All you have to  do to  receive this Beautiful Horse Picture Is to  Answer 

the following T H R E E  Q U E STIO N S PROVIDING You Are a Farmer or 
Stock Owner or Horseman -  Over 21 Years of Age.

FI RST -  In what Paper did you read title oiler.
SECOND -  How Many Horses, Cattle, Sheep or Hogs do you own? 
TH IR D  — Have You EVER used International Stock Food Tonic?

Write to — M . W. SAVAGE, Minneapolis, M inn.

E N A M E L E D  STOCK 
LA R G E S IZ E  22 by 28

Such Splendid, Quality Pictures in Colors and Extra Fine Stock,—usually 
Retail at $2.00 to $3.00 at ArtStores but You can have ONE Absolutely Free.

You will Enjoy this Horse Picture all Your Life and it is entirely 
Free of Advertising, so that it is REALLY an Art Picture of Great Merit 
and a Picture of Three Great, World Champion Stallions,

Dan -Patch 1:55 is the Fastest Harness 
Horse of all Champions. Minor Heir and 
George Gano are the Fastest Team, in the 
World, with a Wagon Record of 2:02, 

Write Me Today and Secure ONE of these 
Beautiful, 22 by 28 Horse Pictures,—in 14 
Colors,-Absolutely Free,—Postage Prepaid.

ASK DEALERS ABOUT M Y  599 FREE PREMIUMS.
INDISPUTABLE FACTS FROM THE PRACTICAL SCHOOL OF 

EVERYDAY EXPERIENCE OF OVER TWO M ILLIO N  FARMERS.
The Fact that International Stock Food Tonic,—3 FEEDS for  ONE GENT,—has Successfully 

stood the Practical, Every-Day Test of Farmers and Stockmen All Over thè W orld for Over a 
Quarter o f  a . Century, is Absolute, Indisputable Proof to any Fair-Minded, Intelligent Man that 
it M ust possess Very Superior M erits. An Increasing Sale for over 26 Years can be explained 
on no other basis. Tne Largest Seller in the World can be built up on ly  on merit. Any other claim 
would be childish nonsense or proof of a vindictive, prejudiced mind. During the past 26 Years, 
Hundreds of Preparations have been offered for sale—had a limited sale, but have entirely disappeared 
— but the sale of International Stock Food T on ic has constantly  increased during these 26 
Years. It is Guaranteed to save 70 Bushels of Oats per year, for Every Work Team, at a using ex­
pense of Only $7.50 per year and also— to keep Horses Healthful and: Stronger. It  makes Colts grow 
and'develop very rapidly. International Stock Food T on ic ,—3 FEEDS for  ONE GENT,— was 
O riginated by one of the Largest Harness Horse Breeders of the World (M . _W. Savage) owning the 
700 acre International 1:55 Horse Breeding Farmi with about 250 Stallions, Brood Mares and 
Colts. He carefully experimented oh both his Horses and Other Stock for many years before placing 
it  on the-market. I t  is Guaranteed to make Your Cows give from Two to Four MORE Quarts of 
Milk, Every Day, and to Make Calves Quick Growers, even on skim milk. It is a common sense,, 
every-day Tonic, Blood Purifier, general System Strengthener and a Great Aid to Better Digestion 
and Assimilation, so that Horses, Cattle, Sheep and Hogs will gain M ore Pounds for Every Bushel 
of grain eaten. I t  has also Always had the Largest Sale in the World for Preventing Disease in Hogs 
anafor helping m ake Pigs, Shoats or Hogs Grow Am azingly. It  is not to take the place of grain, 
but is to mix W ith  grain for Better Health, Larger Profit, by  improving Digestion and Assimila­
tion of All Animals. International S tock  Food T o n ic ,—3 FEEDS for  ONE C®NT,—dièlps keep 
Every Animal up to Full Norm al Strength and Health,, and is a REMARKABLE PREVENT­
IVE of Disease. You eat several kinds of medicinal ingredients With Your Own Food E ver yD ay. 
Don’t  you think it is JUst As Sensible to  think Your Animals should have certain Vegetable Medicinal 
Ingredients, which they eat freely when running wild? DEALERS,, everywhere,. sell>it on a Spot 
C««ti Guarantee to Refund Your Money in fu ll if it ever Fails to k e e p  YourS tockan Better Health 

and to make you a Big Extra Profit- over its low cost of,—3  FEEDS fo t  CENT. _ All
Wide-Awake, Fair Minded Farmers admit this is a Square Deal. Over TW O  MILLION 

FARMERS lUse it  Regularly because it  Makes them  EXTRA M oney in  .G rowing, 
Fattening or fo r  Preventing Disease. YOUR CHOICE OF 599 FREE PREMIUMS,

TH O U SAN DS O F  FA R M ER S  A N D  S TO C K M EN  
D E L IG H T E D  W ITH M Y  $23.10, D AN  P A T C H  G O L D  S T O P  W ATC H .

M.W . SAVAGES
M i l

When you write me for my Beautiful, Stallion 
Picture,— ask me about my Easy Plan for quickly 
securing a- $25.00 Dan Patch Gold Stop Watch, 
— Absolutely Free. Thousands of Farmers and

____________________ Stockmen now carry M y Splendid $25.00' Dan
Patch Gold Stop Watch and you may also have one, WITHOUT PAYING ME ONE CENT. 
lttia  a,—TW O IN ONE,—Gold  WATCH,—Regular Movement which keeps the most Dependable

Time and ALSO.r-the Stop Watch Movement 
with which you can time Automobiles, Races and 
all Speed Events which require the most Exact 
Timing. Each part works Independently of the 
other. A more Beautiful Watch and a better 
time keeper than the $225. Swiss Stop Watch, 
— formerly carried by M. W. Savage. Beautiful, 
High Class,—TWO Gold Watches in One Case.

M . W . Savage has a,— N E W  P L A N ,— whereby Y ou  
can secure a Valuable D an Patch  1:55, C olt,— without 
payingh im  a cent o f  m oney. It you are Interested In se­
curing a  D an P a tch  C olt,-Free,-then  be  sure and Ask 
about thls.-when you  W rite for the Beautiful Stallion 
Picture. Y ou might Secure a colt that would develop into 
a  W orld.Cham pion,-W orth from- $50,000 to $100,000. M . 
W . Savage's Stallion, Arlon 2:071,— sold for 9125,000 Cadi, 
— when only two years old. M . W. Savage Raises a Large 
Number o f Dan Patch. 1:55 Colts,— every year,— from  High 
Class Brood Mares. N o man can tell* which will develop 
into a  85,000, or a  910,000, or  a 925,000; or a  950,000, or 
even a  9100,000 Horse. The one Y ou  Secure m ight be the 
Best o f  all and be a W orld Champion and  be W orth from 
950,000 to 9100,000. Dan sires both Trotters and Pacers 
and has 104 In the 1915 Official Speed List. A  Great Sire.
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G et Stum ps O ut 
W ith Less W ork

Pulling stumps is slow and costly. "A n  explosive reduces 
the labor of clearing land to the minimum. It may be 
used by any intelligent man,”  says Minnesota Farmers’ 
Bulletin 134. Get any stump out quickly, and at the 
same time split it into pieces easily handled, by using

/Itla s fa r m R w d e r .

Atlas Farm Powder is made 
especially for farm use. It is 
easy to use — no experience 
needed. Just bore a hole, load, 
fire, and work that otherwise 
would take hours or days is 
done instantly! Ask your deal­
er about Atlas Powder today.

Send for * ‘Better Farming” Book—FREE’
Our illustrated book. Better Farming,”  tells 
bow to improve the fertility of the soil, how to 
grow bigger crops, redeem waste land, improve 
orchards, etc., with Atlas Farm Powder. Valu­
able to every land owner. Mail the coupon.

ATLAS POWDER COMPANY
General Office«: Wilmington. Del.

Sales Offices: Birmingham, Boston, Houghton, 
Joplin, Kansas City, Knoxville, New Orleans,

New York, Philadelphia, St, Louis 1

You can save money and make 
money by using Atlas Farm 
Powder to blast out stumps 
and shatter boulders, break up 
hard-pan, do ditching and dig 
holes for trees or posts. It is 
the cheapest farm hand you 
can possibly find.

I FREE BOOK COUPON
ATLAS POWDER CO., Wilmington, D e l 
Send me your '74-page book “ Better Farming/ 9 
I am interested in the use o f explosives for the 
purpose before which I mark X. M F 2

Tree Planting 
Ditch Digging 
Quarrying-Mining

Stump Blasting 
Boulder Blasting 
Subsoil Blasting

Name.

Address.

M y  B ig  N e w  F a r m  G a t e  
B O O K  Postpaid iTTTf^m

' I  want every landowner to have my big  Free Boob 
o f  Farm Gates. Tells how to  make 6 year gu ar-jS lf 
an teed _ CAN’T-SAG Gates at home in your fa V  
spare time and save dollars. Shows why these y —, 
easy swinging Gates never sag, drag, rotout or break down — yet cost leas than any other. Write today- tSB 

ALVIN  V . RO W E, P r e s id e n t ^President

Costs Less than A ll Wood— Lasts 3 Times as Long
Made with either 4 or 6 Inch boards, double-bolted between 8 . 
angle steel uprights—not screwed or nailed. No nails to gather 
rust or pull out—no wood joints to collect water and rot. Can T 
be furnished with Elevating Attachment. ,

GUARANTEED 5 YEARS— 30 DAYS FREE TR IA L;
Catalog shows complete Gates ready to hang or jnst the Gate r 
Steels, hinges, bolts, etc. (everything but the boards.) Postal 
brings Catalog—free—postpaid. Write. ALVIN V. ROWE* P res. " 
ROWE MFC. CO.» 2912 AdamaSt. Q aleaburg, III,

Light of Western Stars

*®The WheatYields
Tells the Story

of Western Canada’s Rapid Progress
The heavy crops in Western Canada have caused new 

records to be made in the handling of grains by railroads.
For while the movement of these heavy shipments has 

been wonderfully rapid, the resources of the different 
roads, despite enlarged equipments and increased facili­
ties, have been strained as never before, and previous 
records have thus been broken in all directions.
The largest Canadian wheat shipments through New York 
ever known are reported for the period up to October 15th,
upwards of four and a quarter million bushels being exported in less than six <

and this was but the overflow of shipments to Montreal, through which point ship­
ments were much larger than to New York.
Yields as high as 60 bushels o f  wheat per acre are reported from  all parts o f  the 
country; while yields o f  45 bushels per acre are common.
Thousands o f  American farmers have taken part in this wonderful production. Land 

.  __ prices are still low and free homestead lands are easily secured in good
r  - localities, convenient to churches, schools, markets, railways, etc.

1 o  I n T  4 ,  i -  A  T h e r e  Is n o  w a r  ta x  o n  la n d  a n d  n o  c o n s c r ip t io n .  / w W  
*  F iflarh ' Write fo r  illustrated pamphlet, reduced railroad rates '

—  and other information to

M .  V .  M c l N N E S ,  jf
178 Jefferson Aye. Detroit, Mich.

Canadian Government Agent.

weeks.

tr ia l .
Money-back
guarantee.

DHchini
and Terracing i 
Made E asy—Bigger 

.crops—better farms with 
’ Farm Ditcher 
t  Road Grader

_  Cuts ditch to  4 f t .  Grades roads. | 
All Steel—Practical—Adjustable —  Reversible 
Cleans ditches, cuts and works out dirt a t same tim e. 
Does w ork o f  b ig  machines. Soon pays fo r  Itself. 
W rite fo r  free booklet and Introductory proposition. 
OvensboroDitcher&GraderCo. lac. Box 830,0wen t  bore, i f .  j

M 0 0 . 0 0 0 l o A m u u  H o v e  
S o u a L i  9 .5 ,0 0 0 .0 0 0 ß o c U !

“ lore Potatoes”
From ground planted secured 
by use o f The K E Y 8 T O N E  
P O T A T O  P L A N T E R  than 
by  any other m e t h o d  o f 

planting. Work perfectly ac­
curate, A simple, strong, 
durable machine. W r i t e  
for C A T A L O G , price, etc. 

A . J .  P L A T T . M F R . 
BOX J  STERLING. ILL.

D I R E C T
FROM FACTORY 
FREIGHT PREMID

E v ery  inch Basic 
Open Hearth wire. 
Double Galvanized. 
13c PER ROD UP. 

Money Saving Fence Book and 
sample free. Just write postal now to 
THE BROWN FENCE & WIRE CO. 
Department 4 9  Cleveland, O

WAGONS
High or low wheels— steel or wood—wide 

or narrow tires. Wagon parts of all 
kinds. Wheels to fit any running gear.
log illustrated In colors free.

Co., 35eIb s t, Quincy, III.

By Z A N E  G R E Y
“ Sure, I know ’em ; an’ you’re not shall give you no orders, but—is it too 

mentionin’ one more particular cow- much to ask that you will be my kind 
boy in my outfit,” said Stillwell, with of a cowboy?”
a dry chuckle and a glance at Stewart. “Miss Hammond, what kind of a 

Madeline divined the covert mean- cowboy is that?” 
ing, and a slight chill passed over her, “I—I don’t exactly know. It is the 
as if a cold wind had blown in from kind I feel you might be. But I do
thL hills- A T know that in the problem at hand I

Stewart, I see you carry a gun,” want your actions to be governed by 
she said, pointing to a black handle reason, not passion. Human life is not 
protruding from a sheath swinging low for any man to sacrifice, unless in 
along his leather chaps. self-defense or in protecting those de-

™a'am'” . pendent upon him. What Stillfell and
Why do you carry it?” she asked, you hinted makes me afraid of Nels 
Well, he drawled, “it’s not a pret- and Nick Steele and Monty. Cannot 

ty gun and it’s sure heavy.”  they be controlled? I want to feel that
She caught the inference. The gun they will not go gunning for Don Car- 

was not an ornament. His keen, los’s men. I want to avoid all vio- 
steady, dark gaze caused her vague lence, and yet, when my guests come, 
alarm. She had to do with a question I want to feel that they will be safe 
involving human life; and the value from danger and annoyance. May I 
she placed upon human life, and its not rely upon you, Stewart? Can’t I 
spiritual significance, were matters as trust you to manage these obstreper- 
far as the width of the world from this ous cowboys and protect my property 
cowboy’s thought. and Alfred’s and take care of us—of

A strange idea flashed up. Did she me—until this revolution is ended ? I 
place too much value upon all human have never had a day’s worry since I 
life? She checked that, wondering, al- bought the ranch. It is not that I 
most horrified, at herself. And then want to shirk my responsibilities; it is 
her intuition told her that she possess- that I like being happy. May I put so 
ed a stronger power to move these much faith in you?” 
primitive men than any stern rule or *‘I hope so—I reckon so, Miss Ham- 
order. mond,” replied Stewart.

“Stewart, I do not fully understand It was an instant response, but none 
what you hint that Nels and his com- the less fraught with consciousness of 
rades might do. Please be frank with responsibility. He waited a moment, 
me. Do you mean Nels would shoot and then, as neither Stillwell nor Mad- 
upon little provocation?” eline offered further speech, he bowed

“Miss Hammond, as far aB Nels is and turned down the path, 
concerned, shooting is now just a mat- “Wal, wal!” exclaimed Stillwell, 
ter of his meeting several of Don Car- Thet’s no little job you give him, Miss 
los’s vaqueros. It’s sure wonderful Majesty.”
what’ Nels has stood from them, con- “It was a woman’s cunning, Still­
sidering the Mexicans he’s already well,”  said Alfred. “ My sister used to 
killed.”  be a wonder at getting her own way

“Already killed! Stewart, you are when we were kids. Just a smile or 
not in earnest?” cried Madeline, two, a few sweet words—and she had 
shocked. what she wanted.”

“I reckon I am. Nels has seen hard “Al, what a character to give m e!” 
life along the Arizona border. He likes protested Madeline. “ Indeed, I was 
peace as well as any man, but a few deeply in earnest with Stewart. I do 
quiet years don’t change what the not understand just why, but I trust 
early days made of him. As for Nick him. He seems like iron and steel. 
Steele and Monty, they’re just bad ac- Then I was a little frightened at the 
tors, and looking for trouble.”  prospect of trouble with the vaqueros.

“How about yourself, Stewart? Still- Both you and Stillwell have taught me 
well’s remark was not lost upon me,”  to look upon Stewart as invaluable. I 
said Madeline, prompted by curiosity, thought it best to confess my utter 

Stewart did not reply. He looked helplessness and to look to him for 
at her in respectful silence. In her support.”
keen earnestness Madeline saw be- “ Majesty, whatever actuated you, it 
neath his cool exterior, and was all was a stroke of diplomacy,” replied 
the more baffled. Was there an in- her brother. “The fellow has good 
scrutable mocking light in his eyes, or stuff in him; but remember, he’s a 
was it only her imagination? The composite of tiger-breed and forked 
cowboy’s face was as hard as flint. lightning, and don’t imagine he has 

“Stewart, I have come to love my failed you if he gets into a fight.” 
ranch,” said Madeline slowly, “and I “ I’ll sure tell you what Gene Stew- 
care a great deal for my—my cowboys, art will do,” said Florence. “ Don’t I 
It mould be dreadful if they were to know cowboys? Why, they used to 
kill anybody, especially if one of them take me up on their horses when I was 
should be killed.”  a baby. Gene Stewart will be the kind

“Miss Hammond, you’ve changed of cowboy your sister said he might 
things considerable out here, but you be, whatever that may be. She may 
can’t change these men. All that’s not know and we may not guess, but 
needed to* start them is a little trou- he knows?’
ble; and his revolution is bound to “Wal, Flo, there you hit plumb cen- 
make rough times'along some of the ter,” replied the old cattleman. “An* 
wilder passes across the border. We I couldn’t be gladder if he was my 
are in line, that’s all, and the boys are own son!”
getting stirred up.” . . • Early the following morning Stew-

“Very well, then, I must accept the art, with a company of cowboys, de­
inevitable. I can see that some of my parted for Don Carlos’s rancho. As 

I cowboys cannot be checked much long- the day wore on without any report 
er; but, Stewart, whatever you have from him, Stillwell appeared to grow 
been in the past, you have changed.” more at ease; and at nightfall he told 
She smiled at him, and her voice was Madeline that he guessed there was 
singularly sweet and rich. “ Stillwell now no reason for concern, 
has so often referred to you as** the “Wal, though it’s sure amazin’ 
last of his kind of cowboy. I have just strange,” he continued. “ I’ve been 
a faint idea of what a wild life you worryin’ some about how we was goin’ 
have led. Perhaps that fits you to be to fire Don Carlos; but Gene has a 
a leader of such rough men. I am no way of doin’ things.” 
judge of what a leader should do in Next day Stillwell and Alfred decid- 
this crisis. My cowboys are incurring ed to ride over to Don Carlos’s place, 
risk in my employ; my property is not taking Madeline and Florence with 
safe; perhaps my life even might be them, and to stop at Alfred’s ranch on 
endangered. I want to rely upon you, the return trip. They started in the 
since Stillwell believes, and I, too, cool gray dawn; and after three hours’ 
that you are the man for this place. I riding, as the sun began to get bright,

I
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they entered a mesqui grove surround­
ing corrals and barns, a number of 
low, squat buildings, and a huge, ram­
bling* structure, all built of adobe and 
mostly crumbling to ruin. Only one 
green spot relieved the bald red of 
grounds and walls; and this, evident­
ly, was made by the spring which had 
given both value and fame to Don Car­
los’s ranch. ,

The approach to the house was 
through a wide courtyard, bare, stony, 
hard-paeked, with hitching-rails and 
watering-troughs in front of a long 
porch. Several dusty, tired horses 
stood with drooping heads and bridles 
down.

“Wal, dog-gone it, AIT If there ain’t 
Pat Hawe’s hoss, I’H eat it,” exclaim­
ed Stillwell.

“What’s Pat want here, anyhow?” 
growled Alfred.

No one was in sight, but Madeline 
heard loud voices coming from the 
house. Stillwell dismounted at the 
porch and- stalked in at the door. Al­
fred leaped off his horse and helped 
Florence and Madeline down. Then, 
bidding them rest and wait on the 
porch, he followed Stillwell.

“ I hate these Mexican places,” said 
Florence, with a grimaee. “They’re so 
mysterious and creepy. Just watch, 
now! There’ll be dark-skinned, beady- 
eyed, soft-footed greasers slip right up 
oat of the ground. There’ll be an ugly 
face in every door and window and 
crack.”

“ It’s like a huge barn with its char­
acteristic odor permeated by tobacco- 
smoke,” replied Madeline, sitting down 
beside Florence. “I don’t think very 
much of this end of my purchase. Flor­
ence, isn’t that Don Carlos’s black 
horse over there in the corral?”
/ “ It sure is. Then the don s heah 
yet. I wish we hadn’t been in such a 
hurry to come over. There! That 
doesn’t sound encouraging.”

From the eorridor came the rattling 
of spurs, the tramping of boots, and 
loud voices. Madeline detected Al­
fred’s tone of annoyance.

“We’ll rustle back home, then,”  he 
said.

“ No!”
Madeline recognized Stewart’s voice, 

and she quickly straightened up.
“ I won't have them in here,”  went 

on Alfred.
“Outdoors or in, they’ve got to be 

with us!” replied Stewart sharply.
“Listen, Al,” came the boom of Still­

well’s big voice; .“now that we’ve but­
ted in over hyar with the girls, you 
let Stewart run things.”

Then a crowd of men tramped pell- 
mell out upon the porch. Stewart, 
dark-browed and somber, was in the 
lead. Nels hung close to him, and 
Madeline’s quick glance saw that Nels 
had undergone some indescribable 
change. The grinning, brilliant-eyed 
Don Carlos came jostling out beside 
a gaunt, sharp-featured man wearing 
a silver shield. This no doubt was 
Pat Hawe. In the background, behind 
Stillwell and Alfred, stood Nick Steele, 
towering head aqd shoulders over a 
number of vaqueros and cowboys.

“ Miss Hammond, I’m sorry you 
came,” said Stewart bluntly, “we’re in 
a muddle here, live insisted that you 
and Flo should be kept close to us. I’ll 
explain later. If you can’t stop your 
ears, I beg you to overlook rough talk.” 
With that he turned to the men be­
hind him. “Nick, take Booly, go back 
to Monty and the boys. Fetch out that 
stuff—all of it! Rustle now!”

Stillwell and Alfred disengaged 
themselves from the crowd, to take up 
positions in front of Madeline and 
Florence. Pat Hawe leaned against a 
post and insolently ogled Madeline, 
and then Florence. Don Carlos pressed 
forward. Madeline seemed to see him 
from his great high-top boots upward. 
It was a slow, fascinated glance she 
let rise over him.

He wore tight velveteen breeches, 
with a heavy fold down the outside 
seam which was ornamented with sil­
ver buttons. Round his waist he had 
a sash and a belt with fringed holster 
from which protruded a pearl-handled

gun. A vest or waistcoat, richly em­
broidered, partly concealed a blouse 
of silkr and wholly revealed a silken 
scarf round his neck.

His swarthy face showed dark lines, 
like cords, under the surface. His lit­
tle eyes were exceedingly prominent 
and glittering. To Madeline his face 
seemed to be a bold, handsome mask,, 
through which his eyes piercingly be­
trayed the nature of the man.

He bowed low, with elaborate and 
sinuous grace; His smile revealed 
brilliant teeth and enhanced the bril­
liance of his eyes. He slowly spread 
deprecatory hands.

“Señoritas, I beg a thousand par­
dons,” he said. How strange it was 
for Madeline to hear English spoken 
with a soft,, whiningly sweet accent! 
“The gracious hospitality of Don Car­
las has passed with his house.”

Stewart stepped forward. Thrust­
ing Don Carlos aside, he called:

“Make way, there!”
The crowd fell back to the tramp of 

heavy boots. Cowboys appeared, stag­
gering. out of the corridor with long 
boxes. These they placed side by side 
upon the floor of the porch.

“Now, Hawe, we’ll proceed with our 
business,” said Stewart. “You see 
these boxes, don’t you?”

“I reckon I see a good many things 
round hyar,” replied Hawe meaningly.

“Well, do you intend to open these 
boxes upon my say-so?”

“No,” retorted Hawe. “It's not my 
place to meddle with property as come 
by express an* all accounted fer reg­
ular.”

“You call yourself a sheriff!” ex­
claimed Stewart scornfully.

'T’ll open them. Here, one of you 
boys, knock the tops of these boxes,”  
ordered Stewart. “No, not you, Monty. 
You use your eyes. Let Booly handle 
the axe. Rustle now!”

Monty Price had jumped out of the 
crowd .into the middle of the porch. 
The manner in which he gave way to 
Booly and faced the vaqueros was not 
significant of friendliness or trust.

“Stewart, you’re dead wrong to bust 
open them boxes. Thet’s ag’in’ the 
law,” protested Hawe, trying to in­
terfere.

Stewart pushed him back. Then 
Don Carlos, who had been stunned by 
the appearance of the boxes, suddenly I 
became active in speech and person. 
Stewart thrust him back, also. The 
Mexican’s excitement increased. He 
wildly gesticulated; he exclaimed 
shrilly in Spanish. When, however, 
the lids were wrenched open and an 
inside packing was torn away, he grew 
rigid and silent. «

Madeline raised herself behind Still­
well to see that the boxes were full of 
rifles and ammunition.

“There, Hawe! What did I tell you?” 
demanded Stewart. “ I came over here 
to take charge of this ranch. I found 
these boxes hidden in an unused room. 
% suspected what they were—contra­
band goods!”

“Wal, supposin’ they are? I don't 
see any call fer sich an all-fired fuss as 
you’re makin’. Stewart, I calkilate 
you’re some stuck on your new job, 
an’ want to make a big show before—” 

“Hawe, stop slinging that kind of 
talk,” interrupted Stewart. “You got 
too free with your mouth once before! 
Now here—I’m supposed to be consult­
ing an officer of the law. Will you 
take eharge of these contraband, 
goods ?”

“ Say, you’re hoktin’ on high an' 
mighty,”  replied Hawe, in astonish­
ment that was plainly pretended. 
“What’re you drivin’ at, hey?”

Stewart muttered an imprecation. 
He took several swift strides across 
the porch and held out his hands to 
Stillwell as if to indicate the hopeless­
ness o f . intelligent and reasonable ar­
bitration. He looked at Madeline with 
a glance eloquent of his regret that he 
could not handle the situation to 
please her. Then, as he wheeled, he 
came face to face with Nels, who had 
slipped forward out of the crowd.

Madeline gathered serious import 
from the steel-blue flash of eyes where-

Breed Game Birds 
on.Your Farm

» O R  many years, we in America have 
spent much time bemoaning; the 
disappearance of our feathered 

game. It is indeed a fact that we have 
little game to eat and little to shoot. But 
we can have an abundance of game in 
the fields and on the market.

T he farmers o f this country have the 
land and the enterprise to make America 
the greatest game producing country in 
the world. They can supply the ever in­
creasing demand of American markets 
and American sportsmen by game farming.

T o  you, game farming should prove 
o f interest for three reasons:

It is profitable from a marketing stand­
point. T he demand for eggs and for 
breeding stock is much greater than the* 
supply, and will be for years to come. 
Pheasant eggs, for instance, sell today at 
from $20 to $25 a hundred. Live birds 
bring from $5 to $7 a pair.

It will, at small expense in time and trouble, 
supply you with an abundance of food for your 
own consumption. Pheasants, wild turkeys, 
quail, grouse, and other birds forage much of 
their own food, and require comparatively Kttle 
attention.

It will provide more shooting for you and for 
everyone, for it is a fact that game raised for 
sporting purposes can not be confined in any re­
stricted area. A t  the same time, those who own 
large acreage, or  who pool their land with others, 
get profit from those who pay for sport.

Game farming can be done on a small scale, 
and as a side issue to regular farm work, or it is 
a profitable occupation in itself.

W om en on the farm who are raising domestic 
poultry, wilt find it worth while to breed game 
birds as w dl.

W hen conducted on a large scale, a game 
farm produces sufficient income to be a paying 
business in itself;

But this subject is too  big to be properly 
treated in this space. Every progressive farmer 
is sure to be interested in it. W rite for the book, 
“ Game Farming for Profit and Pleasure,’ * 
which will be sent to you without cost. It tells 
o f the subject in a most interesting and inform­
ative manner. Fill out the coupon below and a 
copy will be mailed you at once.

Game Breeding Department, Room  205

HERCULES POW DER CO.
Wilmington, Delaware

Manufacturers of Explosives; Infallible and "E. C. ”  Smokeless Shotgun Powders, L. A R. Orange Extra 
Black Spotting Powders Dynamite for Farming

Game Breeding Department, Room 205̂  _  .
Hercules Powder Company, Wilmington, Delaware 

Gentlemens— Please send me a copy of Game Farming for Profit and Pleasure.
in game breeding from the standpoint o f . . . . —. —- —- - —-------------------------------

Very truly yours,
Name .  ___ ___ ___ ________—  ------------------------------- --------- .------- —- - - - - — - -

I am interested

Come to Detroit
The Automobile Center

A n d Big opportunities 
everywhere for Detroit Hi trained automobile men. Inter- 

-  estinff, pleasant and money making 
business. Ambitious men needed to  start 

garage and repair shops everywhere. Learn 
bow. Chauffers, garage and repair men, testers, 

etc., have more than they can do. Plenty o f room for 
you-

EARN $75 TO $300 A MONTH
Students have experience o f building new cars from 
start to finish—factory training in block testing, etc. 
—all the leading types of starting, lighting and igm- 

W  tion systems in  operation. New 6-cyl. Losier Touring Car and 8-cyl. King 
y  Car used for road instruction. Just purchased—new 8-cyl. Cole Motor for m o c k  

_ rtest dept, solely for students instruction. Just added 1916 Delco System an used 
in  Buick, Hudson and Packard 12.

DETROIT IS THE PLACE TO LEARN

[ars. guarantee copy o r  auto o ca o o i  « e w »  w u  uow uiuvui«»»
S E E . O r better etili, jum p on  a  train  and com e to  D etroit, as hundreds have done. 

Learn th e  autom obile business in  D etroit and learn it right.
MICHIGAN STATE AUTO SCHOOL, 1002 Auto Bldg., 11-1» Seldeo Ave., PETKOTT, MICH.

00D SEEDS
GOOD AS CAN BE GROWN 

Prices Below AH Others
1 w ill g iv e  a  lo t o f  n ew  
sorts free w ith every order 
I  fill. B u y and test. R eturn  
If n ot O. k .— money refunded.

Big Catalog FREE
O ver 700 illustrations o f vege­
tables and: flowers. Send your» 
and your neighbors’  addresses. 
R .  H i .  6 H U M W A Y ,  R o c k f o r d , I t L

SEED CORN That CROWS
P rice 's  Early P rolific . 100 days-60 to  tiOfbu. per aore.

O H IO
fPATJLPING, O H IO .

P U R E  F I E L D  S E E D
01over,T im othy, Alsikey A lfa lfa  and'all kinds o f  PU R E  
F IE L D  SEEDS d irect from  producer to  consumer} 
freefrom  all noxious weeds. Ask .for samples.
A. O. HOYT A 00., Box M. FOSTOKIA, OHIO.

Member Mich. Experiment Association. It non no.
5 “ T h e  C om  B elt Oat.” also W orthy's. N ot damaged by 
wet. F ree from  smut. Sam ple and prices on  reauest 
e T » .  C H R IS T IA N S E N . C O R A L . M IC K .

Mention The Michigan Firm e r When Writing W w rtls e n
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Produce

Clear that idle land. Re­
move t h e  stumps and 
boulders. Straighten the 
crooked creeks. Improve 
your soil. Increase your 
crops and the value of 
your farm. Remove the 
handicaps that hinder your 
work and profits.

Red Cross Farm Powder
will help you clear land quickly, 
easily and cheaply. Get those 
unproductive acres in working 
order now and crop them early 
this spring* Thousands of farmers 
everywhere have found Red Cross 
Farm Powder a wonderful help. 

Big Book Free
contains 18 8 pages of interesting 
facts. Explains the use o f Red Cross 
Farm Powder for land clearing, sub- 
soiling, ditching, tree planting and 
many other things, and tells how this 
modern farm help has solved for other 
farmers the very problems that perhaps 
now bother you. W rite today for
Hand Book o f Explosives No. 100F

E. 1. Du Pont De Nemours & Co.
W ilm ington Delaware

by Nels communicated something to fore him—which they did, even Hawe 
Stewart. Whatever that something and his attendants sullenly retreating, 
was it dispelled Stewart’s impatience. Don Carlos got up to confront Stew- 
A slight movement of his hand brought art. The prostrate vaquero stirred and 
Monty Price forward with a jump. In moaned, but did not rise, 
these sudden jumps of Monty’s there “You needn’t gibber Spanish to me,” 
was a suggestion of restrained fero- said Stewart. “You can talk Ameri- 

Then Nels and Monty lined up can and you can- understand American, 
behind Stewart. It was a deliberate if you start a rough-house here, you 
action and unmistakably formidable, an(j your greasers will be cleaned up.
eV^n+t<i j Mad.elli e' * i You’ve got to leave this ranch. You

Pat Hawes face took on an ugly Can have the stock, the packs, and 
look, his eyes had a reddish gleam. traps in tbe seCond corral. There’s 
Don Carlos added a pale face and ex- grub> too> Saddle up and u t  thetrail! 
treme nervousness to his iormer ex- If you don% n i  have tbe United 
pressions of agitation. The cowboys cayalry hf;re in six h and you can 
edged away from the vaqueros and the gamble they,u t what cyow 
bronzed, bearded horsemen who were ieave Qf you!”  ■
evidently Hawe’s assistants. ~ ‘ ... ,Don Carlos was either a capital ac-

I m driving at this, spoke up Stew- tor or else he was thoroughly cowed 
art presently, and now he was slow by reference to the troops, 
and caustic. “Here’s contraband of “Si, senor! Gracias, senor!” he ex­
war! Hawe, do you get that? Arms claimed, and then, turning away, he 
and ammunition for the rebels across called to his men 
the border! I charge you as an officer They hurried after him, while the 
to confiscate these goods and to arrest fallen Vaquero got to his feet with 
the smuggler, Don Carlos!”  Stewart’s help and staggered across

These words of Stewart’s precipi- the courtyard. In a moment they were 
tated a riot among Don Carlo s follow- gone, leaving Hawe and his several 
ers, and they surged wildly around the comrades behind.
sheriff. There were ah unflinging of Hawe was spitefully ejecting a wad 
brown, clenching hands and a shrill, of tobacco from his mouth and swear 
jabbering babel of Mexican voices. The ing in an undertone about “white-liv 
crowd around Don Carlos grew louder ered greasers.” He cocked his red eye 
and denser with the addition of armed speculatively at Stewart 
vaqueros, barefooted stable-boys, dus- “Wal, I reckon as you’re so bent on 
ty-booted herdsmen, and blanketed doin’ it up brown that you’ll try to fire 
Mexicans, the last of whom slipped me off’n the range too 
from doors and windows and round <<If ? ever do, p at, you’ll need to be
C“  . ‘ . .  .. , _  _ carried off,” replied Stewart. “JustShrill cries evidently from Don Car- now 1>m politely inviting you and
los somewhat quieted the commotion. deputy sheriffs to leave.
Then Don Carlos could be heard ad

Two
W atches

dressing Sheriff Hawe in an exhorta­
tion of mingled English and Spanish. 
He denied, he avowed, he proclaimed, 
and all in rapid, passionate utterance. 
He tossed his black hair in vehemence; 
he waved his fists and stamped the 
floor; he rolled his glittering eyes; he 
twisted his thin lips into a hundred 
different shapes and, like a cornered 
wolf, showed snarling white teeth.

It seemed to Madeline that Don Car­
los denied knowledge of the boxes of

“We’ll go, but we’re cornin’ back one 
of these days, an’ when we do, we’ll 
put you in irons!”

“Hawe, if you’ve got it in that bad 
for me, come over here in the corral 
and let’s fight it out.”

“I’m an officer, an’ I don’t fight out 
laws an’ sich, except when I hev to 
make arrests.”

“Officer! You’re a disgrace to the 
county. If you ever did get irons on 
me, you’d take me some place out of

, , ... , , , , sight, shoot me, and then swear you
contraband goods; then knowledge of kiUed me in Seif.defense. It wouldn’t 
their real contents; then knowledge of be tbe firsf time you pulled that trick 
their destination; and, finally, every- p a  ̂ Hawe' ”
thing except that they were there in <<Ho! bo‘,» iaugbed Hawe derisively, 
sight, damning witnesses to some- Then he started toward the borgeg
bodys complicity in the breaking of Stewart’s long arm shot out and his 
neutrality laws. Passionate as had band clapped on Hawe’s shoulder, spiix-
been his denial of all this, it was as 
nothing compared to his denunciation 
of Stewart.

ning him round like a top.

Ask 
About 
Hand- 
Power 
P tillers 
Low Prlo# 
120,000  
Pound* Pull

“You’re leaving, Pat, but before you
(B , , leave you’ll come out with your play,“Senor Stewart, he keel my vaq- or you>11 crawl/> said stewart «You’ve

uer°! shouted Don Carlos, as, sweat- got it in for me, man to man. Speak 
mg and spent, he concluded his ar- up now> an. prove you,re not the CQW_ 
raignment of the cowboy. “Him you ardly skunk IVe alwayg thought , 
must arrest! Senor Stewart a bad Fve called your hand >, 
man! He keel my vaquero!”

“Do you hear thet?” yelled Hawe.
“The don’s got you figgered fer thet 
little job at El Cajon last fall.”

The clamor burst into a roar. Hawe 
began shaking his finger in Stewart’s 
face and hoarsely shouting.

Pat Hawe’s face turned a blackish- 
purple hue.

“You can jest bet I’ve g;ot it in fer 
you,” he shouted hoarsely. “You’re 
only a low-doWn, drunken cow-punch­
er! You never had a dollar or a de- 

■  IIP  H  cent job till you was mixed up with
Then a lithe young vaquero, swift thet Hammond woman”

as an Indian, glided under Hawe’s up- stewart’s hand flashed out and hit 
lifted arm. Whatever the action he Hawe’s face ln a ringing g, The 
intended, he was too late for its execu- sheriff’s head jerked back, his som- 
tmn Stewart lunged out, struck him, brero fell to the ground. As he bent 
and knocked him off the porch. As he over to reach lt> hig band ghook hig 
fell, a dagger glittered m the sunlight arm shookf hig whole bod gbook 
and rolled clinking over the stones. Monty Price jumped stralgbt forwird

The man went down hard and did and crouched down with a strange, 
not move. With the same abrupt vio- wild utterance. Stewart seemed all at 
lence Stewart threw Hawe off the once rigid, bending a little, 
porch, then Don Carlos, who, being less “Say ‘Miss Hammond,’ if there’s oc- 
supple, fell heavily. Then the mob casion to use her name,” said Stewart, 
backed before Stewart’s rush until all in a voice that seemed cooly pleasant, 
were down in the courtyard, yet had a deadly under note.

The shuffling of feet ceased, the Hawe did a moment’s battle with 
clanking of spurs, and the shouting, strangling fury, which he conquered in 
Nels and Monty, now reenforced by some measure.
Nick Steele, were as shadows of Stew- “I said you was a low-down, drunk- 
art, so closely did they follow him. en cow-puncher, a tough, an’ as near

in  summer. W eight about the Stewart waved them back and stepped a desperado as we ever hed on the
wS^û m?severafpairs oi icath- down into the yard. He was absolute- border,” went on Hawe deliberately.

ly fearless* but what struck Madeline His speech appeared to be addressed 
« .‘diiTn; Kb£S 80 keenly was his magnificent disdain, to Stewart, although his flame-pointed 

^̂m'onetmbacki?shoe*do*noi! Manifestly he knew the nature of the eyes wire riveted upon Monty Price.
____  iS r F R E E  yc°a^oag  whTch £ £ £ ' m e n  w i t h  w h o m h e  w as dealing. F rom  “ I  k n ow  you  plugged  th et vaquero last

styles, g ives prices and teiis how  to order, a  postal brings it. the look of him it was natural for Mad- fall an’, when I git my proof I’m com-
OVERLAND SHOE CO* Dept. <5 Racine, Wit* eline to expect them to give way be- in’ after you! ”

OVERLAND ALUMINUM SHOES
Sixti l  to 13 Sane Monti and Prevent Sieknaaa

H tighti W ater-P roof, Rust-Proof, 
ln% Rot-Proof* Warm In winter, cool

No longer do you need two 
different watches — one 
strong, to stand hard 
daily usage; the other of 
Handsome Appearance 
for Sunday and “dress-up” 
occasions. For here is a  
watch combining sturdy 
construction with Beauty, 
and at a reasonable price.

South Rend
No. 217 is cased in 20 year 
gold-filled, dust-proof case. 
It-is an accurate time-keep­
er, that can be depended 
upon. Plain, easy-to-read 
figures on dial, dignified 
and beautiful. $25 and up, 
according to kind of case.
Ask your jeweler to  show you N o. 
217 when you’re next in town. The 
P u rp le  Ribbon on $ ou th  B en d 
Watches, as shown above, helps you 
know them instantly. Send for 68 
page watch book describing the com­
plete line o f  South Bend Watches.

South Bend Watch Co.
Owned by the S tudebaken  

232 S tu d e b a k e r  S t.
South fiend India«*

FROZEN IN ICE 
KEEPS PERFECT TIME;

Colum bia
B a ite r ie ?

The Cell that Rings the Bell.
T o  ring the help t o  dinner— to  call 

som eone to  the phone— for  every kind 
o f signal, use CO LU M B IA S. T h ey ’re 
the cells that ring the bells unfailingly 
— and run engines, autos, phones, trac­
tors ; make lanterns blaze; set off 
blasts! The world over, "C olum bia—ie 
the other name fo r  R E L IA B IL IT Y . 
N a t io n a l C a rb o n  

Company 
Cleveland, Ohio
Fahnestock spring-clip 
binding: posts, no extra 
charge. Make connec­
ting cells an easy job.

LN q . 6 1
- U M I

C O R D  W O O D  SAW S
M ade’o f  special saw steel a fter our 
own analysis. Every saw given uni­
form  and tough tem per to  the very 
p o in tsof the teeth. These saws hand 
set and filed. A rbor hole 1H in.

Satisfaction Guaranteed
Price Size Price Size Price.

o o fn- loan 24 in. $3.50 28 in. $4.7522 in. *3.00 26 in. $4.00 30 in. £.25
5® «« wood Tilting Table Saw Frame. W eight 
870 lbs. Thoroughly braced, com plete. $14.90. Send 
personal check o r  m oney order. W e make imm edi­
ate shipm ent by express o r  freight.
F U M E B S ’  C E M E N T  T I L E  M4C H IH E  C O ., > t. J o i n t ,
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“That’s all right, Hawe. You can 
call me what you like, and you. can 
come after me when you like,” replied 
Stewart; “but you’re going to be in 
bad with me. You’re in bad now with 
Monty and Nels. Pretty soon -you’ll 
queer yourself with all the cowboys 
and the ranchers, too. If that don’t 
put sense into you, here, listen to this. 
You knew what these boxes contained. 
You know Don Carlos has been smug­
gling arms and ammunition across the 
border. You know he is hand and 
glove with the rebels. You’ve been 
wearing blinders, and it has been to 
your interest. Take a hunch from me. 
That’s all. Light out now, and the less 
we see of your handsome mug, the bet­
ter we’ll like you!”

Muttering, cursing, pallid of face, 
Hawe climbed astride his horse. His 
comrades followed suit.' Certain it ap­
peared that the sheriff was contending 
with more than fear and wrath. He 
must have had an irresistible impulse 
to fling invective and threat upon 
Stewart, but he was speechless. Sav­
agely he spurred his horse, and, as it 
snorted and leaped* he turned in his 
saddle, shaking his fist.

His comrades led the way with their 
horses clattering into a canter. They 
disappeared through the gate.

Later in the day, when Madeline and 
Florence, accompanied by Alfred and 
Stillwell, left Don Carlos’s ranch, it 
was none too soon for Madeline. The 
inside of the Mexican’s home was more 
unprepossessing and uncomfortable 
than the outside. The halls were dark, 
the rooms huge, empty, and musty. 
There was an air of silence and sec­
recy and mystery about them most fit­
ting to the character that Florence 
had bestowed upon the place.

Alfred’s ranch house, on the other 
hand, where the party halted to spend 
the night, was picturesquely located, 
small, cozy, camplike in its arrange­
ment, and altogether agreeable to Mad­
eline.

The day’s long rides and exciting 
events had wearied her. She rested 
while Florence and the men got sup­
per.

During the meal Stillwell expressed 
satisfaction over the good riddance of 
the vaqueros and, with his usual opti­
mism, trusted he had seen the last of 
them. Alfred, too, took a decidedly 
favorable view of the day’s proceed­
ings; but Florence appeared unusually 
quiet and thoughtful. Madeline won­
dered a little at the cause. She re­
membered that Stewart had wished to 
come with them, or to detail a few cow­
boys to accompany them, but Alfred 
had laughed at the idea and would 
have none of it.

After supper Alfred monopolized the 
conversation by describing what he 
wanted to do to improve his home be­
fore he and Florence were married. 
Then, at an early hour, they ail re­
tired.

Madeline’s slumbers were disturbed 
by a pounding upon the wall, and Flor­
ence’s crying out, in answer to a call 
of—-

"Get up! Throw some clothes on 
and come out!”

It was Alfred’s voice.
“What’s the matter?” asked Flor­

ence as she slipped out of bed.
“Alfred, is thqre anything wrong?” 

added Madeline, sitting up.
The room was dark as pitch, but a 

faint glow seemed to mark the posi­
tion of the window.

“Oh, nothing much,” replied Alfred. 
“ Only Don Carlos’s ranch is going up 
in smoke!”

“Fire?” cried Florence sharply.
“You’ll think so when you see it. 

Hurry out! Majesty, old girl, now you 
won’t have to tear down that heap of 
adobe, as you threatened. I don’t be.- 
lieve a wall will stand after that fire.”

“Well, I’m glad of it,”  said Made­
line. “A good healthy fire will purify 
the atmosphere over there and save 
me expense. Ugh, that haunted rancho 
got on my nerves. Florence, I do be­
lieve you’ve appropriated part of my

riding habit. Doesn’t Alfred have any 
lights in this house ?”

Florence laughingly helped Madeline 
to dress. Then, hurrying through the 
dining-room, and stumbling over the 
chairs, they went out upon the porch. 
Away to the westward, low down along 
the horizon, they saw leaping red 
flames and wind-swept columns of 
smoke.

Stillwell appeared greatly perturbed.
“Al, I’m lookin’ fer thet ammunition 

to blow up,” he said. “There was 
enough of it to blow the roof off the 
rancho.”

“Bill, surely the cowboys would get 
that stuff out the first thing,” replied 
Alfred anxiously.

“I reckon so; but all the same I’m 
worryn’. Mebbe there wasn’t time. 
Supposin’ that powder went off as the 
boys was goin’ fer it, or carryin’ it out! 
We’ll know soon. If the explosion 
doesn’t come quick now, we can figger 
the boys got the boxes out.”

For the next few moments there was 
the silence of sustained and painful 
suspense. Florence gripped Madeline’s 
arm. Madeline felt a fullness in her 
throat and a rapid beating of her heart. 
Presently she was relieved with the 
others when Stillwell declared the dan­
ger of an explosion need be feared no 
longer.

“Sure you can gamble on Gene Stew­
art,” he added.

(Continued next week).

A FE B R U A R Y  RAMBLE.

B Y  F . J . Y .
February wild? She’s not always so. 
Here’s a winter day full of charm I 

know.
Leave the fireside, Jacko falls in train, 
Through the gate we go out into the 

lane.
Loiter at. the gate, rub old Brindle’s 

nose;
While she licks my hand other cows 

crowd close,
Down the lane we go, climb the or­

chard hill,
Through the sparkling snow and the 

winter chill.
Linger at the pond all ice covered o’er; 
Where the sparrows hop round the 

frozen shore.
Jacko finds the track of a timid hare; 
Hard to call him off—so I leave * him 

there.
Onward still and up to the pasture 

lot—
Crystal white expanse, pure without a 

blot;
Skirt the woodlot’s edge where the 

trees stand bare,
Holding up grey arms to the wintry 

air,
Stop to rest a bit on a fallen log; 
Warm from exercise, breath a misty 

fog.
Watch a snowbird seek for his morn­

ing meal—
Perky little chap—nothing daunts his 

zeal.
Jacko soon returns, hopping on three 

legs,
Sitting in the snow, folding arms, he 

begs.
Thinly clad is Jack, but his heart is 

true—
Plainly says, “I leave not until you 

do.”
Answering his appeal onward then we
Have a jolly race through the frosty 

air.
Jacko soon revives, does not spirit
Then we face about for the journey 

back. •
Down the westering slope wander at 

our ease;
Icicles hanging sharp from the apple 

trees.. --
Crunching snow beneath, arching blue 

above, ,
Peace of God o’er all, telling of His 

love.
Now the house we spy, barn and gar­

den land,
Cupped in hollow like ’twere in God s 

own hand.
Poor old farm perhaps—not worth 

much they say;
Yet it shares this bright February day.

Education will not make people hap­
py unless it is directed into useful 
channels.—Lord.

Talents are absolutely nothing to a 
man except he have the faculty of 
work along with them.—Lowell.

w

Operator Installer Lineman Ckrk

The Picked Army of the Telephone
The whole telephone-using pub­

lic is interested in the army of 
telephone employees— what kind 
of people are they, how  are they 
selected and trained, how  are they 
housed and equipped, and are they 
well paid and loyal.

Ten billion messages a year are 
handled by the organization of the 
Bell System, and the task is en­
trusted to an army of 160,000 
loyal men and women.

N o one of these messages can 
be put through by an individual 
employee. In every case there 
must be the complete telephone 
machine or system in working or­
der with every manager, engineer, 
clerk, operator, lineman and in­
staller co-operating with one an­
other and with the public.

T h e Bell System has attracted 
the brightest, most capable people 
for each branch of work. The 
training is thorough and the worker

must be specially fitted for his 
position.

W orkrooms are healthful and 
attractive, every possible mechan­
ical device being provided to pro­
mote efficiency, speed and comfort.

G ood  wages, an opportunity for 
advancement and prompt recogni­
tion of merit are the rule through­
out the Bell System.

A n  ample reserve fund is set 
aside for pensions, accident and 
sick benefits and insurance for em­
ployees, both men and women. 
“ Few  if any industries,** reports 
the Department of Commerce and 
Labor, “ present so much or such 
widely distributed, intelligent care 
for the health and welfare o f their 
women workers as is found among 
the telephone companies.**

These are some of the reasons 
why Bell telephone service is the 
best in the world.

A merican Telephone  and Telegraph  Company  
A n d  A s s o c i a t e d  C o m p a n i e s  

One Policy One System_______ Universal Service

HARNESS
H O RSE

COLLARS
Ask Your dealer for the Label

M a d e  a n d  W a r r a n t e d  b y

ARMSTRONG & GRAHAM
W H O L E S A L E  O N L Y .  DETROIT, E S T A B L I S H E D  1880.

VIRGINIA and NORTH CAROLINA Farms Mean Independence
Yes actual Independence, I f  y ou  are w illing to d o  y ou r part. Farm s bought at $15 per acre 
and up w ill earn y ou  a  com fortab le  living and under proper cu ltivation  w ill increase In 
to  value 10* o r  m ore  annually. Delightful clim ate, sociable neighbors, 

good schools, churches, good roads, nearby m arkets. Close to  railroad.
New Y ork , Philadelphia, W ashington, B altim ore 6 to 12 hours. Our 
m agazine, “ The Southern H om eseeker,”  describes in  every day lan­
guage Southern opportunities em phasized by letters from  those w ho 
have located here. I t  tells the truth about taxes, labor, low  priced 

lands, clim ate, crops and liv ing  conditions. W rite today for years 
subscription, Official farm  list, m aps, etc. I t ’s A ll Free.

F. H . La BAUME, a g r l . & i n d s l . A g t ., No r f o l k  a w e s t e r n  r y . 
ROOM 402 N. a  W . B L D S . R O A N O K E , V IR G IN IA

If You Want To Have The Best Fur Coat Or Fur Robe
In your vicinity, send that Hide to

The Blissfield Robe £ Tanning Co., Blissfield, Michigan.
Who Guarantee a Square Deal.

Have you any Muskrats? We make fine Ladies’ Fur Sets. Men’s 
Caps, Gloves, etc. Our new catalogue is just out, finest ever issued 
devoted to Fur Work; It is free for the asking. Address
flie*Blissfield Robe A Tanning C o ., Blissfield, Michigan , Lock Box M. F .

C O A T S
We custom tan and d re s s  
and make np a. coat from 
a la rg e  beef hide Or h o r s e  
hide for $10 complete job. 
Send for our illuatrated 
catalog today that will give 
you fu ll information on 
making up all kinds of for 
c o a t r .
W. W . W E A V E R ,  

C u s t o m  T a n n er, 
R eadin g, M ich iga n .

Get Y  our Hide TannedM
L vL Cow and horse hides tanned perfectly j[ijk  
Wr end made into handsome coats, robes, ® ' 
' mittens, etc. W A T E R  A N D  M O T H  P R O O F . 

FU RS D RESSED(all kinds.) H EA D S M O U N TE D  
Booklet and samples free.

S ylvan ia  T an n in g  C o.. Dept.4,Syh«ia,0hio

Mention Michigan Farmer when writing te advertisers
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IV and H e r  N e e c L?
At Home and ELfewtjere

m u

The Domestic Crucible—22
Grace Decides to Be Firm

John. When he came up at noon, he frost, decay goes on among the pro-
positively smiled as he entered the ducts of garden and orchard. It is
kitchen. Grace’s heart smote her at needful to keep these sorted over to
this peace signal. If only she had left eliminate the waste and insure safe

IT’S bedtime, John Ludlow,’’ Grace for Carlo, and in her determination to d? W? t?°^e ®ld drapes and made the Preservation of the remainder. Many
announced into the dark of the show her independence, poured a pint shortcake* " ut & was to°  late. a man can remember how, as a boy,
screened-in porch, where John had of cream into Snowball’s saucer Peace overtures faded from John’s ke dreaded the task of sorting apples 

been lounging in the hammock since though cream was scarce and the but- face as he entered the dining-room, ln the cellar, but it has to be done, if 
their silent supper. “You’ll never get ter money had to pay for the screen darkened by the soft green drapes. He the job is rather disagreeable, 
up in the morning if you don’t get to she insisted on having for the porches. ate the meal silently, apparently not The partly decayed fruit is not whol- 
sieep right away.”  She hurried through the dishwash. Row ing what he was eating. But ly worthless. An apple with a decay-
.. sleep out here,’ ’ John re- lng;  slighting the cream separator in Whe?  ? read pudding followed the ed sp°t can be trimmed and used to

phed pohtely. I want plenty of air, a way that would have scandalized her mashed Potatoes, salmon loaf, canned good advantage, especially in a year 
and its stifling m that bedroom.” mother, decided on bread pudding for c°ra and pickles> an things he detest- like the present when apples are 

Grace opened her lips to remon- dinner> which John loathed instead _f f d;  Grace saw all hopes of an early ar- scarce. Provident housewives should 
strate, then shut them tightly and strawberry shortcake and whiDDed bltratlon meeting vanish. H6 was pos- cook and can every bit of such fruit
walked away. cream, which he would be expecting UlVe Sh®. pIanaed that meal out of for spring and summer use. Sweet

Stifling in that bedroom, and it was and then went to the dininK_room t(! pure malice. Why hadn’t she picked apples make excellent sweet pickles 
16x18, and the coolest room in the put up her drapes in-there those early peas John told her about and are very acceptable on the table,
house, cooler even than that porch „  . h . , ' the morning before? Why hadn’t she Nobody hears anything about dried ap-
where vines shut out what breeze , sne nad ° nly hung them in cooked the steak the hired man had pies these days, but as fast as the cans
might enter! Of course, it was her ;ne living-room and her own room, in- brought from town last night? Why, are emptied they can be filled with 
drapes he was taking a fling at He j;0 compromise in that way. oh, why, had she fed Snowball the good rich sauce, thus keeping up the
wouldn’t sleep in their own room be- U, y r Joilln chose t°  get mad and sleep cream and left the strawberries stand- store instead of allowing it to become 
cause she had just exercised her law- ?^s oecause she wanted things a ing down cellar? depleted.
ful right to be mistress of the home . tle blt her °Y a way> she would just But there was no use wishing. She Modern heating methods mean heat- 
and had put up overdrapes at the win- gl7e 7im something to get mad over, would just have to stick it out. If she e<* basements and these are'not con- 
dows when he said he didn’t want The dranfts w'm,d **| ,ln 0,1 flflfil “ * 1 --------- ■  ’ “  - J - * ' I '
them. Very well, he could sleep on 
the porch all summer, and when it got 
too cold to sleep out he could go to 
the barn and sleep on the hay, for all 
of her. Those drapes should stay up, 
and John Ludlow should see two could 
be contrary. Though, of course, she 
wasn’t contrary, she simply had to 
show him she had rights he must re­
spect. Let him sleep on the porch, 
she didn’t care. Not a bit! But a tear 
trickled down her nose nevertheless

The Backward Child

WOMEN FARMERS IN GRAND 
TRAVERSE.

The drapes would go up all over the gave in now, she would be tyrannized ducive "to keeping vegetables and 
. . . over all her married life. A dozen fruits. A separate compartment needs

morning in t e field seemed to wives had told her so, and experienced to be provided for them in such cases, 
nave wrought internal changes in wives ought to know! D e b o r a h . Potatoes will shrivel badly in a warm

room.
The ideal cellar is cemented as to 

floor, and whitewashed upon the wails. 
_  It is also provided with windows to
By CHAS. W . K O LLO C K . brighten the interior. It is possible

T uiTi i to make of it a sanitary cheerful room
« ^ Badkward Cblld may not* at ed in the schools for defectives only, instead of the dark, unsightly place 
first thought, seem to be a ser- and where, in many instances, they sometimes found under living-rooms. 

** ,v<u»u uv v* ü uci uuoc ne v ci nicies» ious problem among the many are educated and trained to be not Stairs leading to the upper rooms are
and splashed onto the filmy dresser taat confront us today. What is really only self-supporting but useful citizens. easily kept clean if covered with lin- 
scarf as she meditated. meant by the Backward Child? It The medical inspection of schools oleum. Paint answers equally well,

Just last week she had solemnly means a child who has begun to at- should begin in selecting the locations and either is far superior to bare 
vowed they should have no more quar- tend scko°i> wko fails to learn as oth- for the schools. The buildings should k°ards, which must be cleaned by 
rels! A distinctly audible sniffle warn- er children do and at the end of the be on high ground where the drainage scrubbing,
ed Grace that if she was to insist on term is turned back to repeat the is good and the surroundings are heal- fijgj— mm
her rights she must stop that train of course. They are usually regarded as thy. They should be away from exces-
thought. She blew out the lamp and mentally deficient and undoubtedly are sive noises, have plenty of air and sun-
dropped into bed, telling herself that Physically affected or diseased. This light and ample playgrounds. School- ■' ---------
it was all John’s fault and he should d o e s  n o t  seem to impress us as à  very houses should be planned by archi- BY GRACE t . s t u t b m a n .
be the first to give in. She was to run serious affair, but let us look more tects who make a specialty of such AH the world reads with interest the 
the house and he the farm, that was closely into the matter and learn the work and such matters as light, venti- letters which the “Woman Homestead- 
their’ agreement and he could live up results. There are in this country lation, heating, plumbing, desks,* black- er” kas written from the Colorado 
to it. But in spite of her positive twenty millions of school children, ten boards, wall, books, bathing facilities, ranch, “ The Woman Rice Planter,”  
knowledge that she had the right of it, millions of whom have ear, nose and and especially the drinking water Publishing the journal of her experi- 
sleep was a long time coming and throat troubles, and five millions suf- should receive most careful attention. ences in Carolina, but of the women 
there was a large damp spot on her fer from affections of the eyes. There The teachers, as well as the children, fruit growers of our own state little 
pillo\fr before she finally forgot her are three hundred thousand blind per- should be examined to learn if their bas been said or sung, 
troubles in slumber. sons in the United States whom it health is good, if they have chronic It is doubtful if in any territory of

Breakfast was a silent meal. Grace costs the country fifteen million dol- affections which may be contagious or similar area can be’ found so many 
got up a half-hour earlier to make the lars a year to support. At least 20 per infectious and whether, as far as can women owning and directing farms as 
particular sort of corn muffins that cent of thèse have lost their eyes from be ascertained, they are mentally and on the Grand Traverse peninsula 
John most enjoyed, but he reached by ophthalmia neonatorum which should, morally fit to teach. School nurses to Michigan. This does not include thé 
the heaped-up plate at his elbow and bad the proper preventive treatment aid in inspection may be o f great as- farmers’ wives to whose thrift and 
took the three-days’-old bread. The been used or had they been promptly sistance and it would indeed be a real good judgment many men owe the suc- 
coffee was Onusualiy good, the eggs and properly treated after infection, advance to have a competent trained cess of their farming Neither does it 
just soft enough, the potatoes fried to have resulted in a negligible per cent nurse in attendance at every school, refer to another large class of women 
the delicate shade of golden brown of blindness. There are among the not only to look after the many physi- who have turned over to their hus 
that John always wanted. But some- twenty million school children about cal ailments of the pupils but to teach bands the management of their inher-
how the meal went begging so far as three million who are called “repeat- them many simple things about injur- ited or acquired lands There are
John and Grace were concerned. The ers,”  that is, those who remain in one ies, caring for the injured, etc.—Jour- many wives whose money has boueht
hired man consumed muffins and cof- room at school term after term. These nal of the South Carolina Medical As- land and equipment for the husband to
fee with that air of conscious uncon- repeaters” cost the country about one sociation. operate No one knows ho
cern always adopted by the help when million dollars a year extra to try to --------;__ .̂.. women also furnish the brain7 fo?the
they feel the domestic barometer wob- educate them, and then failure is the IN THE CELLAR management of the farm but since the
bang, and after what seemed to Grace more common result. These children .____  man ___ ’ ..
“  “ d John departed tor are too often supposed to be mentally BY e l i ,a  b . noeuwoon. women are excluded ^ “ ^ 'eon rid !

i f "  fllng’ng back a deflciant. wben' °n contrary, they The farm house cellar is a store- oration of women farmers. We refer
bled Good-by as he slammed the are physically defective or diseased. In house of food reserves in winter. Mod- now to single women, widows, or
screen behind h m reality only about three per cent are ern living has somewhat changed in wives whose husband^ are occupied

Grace gazed .at her peace offering of mentally defective and the money rural communities as elsewhere and with other pursuits. A census of Pe-
asd0hn 8alked down the spent in trying to teach them is often there is less of the wholesale slaugh- ninsula township would show a large

b‘*  tears ,rol>ed J7 s.ted “  ,tbe cause ? ' t ic  trou- ter of meat animals to be stored away number of farms owned and con tro l^
Ï  s  ?  T  , f  t v l ”t T  J  T  Certal”  f  in ° ne 8bape or “ Oticr tor use during by women. Some are thus engaged byi f , ,M  coflf e' , Bu‘  0D'y tw0! take hut a small portion of Uie one m l- cold weather, yet supplies must be necessitybecausethehusbandorfath- 
Indeed, she was not going to sit around lion dollars that are spent in trying to cared for and the cellar contains a er has died leaving the farm to be sold 
and cry because her husband chose to educate them to use m «nding the wholesome assortment of fruits and unless the wife or daughter chooses to 
be a brute. She jumped up Quickly, real causes of their backwardness, vegetables and meats. Tightly closed put her shoulder to the w heel and as 
swept the plate of mufflns into a basin when the truly defective could be plac- as it is, to prevent 'the entrance o f sume command. In many instMees
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they have preferred to retain control 
of the home,„..place and ^re finding a 
fascination in the alternating triumphs 
and disasters of this most complex 
phase of agriculture. They are find­
ing, too, a satisfactory life and a com­
fortable living. The editor of Collier’s 
Weekly said recently: “True success 
lies not in attainment, but in the sin­
cere and unremitting struggle to at­
tain.” In the light of this definition 
these women are succeeding admir­
ably as are those others, newcomers 
in the region, who have purchased 
land, set out new orchards or renovat­
ed old ones and are making every ef­
fort to build up their farms and to 
produce the sort of fruit which will 
increase the good reputation of the 
region.

They come from varied walks in life 
and have turned to farming for a vari­
ety of reasons. There are school-teach­
ers, artists, musicians, stenographers, 
unoccupied women of independent 
means, the childless and hence idle 
wives of traveling salesmen, as well as 
the never idle mothers of a small brood 
whose father is busy in one of the 
leading professions. Some have come 
because their friends did. Others have 
been influenced by the abundant liter­
ature of the day dealing -with the 
charms of country life. Still others 
have come to some of the resorts 
which abound for a summer’s holiday, 
and finding here a bit of the “delec­
table land,” have chosen to remain 
and become the possessors of a share 
of all that this region has to offer of 
"land and lake and sky,”  and oppor­
tunity.

Because a woman is physically un­
able to perform all the heavy tasks of 
farm work is no reason why she can­
not wisely direct the operations of 
field and orchard. To be sure she has 

. the expense of an extra man to attend 
to the duties which a man farmer 
would ordinarily do himself, which 
subtracts substantially from the net 
income of her farm. But in some cas­
es, if not all, it may be that by wom­
an’s natural attention to details and 
.by stopping of small leaks she makes 
in the long run as much as her broth­
er farmer.

It seems to be the general opinion 
that a woman cannot cope with the 
hired man problem, that a man will 
not work for a woman and carry out 
her orders to the fulfillment of her 
plans, but experience in this locality 
seems to prove that it is a matter of 
personality and not of sex. The fem­
inine employer seems to succeed here 
as well as the masculine. Not long 
ago we read an unconvincing tale of 
a woman who tried to carry on her 
father’s farm after his death but found 
that the men did not consider her au­
thority and were constantly criticizing 
her plans and pointing out flaws in her 
judgment till in despair she gave up, 
ostensibly, and later masqueraded in 
masculine attire, posing as her twin 

-  brother, whereupon, the “hands” all 
fell to work with vim, everything 
boomed and the year ended in a blaze 
of glorious success. The moral of this 
was supposed to he that men won’t 
work for a woman if they know it. 
While between the lines we spied this 
point, if she had assumed the same 
attitude toward her men and used the 
same tactics with her skirts oh, that 
she did while pretending to be a man, 
the results would have been as grat- 
fying.

Most of the established women farm­
ers on the Grand Traverse peninsula 
follow the plan of separate, indepem 
dent house and garden for their men, 
and they thus make a point of employ­
ing only married men who have the 
stimulus of family ties to keep them 
practically permanent and to inspire 
them with ambition to give satisfac­
tion and to retain their positions. It 
isn’t a mere job, it rises to the dignity 
of a situation in these cases. Some 
employers furnish firewood, others a 
stipulated daily allowance of milk, and 
most of them allow the hired man the

yield from one or more cows for the 
winter months during which the owner 
ip away.

This absence of the owner during a 
part of the year suggests a thought 
which merits consideration. She is 
away, either to follow her profession 
of teaching, painting, singing, nursing 
or whatever it is on which she depends 
for income while her farm is develop­
ing, or she goes to enjoy the social ad­
vantages, or rest or travel which her 
family wealth enables her to secure. 
From her earnings, if she is a profes­
sional woman, or from her income if 
she is a woman of means, she has the 
wherewithal to build up her place 
more quickly than the widow or daugh­
ter on the home farm who must de­
pend 0n the farm itself to furnish her 
living, to ' renew equipment and to 
maintain its highest degree of fertil­
ity. Educators say that anyone can 
teach the bright pupils, but it takes 
the best teaching ability to impart 
knowledge to dull minds, and so we 
would say that anyone can take money 
from other sources and build up a 
farm, but the mr.n or woman who by 
good judgment and earnest effort can 
make a farm build itself up, is deserv­
ing of the higher praise.

Should one ask if these women are 
getting rich, the answer would doubt­
less be that farmers do not “get rich” 
as wealth is counted now-a-days. If 
the question is modified to the point 
of inquiring if they are “making mon­
ey,” it would be safe to say that they 
are as much as the men, each accord­
ing to her several ability. Or we would 
meet it by the Yankee method of re­
plying to one question by asking an­
other, “Do all men farmers succeed 
financially?” Most certainly not, and 
neither do all the women. Some do 
and some do not. Some have under­
taken and given up discouraged, oth­
ers are still striving against great odds 
while a few have reached independ­
ence. At any rate, all have found ab­
sorbing interest which precludes phy­
sical and mental stagnation. Our ar­
gument is that farming is a business 
at which a woman may succeed as wqll 
as a man if she has the requisite qual­
ifications. Of course, the ideal ar­
rangement for farm life is first a farm 
home made up of the great triangle of 
husband, wife and children, but since 
the gods do not vouchsafe these bles­
sings to every maiden, do not refrain 
from undertaking to run a farm if you 
feel that you would like to do it, sim­
ply because you belong to what used 
to be called the gentler and weakter 
portion of human kind. Looking for 
compensation in all forms of affliction 
let the lone woman farmer lay this 
flattering unction to her soul, you 
couldn’t discharge a husband and get 
another if he didn’t do the work as 
you want it done.

The woman who would own and op­
erate a farm needs the suppleness of 
a sapling to bend and not break when 
storm and stress arrive; the firmness 
of granite with the resilience of rub­
ber, to rebound when borne down by 
disappointment and the uncounted dis­
asters incident to crop and equipment. 
She needs courage, sound judgment, 
foresight, health, and a sense of 
humor,.

HOME QUERIES.

Household Editor:—Can you tell me 
how I can get spots of red barn paint 
out of light-colored print? I tried 
wetting them with kerosene and wash­
ed carefully with naphtha soap. It 
hardly made them fainter. Boiling did 
no good. Do the tiny black flies do 
house plants any harm? If so, is there 
a remedy?—Mrs. F. L. S„ Traverse 
City.

Soaking the paint in gasoline or tur­
pentine should remove it. Water and 
boiling will only make matters worse. 
Wash the plants in tobacco water.

Household Editor:—-Will you print 
the names of several firms in Detroit 
who buy flowers from small producers, 
such as asters, gladiolas, tulips and 
dahlias?—A. J. B. .

We cannot print the names of busi­
ness firms in this column.

N o t MADE BV T H E

CMJUHET PAW N* POWDER CO.
t BAKING pc* 
CHICAGO

L ...J* 2& Z 3Ê

1Y >niW ll

M o n e y ,
Kalamazoo Pipeless Register Furnace

G E T  in  c e lla r —connect with big register set in flopr o f one o f  main 
b ro o m s—heats the whole house with forced warm air—easy to set 

pipes to fit except smoke pipe. - •
Free T rial— C ash  or E asy Paym ents

Write at once fo r  manufacturer’ s factory price. W e p a y freig h t and 
hours. I f  you prefer a pipe furnace we shall be glad to  make up

prices* Write today and ask for Furnace Catalog No. 9 0 9  
K A L A M A ZO O  S T O V E  C O ., M a n u fa c t u r e r s ,  K A L A M A Z O O , MICH.

______  300.000families using Kalamazoo Stores, Kanges.Gas Stoves, Furnaces
[ i r _  White Enameled Metal Kitchen Kabinets and Tables.
W  6  4 catalogs—say w hich you w ant,
P a yG* M a i  rtfl-L

Rheumatism, gout o r  lumbago 
are soon relieved by

Vaselineoft

C a m p h o r a t e d
P e tro le u m  Jelly

A lso  strongly recommended as A 
soothing, healing ointment for gath­
ered breasts.
A t drag and general stores every­
where. Illustrated booklet describ­
ing all the “ Vaseline”  Preparations 
mailed free on request together with 
’ ’Vaseline”  Poster Stamps. 
G H E S E B R O U G H  M F G . C O . 
. (Consolidated)

33 State Street New York City

Indoor Closet
More Comfortable Health­
ful and Convenient than 

the Ont-Door Privy
Elim inates th e  open  vault and cess*
Sool, breeding places f o r  germs, 

lave a warm, sanitary, odorless 
„ to ile t  right in  your house. N o going 
* ou t in  oo ld  weather. A boon  to 

invalids. Endorsed by State Boards o f  H ealth.

A B S O L U T E L Y  O D O R L E S S
Put It Anywhere In Th* House 

T h e germ s are k illed  by a chem ica l process in  
water in  the container, w hich you em pty once  a 
m onth. A b s o lu t e ly  n o  o d o r .  N o m ore trouble 
to em pty than dishwater. Closet absolutely 
guaranteed. W rite  f o r  fu l l  description and price.
ROWE S A N IT A R Y  U F O . 00. 318 ROWE B I N . ,  D ET RO IT ,
Ask about the Ro-San Waahstand— Hot and Cold M ICH . 

Running Water Without Plumbing_________________

Buy / % A C C P P  WHOLESALE 
Your O U r  r  EL C .  IN 10-LB LOTS 
Get th eB E S T an d  S AV E lO ctsperpound. 
W E  PAY POST, EXPRESS or FREIGH T

IF YOU .LOVE GOOD OOFKKH SEND FOR PRICE LIST
:VNE COFFEE C O. (E st 1881) Coffee Specialists 

7, 2 855 -57  W . M adison S U  C H IC AG O .£ept

I l iF I T C  $10 to  $ 2 0  a Day
M M  ■■ I l  I  w  Easy sellings new, juatoot.

Aluminum Patent
Gem Steam Cooker

Cooks entire meal over one burner. 
Will not burn or scorch food. G u a r -  

,  a n  t e e d  1 5  y ea rs . Thousands will, be 
I sold—low price—big profit. W riteqm ck 
I tar exclusive territory and large free

__r  catalogue of 400 specialties.
mertean Aluminum Mfg. C o., Dlv. B.B.Lemoot, Ilia

Free for Testing
À pair o f mated EVE ^EA RIN G  STRAWBERRY PLANTS PREE i f  

you will report as to your success witu them. Will bear loads o f  big* red. 
berries from June to November. We 
have counted 480 bernes* blossoms 
and buds on a single plant. A postal

seed. Send 10 cts for mailing expense 
or not. as yon- please. Write today .n^  set acquainted with 
THE G A R D N E R  N U R S E R Y  COUPANT 

B ox 7 4 3 ,  O sage, Iowa.

“ S T R A W B E R R Y  P L A N T S  
T H A T  G R O W ”

‘PROGRESSIVE” , Best Fall-bearer: Also Sta, 
June sorts, including our New Seedling, COL­
LINS” . Full Assortment other Fruit Plants. 
Catalog FREE .

C. E. Whitten’s Nurseries,
Box ( 1 4 ) B rid g m an , M ich.

trawberry PlantsS ' _ „
Guaranteed as good as grows at $1.00 per 
1000 and up, Catalogue FREE.

ALLEN BROTHERS, R. 9, Paw Paw Mich.

Strawberry Plants
And other Small Fruit Plants
E . W . P O T T E R

B o x  3 6 8 , L e s lie , M ic h ' C a ta lo g  F r e e .

STRAWBERRY AND SM1LLFRUIT PLINTS
R eliab le  N orthern Grown 
Plants, Ornamental Shrubs 

and Gladiolus. W e grow, se ll d irect, guarantee to  please. 
W rite fo r  free  illustrated P lant Book. Address it. J . 
stahelin , the St. Joseph Kuraery, Box 461. St. Joseph. Michigan

STRAWBERRIES Catalog Free
R o k e ly ’ a  fa m o u s  M ich ig a n  p la n t s .  Only hardy well 
rooted stock. All varieties—Strawberry, Raspberry. 
Blackberry, Currant, e tc., including the EVE RBEARIN G  
S T R A W B E R R Y . W rite today sure f o r .fr e e .catalog, 
J. N. ROKELY, BOX R 6 .  BRIDAMAN, S IC S .

NEW STRAWBERRIES » 11^2
(¿liable, interesting and instructive—All about the new  
iverbearers and other important varieties. Address 

N. FLANSBURGH A  SON, UCKSON. MICH.

WHOLESALE PRICES
Strawberry Meats. _Many otter varieties « id  gsrd 
easonable prices. Catalogue FREE, Write today to 
-  WESTOlfA COMPANY. “ “ “Y im ir r *"  *“ />J

t rootsl
msanI

i  Plants, $1.65 per 1000. T ruthful, valu-
rawberry a b le lflu stra ted  catalog free. W orth  
. Mayer’ s P lant Nursery, M errill, M ichigan.

»
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H. H. Johnson
This was for Mr. S. W. Warren of 
Tryon, Neb., a n d it  was in  a n  Old Trusty 
th a t h a d  fa llen  o f f  th e  p o r c h  a n d  let lay 
around the yard and gi ven abuse that would have 
put an ordinary incubator out o f  business in no 
time. Old Trusty is built to  make good, not only for a few  years but fo r  many years, and make 
big hatches any time and anywhere. 650,000 sat­
isfied owners.

W rite fo r  T h is T O F F  
13 6 -P a g e  B ook  JT IX E jEj

and get our 1916 price, freight naid to  you r sta­
tion. 40 to  90 days* trial. H . H. JOHNSON.
M. M. JOHNSON CO., Clay Center, Neb.

Less $ I  A  
Than 1 1 1
Freight paid anywhere 
east o f  Rockies—a trifle 
more farther west.

Write
for Expresa
Prepaid Price

and get onr 1916 Incubator 
Book FREE and postpaid. 
Shows why Prairie State In­
cubators "hatch most 
chicks that Ilvc-'V Contains
chapter on Poultry Diseases# also 
one on hatching ana rearing. 
PRAIRIE STATE INCUBATOR CO. i 123 l a i n  Btr— t . ----------------

Mrs. C.P. 
with her 14 
or wins in 
and Nebr 
Hatching i

Homsr City.Pa.
Egg Incubator 1 B O TH  C 4  A  
Chick Brooder / F O R  *  I
Wta, If ordered together. 30days 
¡ S n i t i s l .  10-year G uarantee.

Order direct from this advertise- PflKQ  SKY ment—money back if not satis- East of 
HByL factory. Incubator is covered5a * r  •
T C p  Wlth galvanized iron, triple walla. R O C K lG B  
I Q copper tank* nursery egg test*T ’ E* Set up ready to run. —bI .„P® ,.B” °ier

Chick

Your Name 
on a Postal

Wisconsin Wins In B ig Hatching
Contests ES■ Why Pay More

B For only $10 you can 
_  get these two prize
■  winning machines,
■  delivered, freight paid 
*  east o f the Rockies.
■  You take no risk — 

money back if not
P| satisfied. Yon can order

Wisconsin Incubators have f l  
long proved their wonderful H  
hatching qualities. Compet- •  
ing with every make known, ■  
they won in the five big an- m 
nual National Hatching Con- •  
tests. Think of it. Five con- g  
secutive victories. That cer- _  
tainly proves you can’t make ■  
a mistake. Shipped on g

FREE T ria l g
M O NEY
BACK

vie also  
and 180

Wisconsins have hot water 10-YEAR  
GUARANTEE iheat, double walls, double glass doors, copper 

tanks and boilers, self-regulating. Nursery under egg tray. Made of finest, select, 
clear CALIFORNIA REDWOOD, not pine, paper or other flimsy material. Incubator fin­
ished in natural color—not painted to cover up cheap, shoddy material. Incubator and Brooder 
shipped complete with thermometers, egg tester, lamps, everything but the oil. This is the best 
outfit you can buy. If you don’t find it satisfactory after 30 days’ trial, send it back. Don’t 
buy until you get our new 1916 catalog^ fully describing this prize winning outfit. WRITE 
FOR IT TODAY. You can’t make a mistake in buying a Wisconsin. Chi the market 15 years.
W ISC O N SIN  INCUBATOR COM PANY, 3 Box 106  Racine, W is.

Stronger Chicks and More of Them
D on’t waste a whole season—your time, temper and money. Startrlght. 
Your interests and ours are identical. You want better chicks and more 

of them—we want you to have them. X-Ray book tells how. 
Send for free copy.

X -R a y  In cu b a to r
Duplex Central Heating Plant chases cold out o f all the 

corners. X-Ray Automatic Trip keeps heat regulated ex­
actly. F ill the X-Ray Tank only one tim e— one gallon  — for the entire 
hatch. Hinged glass panel top permits you to see all that’s going 
on in the hatching cham berwithout raising the top or even stooping. 
X-Ray perfectly level egg tray leaves all space available for eggs. 
Fifteen big special features. Get tree book and see for yourself. 
We pay express to practically all points.

Give your chicks a  chance. Raise largest percentage.Brooders Too k . 1Uby central beating: plant,
X-Ray Incubator Company, Dept. 29, Des Moines, Iowa

X-Ray Brooders — sanitary, rat-proof, evenly heated 
t. Postal for free book No.29

The Nigh Percent HatcherA m
U |  I W I  Buy the Gem and be sure. 25 years highest 

success. Capacity 50 to 270 eggs. Gem chicks 
always lively and thrive because our unique system of reatila« 
tion conserves natural egg moisture. Walls six-ply (4 layers of 
Insulation). Built of Cypress, the “ wood-eter­
n a l ."  Gem hot-water heating system of cold- 
rolled copper distributes and equalizes warmth.
Best double-wafer regulator. Removable chick 
trays. Many more features in big, free catalog.
Get our special offer, also "H o w  to Buy an  
Incubator," and save money. Write today.
GEM MFC. CO., Box 20, GraenviU«, 0 ,

Raisiné Poultry

W IN S
In Z Biggest 
HATCHING 
CONTESTS

Ever Held

Merrick, Lockney,Tex. v 
40 esjr Ironclad incubat- 
the Mo. Valley Fanner 

r. Farm Journal Bir  
Contest. She placed 148 
e incubator and hatched 
r chicks. Think o f that. 
nnw ret these famous . 

ds of Calif. Redwood.

f S T i V i  BEFORE you pay

New 100-pasre book—just off press—by . " ryau*nf ~inr a "
____HI_____|___ you ne_ _________
o f  women pay for homes raising: poultry
very information you need.

i the

in back yard— healthful, into restine 
This book tells how to avoid beginner's costly mistakes—gives 
experience successful breeders—how they started.
Brew and made money.

Describes America s greatest money-saving line! 
o f  guaranteed incubators, brooders. Book in large] 
demand—w rite  Im m edia te ly .
Model Incubator Co.) 15 Henry St.. Buffalo,N.Y.

A lso S9 B arclay S t., N ew  Y ork C ity

< 9 )1

CATALOG
B r in g s

THE UNITED FACTOl

$2.50 for 25 to 50 CHICK HOVER
Made of Galvanized Steel. Can be used 

(nanybox, Safe and durable. Hot water 
•'eat- All complete. Incubator book ffee.

We make 71 different articles.
•TENDED. INCUBATOR CO., U.U7, Mich*

This 135-Egg Incubator and Brooder 
hipped anywhere on 30 days* trial. 
N o money down — no deposit.

Pays for BOTH If Sat­
isfactory When Tasted 

No other such open liberal offer 
as this, because no other outfit 
equals the UNITO, Incubator 

: hot water; Brooder hot air. Both 
galvanized iron, oatiafaction 
guaranteed. We take all the ri*k 
ICaah prlco both only $9.45. 
CO. Bh 431 CIOv. land, O

Tells why chicks die
E. J. Reefer, the poultry expert, 4382 Reefer Bldg. 
Kansas City, Mo., is giving away free a valuable 
book entitled, "W h ite  Diarrhoea and How to Cure i t ."  
This book contains scientific facta on white diarrhoea 
and tells how to prepare a simple home solution that cures this 
terrible disease over night and actually raises 98 per cent of 
every hatch All poultry raisers should certainly write Mr. Reefer 
for one o f these valuable FREE books.

Constructing the Poultry House
' T '  HIS is the time when people

X  think, of building new poultry 
houses or enlarging old ones that 

thé flock has outgrown. In building a 
new house it is a mighty good scheme 
to try and overcome some disadvan­
tages that were present in the old 
structure.

In selecting the site for the poultry 
house, we need to be very cautious 
because the site has so much to do 
with the health of the chickens and 
with the salability of the eggs. If we 
were to place the chicken house in a 
low, damp, dirty place it would mean 
that we would have diseased fowls 
from parasites that live in the soil and 
in addition, we would probably have 
dirty eggs, because dirty ground means 
dirty feet for the hen—dirty feet mean 
dirty nests, and so on until the egg 
lands in the. hands of the consumer. 
Then we hear peculiarly grating, disa­
greeable remarks, not to mention the 
fact that we have to take less money 
for the eggs than as though the old 
hen had wiped her feet on the door 
mat.

The most important things to bear 
in mind when building a chicken house 
are dryness, ventilation, sunlight and 
disinfection. We will take them up in

house, giving rise, as it does, t& vari­
ous and sundry diseases such as roup, 
catarrh, and so on.

The body temperature of the hen is 
160 degrees F., and s9 we see that she 
must have considerable air to main­
tain such rapid oxidization within her 
body. She requires more air in pro­
portion to her body weight than any 
other creature upon the farm. King 
estimates that a horse weighing one 
thousand pounds breathes a trifle less 
than thirty-five hundred cubic feet of 
air daily. A cow of the same weight 
demands a little less than three thou­
sand cubic feet, but two hundred five- 
pound hens make a demand upon the 
ventilation for eight thousand cubic 
feet of air every twenty-four hours. 
This shows us immediately that one of 
the most important essentials of poul­
try house construction is that we pro­
vide ample air for the hens to breathe. 
There can be little question but. that 
many farm poultry houses are deficient 
mainly because they do not admit 
enough fresh air and sunlight. Fresh 
air is just as essential as is food and 
sunlight is nature’s own disinfectant. 
The point to be remembered in venti­
lating the poultry house is to admit 
liberal supplies of fresh air, but at the

Good Hens can not do their Best in Poor Coops.

the order named. In the previous par- same time to keep this from circulat- 
agraph we spoke of some of the effects ing over the fowls in the form of a 
that a dirty yard might have upon the draft. A muslin front house adapts 
hen and the hen market. That was itself to this principle very readily. ■ It 
destructive' criticism. Constructive has, however, an objectionable feature 
criticism would dictate that we place when used in rather damp locations, 
the hen house upon a southern slope— If the meshes of the muslin are too 
that means sloping, not level ground. If tight, the moisture collects in them 
we can get a location that has a warm and with it the dirt, thus giving an-un- 
porous soil and that is capable of be- sightly appearance. • However, the ap­
ing well drained, we may deem our- pearánce is not the most objectionable 
selves very fortunate. It is a very feature that such a wet combination 
good plan to keep the hen house at possesses. When the meshes become 
some little distance from the surround- wet the strands swell and clog up most 
ing buildings so that thére will be pro- of the pores through which air can en- 
vided no harboring pláces for rats, ter. In getting muslin for a muslin 
mice, or other Vermin. Some people front house, we ought to get that with 
think that the chicken house ought to large meshes rather than tightly wov- 
be pretty close to the dwelling house en .fabric.
but I am slightly at variance with this Sunlight and the mite mean constant 
view. That the proximity of the chick- fight. Wherever sunlight can get to 
en house does have something to do roosts or- poultry house appliances, we 
with the ease with which the woman taay rest assured that the lice will not 
of the house can take care of the be very troublesome. Direct sunlight 
chickens I have little doubt, blit I sin- is one of the best disinfectants that 
cerely believe that the obnoxious pres- can be had and the more that can get 
ence of the chickens on the back porch into the poultry house the better, 
more than outweights the convenience There are many more poultry houses 
that is had by their quarters being that suffer from insufficient light than 
close to the house. It seems to be the there are that have too much. A very 
inherent nature of a chicken to want good rule to go by in putting windows 
to be around the back porch if his into the hen house is to allow one 
quarters are close enough, and as for square foot of glass for every ten to 
me, “give me liberty or give me death” sixteen square feet of floor space, or 
—of the chicken. one square foot of glass to each three

The kind of floor that ought to be in birds to be housed. The construction 
a chicken house is a matter that may of a hen house ought to be simple, in 
well merit some attention. It is more fact so simple that at any time the 
or less ideal to have a cement floor hou£e can be thoroughly sprayed with 
because, in this manner, Ave can keep the assurance that the gasolene or ker- 
out vermin that would burrow up from osene used can get into all the crevices 
underneath, but it is true that fowH or cracks which present themselves, 
are not as healthy on cement floors as The nests may well have portable 
they are upon dirt floors. The cement backs and fronts, or be so arranged 
is apt to be damp and if there is any- that the top can be raised up, the 
thing that cannot be condoned in poul- straw cleaned out and the nests com- 
try house architecture it is a wet pletely disinfected. Do not forget that

J

I
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IW UITellYouHow
to Make Poultry Healthy 

Mate b u s Lay Make Chicks Grow
Now that mating time has arrived, it’s up to you to see that your poultry 
get a tonic and internal antiseptics to make them vigorous and free of 
disease. Therefore, feed  Pan-a-ce-a. ^
In that condition your hens will lay better, you will get more healthy, fertile 
eggs and the chicks will stand a better show of reaching maturity. 
Therefore, feed  Pan-a-ce-a.
And, before the hatches come, I want to warn against gapes, leg weakness 
and indigestion, for these ailments are responsible for half the baby-chick 
losses. Therefore, feed  Pan-a-ce-a— it will save you these losses.
My lifetime experience as a veterinarian, a doctor of medicine and poultry 
raiser has taught me the needs of poultry under all conditions; that is why 
I urge you to try my scientific and long-tried prescription,

Dr. Hess Poultry
PAN-A-CE-A

It’s a Tonic—Not a Stimulant
Here are a few of the valuable ingredients in Pan-a-ce-a to meet the 
requirements of your poultry which I have just stated:
N ux Vomica, a nerve tonics Carbonate o f Lime, a shell former; Hyposul­
phite o f  Soda, an internal antiseptic; Quassia, an appetizer; Iron, to 
enrich the blood, and other valuable ingredients, all well known and recom­
mended by the highest medical and veterinary authorities.
Perhaps the strongest argument in favor of Pan-a-ce-a is the fact that it has 
been on the market for 22 years and is growing in favor each year. 
Read the guarantee in the right-hand panel—that is your protection.
There is a Dr. Hess dealer in your town, a man whom you know, a man 
who stands back pf my guarantee and will return your money if Pan-a-ce-a 
fails to make good. lbs. 25c; 5 lbs. 60c; 25-lb. pail, $2.50 (except in
Canada and die far West).

lay and your chicks 
grow that I have told 
my dealer in your town 
to supply you on con­
dition that if Pan-a- 
ce-a does not do as I 

claim, return the 
empty package and

A s h l a n d *  O h i o

Dr. Hess Stock Tonic 
25-lb. pail, $1.60; 100-lb. sack, $5.00

W hy pay the peddler twice my price?
Your stock need this tonio now to harden and condition 
them after the confined heavy feeding of winter; There's 
nothing better to put horses in trim for hard spring and 
summer work. Milch cows need it just now to prepare 
them for the heavy milking season ahead Dr. Hess Stock 
Tonic makes all stock healthy, keeps them toned up and 
expels worms. Sold under money-back guarantee. 25-lb. 
pail, $1.60 ; 100-lb. sack, $5.00; smaller packages as low as 50c 
(except in Canada and the far West and the South). Send 2o 
for my new free Stock Tonic book.

Dr. Hess Instant Louse Killer
Kills lice on poultry andall farm stock. Dust the hens and 
sprinkle it in the nests, or, if your fowl are pro' 
vided with a dust bath, Bprinkle Instant 
Louse Killer in the dust bath every 
other week—the hens will do the 
rest. Also destroys bugs on cu­
cumber, squash and melon vines, 
slugs on rose bushes, etc.
Comes in handy, sifting-top 
cans. 1 lb. 25c; 8 lbs. 60c 
(except in Canada and 
the far West). 
guarantee i t

11 you have a  sick or infured 
anim al, w rite Dr. H ess, tell 

sym ptom s, enclose 2c stamp 
lor reply, and he w ill send 
you a prescription and 
letter of advice free of 
charge.
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garrid P vmounfh ÂŸOK^COOKERELS, large, farm  ■a ll Oil ■ IJinuuillll raised from  prize w inning flock. $3 
each , tw o f o r  $5. J .  A. BARN USX, U nion City, M ich.

Barred Rock Cockerel*-200 blgA U8hy vigorous birds
W . O G o ffm a n , R . 3,

A few pullets.
B en ton  H a rb or , M ich .

Barred Rocks °Pte,t.prize strain. GrandRinglet OaiTeO HOCKS Breeding Oockerels fo r  sale, S3 
apiece, two fo r  S5. Also selected pens fo r  breeding. 
P la in  view Stock and D airy Farm , Rom eo, M ien.

BIG  Beautiful H en hatched Barred Plym outh Rocks 
sold on approval $2 to $5 each. (4 females and m ale 

$10)good layers. Circulars and photos. John Northon,Clare, Mich.

Big Cash Profits
Every W eek on Chicks. W rite me for detail'» 
showing how beginners with B elle C ity outfits 
make $ 1 O to f2 S  a week on day-old  chicks. 
G et the facts!  A n y man, wom an, boy o f  girl 
can do it by follow ing m y plan and using m y

a dust bath is one of the ways nature all the time, also all danger of musty 
provides so that the fowl can dust her- or moldy oats is avoided by the open 
self and thus get rid of the parasites trays.

Cousins Northern King Strain Barred Plym outh
— — — ------ - - - - ..  .......0  Rocks. Have won
many prizes. Som e n ice O ockerels aind Pullets fo r  sale. 
W rite  fo r  prices. David W. Cousins, N orth port, M ich.

CLE A R V E IW  Poultry Farm  Established 1900. T rap ' 
nest strain o f  S. 0. W. Leghorns Eggs fo r  hatching. 

l£l_$ld—50^_$j ĵ_jOQ^_^.__Thos H . Barns, CreHton. Ohio*

CJ—§  I  S. 0 .W . Leghorns,¡Scjeach..... . .V  V l , l  Barred Rocks, 10c  each. 
JO S . NEUM AN, P rop., Eureka Farm, Dorr, M ich .

Barred Plymouth ?Xrei?KomB%sTb»̂ u
ing  obtainable not ou ite  matured. W ould cost $5.00 
otherwise. R IV E R  V IE W  FA RM , R. 2, Vassar.M ich.

Barred Rock Ckls.bÿb? bi-rd- from ?2hip~
narrow barring. A . A . Pattuito,

b ig bone fellow s With deep I '  Deckervilie, M ich

BA R R E D  Rocks Parks 200 Egg Strain with records to 
290 eggs a year—$1.50 per 15 Delivered. By Parcel 

post. Fred  A stlln g . C o n s ta n t in e , M ich .

BU IF  LEGH O RN S — Oockerels, pullets, hens o r  
■, pens; anything you wish in  Buff Leghorns. Great 

laying strain. D r. W illiam  Sm ith, Petersburg, Mich.

Chicks that Live $15 per 100.
flottes. W hite Leghorn  Chicks $12 per 100, Pekin 
and Rouen D ucklings .25 cents each. ÀLDH AM  
P O U L T R Y  F A R M , R . N o. 37, P h oen ix v ille . Pa.

m i f K C  W e ship thousands each season, Ten 
varieties, A n con a ’ s $11 a hundred, 'free  

booklet. F reep ort  H atch ery , B ox 12,F reep ort,M ich .

FffOC fo r  hatching—From  pure bred W hite Plym outh 
“ 5 5 *  Rocks. Pekin and W hite rum m er ducks. W hite 
A frican  guineas. H. V . Hostetler, R. 1, St. Johns, M ich.

EGGS for H atching. Park’s 200-egg strain barred 
Plym outh Rocks. 15-S1.50; 25-S2.50: 30-$3.00: 

60-$4.50. J. E . Grimm, Conklin, M ich .

S. C ._W . Leghorn , good as offered. Is 
^ J * * * ^ *  eggs $1.00, SO.eggs $1.75. Catalog free. 

M . M A Y E R , J r . .  M errill, M ich .

■ T I M E S , i f
iw o r ld ’! 

/Champioi 
Belle citt

Incubators and Brooders
402,000 in use. Get the whole 
w o n d e r fu l s t o r y  t o ld  b y  the ch a m p io n *  
s h ip  w in n e rs  th e m s e lv e s  in  m y  b ig
Fre e  B o o k , “ H a t c h i n g  F a c t s ’ ’

mtiuV___ „  On p oetica l Chicken Rawing
f mej i ul1 description and illustration o f  

g y  ffB W S k g  and brooder in actual colors—the kind 
used by U. S. Government and leading Agricultural 
Colleges—that won the "T y c o s "  C u ^ t h ^ w il l^ f n  
biff success and cash profits fo r  you— “

M y 10-Y ear Money-Back  
Guaranty— M y Low Prices

T-same as last year. F re ig h t p rep a id . M y  
H®*“ e Jest— âll facts, proofs, particulara 

—100 photographs o f  prize winning hatches—also my
$ 1 3 0 0  G o l d  O f f e r s

Condtitons so easy anyone may receive biggest tav
S S T U & iM S P -** hadt° make
I^am  how I paid one Belle City user $156.25. another 
i 50» P ar} /  rrom$45 down. Everything comes with 
-  f, .  W nLe me today' Jim Itohan f  f te sB ello  C ity Incubator C o ., B ox  1 4 ,  R acine, W it,'

that cut down winter production and 
annoy the old biddy.

One of the best louse powders that 
can be had was first formulated in Cor­
nell University by R. C. Lowry. It is 
prepared by mixing three-fourths of a 
pint of gasolene, one-fourth pint of 
crude carbolic acid and two and one- 
half pounds of plaster of paris. Force

The top tray is fed each morning 
and all the others are sprinkled with 
warm water and moved up a notch, 
putting the freshly filled tray in at 
the bottom. All are well sprinkled 
again at night.

One of these sprouters painted a 
nice, dark green, combining nicely 
with the green of the oats, makes a

this mixture through a sieve to break pleasing object in the kitchen, giving 
up the lumps, dry in the air and when a hint of spring time.

EGGS fo r  hatching. Baby chicks a specialty. From  
pure R. 0 . Rhode Island Reds and 8 . C. W hite Leg­

horns. $1.00 per setting. Baby chicks $10 per 100. Book 
your orders now. Red & W hite Poultry Farm, H . A. 
N icholls, Prop., Ellake, M ich.

Ferris I P (Thorns’--.?®®. S tra in . One custom er's i BIIIi  Legnurns flock averaged 102 eggs in  six w inter 
m o8., another 181 eggs in  10 m os., another 199 eggs in 
12 mos. You can do as well. Eggs, chicks, breeding 
stock from  hens w ith records up to 264 eggs. Prize 
winners at largest shows. Prom pt shipment, prices low. 
Quality guaranteed. W hite Leghorns are best fo r  eggs. 
W e raise thousands. Free catalog and price list gives 
particulars. W rite fo r  it now. 16years square dealing- 
thousands o f  pleased customers. F E R R IS  LEGH O RN  
FA R M , 934 Union, GRAND RA PID S, MICH.

Fur fimrlr r.lparanrs a few  Buff Rook Cocks and 
rV l UIIIGK blBaiSIIGv, Cockerels at $2 each. Hens and 
Bullets$1.50 each. Blue Orpingtons, bothsexes$2 each. 
M ust be sold before February 10th. W inners at Chicago, 
1911, ’12,’13,’ 14 and’ 16. Bird Lawn Farm , Law rence,M ich,

F O W L E R ’ S B U FF ROCKS,
SI Ito $3. W hite  H olland Turkey Toms $5; hens $3. 

R* B. F O W L E R , H artford, Michigan.

Cnr ®«|a—White R ock Cockerels 9 lbs. $3.00, 8 lbs. 
•yr Odlc $2.50. Fine white birds. Order early.
M rs . Elsie M . R o b in s o n , P etersb u rg , M ich ig a n

Compound Ineubafors
p - G e t  B i g g e r  H a t c h e s * - .

A n w  P/m om — A n y  T i m a - A n y  C llm a tr n  
These famous M eta l c o v e re d  m ach in es make 

me m on ey  e v e ry  y e a r  f o r  p o u ltry  ra isers. Hiffb 
Q u ality  m ateria l, su p er io r  co n s tru ctio n , s im ­
p l ic i t y  an d  ease of operation all com b in e  to eiveto e  greatest --------
batching value.

Don’t Pay 
Tw o 

Prices

IM PR O V E your poultry. My Young’s strain S. C .W hite 
Leghorns great money makers. Strong, vigorous, free- 

range stock. Baby chicks $8 per 100 and up. Satisfaction 
guaranteed. Prea catalogu e, W. Van Appledorn, Hoi land, Mich.

Mammoth Bronze Turkey* Ä ahensd'atA$4e<»
each. CO LLAR BROS., Conklin, M ich ., ¡R. No. 2.

MAM M OTH  Bronze Turkeys Mammoth Toulouse Geese and 
B.P.Rock and S.C.White Leghorn Cockerels.Berkshires, both 

■ex all ages. Chase's StockFarm , M ariette.M ich. R .l

Fine Crest White Orpingtons
after Feb. 1st., baby chicks . „ . ,  ¿ «m o. w
H O U G H , Pine Crest Farm, Royal Oak, Michigan

Strong, vigorous birds 
best o f egg strain, eggs 

later. M R S. W ILLIS

dry cork tightly. This mixture will re­
main good indefinitely. When you want 
to apply the powder, punch some holes 
iH the top of a tin can and use this as 
a shaker. The fowl may be held by 
the legs with her head down. In such 
a position the feathers fall readily 
away from the body so that the pow­
der may be distributed through td the 
skin. Frequent applications of this 
louse powder are to be recommended.

In building the poultry house, par­
ticular attention may well be paid to 
its location, the construction ought to 
be such that the coop will be dry, lib­
erally ventilated, accessible to the sun 
and capable of being easily disinfected.

Ingham Co. I . J. M a t h e w s .

One of the neighbors proclaims 
mine “prettier than any house plant.” 

It is not only pretty, but a grain-sav­
er, and the materials for making can 
be readily picked up on nearly any 
farm. . . "

Kalamazoo Co. Mr s . M. K ennedy.

SHIPPING HATCHING EGGS.

A HOME-MADE OAT SPROUTER.

The accompanying picture repre­
sents an oat sprouter which I made 
myself and have used with success.

In the basin on the right are 53 eggs 
and 76 in the basin on the left. This 
shows the gain made by my hens, in

The season is almost at hand when 
many of us will be buying, and not a 
few selling, eggs for hatching. It is, 
therefore, pertinent to discuss at this 
time methods of shipping hatching 
eggs. It is not true that faulty pack­
ing causes much trouble in the line of 
poor hatches, for the average breeder 
of fancy stock knows how to ship his 
eggs. Usually more of the fault lies 
with the receiver who does not give 
the eggs proper attention when they 
arrive at their destination. This at­
tention should consist of a period of 
quiet before they are put in the incu­
bator or under the hens. It is inevitar 
ble that the delicate cells and germs

In this incu-l 
bator yon get I 
t h e  greatest I 
batching value! 
at the lowest 
possible price, 
will last a life 
time.

C . P. Shlrey,writes:
I hatched 2 2 0  

chicks from 2 2 2  
fertile eggs. J have B  Made 
not done this with ■  ■„ i n  
any other machine and I  JJ! VVBf 

-------  msm I  have tried a  number. SIZ6S

F R E E  1 9 1 6  Catalog F R E E
Don't buy an incubator anywhere at any 

price until you get our new 1916 catalog ana 
rock bottom prices. You owe it to yourself t o  
know all’ about this wonderful incubator* Write today—sure.

WARSAW INCUBATOR CO.
Box 249«______________Warsaw* IIL

R . I , Reds, Both Combs, Mott Popular „ 1Kai
Eggs for hatching. B aby Cbicks. W rite for catalog 
IN T E E L A K E 8 F A  RM. Box 39. Lawrence. M ichigan

strain in 
Michigan

Rh o d e  i s l a n d  r e d s  and p l y m o u  t h  r o c k s .
Males 5 to  12 lbs. accord in g to  age $2 to  $5; P, R. hens 

Weight5 to9H  lbs., eggs 15 fo r  $1.00; P. R . eggs $5per 100. 
M am m oth Bronze Tom  Turkeys, 8 to 88 lbs. according 
to  age $6 to $25, 10 eggs $3. A. Ë. Cramp ton, Tassar, Mich

R and S C. R . I . Red Cockerels, eggs and baby chicks, 
.  W . Emden Ganders, B . O. Ducks. Fine stock 

Prices reasonable. O .E . H awley, Ludington, M ich '

Rose Comb Brown Leghorn & Mimmofh Pekin Duck
E g g s tl per setting, $5 perlOO. W . China G eese 25 cents 
each. C L A U D IA  B E T T S. H illsd a le . M ich .

R O SE  AND SIN GLE C O M B  R h o d e  Is la n d  R ed s 
Eggs, per 15, *1.50 by parcel post; from special pens. 
20c each by express, Jennie Buell, Ann Arbor, M ich.

■ - to smsiiii p r ize
' winners at Ionia . Choice cockerels rea­

sonable. Sendfoi circular. C. W.Browning, H.2,Portland,Mich.

S O. R. M in oicas Cockerels and Pullets. Eggs, Pope 
• strain. P. 0. Bred Sows and fa ll pigs. B ig  type 

w ith quality. R . W . Mills; Saline, M ich . ‘ P

DEE'
Co l o n y
ROODER

Beginner Lost R 
Only One Chick

Cast Iron J BROODER Candee Colony Brooder that
Coal Burnino-Self Reodlatino were 6 weeks old last Wednes- 

* *  w  C »• day and I still have 271 and I
wnte Tor Big never saw or run one of your

Illustrated Catalog Brooders or any other until 
that gives the experi-' 52y:” TF* 8J; John, Jackson, 

ence of Candee operators “ i*jh.,May31, 
last year and pictures of 

their plants. Tells about the coal- 
burning brooder automatically 
regulated. Large, roomy hover.
Poultry raising will be more prof­
itable brooding with the Candee.

Candee IncslMtor&BrooderCe.
Depict Eastwood, N. Y.

Licensed by Wo A«
Schleit Mfg.Co.gInc.

one week after I began feeding the «It ueiicaie ceiis ant6 teeuiug me get m0re or less disturbed by a long
trip—this in spite of skillful packing 
and careful handling.

The express companies handle most 
of the hatching eggs that are trans­
ported, as it is undoubtedly true that 
they do it with more care than the 
post office department. Yet it is also 
true that long shipments are made by 
parcel post and good hatches result. 
Several manufacturers of parcel post 
boxes put out cartons that carry eggs 
with a considerable degree of safety. 
All packages containing eggs should 
be so marked, whether they are to be 
sent by express or parcel post.

Fiber boxes are best for mail ship­
ments but baskets are better for ex­
press. It is undoubtedly true that a 
basket is handled with more consider­
ation than a box by express company 
employes. The basket should be just 
about large enough to hold the ship­
ment with the necessary packings. A  

bushel basket will hold about 100 eggs, 
while a ten-pound grape basket will 
hold one setting.* The grape basket is 
scarcely strong enough, however, but 
baskets of that size do not cost very 
much.

When the basket is ready to pack, 
line it with newspapers and put one 

over the bottom.

Sprouted Oats Increase Egg Supply.
sprouted oats, with no other change in 
their diet.

The sprouter was set out on the 
porch in order to get a good light, but 
its regular place is in the kitchen, by 
a window near the kitchen range.

It is simply a frame with cleats on, 
to hold trays made of one-half-inch by " “ “e,"“ "

W E M Y  $ 8 0  4 M ONTH S A U R Yana furnish rlgr and all expenses to Introduce 
2JJS poultry and stock powders.
B IC H W  CO M PANY. X 682 , S P R IN G FIELD , l-L IN O IS

Q  C ,£ hit0 M § 1,V,rn*i’ vigorous bred to  lay stock. D . V^- Eggs, fo.OO hundred—75c fo r  13, a few  day old
i f 1*  r nMii’v ehvo ryxt a ?  d fertility  guaranteed. M . MALONEY, H. Jio. 1, Kalamazoo, M ichigan.

Ufa|nyf Corner W yandottes.. both fancy and■ ■ llllll  WUIIICl Utility,a n ice  lot o f  cockerels fo r  sale. 
Satisfaction  guaranteed. W .J . Scholl, Bremen, Ohio.

White Wyandotte 1owneprfeemandandritemayourt
wants. D A V ID  BAY, 202 F orest A v e„ Y p s lla n t i.i /io k

While Wyandotte Oockerels «Tm  «foô*1 *350
E G G A D A Y  P O U L T R Y  R A  N CH , Marshall, Mich!

WH IT E  W yandotte Cockerels, $2.50, £ ? .£ ) and &
__each. From High Bred stock and heavy layers

A . F R A N K L IN  SM IT H , Ann Arbor, Michigan.

R ip *  P O U LTR Y  JO U R N A L—the Practical
„  Poultry Paper fo r  P ractica l Poultry Raisers; only 
paper devoted exclusively to  the poultry interests o f  
Illinois. Indiana, _ M ichigan and W isconsin *

one-inch wood strips, with galvanized 
wire screen tacked on the bottoms.

This greatly simplifies the raising of 
early chicks, also gets the good fertile 
eggs, from which to hatch the early 
chicks. For feeding chicks it is best 
to cut off the top of the oats and clip 
them up in short lengths with the 
shears, feeding the rest to the hens.

Little ducks and geese require great 
amounts of green feed and in an ex-

YÖUR paper: 
SPECIAL O F - . „ „  
stamps. B ig F ou r !

POULTRY.

Whllfl W yandottes. Duston’ s strain, 3 firsts at Van 
" " '• jB u r e n .  Oo. F air. 25 fine cockerels $3 each 2 fo r  
$5. V E R N  MOORE, R. No. 1, H artford, M id i

Whiff Holland Turkeys. FT ^ aÄ ? l C 8y$l.^:k’
Aloen Whitcomb, Byron* Center, Michigan.

Pekin and Ronen Drakes c  oL ^ hoo°r 3
■her Id an Poultry Yard*. ShtrM aa, M ichigan.

Single Comb White Leghorns
Day-Old Chicks t  Eggs for Hatching

Cheap feeds, free range, bulk o f work of handling 
the nock In winter, when the farmer is least 
occupied, makes poultry raising doublyattractive 
and profitable for the farmer. Our stock bred 
for vigor and egg production, makes raising easy 
and profit certain. Just a word about our mat- 
lng : Every male bjrd used In our breeding pens 
has been sired by males out of 200 egg hens or 
better. We are offering chicks and eggs for 
Hatching from these males mated to large, vigor­
ous,'early-maturing females, at very reasonable 
prices. Two thousand chicks per week. Absolute 
satisfaction, full count and safe delivery guaran­
teed on all orders. We are booking orders for 
early spring delivery. Write us for prices and further particulars.

Hillandale Poultry Farm,
K re n te l Bros., Props.. East L u tin g ', M ich

Wrap each egg separately in soft pa­
per and place them in thé basket, the 
small end down. Place them one inch 
apart and fill all spaces with excelsior, 
crowding it in carefully. Put on an­
other layer of excelsior and repeat un­
til the basket is full. The secret of 
success is to keep the eggs from com­
ing in contact with each other during 
the journey. Round up the top with 
excelsior and cover with canvas, sew­
ing it to the basket all the way round, 

u n n s r t î i i c e  u e i w e ç n  —

, • br<>ken. No eggs should be shipped
t y ^  ,!îe ,Tei y !oose “ 'unless they have perfect shells. Hens 

the frame, or they will stick when wet in the breeding pens should be fed all
11 n  I n  tyi o l r i n o *  o  c m p A i i r o w  n l i A w  a v >a  . .

-zoiTshouidread it?Bright3iappy Live tremely dry time one of these sprout- 1T Tn Tnp naB1,ot Qll ____ .
special OFFER: 6 mos. TriaiSubscfiptionT* Heni ers miffht st)ell the different het ween ^  6 Dasket all the way round.nr Poultry Journal, Desk26, Chicago. ers «pen tne uinerence between Eggs packed in this wav are seldom

—  - -.-------- g—l__  success and failure. i._*__

up. In making a sprouter allow one 
square inch of space for each hen to 
be fed and a few extra inches for the 
early broods of chicks, or else allow 
an extra tray from which to cut the 
tops for the chicks. Seven trays are 
used in this one as this allows a tray 
for each day in the week.

The tray that is emptied
m orn in e  is refilled  at on ee w ith nnta ia ie r \ w,as round possible to influ-rnornmg is refilled at once, with oats ence the color of the eggshell by pair-
that have been soaked over night m ing a cock of. a breed which, has yel-
warm water. low or brown eggs with a hen of an-

Ten minutes twice a day will care °ther breed that lays white eggs, or 
for this sprouter and there is nn lamn i  . versa* the breed of the hen alone
„ J  a ? “ °  . p beine responsible for the color o f  theto be «leaned, filled and kept burning, eggshell.

the oyster shells and green food they 
will eat. This gives the eggs strong 
thick shells. C .  H. C h e s l e y .

It was found that 15 days after mat­
ing the hens still laid . fertile eggs. 
When mating was repeated after a pe­
riod of more than 1ft days, thé first fer- 

in the î ile egg was generally laid three days 
later. It was found possible to influ-
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How to Sell the Big Crops
■ HEN in any industry the supply usual quantities in the fall. The whole- 

catches the demand, the prob- sale price dropped $3.00 per box in 
lem in that industry becomes thirty days. However, the wholesale 

no longer production. It becomes and retail trade had large supplies of 
sales. The question is not how to pro- high-priced foreign and California lem-, 
duce, but how to sell. ons on. hand, a condition which pre-

In previous articles we have shown vented a free distribution of the fruit 
that the problems of the jobber, the for many weeks«
retailer and the consumer are also the The reduction of the duty of one 
problems of the producer. In analyz- cent per pound in 1912 lowered the ov- 
ing our big problem we said, “Here, erhead charge on foreign fruit 72 cents 
on the one hand, are food supplies for per box, and because the war cut off 
the people of this country and here on the usual continental European mar- 
the other are the one hundred million kets this country received a flood of 
inhabitants. How can we economical- Italian lemons of all grades whenever 
ly distribute these crops to "  these it was figured that overhead charges 
people?'’ could be realized. The New York price

Our conclusion was that the 2,500 of foreign lemons for the year 1915, 
produce jobbers with their 7,500 trav- which is a leading factor in establish- 
eling salesmen and the 300,000 retail- ing values throughout the country, was 
ers whom they supply are virtually the only slightly more than the average 
producer’s agents who perform a dis- cost of producing and placing a box of 
tinct function—a necessary service-— lemons on the cars in California, 
in assembling perishable products in But people ate no more lemons,
the market centers and distributing The California lemon growers figur-
them to the consuming public. We ed their acreage. They found that they 
have said very little regarding the pro- had 20,000 acres of lemons four years 
ducer’S relation to this public. old or under, which would soon throw

Agricultural science and modern an additional supply upon the market, 
methods of farming have made it pos- It would be necessary to increase the 
sible for thè grower to economically consumption of lemons in the United 
produce fruit which should yield a fair States and Canada from 75 to 100 per 
return on the investment. Let us as- cent within four or five years, 
sume that we have a marketing sys- The California lemon growers are 
tern which is fair and satisfactory to well organized. They have had years 
every factor engaged in the distribuì- of hard experience in growing and 
ing process. The crop comes to the marketing Citrus fruits. They selected 
consumer in good condition and at a national advertising as the practicable 
reasonable price because the market- implement for increasing the consump- 
ing is efficient and not extravagantly tion of American lemons. Good adver- 
or dishonestly performed. The conse- tising, they logically reasoned, would 
quent good will and demand of a sat- teach people the hundreds of useful 
isfled public is reflected to the retailer ways for employing this versatile fruit, 
and passes through the jobber’s sales- So the Exchange set aside $100,000, or 
men and the jobber to the producer, two cents per box, for Its first year’s 
The crop moves rapidly and everyone campaign to make people use two lem- 
is satisfied. ons where they formerly used one.

But, even under these almost per- This was not their first experience 
feet conditions, suppose the country with advertising. Twenty years ago 
produces too much. The crop accumu- when the. state shipped 5,000 cars of 
lates in the jobbing and retail stores, citrus fruits there was a great cry 
It rots in the grower’s fields. Prices about overproduction. Today a nor- 
take a slump. But the public is al- mal crop is 50,000 carloads. Six-sev- 
ready consuming its fill. LoW prices enths of this is oranges, 
offer little inducement to buy. Sales- From 1894 to 1914 while the popula- 
manship is speeded up without result, tion of the United States increased 47 
There is an oversupply. per cent the California citrus ship-

What can the grower do? What ments increased 724 per cent. During 
forces has he at his command ? To this period Florida citrus shipments 
whom oan he appeal? Let us see what increased 95.2 per cent and imports 
others have done under these condi-. 26.6 per cent.
tions. Under these conditions it is said that

Last year the California lemon crop F. Q. Story, the Exchange president, 
increased 132 per cent over tfye output for ten years or more, rose regularly 
of the preceding year. Americans use at directors’ meetings, when the corn- 
lemons most freely in cold drinks in ing year’s policies were being settled, 
hot weather. They use them in a com- and advocated advertising of oranges 
paratively small way throughout the to the consumer to increase consump- 
year for culinary and other general tion, until by sheer persistence he got 
purposes. A low-retail price will not an experimental appropriation and 
greatly stimulate the use of lemons in demonstrated that he was right, 
the summer time, when temperature Probably this orange advertising 
is the real controlling factor. was the first big attempt to advertise

Last year the moBt significant factor a perishable crop. And it made good, 
in the lemon situation was the abnor- It taught people to eat more oranges., 
mally cool'weather that prevailed over They got the orange habit. The- fact 
the United States after the middle of that this year the Exchange spent 
May. Only twice after April did the $250,000 on its orange advertising, and 
average eastern temperature reach the appropriated $100,000 to launch a lem- 
normal; twice only after May did the on campaign, indicates how much im- 
central temperature reach normal; portance these men place upon con- 
and at no time after May did the aver- sumer demand as a factor in bringing 
age temperature reach normal in the to them fair returns on their invest- 
westem sections of the United States, ment.

When war was declared in 1914 it The California raisin growers faced 
was generally believed that importa- a similar situation. As they developed 
tions of foreign lemons would be stop- raisin growing around Fresno they 
ped. Wholesale and retail prices rose reached a stage in which raisins could 
to abnormal figures in the fall} the no longer be produced ab a profit, 
trade had no advioes regarding impor- Prices got down to one and one-half 
tations and the dealers stocked up for cents and two cents, and some growers 
the future with high-priced fruit. were abandoning their farms—leaving

But imports were not stopped. Ita^ the fruit to rot on the vine»/ The 
ian lemons were shipped here in the growers banded together through nee-

How there came 
to he a 

Pere Marquette Railroad
“ As it stands today, the Road embraces 41 lines originally 

entirely separate. These lines gradually grew into three small 
systems— the Flint & Pere Marquette in 

A  FEW eastern Michigan; the Chicago & West
FACTS Michigan in western and the Detroit, Grand

Rapids & Western in the central part of the 
state. These three systems were consolidated in 1900 to form 
the Pere Marquette Railroad.

“ The Pere Marquette Railroad didn’t ‘just happen’. It is 
the result of a steady growth due to manifest need. T h e  little 
lines couldn’t furnish connected service— consolidation resulted.

Today we have through service to nearly all 
AND A  FEW the principal cities of the state. 
THOUGHTS Would we return to die 

old order o f things? Not 
w e ! This Railroad is here today by virtue of the 
efforts o f some of the best men Michigan ever 
had. W e  of this day cannot know of their struggles, 
their determined perseverance, their sacrifices, 
their indomitable courage and heroism. But the 
bands of steel stand for all these.

“ This is Michigan’s Railroad. It serves US in Michigan 
principally, and it must be conserved in order that it may 
continue to serve us as it should. It needs your word of en­
couragement. It needs your business. It needs your help in 
securing adequate rates. These things will enable the Road to 
so maintain itself as to guarantee its future on a basis which will 
meet your transportation demands and promote the progress 
and development of the state. W e  are doing everything 
possible to bring about this result. Are you doing your part?

Talk N o. 2 Operating Receiver, 
Pere Marquette Railroad.

Locate in Virginia
Virginia Farms are selling now 

for $25.00 per acre and up—adapted 
to the growing of Corn, Alfalfa, 
Fruits, Grains, Grasses and the pro­
duction of Beef and Dairy cattle. 
One farm of 500 acres yielded its 
owner a Hay crop of over 2,000 tons 
last year from Alfalfa alone. Lands 
are advancing in value each year— 
thousands of acres are waiting to 
be tilled by the most progressive 
methods of the day, to yield highly 
profitable returns. Virginia claims 
the finest apple growing section in 
the world.

Come to Virginia—now is the 
time to buy. Healthful climate, 
abundant rainfall, good water, pub­
lic schools and churches. Cheap 
and quick transportation to the 
great Eastern markets enables you 
to command highest prices for your 
product's. Virginia offers the great­
est Of opportunities for farmers and 
investors.

Send for hand-book with map and 
other literature telling about the op­
portunities to be had in the Old 
Dominion. Write now-—while you 
think: of it.

G . W . K O I N E R  
State Commissioner of Agriculture 

R IC H M O N D . V A .

; Biggest O ffer Y e t !_______
BIG 155-Egg Incubator. Mad« ,

. of  genuine California Rod- lOoVJpcK 
W eed. Natural Finish. Double Doors. Deep 

iM lW u r . Thermometer. Teeter. Self-regulating. 
H a s hundreds o f  air cells to  protect eggs from  outside 
changes. H ot water heat. C aM-roIlea, .ana, piece cor- 
gdgated copper heater. W on’ t leak. B iggest bargain 
e v e r  offered on a  guaranteed incubator and brooder! 
© toa r from  this ad or  write for. new 1916 catalog.
Progressive Incubator C o., B talM . Radge. Hit.

¿The Profits In 
Poultry K eeping*

B ig  F R E E  1916 
P ou ltry  G uide.
Describes Cyphers,
Popular-priced In­

cubators, 3 styles—
8 sizes. 20 years leader- 
lip. W rite  today.

CYPNEBS INCUBATOR CO..O..I.35 .Buffalo.*.?. 
Haw T.rk Bm Im  CKica,.
Ktuas City O.llai ( i t lu i

• i

pnillTRY PIPED 44-124 P A G E  periodical, rilULInl "Aren up-to^iate; tells a ll you 
want to  know about care and m anagem ent 
o f  poultry fo r  pleasure o r  profit. F o u r  
m onths f o r  10 c e n ts .
POULTRY ADVOCATE. Dept 117, 
Syracuse, N.Y.

P A Y  BIG  PR O FITS
Raise your ow n  honey. W e sta rt 
you right. Send today fo r  B aa  8  up- 
ply Catalog and n n  | 1 I  I 

Sample copy mt A m erican B ee Journal. M  M  f 4  h  
Oldest Bee paper in  America — all A  1 *  1 -
A. G. WOODMAN CO., Dipt, IB, Orand R a p id s , Mich.

BEES

C B Z szn zB B ìr*
W e  positively teach you at home by mail to  earn 
£25 to f  50 weekly as Chauffeur or Repairman.
[ w l w S  MPtltcd to poflitionp, Boat system, lowest prioe. 
bO D K Ifl FURNISHED. Writ* for Face Book.
Practical Auto School, 66-W  Beaver Street, Hew York

WANTFD_AN IDF A* W ho oan th ln k  o f  sim ple"  A «  I CD HI* ID C n. th in g  to  patent? P rotest 
your ideas} they m ay brin g  yon wealth. W rite  fo r  
N eeded' inventions0  and How to  get your Patent 
and Your M oney.’ * RA N D O LPH  g  GO.. PA TE N T 
ATTO RN EYS. D E P T . 67, W A S H IN G T O N , D . 0 .

PATENT!ABLE IDEAS WANTED. M anufacturers 
want Owen Patents. Send fo r  3 free  
books; inventions wanted, eto. I  help  

you m arket you invention  w ithout charge.
RICHARD B. OWEN, 12B Owen Bldg., Washington, D. 0.

DATFIVTC T h at Protect and Pay 
i N i t l i j l i  i d  Send Sketch or Model for- Search
m B O O K S A N D  A D V IC E  F R E E
Watson E. Coleman, Patent Lawyer.Washington,D.C

WA N T E D . M an to  run grain and stock farm, must 
be  thoroughly competent; one with technical know­

ledge would be m ore favorably considered. Farm  about 
400 acres, near D etroit. Application w ith references only 
Will be considered. B ox  M . 212, la  Care Michigan Farmer.

O R  POST CARDO. Twenty Five A i O  Fine Poet Carda for Dime, I v C
O. P. W IX80N . MASON, MICH.

DOGS

mm forhuwins'^.
W . E. L E C K T ; H o lm es  v ille . O h io
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W rite Your Own Guarantee
'  I a HE Champion Guarantee is “ Absolute satisfaction to the 

user. Free repair, replacement or your money back. ’ *
If in your opinion that way of putting it does not afford 

you every possible protection in buying Champion Spark Plugs, 
write your own guarantee and forward it for our signature.

Absolute satisfaction to the user** makes you the judge of 
our product, and if you are not absolutely satisfied, you have 
your choice of three remedies “ FreeRepair,”  “ Replacement”  or 

‘Money Rack. ’ *
And always you are the counsel, judge and jury, all in 

one, and there is no appeal from your verdict.
But such is the dependability o f Champion Spark Plugs and 

such is the thoroughness of our inspections, that our guarantee x„s; 1- j^in- ,7Sc 
is scarcely ever brought to mind, except as we see it printed i 9 i i  are equipped 

on the cartons in which we pack our product. thi8bpiu&°ry

Champion Spark Plug Co., “ HSS?

The McCallum Road Plane
This implement is adapted for the maintenance of grav'd and dirt roads. The 

lever deflects the rear blade controlling the depth of the cutting blade which elim­
inates road waves, chuck holes and ruts. It is ten feet long, five feet wide and 
weighs four hundred lbs. drawn by two horses. Double ones right and left takes 
entire road at one operation drawn by four horses or tractor. Manufactured and 
sold by Patentee.

ANGUS McCALLUM, PONTIAC, MICHIGAN.

WANTEO-Honest, Energetic Men
In every county .to sell our big line of goods direct to 
farmers. EXPERIENCE NOT NECESSARY. We 
fully instruct you. Farmers, laborers, mechanics, or any 
men willing to work can make

$1000 to $3000 a Y ear
handling our big sellers. Exclusive territory given. We 
furnish you the capital. You furnish the team to carry 
the goods. Be your own boss In a pleasant, permanent 
and profitable business. Write at once for full particu­
lars, giving age and occupation.

THE DU 0F0RM  COMPANY,
D ep t. 2. North Java, N.Y.

P e r
A N D  T I M O T H Y  B u .

INVESTIGATE—Seat and Cheap«»« Seeding Known. 
Alsike Clover and Timothy mixed. Fully 1-8 alsike, a big? 
bargain. Greatest hay and pasture combination grown. 
Write for Free Sample and 100 page catalog.and circulars 
describing this wonderful grass mixture. Beats anything 
you can sow and ridiculously cheap. We handle only best 
tested recleaned seed guaranteed. Write before advance. 
A. A. B ERRY S E E D  CO ., Box 531. Clarlnda, Iowa

CLOVER
We have the kind 
you used to. sow. 
Large, plump, blue 
seed; over 99% pure 
and high vitality. 

Remember, every five pounds o f dead seed and 
impurities to the bushel, adds $1.00 to cost; also, 
that the country is flooded with seed containing 
five to fifteen pounds to the bushel that wifi not 
grow.
The C . E. DePuy C o.pS!"'„*c

P R I C E S »
(WAIT!;

AD-6

[u .t  m y 1 9 1 6  price ! Don’ t  
buy an engine o f  any make 
or kind or price until you

-----------first get my low 1916 prices
and . . . »  buyIns p lan., Including terms.

I build these Masterpiece engines in my 
great chain o f factories and sell them direct 

W to farm and shop with only ono small profit 
added to actual cost. My Now 1616  2 5 0 - 

Pano Book illustrates and describes all sizes 
„  _  5  from 13-4 H. Pi light work engines to 16 
H. P. moguls for biggest, tough- l|i 
est, heaviest jobs. ¿r-S E Skl- 
All Galloway Master-
giece engines are large 

ore, l o n g  stroke, 
heavyweight and 
low speeded. Built 
for lifetime service 
a n d  satisfaction.
1916 improvements , 
include valves in the 
head, extra cooling 
perfected .oiling system, 
economy carburetor, built, 
in magneto and Hercules

: surface,

water-cooled cylinder head. These features and 
many others make Masterpiece engines pow er kinjgs 
in every field. Shipped from Waterloo, Council 
Bluffs, Kansas City, St. Paul and Chicago.
Ask for  my special proposition and new book today. 
A  postal gets it. I ’ ll pay the postage.
W M . G A L L O W A Y . B o x  185 W a te rlo o , Io w a

Price«. Take no chances by sowing damaged 
m  local seed this year. Make big money by 

^ ft  ■  E f t  sowing our guaranteed Northern
and Canada Seed Oats. Ex- 

H  tra fine Pure-Bred Quality.
Wonderful yields. Be sura 

and get our low  prices, also our valuable Profit-Sharing 
Exclusive Field and Brass Seed Guide with samples you 
want Pree. Address American Mutual Seed Company.  
Dept. £81 43rdand Robey St., Chicago, Illinois.

TIMOTHY g A L S Y K E  $,4 . 5 0
P er bu .

B ags extra  a t  20c each . S en d  u s  y o u r  ord er . 
Y o u n g - R a n d o lp h  Seed C o . O w o sso , M ic h ig a n

Em FEED MILL
Self-Sharpening Silent-Buhi

■ Grinds 1,000 to 3,000 Bushels Per ■
Saving in cost o f grinding plates C a f  R „ L r c  !  

5 quickly pays for mill. Plates are D i m * #  ■
b  seif-sharpening, self-aligning. Running empty doesn’t g  
5  injure plates. Grinds all kinds of grain, hay, snap g 
m corn, millet, grass or weed 
m seeds— wet, dry, oily. 25%
■  fuel saved.

8 10 Days Free Trial
I  Write today fo r free trial offer—
|  give h. p. of your engine. We will 
g  send y o u , / ’» ,  a valuable 48-page 
■a book "Economy and Efficiency in 
S  Feeding Farm animals**«
S C j  LETZ M FG . CO. *

210 E u t  Road CROW N P O IN T , IN D .

essity—a factor which has compelled would mean an increase of $70,000 in 
successful organization in many agri- the'cheese business alone, 
cultural industries. If, by telling people why they should

The raisin growers’ selling organiza- use more dairy products or how they 
tion agreed to take a certain definite could use more, they could make ev- 
fixed figure—I believe it was three and ery person in this country consume 
one-quarter cents per pound—all the one-half glass of milk, one-twelfth of 
■raisins of those who joined the associ- a pound of butter, .009 of a pound of 
ation. They bought about eighty per cheese and two teaspoons of ice cream, 
cent of the total crop, but found when in addition to what they already eat, 
they came to sell it that they had it would increase the dairy business by 
something like 10,000 tons left on their $635,000,000.
hands. Incidentally, helping the milk, butter

Their crop was increasing with what or cheese industries would help the 
appeared to them alarming rapidity dairy cow industry and that would ben- 
and the danger was what to do when efit every industry that is in any way 
a bumper crop came. They said, “We dependent upon the dairy cow. 
are raising sixty to seventy-five thou- A consumer demand, equal to or 
sand tons now. Wha^ will we do when greater than the supply of dairy pro- 
we have a crop of 100,000 tons?” ducts, would be the first essential In

There was just one solution—make achieving the above conditions.
people eat more raisins. Advertising 
was the method.

In the fall of the first year, 1914, 
they appropriated $100,000 for the 
campaign, and in the spring showed

Honey is being gathered, mixed, 
packed, marketed and nationally ad­
vertised. Mingling the products of 
many hives plus careful grading makes 
uniformity possible. The shipper has

their faith by another appropriation of a uniform product of dependable grade
$160,000.

They were not so much interested in 
establishing their own label or taking 
trade from other brands as in increas­
ing the consumption of raisins. They 
wanted to sell their brand where none 
was sold before, and they succeeded.

One outlet they went after was the 
baking trade. They said, “Here, Mr. 
Baker, we are going to advertise rais­
in bread. You can bake and sell it 
and we will grow the raisins.” They 
now have several thousand bakers 
making raisin bread, and some of them 
bake a thousand loaves a day. That 
means each such baker takes annually 
something like 16,000 ibs. of raisins.

If you drive around through the 
fields of. Fresno it seems as though the 
whole world would never use the 
amount of raisins they are growing, 
and when they tell you that this year 
they expect to pack 110,000 tons, you 
feel sure they have an over-supply. 
But 110,000 tons distributed over one 
hundred million people means about 
two pounds per capita. In England, 
as a matter of fact, the average raisin 
consumption is said to be five pounds 
per person.
* The National Dairy Council, at its

and a regular supply. He is ready to 
call the public’s attention to his goods.

The Florida Citrus Fruit Exchange 
is seeking to make people eat more 
grapefruit and oranges—particularly 
their own brands—through an adver­
tising campaign similar to that of the 
California orange and. lemon growers.

Several brands of butter are being 
placed on the market and advertised 
in the face of conditions, not unlike 
those under which honey is popular­
ized.

An association of northwestern ap­
ple shippers has concentrated its en­
tire appropriation on a campaign in 
New York City. They are attempting 
not only to make people want more 
apples and more of their particular 
brand, but they are striving to teach 
them just when they should buy eq,ch 
variety shipped under that label. They 
realize that a satisfied customer is the 
best advertising obtainable and that 
buying the right variety at the right 
time-—that is, when that particular va­
riety is at its best—means maximum 
satisfaction to him who eats it.

The California walnut growers are 
striving to overcome certain difficul­
ties which are peculiar to their indus-

first annual meeting in Chicago in No- try by going direct to the consumer, 
vember, 1915, gave as its object the They pack walnuts in one-pound boxes 
“promoting of the dairy cow and all and tell people about them through 
interests dependent upon her, through national advertising.
co-operative and united effort.” It is 
proposed to raise a fund of $150,000 to 
$200,000 a year for a period of three 
years to cover an advertising cam­
paign similar to that which proved so 
successful in disposing of lemons, or­
anges, raisins and other foodstuffs. 
The dairymen believe that the public 
is losing sight of the advances made 
in the dairy industry and the actual

Long ago other industries realized 
the value of consumer demand and 
consumer good will. The manufactur­
er studied supply and demand while 
the producer planted his orchards.

The necessity for a largé consumer 
demand is even greater with a perish­
able crop than a manufactured article. 
The manufacturer can decrease his 
factory output, but fruit and most per-

food values which dairy products now1 ishables are grown and matured regu-
contain.

They must convince the public that 
dairy products are pure, healthful and 
safe to eat, that they are economical, 
and that they possess high nutritive 
value. And they must co-operate to 
enforce regulations which will, make 
their products all that they are repre­
sented to be. They must distribute 
recipes showing new uses, publish edu­
cational matter showing why dairy

larly, regardless of economic condi­
tions.

When the number of producers nar­
rows down to a few they restrict pro­
duction to what the consumers will 
take, although hot necessarily by 
agreement. Each makes what he finds 
he can sell, and the net result is re­
stricted production.

But when we come to conditions un­
der which our big crops of fruits and

products are valuable foods and prove perishables are produced, we find, in-

W rlte  fo r  S a m p le« and  P rices o f
White Bonanza Seed Oats

O n e  o f  th e  best varieties g row n  In M ich ig a n . 
Y o u n g -R a n d o lp h  S eed  C o. O w osso , M ic h ig a n

to the consumer that such products 
are derived and distributed under heal­
thy conditions.

The per capita consumption of milk 
is something less than half a glass per 
day; of butter less than one-twelfth of 
a pound; of ice cream, about two tea­
spoons full; cheese .009 of one pound.

Take for analysis, the average 
daily per capita consumption of 
cheese. When weighed out it is hardly 
enough to bait one hole of a mouse 
trap. A rough estimate of the retail 
price realized for cheese produced in 
this country shows that the consumer 
pays $70,000,000 for cheese every year.

If the dairymen could induce every

stead of a few hundred starters, thou­
sands of people engaged in the indus­
try.' It is neither practicable nor de­
sirable to narrow this field to a few 
people who control the industry. Now, 
that means this: either the demand 
must be stimulated to keep ahead of 
the supply or else when the supply 
catches the demand a disaster will ov­
ertake the industry. When the sup­
ply catches the demand and there is 
a little surplus distributed among 
these thousands of producers, the lat­
ter get in a panic to sell and each en­
deavors to get from under the impend­
ing crash. The result is that prices 
fall to where they only cover the cost

person in this country to eat every day of distribution and nothing is left for 
a piece of cheese of sufficient size to the growers.
bait two holes to a mouse trap, it Illinois. D. W. FRANCisca
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COLD STORAGE HOLDINGS OF 
APPLES.

The quantity of apples stored in 
coolers, according to the Office of Mar­
kets, appears to be 14.8 per cent more 
on February 1 this year than were 
held on February 1, 1915. The bar­
reled apple holdings show an excess of 
33.6 per cent over a year ago, while 
boxed apple holdings are 25.2 per cent 
below those of last year. Apples mov­
ed out of storage faster during the 
month of January than in December. 
At the end of January 27.3 per cent of 
the December holdings had moved 
from the coolers.

Crop and Market Notes
Michigan.

Muskegon Co., Feb. 16.—Have from 
10 to 11 inches of snow, and winter 
grains are- in fine condition. Farmers 
have plenty of roughage but need more 
grain. Stock mostly marketed. Very 
few sheep here. Hens have started 
laying. Not much maple syrup made. 
Butter-fat 31 %c; eggs 28c; chickens, 
alive 13c; dressed hogs 8c; beef 8c; 
wheat $1.25; corn 82c; beans $3.25; 
red kidneys $4; potatoes $1; hay $14 
@15 per ton.

Branch Co., Feb. 16.—Not much 
snow at present and ground is frozen 
but no ice. Winter grains look good. 
Stock not doing well, there being a 
scarcity o f grains. Much corn is spoil­
ing, some of it being unfit for feed. 
Hens have started laying. Wheat is 
$1.25; corn 65c; oats 42c; potatoes 
60c; eggs 20c; butter 25c; butter-fat 
30c.

Mecosta Co., Feb. 16.—There is some 
snow. Fall grains have suffered from 
previous freezing and thawing. Not 
much stock fed this winter, feed be­
ing scarce in some sections. Beans 
are about sold and the potato outlook 
is not so favorable as a short time 
ago. They are now worth 75 @  80c. 
Some farmers are selling. Butter-fat 
30c; eggs 35c; hogs $7.50; fat cattle 
$6 per cwt.

New York.
Orleans Co., Feb. 17.—We have a 

heavy fall of snow and zero weather. 
Winter grains in fairly good condition. 
Farmers seem to have plenty of feed 
for own use but none to sell. About 
the average amount of feeding stock. 
Fruit growers are somewhat discour­
aged, being unable to realize from their 
stock in storage no higher prices than 
were offered in the fall. Eggs are 
abundant, bringing 25c; milk 4%c per 
quart, wholesale; potatoes $1; hay $18.

Niagara Co., Feb. 17.—There is now 
enough snow for sleighing, though the 
ground was bare for a long time, and 
winter grains showed signs of heaving. 
Grains nearly all disposed of. Hens 
are laying some; eggs 28c; wheat is 
$1.20; shelled‘ corn 85c; pea beans 
$3.50; red kidneys $4; hay $15@18.50.

Ohio.
Fairfield Co., Feb. 15.—Ground has 

been bare much of the winter and 
wheat is in bad shape. Farmers have 
plenty of feed for own use. Usual 
amount of cattle and hogs fed, the lat­
ter being pretty well marketed now. 
Hens are laying well. Eggs retail at 
25@28c; butter 25@30c; wheat $1.25; 
corn 70c; oats 42c; potatoes $1; hay 
$15; cattle $5@8; hogs $7.50.

Highland Co., Feb. 16.—Lack of snow 
has damaged -wheat and rye. Farmers 
have plenty of roughage; cattle and 
hogs nearly all sold. Hens are not 
laying well. Wheat $1.20; corn 68c; 
oats 48c; beans $3.50; potatoes $1; 
hay $15; cattle $6@8; hogs $7.50@8.

Minnesota.
Lyon Co., Feb. 15.—Weather severe 

since first of January, and snow ' is 
deep. Usual amount of stock is being 
wintered. Public sales are well pat­
ronized and bidding is high. Seed corn 
situation is serious, Butter-fat 30c; 
butter 25c; eggs 35c; oats 40c; wheat 

, $1.20; hogs $7.50; cattle $6.
Nebraska.

Lincoln Co., Feb. 15.—Snow is prac­
tically gone and wheat is looking good. 
Cattle are in good condition. A large 
portion of fat cattle are marketed. 
Hens are laying well; eggs 22c; cream 
27c; wheat $1.12; cattle $7@7.50; hogs 
$7@7.25.

Smith Co., Feb. 12.—Wheat looking 
well. Farmers have plenty of rough 
feed, and are well supplied with stock 
cattle; fat stock well marketed. Hens 
are laying a little at present. Milk 5 
@7c per quart; butter-fat 27c; wheat 
$1.12; corn 57c; potatoes $1.50; hogs 
$7 @7.40.

Otoe Co., Feb. 15.—Have had a cold 
steady winter with six inches of snow 
at present. Wheat in good shape so 
far. Not many cattle feeding in this 
section. Feed is plentifuL Hens have 
started laying. Butter 28c; milk 6c a 
quart; potatoes $1@1.25; hay, prairie 
$5@6; alfalfa $7@8; cattle $60@100 
per head; horses $100@225; corn 62c.

W

Red 
Side 
W a ll-  
Black 
Tread
The Distinctive
Firestone
Trade-Mark

H E N  a man puts his name on a product he gives 
a pledge to the public which only Quality can make 

good. The value in a well-established name, 
therefore, is in the honor and good faith 

for wnich it stands.
On every Firestone tire there is stamped 

the name of the founder of the world’ s 
largest exclusive tire com pany—  

H . S. Firestone, the president of the 
Firestone T ire and Rubber C o.

On the roughest roads, in the 
w orst weather, you  can rely on the 

extra toughness and thickness o f  
the Firestone tread and sidew all. 
T h e built-in values mean most 

m iles per dollar.

Tube Bag Free
Fine rubberized tube bag 
free for your dealer’s name 
and make of your tires. Also 
Free Book, “ Care and Repair 
of Tires,’ ’  No,25

Firestone Tire and 
Rubber Company

“ America’s Largest Exclusive 
, Tire and Rim Makers”

Akron,0 ., Branches and 
D ea l»*  Everywhere

wmKt

r ft ' v

Just a 
Postal

T h is
B o o k F R E E

«• /« S o l? 5
r  ^

<K

SHOWS HOW TO

MaJke Old C&.rs 
L o o k  Like New

Your old  car with all its mileage is really better 
than new. It  is just fairly Umbered up. The new 

parts have become acquainted with each other and 
your car is ready to get down to business. All it 

needs is a little paint, varnish or finish here and there 
to restore its just-from-the-factory freshness.
Our free book shows everything needed to rejuvenate 

your car.
Peerless M o h a ir  T o p  D resin g  P eer less  C y lin d e r  E n a m e l-  

—Leaves cloth soft and pliable. G r e y —Heat, gre.se or gasoline
P eerless L ea th er T o p  D ressing -Ronows finish.

^ 4 5

HB’i  hurt.
P eerless M ir fO fO td —-Used with 

brush or cloth to restore lustre.
P eerless A n ti-R u st  R im  P a in t  

—Robs tire changing o f its horrors.
Peerless A u to  B o d y  P o lish — 

Brightens all varnished parts.
P eerless E xtra  P in o  B lack  

J a p a n —For use on wood or 
metal.

Peerless L in in g  D ye—Colors stains 
and faded parts. -

P eerless C u s h i o n  D re s s in g s  
Brightens and renews the finish.- 

Peerless L a m p  E n a m el-G loss—For 
brass, n ie k le o r jro n . a 

P eerless L a m p  E n a m el -  D u ll—One
coat covers solid.   _ _  _  — B—I _  _ _  |

p e e r le ss  J e t  B la ck  F e n d e r  J a p a n — P eerless B a ttery  B ox  B la ck — 
Heavy bodied, rich close. Proof against battery acids and

P eerless F ord  T o o  D r e s s in g —Makes an old top look like new. _  fumes.
Peerless C y lin d e r ' E n a m e l-B la ck —Saves cylinder and all P eerless L iq u id  W a x — Easily 

metal parts from task ____ _______  applied m  light even coat.
SEND FOR YOUR COPY TODAY F R E E

Tells how to  keen your ear "L ook in g  young .”  Y ou  o r  your painter c an easily  „apply  any o f  our 
preductsfW3oki b y *g a r^ e^ d ea tos^ lw tb era . I f  yours can ’ t supply you  write ua direct. Bem em ber 
this special m oney-saving book  la F R E E .
THE COLUMBUS VARNISH CO. 263 Cozzens S t , Columbus, O hio.

Farms and Farm Lands For Sale
The South-The Homeland
FOUR TO SIX  TONS OF ALFALFA, 60 t o  10» 
bushels o f  com  to  the acre, 6100 to 6500 an acre iron» 
fruit or trade, opportunities fo r  the stock raiser and 
dairyman, a  climate which means tw o to  four crops 
a  year, pleasant heme locations, attractive land 
prices, are things the South offers homeseekers. Our 
publications and special information on  request.

. it. V. BXOHAKD8
Xnd.and Agr.Com’r.Southern Ry. CH-BSED 

B M IM H  Boom 68  Washington. P .O . M

Choice Virginia Farms
11011 CHESAPEAKE A OHIO RAILWAY

A t 615.00 a n  a cre  a n d  u p . M ild  clim ate, fe rt ile  soil, 
abuhdaat rain fa ll, cheap labor. Convenient to  good 
market,school8 and churches. W rite  for  free illustrated 
booklet, “ Country L ife  in  V igin ia”  Address 
K . T . C R A W L E Y , In d u s . A g t., G A O .  R w y., 
R o o m  1023, . . .  R ic h m o n d , V irg in ia

For C . l .  he A w . . .  160 acre farm In Clinton Co. 
rut valB Dy U W iili, M ich. T w o miles from good 
village and market, one mile from car line, eight miles 
from Lansing. Can b e  bought on easy terms ter 
about half price asked for other farms in the same 
locality. S . M . H O L T . L A N S IN G , M IC H ., 
1 0 8  SO. S Y C A M O R E  S T R E E T .

I j ' f t n  c  A I  IP .  200 A. Clay Loam Farm , 120 A- 
»  VJ 1 \  O i l L w  .  under cu ltivation ; balance 
pasture easily cleared ; b a m 4 0  x 64ft., fu ll basement, . 
too l shed 18 x  40; good 10 room  house, basem ent; vood- 
shed: ice  house; ch icken  coop ; hog house; garage: 70 
to n  silo ; good well; w indm ill; water inhouse and barn , 
gas ligh tin g  plant f o r  house and barn also gas range. 
4H m iles from  county seat and 9 m iles from  railroad. 
U nlim ited free  pasture available. T erm s $50 per acre, 
part cash. Owner R . S h ep ard , M lo , M ich ., R , 1.

Virginia Farms and Homes.
FREE CATALOGUE OF SPLENDID BARGAINS. 

R .  B .  C H A F F I M  &  C o . , I i x c . , R i c h m o n d . V a .

P n r m n r e '  Y on can  get m ore value fo r  your 
■ d i l l M J i S «  m oney in fo rm  prorerty in  Southern 
M ichigan than any where in  the U nited States. I f  
interested w rite fo r  free  catalogue.
B Y E U S  A  B B O W N . C o ld w a te r . M ic h ig a n

S o u th e rn  F a r m s ,
Tennessee. Cheap land for corn, stock or  general farm­
ing. M artin A Cole, 118 M adison A v ., Memphis, Tenn.

r  g_|f l , 640 acres o f good land in whole or In part;
r m  d a is ,  a rare bargain If taken soon. Inquire o f 
C . C . W hitney, 229 Shearer Bldg. B ay C ity, M ich.

Far C .I .*  F orty  acres good uncleared land in  M ont- 
Mil s i l l ,  m orency County" N o buildings, sm all tim ­
ber, good roads. R ailroad  bu ild in g  to town two m iles 
away. $200. J . S. R iegel, 533L in co ln  A ye.,Toledo, Ohio.

1441. STOCK FIRM. I f f t t i S P - i Ä T  E Ä
Term s. Others, Evans-Tinney Co., Frem ont, M ich.

CQ Acres fo r  sale o r  rent, jo in in g  village, tom ato 
factory  20 rds. from  farm , 30 m i. from  D etroit. 

K n .  C a rr ie  W a te r s ,  B e lle v il le ,  M ich .

GLA D W IN  CO. FA R M S and Stock Ranches pay b ig  
dividends, M y new farm  list  just out,tells wny. I t ’ s 

free. V. G. REYNOLDS. GLADW IN. MICH.
r O R  SA LE : 120 acre fa rm  110 acres cleared , 10 wood- 
v  land. G ood barn  and house. Sanilac Co. Inquire 

J o h n  H ig g in s . B araga , M ich .

FOR SiLE~^^CR(~~ acresBalance P low  land 
Bara. P rice  $4200.00, w ith  $1200 
years 3 per cent. Address Owner. M. H.I per 

L e i

ïd young Tim ber, 
Snug House and 

ash. Balance T en
faowell, Michigan.

n  n  -f- a  gJS _  A  good honest man with 
v v  C l  E K E  C  U  team s and m achinery to  

work 1S6 acre  farm  on  shares at O rtonville, M ich. 
Apply J . F . W EH N ER, 119 P u lford  St., D etroit, M ich .

B-ft. Boiler Steel Hegtroughs $1.95

_  Write ter f tw  descriptive eireolar _  wA>jdspfhdsiyBetter g tmml 1- 9 In, Thick" 
FULTON SUPPLY CO ., 1603 Fulton S L . C h icago , III,

5555555555585555555555-$55YW5555555555

mailto:15@18.50
mailto:7@7.50
mailto:7@7.25
mailto:1@1.25
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Markets.
GRAINS AND SEEDS.

February 22, 1916. 
Wheat.—Although wheat values

show a heavy decline for Monday, the 
average quotations for the past week 
were on practically the same level as 
those for the previous week. The mar­
ket has resolved itself into a proposi­
tion of getting the grain to European 
countries. Whenever the opportunity 
for export is restricted on account of 
lack of cargo space, prices here sag, 
and on the other hand, any increase 
in ocean transportation facilities al­
lows prices to jump up. Values in Eng­
land were the highest last week they 
have been since the Franco-Prussian 
war in 1871, and are ruling about 75c 
above American seaboard prices. Ar­
gentine Republic has advised its farm­
ers to hold their wheat, stating that 
European needs will require all the 
available product regardless of the 
price consideration. Crop news in this 
country suggests that much damage 
has already been done by exposure, es­
pecially in the southern wheat grow­
ing states. Primary receipts are lib­
eral although the visible supply shows 
a decrease of 2,269,000 bushels. One 
year ago No. 2 red wheat was quoted 
at $1.53% per bushel. Last week’s 
Detroit quotations were:

No. 2 No. 1 
Red. White. May.

W ednesday........1.32% 1.27% 1.36
Thursday .. . . . . .1 .3 2  1.27 1,35ft
Friday ............... 1.32% 1.27% 1.36
Saturday . . . . . . .  1.31 1.26 1.34%
Monday .........1 .2 7 %  1.22% 1.30

Chicago.—No. 2 red wheat $1.25@ 
1.27%; May $1.24%; July $1.20% per 
bushel.

Corn.—Corn has been coming to the 
market freely, which with a poorer 
eastern demand and the depressing in­
fluence of the wheat trade, caused a 
liberal decline in quotations since last 
Friday. The visible supply increased 
2,241,000 bushels last week. A year 
ago No. 3 corn was quoted at 73c per 
bushel. Last week’s Detroit quotations 
were:

No. 3 No. 3 
Mixed. Yellow,

Wednesday • » ............ 74 76
Thursday . . . . . . . . . . .  74 76
Friday ........................ 74 76
Saturday ...................  73 75
Monday . . . . . . . . . . . . .  72 74

Chicago.—No. 4 yellow corn 68@ 
71 %c; May 76%c; July 767/8c.

Oats.—The demand for oats is only 
moderate, which with a fair volume of 
stocks, permitted values to decline 
with, those of corn and wheat on the 
bearish market Monday. The visible 
supply is 341,000 greater than a week 
ago. Primary receipts have been fair­
ly liberal. One year ago standard oats 
were quoted at 58%c per bushel. Last 
week’s Detroit quotations were :

No. 3

DAIRY AND POULTRY PRODUCTS.
Butter.—.Trade rules firm with pric­

es for best grades l% c higher. Extra 
creamery 32c; firsts 31c; dairy 21c; 
packing stock 18c.

Elgin. The demand is good for all 
kinds, including storage stock. The 
receipts of extras is not equal to the 
demand. Prices are l% c higher. Bas­
ed on sales prices are 33c.
, Chicago.—;The business is good for 
all grades. Extras are in demand and 
bring premium prices. Receipts are 
light and are not held long. Extra 
creamery 32%c; extra firsts 31@32c; 
firsts 27%@30c; extra dairies 31c; 
packing stock 19@19%c.

Eggs.—Buying in small lots prevails 
because it is expected that the mild 
weather will bring lower prices. Cur­
rent receipts are quoted at 22c; can- 
died firsts 22 %c.

Chicago.—Mild weather had a weak­
ening effect on the market. Prices 
are about l% c lower than last week. 
Buyers are only taking small quanti­
ties. Firsts 22@22%c; ordinary firsts 
21@21%c; miscellaneous lots, cases 
included 20@22%c; refrigerator stock 
12%@15c, depending on quality.

Poultry.—Increased receipts have 
caused easier feeling but prices remain 
unchanged. Turkeys 16@17c; spring 
turkeys 21@22c; fowls 14@18c, ac­
cording to quality; spring chickens 
16% @ 18c; ducks 18@19c; geese 17 @ 
18c per pound.

Chicago.—A moderate demand exists 
on local account and the feeling is 
fairly firm. Many poor and thin geese 
are coming and are hard to sell. Tur­
keys, young and old 12 @ 19c; fowls 
1 1 % @ 1 5 % c ; springs 17c; ducks 15@ 
17c;- geese 10@15c.

tidy shipping cattle selling mostly 
steady to 10c lower, but the light and 
plain cattle sold very mean and bulk of 
them went 10@25e lower. There was 
a good healthy trade in the cow mar­
ket and also the bulls. We look for a 
fair run of cattle here next Monday 
and a steady trade. .

Our hog trade was rather slow at 
the opening and prices generally 5c 
lower on the best grades, while pigs 
were extfemely dull and fully a quar­
ter lower than Saturday’s best time. 
Bulk of the sales were around $8.60, a 
few selected lots a little more; pigs 
generally $7.75, with light quotable as 
high as $8.25; roughs $7.50@7.60; 
stags $5@6. About everything sold 
that arrived in time for market and 
the outlook for the next few days, full 
steady.

Market was active on sheep and 
lambs today and prices 5c higher than 
the close of last week. All sold and 
we look for steady prices the balance 
of the week.

We quote: Lambs $11.50@11.75; 
cull to fair $8@11.40; yearlings $8.50 
@10.25; bucks $4.50@7; handy ewes 
$8.25 @8.50; heavy ewes $8@8.25; 
wethers $8.75@9.25; cull sheep $4.50 
@7; veals, good to choice $11.75@12; 
common to fair $8@11; heavy $6@9.

It'is not possible to maintain prices 
for fat lambs, ytearlings and sheep at 
their highest quotations all the time, 
but even on sharp reactions, prices 
are still far higher than in any for­
mer winter. The opening of the feed­
er .outlet is an important feature, feed­

in g  lambs selling last week at $10.35@ 
10.40, the highest prices ever paid in 
the Chicago market for lambs to go 
°,ut to feed lots, and standing more 
than $2.50 per 100 lbs. higher than the 
best price paid for feeders in 1914. . 
Joe Tvoek’s close saw lambs selling at 
$8@11.50, yearlings at $8.50@10.10, 
wethers at $7.25@8.50, ewes at $4.50 
@8.25 and bucks at $5.50@6.75.

Horses were plentiful last week and 
in good local and shipping demand at 
about recent prices, with liberal pur­
chases of horses for the French army. 
Farm workers were offered at $90@ 
150, while inferior animals went as 
low as $50@75. Drafters were salable 
at $200 @285, according to weight and 
quality, with few choice enough to go 
over $240. Desirable chunks brought 
$165 @220, and a few pairs of big hors­
es sold at $500@540.

FRUITS AND VEGETABLES.
Apples.—Apples are moving freely 

and offerings are ample. Greenings 
$2.50@3.50; Spys $3.50@4; Baldwins 
$3@3.50; Steel Red $4@4.50. At Chi­
cago the movement is somewhat freer. 
Quality is only fair and peddlers are 
the chief buyers. No. 1 Greenings are 
$2.75@3 per bbl; Jonathans, No. 1$3.50 
@ 4; Baldwins $3 @3.25; Wagehers 
$2.25@2.75; Spys $3@3.75.

Potatoes.—Steady and in fair sup­
ply. Carlots on track, white and red 
$1@1.05 per bushel. At Chicago the 
market ruled quiet. Concessions are 
being made by handlers to stimulate 
trade. Michigan whites are selling at 
88@92c per bushel. Other kinds sell 
from 80 @ 92c.

WOOL AND HIDES.

Standard. White.
Wednesday ...............  51 50
Thursday . 50Friday . . . . ................  51 50
Saturday .. ................  50 49
Monday . . . ............ . 48% 47%

Chicago.—-Standard oats 45% @
47%c; May 46%c; July 44%c per bu.

Rye.—Market is quiet with No. 2 at 
$1, or 1c below last week’s price.

Barley.—Values are easier with 
malting at Milwaukee quoted at 68 @ 
74c and at Chicago 66@75c.

Beans.—The demand for beans is 
active, offerings small and local prices 
are 2@5c higher. Immediate, prompt 
and February shipment $3.65; March 
$3.67. At Chicago prices ruled steady 
with pea beans, hand-picked, at $3.80 
@3.85; prime choice $3.65@3.70; red 
kidneys $5.20@5.40.

Peas.—At Chicago the market is 
quoted at $2.40@2.50 for field peas, 
sacks included.

Clover Seed.—Higher; prime spot 
$13.30; March $12.50; prime alsike $10. 
At Toledo prime cash $13.27%; prime

Wool.—A stronger undertone is de­
veloping in the wool trade with prices 
holding firm to higher. England has 
placed an absolute embargo on East 
India wools, thus curtailing supply to 
the advantage of holders. Domestic 
offerings are in greater demand with 
fleeces in particularly small supply. 
Quarter-blood Ohio unwashed wools 
sold at Boston at 39c last week; half- 
bloods 36c, with the corresponding 
Michigan grades at 36@37c and 32@ 
33c respectively.

Hides.—No. 1 cured 16%c; do. green 
14c; No. 1 cured bulls 13c; do. green 
10c; No. 1 cured calf 21c; do. green 
20c; No. 1 horsehides $4.50; No. 2 
$3.50; No. 2 hides lc  lower than the 
above; sheepskins, as to amount of 
wool, 50c@$2.

GRAND RAPIDS.

Potatoes have sold here at 70 @ 80c 
during the past few days and the buy­
ing price at Greenville and other load­
ing stations is around 75c. White pea 
beans are also worth less just now, 
with quotations at $3.10. Fresh eggs 
are bringing 20@21c and No. 1 dairy 
butter is quoted at 23c. Grain prices 
at the mills are as follows; No. 2 red 
wheat $1.25; oats 50c; rye 85c; corn 
75c; buckwheat 75c. *

alsike $10.
Timothy Seed, 

bushel.
-Prime spot $3.80 a

FLOUR AND FEEDS.
Flour.—Jobbing lots in one-eighth 

paper sacks are selling on the Detroit 
market per 196 lbs., as follows: Best 
patent $7; seconds $6.70; straight 
$6.50; spring patent $7; rye flour $6.

Feed.—In 100-lb. sacks, jobbing lots 
are: Bran $26; standard middlings 
$25; fine middlings $30; cracked corn 
$33; corn and oat chop $29 per ton.

Hay.—No. 1 timothy, $18.50@19; 
standard timothy $17.50@18; light 
mixed $17.50@18; No. 2 timothy $15 
@16; No. 1 mixed $14@15; No. 1 clover 
$10 @13.

,Chicago.—Choice timothy $18@ 
18.50; No. 1 do. $15.50@16 50; No. 2 
$13.50@14.50.

DETROIT EASTERN MARKET,

Only a moderate amount of business 
for the season was transacted Tuesday 
morning. Cabbage was selling freely 
at 60@65c per bushel; apples moved 
slowly at 80c@$1.50 per bushel; car.- 
rots $1.25; potatoes 90c@$1.20; pars­
nips 70@80c; new rhubarb 15@25c a 
bunch; green onions eight bunches for 
25c. Hay is moving slowly at $18@22 
per ton.

LIVE STOCK MARKETS. 
Buffalo.

February 21, 1916.
(Special Report of Dunning and Stev­

ens, New York Central Stock 
Yards, Buffalo, N. Y.)

Receipts here today: Cattle 171 
cars; hogs 100 d. d.; sheep and lambs 
48 d. d.; calves 1000 head.

With 171 cars of cattle here today 
the market was very slow, the choice

Chicago.
February 21, 1916.
Cattle. Hogs. Sheep. 

Receipts today. .17,000 57,000 14,000 
Same day 1915.. 12,012 39,189 8,924
Last week.........40,621 251,528 76,134
Same wk 1915..38,322 219,285 52,441

Shipments from here last week were 
10,192 cattle; 54,642 hogs, and 16,983 
sheep, comparing with 12,949 cattle; 
67,978 hogs, and 14,315 sheep a week 
earlier, and with 7,336 Cattle; 24,455 
hogs, and 2,580 sheep a year ago. Hogs 
marketed here averaged 206 lbs.

This week opens with a small Mon­
day cattle supply and firm to 10c high­
er prices, while hogs are firm to 5c 
higher at $7.65@8.40. Sheep and lambs 
ar.e unchanged.

Cattle were marketed much less lib­
erally last week than a week earlier, 
as the glutted condition of the market 
at that time brought about reductions 
of 25@40c per 100 lbs. in most descrip­
tions. This fall in prices made most 
stockmen less eager to hurry their 
cattle to market, and supplies offered 
for sale were so materially lessened 
that the decline was speedily recover­
ed. There was not much trading in 
steers last week below $7 or above 
$8.75, with sales of the best class of 
heavy steers at a range of $9@9.65 
and a sale of five head of prime steers 
that averaged 1,618 lbs. from the Uni­
versity of Illinois at $10.25. The com­
moner class of thin steers of light 
weight sold for $6@7.45, with a medi­
um grade of steters taken at $7.50 and 
upward and steers that passed for 
good at $8.25 and* upward. The best 
yearling steers received brought $9, 
with no prime ones offered. Butcher­
ing Cows and heifers had a good out­
let on the basis of $5 @7.40 for cows 
and $5@8.75 for heifers, with compar­
atively few fat little yearling heifers 
going as high as $8. Cutters sold at 
$4.15@4.B5 and canners at $3@4.10, 
whiles sales took place of bulls at $5 
@7.25. Calves sold during the week 
at a range of $4.50@11.25, with a late 
top at $11. Weakness was developed 
in the cattle trade on Thursday, and 
prices lost 10 @ 15c of their early gains, 
with local packers apparently stocked 
up and shipping orders lacking. Dur­
ing the entire week there was a poor 
market for Illinois dairy cows, aa- 
many of these cows have been con­
demned on post-mortem recently, but 
sound Wisconsin dairy cows had a 
fair outlet. The university $10.25 
steers were Shorthorns of fancy finish 
and had been used in the class work 
at the college. Above $9 there was a 
slim showing of cattle. Limited sales 
were made of stock cattle at $6@7.25. 
The outlet for this class of cattle has 
caused them to sell 40@50c higher, 
with four states, Illinois, Pennsylvan­
ia, Delaware and Michigan ready to 
accept Chicago stock. Illinois requires 
that stock going out must be held in 
quarantine 21 days and be inspected.

Hogs made another high record for 
the winter packing season last week, 
with a top at $8.50, the local and ship­
ping demand being extremely good; 
most of the hogs sold brought over 
$8, prime heavy shipping borrows go­
ing the highest and prime light ship­
ping hogs at prices not much below 
them. Recent receipts have averaged 
in weight 203 lbs,, comparing with 199 
lbs. a week earlier, 223 lbs. one year 
ago and 221 lbs. two years ago. Ex­
tremely liberal runs of hogs are apt 
to show up at the opening of the week* 
and nearly 80,000 hogs reached here 
on Monday last week. Pigs failed to 
sell as well as a week earlier. The 
week closed with sales of heavy pack­
ing hogs at $7,95@8.30, the best heavy 
shipping and butcher hogs at $8.30@ 
8;37%, light bacon hogs at $7.60@ 
8.12%, light shipping hogs at $8.15@ 
8.30, and pigs at $5.50@7.35.

NOTICE TO BEAN GROWERS.
The Michigan Bqan Growers’ Asso­

ciation will meet Thursday, March 2, 
1916, at the Agricultural College dur­
ing the week of the Round-up Insti­
tute. Important plans for this next 
year’s crop will be discussed.—Jas. N. 
McBride, State Market Director.

BOOK NOTICE.
“The Marketing of Farm Products/* 

by Dr. L. D. H. Weld, of Yale Univer* 
sity, formerly of the University of Min­
nesota. This book aims to set forth 
the fundamental principles of market 
distribution ' as applied to agricultural 
products. The author has attempted 
to describe the marketing conditions 
as they are, and has made no effort 
to propose any definite or comprehen­
sive program for improvement. He 
believes that investigations of market­
ing practices have not proceeded far 
enough as yet to make such a program 
possible. The book is divided into 21 
chapters which cover, in an unpreju­
diced manner, the whole range of mar­
keting factors. It contains 480 pages 
and can be secured through the Mich­
igan Farmer office at $1.50 per copy. 
Published by the Macmillan Company, 
New York City.

The British government plans to 
take over all the large distillery prop­
erties and turn them into munition fac­
tories. •

Michigan Butter and Egg Shippers* 
Association will meet in Detroit Feb­
ruary 29, at Hotel Statler.

Forage Crop
All Michigan farmers interested in for­
age crops should have a copy of our new 
spring catalogue which gives valuable 
information about Sweet Clover, Sudan 
grass, Cow Peas and Soy Beans, Alfalfa, 
Winter Vetch, etc. Write today. A 
postal card will bring it to you free of 
charge. Address

Alfred J .  Brown Seed Com pany,
Grand Rapids, Mich, and please mention the Mich, farmer

RUFUS B. HOLMES CO.
H ig h  and R iop e lle  Sts. D etro it , MIcBt.

Commission Merchants
Poultry, Live or Dressed, Dressed Hogs, Calves 
Sheep and Eggs. Reference, Peninsular Savings 
Bank, Sullivan Packing Co. Shipments Solicited. 
Satisfaction Guaranteed.

H A Y Ship your good quality to us.
Highest Market Prices.

E. L. R ich m o n d  C o ., D etroit.

H A Y  OUR NEW LOCATION—
623-625 Wabash Bldg., Pittsburgh, Pa. 
Daniel McCaffrey’s Son» Co*

rpH E  HARPSTER COMMISSION CO., Union Stock 
-1 lards, Toledo, O., Sell live stock on commission, get highest prices ana best fills. Try them. Daily 

market, force o f six looks after y o u r  interest. 
Financially hacked by over $1,000.000.

WE WILL PAY THE HIGHEST OFFICIAL DETROIT
Market Quotation day o f arrival delivered here, *»(l 
will pay premiums whenever possible.
A m erica n  B u tter  &  C heese C o ., D etro it . M lcft

SAVE MONEY UNLOADING
Save 'the expense o f men and teams in unload- ] 
ing hay, grain, pulling timbers, 1
elevating ice. drilling, dirging, etc., 
with an IR E LA N D  H O IS T .
100 use* on each farm. Guaranteed ! 
everyway. Free circulars. Ireland 
M achine & Foundry C o., 83 State 
St.,1 Norwich, N.T. Alaomfgrs. of 
drag and wood sawn, mills, etc.

Far Cain* Write W. A. Ewalt, Mt. Clemens, Michigan, 
ir i o d io. for those pure bred, Sable and white, Scotch 
Collie Puppies, natural heelers from trained stock.

MACilC egg tester tells hatchable eggs before Incubat­ing. 1 year trial guarantee. White and Brown leghorn 
eggs $3.50 per 100. Catalog free. Welday, M. F. Seville, 0.
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Tiger Brand[_|M E
Lump Lime, H y d ra ted  
Lime or Ground Stone. 
W e sell our lime under this 
brand because fanners who 
try  it  once want to  buy d ie  

same quality again. T h e  T iger Brand 
guarantees strength and uniform ity.
There is a  dealer near y ou  w ho selli T iger Brand. 
W rite (or hi* name and our F R E E  Lim e B ook .

T H E  K E L L E Y  IS LA N D  L IM E  & TR A N S P O R T CO .,
101 Leader Bldg. Cleveland, Ohio

THIS IS THE LAST EDITION.

The first edition is sent to those who 
have not expressed a desire for the 
latest markets. The late market edi­
tion will be sent on request at any 
time.

DETROIT LIVE STOCK MARKET.

FRESH FROZEN
W inter Caught Herring

— . .  W e w ill deliver at your 
door by parcel post 8  

pounds o f  dressed  and  
sealed  h erring, ready for 
the frying pan for

$1.00
o r  12 pounds R ound herring for

•_ $ 1 .0 0
or 7  pounds sm oked herring ready to e a t  fo r  

t l  A A  Three boxes for $2.75. Fish 
y - 1  . t /V I  Guaranteed to  arrive in  good 
condition. Offer good to  April 1st. Send 
cash, m oney order or check. D o  I t  N o w !

The Ranney Fish C o.,
West llth  St., Cleveland, O.

L e a r n  M u s i c
A t  H o m e  !

lF rsa°^N ew  Method—Learn To ir r s a ^ c p ^ y  By Note—Piano,
a O r g a n ,  V io l in ,  B an jo , 

M a n d o lin , Guitar, Cornet, 
H a rp , ’C e l lo  o r  t o  s in g . 
Special Limited Offer o f free 
weekly lessons. You pay only 
for music and postage.which 
is small. No extras. Begin­
ners or advanced p u p i ls .  
Everything illustrated,plain, 
simple, systematic. Free lec­
tures each course, 16 years' 
success. Start at once. Write 
for Free BookletToday—Now
U. S. SCHOOL OF MUSIC, Bos 270
225 Fifth  Avenue, N e w  Y o r k  City

STEEL MANTLE BURNERS ARE THE BEST
I n c r e a s e  y ou r  Lam p and Lantern  
L ig h t  T h r e e  T im e » . H o  S m ok e . N o 
O d o r . F i t  C om m on K erosen e Lamps 
and T u b u la r  L antern s. E v e ry  B u rn ­
e r  F u lly  G u a ra n te e d . I l  Y ou r D eal­
e r  D oesn ’ t  K eep  Them  Send H is 
Name an d  Address and you r H om e and 
A d dressand  86c f o r  a S am ple  o r  $1.00 
f o r  Seises, L o e a L C o u a ty  a n d  S tate  
A g e n t «  W a n te d . W r ite  fo r  F ree  Par- 
t icu la rs  T o d a y .  T h e , Season Is  On, 
How Ie  T h e  T im e T o  S e ll Them , 
yhc Steel Mantle light Co. 390 Huron St Tokdo, 0.

Millions of Trees
PLANTS, VINES, ROSES, ETC.
The oldest,' largest and most complete nursery In 
Michigan. Send for catalog. Prices reasonable.

I. E. ILGENFRITZ’ SONS CO., 
TIM MONROE NURSERY, M onroe, filch

P la n t  T re e s  G ro w n  a t

M O N R O E, MICHIGAN
I f  you want vigorous, hardy stock, if you want reliable 
varieties, if  you want reasonable prices and satisfac­
tion with your purchase, send for a oatalog and secure 
your trees and plants from
THE MICHIGAN NURSERY COMPANY
W tn k w o r th  A  S ons, M o n r o e ,  M ic h ig a n .

G ro w e rs  f o r  S ix ty -se v e n  Y e a rs .

AUGUSTA BASKET COMPANY

•BA SSW O O D  O A R T S ’*

rManufactijrers o f 
Best Quali!;/ Fruit 
Packages, B a s k e t s ,  
¿rates, etc.

Write for 1916 cata­
log and price list,
Augusta, Mich. 

B ox 62.

P e d i g r e e d  O a t s :
Worthy, Alexander and other varieties, bred  by the 

Michigan Agricul, ural College, best o f  hundreds o f 
varieties tested. Grown in Michigan and adapted to 
Michigan conditions. Reported upon by farmers as 
follows: “ The oats produced 8i bushels per acre, best 
yield in township.”  ‘ ‘Your pedigreed oats have a very 
stiff straw and are good yieldere. ‘ ‘Were far better 
than my own variety.”  ‘ ‘Best crop vre have had in ten 
vears.”  “ Best we ever grew.”  Etc. Write to Secretary  
M ich . E x p erim en t A sso c ia tio n , Fast Lansing, Mich.

Trees
jam  I i_ 2 year, 4 t o  S ft .  h ig h —Ideal s ize  fo r  
1UU Apple O rch a rd  P .anting. Semi for Free Catn. 

log Apple, Pear, Poac_i, Cherry, Plum, Small 
- -  F uit, Ornamental t-oes, Roses and-Shrubs. 

tH fl B u y  d ire ct  o f  g row er—O n e -lia .f  a g e n t ’ s prices. 
0 1U D en ton . W illia m s  Sc D e n to n , Wholesale 
Nurseries,G W.Williams,Mgr.,Box 141, Dansville.N.Y

WHITE SWEET CLOVER
Specially treated for quick germination 
A lso  F a n cy  M ed iu m  M a m m o th , 
A lsike  a n d  A lfa lfa  C lovers, T im o th y  
Seed, W in ter  V etch ,_ e tc . Ask for 
samples and special price list. Young- 
R andolph  Seed C o.. O w osso, M ich .

Small Fruits » r f e s
W . N. SC AR FF. B ox F.

also Farm SeedTjetc. 
40 page Catalog Free. 
N ew  C a rlis le . O hio.

Grapa
free.

ui___  rn n —2yr. for $9.00. 100 currants 2yr. for
YlfIBs D U U  $2.00. Strawberry plants. Catalogue 
W o o d b in e  N nrwerb-s. G o n '-v o . » .

fan • . . .  . M * T h e  C orn  B e lt  O a t. D escrip-I /II II||^ DOT d l l u  tion , prices and sample fine, 
worn*  Monnytown Stock Farm. F iat Bock. M ich.íoytown

SWEET CLOVER SEED. biennial, yellow. .
$9.00 bu. of 00 lb. R. E. PURDY, Falmouth, Ky.

Thursday Market.
February 24, 1916.

Cattle.
Receipts 2278. There was another 

heavy run of cattle at the local yards 
this week, but in all other departments 
the receipts were far below those of 
a week ago. Most of the roads gave 
satisfactory service but the Michigan 
Central fell behind and there is a good 
chance for improvement in their ser­
vice, which it is hoped will be rem­
edied.

The cattle trade was dull and every­
thing but canners and bulls were big 
25c lower than they were a week ago 
and on Wednesday quite a large num­
ber went over unsold at dark, the de­
mand for stockers and feeders was 
dull, but speculators took hold freely 
and helped out wonderfully. The close 
on Thursday was dull at the decline.

Milch cows of quality were scarce 
and the few offerings brought strong 
last week’s prices. Common grades 
dull. Best heavy steers $7.50; best 
handy weight butcher steers $6.50@7; 
mixed steers and heifers $6 @6.25; han­
dy light butchers $5.50 @5.75; light 
butchers $5@5.25; best cows $5.50@ 
5.75; butcher cows $4.75@5; common 
cows $4.25@4.50; canners $3@4; best 
heavy bulls $5.50 @6.25; bologna bulls 
$5.25@5.50; stock bulls $4.50@5; feed­
ers $6@6.75; stockers $5@6.25; milk­
ers and springers $40@80.

Bishop, B. & H. sold Mich. B. Co.'
5 butchers av 831 at $6.50, 5 cows av 
1120 at $5.50, 2 bulls av 1625 at $5.75,
1 canner wgh 1010 at $4.25; to Sulli­
van P. Co. 7 steers av 907 at $6.70, 5 
butchers av 850 at $5.40; to Thompson 
Bros. 11 steers av 1074 at $7.25; to 
Hammond, S. & Co. 20 do av 933 at 
$7.85, 5 do av 800 at $6.50, 2 do av 
1040 at $8; to Bray 17 cows av 1007. at 
$5, 4 do av 800 at $4.25,1 do wgh 1150 
at $6, 1 do wgh 860 at $3; to Parker, 
W. & Co. 1 bull wgh 1590 at $5.75; to 
Sullivan P. Co. 3 cows av 920 at $4.50, 
3 do av 1060 at $5.60, 1 heifer wgh 790 
at $6.60, 8 steers av 991 at $7.10, 1 cow 
wgh 1190 at $5.75; to Breitenbeck 8 
steers av 1000 at $7.10, 4 cows av 
1000,at $5.50, 1 do wgh 1050 at $4.50; 
to Bresnahan 8 do av 900 at $4.50, 11 
do av 1066 at $4.75, 1 bull wgh 1400 at 
$6; to Hammond, S. & Co. 1 steer wgh 
680 at $6, 9 do av 724 at $6.15, 1 do 
wgh 850 at $7.50, 4 cows av 900 at 
$4.15; to Bray 4 cows av 840 at $4, 2 
do av 750 at $5.50, 4 do av 1100 at 
$5.65, 8 do av 944 at $4.25; to Sullivan 
P. Co. 20 steers av 1073 at $6.85, 16 do 
av 1162 at $7.35, 3 do av 917 at $6.50,
6 cows av 902 at $5, 3 do av 1070 at 
$5.75, 6 do av 1123 at $5.50, 2 do av 
990 at $4.25.

Reason & S. sold Thompson Bros. 4 
bulls av 1330 at $5.75, 2 butchers av 
885 at $5.50, 7 do av 500 at $5.90; to 
Sullivan P. Co. 7 cows av 990 at $5.80, 
1 cow wgh 1370 at $5.25; to Nagle P. 
Co. 8 steers av 872 at $7.10; to Bray
1 cow wgh 1070 at $4, 7 do av 1040 at 
$5.60, 1 steer wgh 1500 at $6.75; to 
Wyness 10 do av 938 at $7.50, 3 do av 
903 at $6; to Newton B. Co. 3 cows av 
1003 at $4, 4 do av 1072 at $5.75; to 
Dunne 1 steer wgh 1180 at $6.75 ; to 
Bray 9 cows av 955 at $4, 3 do av 983 
at $6.

Veal Calves.
Receipts 847. Good veal calves sold 

about the same as on Wednesday or 
last week; one or two small bunches 
of extra fancy brought $12, »but bulk of 
the good went at $11 @11.50. Common 
and heavy grades were very dull at $7 
@ 10. -

Haley & M. sold Hammond, S. & Co.
2 av 105 at $9, 20 av 145 at $12; to 
Hopp 2 av 300 at $7.

Sheep and Lambs.
Receipts 3055. The supply of sheep 

and lambs was very light and the quali 
ity common, the fèw good ones bring­
ing $11 per cwt. The demand for good 
grades v/as strong and many more 
could have been disposed of at good 
prices. Best lambs $11; fair do $10@ 
10.50; light to common lambs $8.59@ 
9.50; yearlings $10; fair to good sheep 
$6@7.50; culls and common $5@5.50.

Sandel, S., B. & G. sold Thompson 
Bros. 8 lambs av 50 at $5.50, 13 sheep 
av 95 at $5.50, .2 do av 90 at $7, 14 
lambs av 65 at $10.35.

Bigelow sold Sullivan P. Co. 10 
lambs av 55 at $8-50, 40 do av 65 at 
$10.60. _  _

Roe Com. Co. sold Sullivan P. Co. 
5 lambs av 85 at $7, 28 do av 75 at 
$10, 8 do av 65 at $10.50.

Hogs.
Receipts 7593. T^e hog trade was 

active and good grades were fully 25c 
higher than they were a week ago, or 
strong at Wednesday’s prices. Heavv 
grades $8.45@8.50; light and mixed $8 
@8.30; good pigs $7.25@7.65; light 
thin pigs $6.50@7.

C D  C  C  i r v C  EL
We G iv e \b u  
This Fine Leather 
Tobacco Pouch

Every smoker appreciates a leather to­
bacco pouch. This handy, serviceable,
Tuxedo Draw-Pouch is made of fine, 
soft, flexible tan leather, with a draw­
string and snap that close pouch tight 
and keep the tobacco from spilling.

Send us 10c and your tobacco dealer’s 
name, and. we will mail you prepaid, anywhere in U . S., a 10c tin of 
T U X E D O  and this handsome Leather Draw-Pouch. W e gladly 
make this offer to get you to try T U X E D O .

The Perfect Pipe Tobacco

T U X E D O  is the one tobacco that 
every man can smoke all day long, the 
year ’round, with the greatest enjoyment 
and comfort.

Because the exclusive “ T u xedo  
Process”  makes T U X E D O  so delight­
fully mild and free from all trace of 
“ bite” , that T U X E D O  cannot irritate 
the most sensitive throat or tongue.
Convenient, glassine wrap- ped moisture-proof pouch OC

Famous green tin with gold 1 
lettering, curved to fit pocket IU C

In Tin Humidors, 40c and 80c
In Class Humidors, 50c and. 90c

THE AMERICAN TOBACCO COMPANY 
111 Fifth Ave., Hew York City Room 1199

“Low and 
Easy to 

Fill.”
w r i t s : f o r

F R E E
C A T A L O G  ,

The Guarantee Spreader

Writ* u t toflay for citalog, we w ill save you money.
Guarantee Manufacturing Go., Dept. B53, Baltimore, Md.

M  “ HARD to 
W E A R  
GUT”

Has a cq u ire d  a national reputation for spreading LIMB. 
GROUND LIMESTONE, commercial fertilizers, and etc. 
THE GUARANTEE SPREADER will pay for itself by 
properly applying one car o f these expensive fertilizers, 
EVENLY, and has more good points than any other spread­
er on the market. The special patented features such 

ns our spider-triangle-steel- 
blade-force feed, and spread­
ing attachment that will 
spread evenly or sow in rows. 
Our exclusive shifting clutch 
quickly throws machine in 
and out of gear from seat and 
is a real necessity for saving 
material. Completely eqi ip- 
ped with accurate acre-mark, 
indicator, screen, lid, seat, ueck- 
yok». double and single-trees. 
No lung extra to buy. WE P AY 
FREIGHT. A dependable spreader 
at a low price. ‘  ,

M ilking Tim e Cut In H alf
C lea n er M ilk— D ou b le  P ro f i t s

Instead of eight cows, you or your hire’d man 
can milk 13 to 30 in practically the same time 
and without getting tired over the job. More­
over you can mil1-: the last few Cows just as clean and good as the first if you are using a

Hinman Milker Outfit"
Thousands axe already doing it and they tell us they 
wished they had realized years before how simple the 
H inm an  was to operate and clean.

HINMAN MILKING MACHINE CO., 74-84

OUR FREE CATALOGUE 
will tell you and show by pictures how 
simple the H inm an Milkers are-nhow 
they do the work—why the milk is so much 
cleaner and how they will increase your profits.
A letter or postal card asking for this he ok 
will bring it right away. Send for a copy today.

Elizabeth St., Oneida, N. Y.
__________J

fSwfcongy on FuicC’Pfliiit'ftoofing
B efore  you put up that fen ce—or  do that roofing o r  painting job , get Ensley’ s F j 

C atalogs—one on  eaeh subject. You absolutely can ’ t  afford to buy anywhere before 
y o u  study these books—greatest ever issued on  F e n c e ,  F a in t  a n d  B o o t in g .

ENSLEY’S PRICE IS RIGHT
Q uality, too . Enorm ous output makes attractive prices. B ig  stock.

Prom pt delivery. You get what you want when you want it. Catalogs 
g ive you com plete in form ation—many help fu l suggestions. Y ou al ways 

g et a s q u a r e  d e a l  from  Ensley. Send a postal now—specify w h ich  
stulog you want—F e n ce , P a in t  o r  R o o f in g .

THE F . B . ENSLEY C O , 262 ENSLEY BLN., IETUIT, Kiel.

mailto:5@5.25
mailto:4.25@4.50
mailto:5.25@5.50
mailto:6@6.75
mailto:5@6.25
mailto:6@7.50
mailto:5@5.50
mailto:8.45@8.50
mailto:7.25@7.65
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Solid con« 
■ traction and 

good style give 
to Honorbilt 
Shoes their well 
earned reputa- 
lion for quality. 
For comfort and 
wear they have 
no equal no mat« 
ter what you pay*

HONORBILT
SHOES

Materials are the choicest; work­
manship is high grade. A  trial will 
convince you that they are 
the best money’s worth you 

ever secured in footwear. Ask your dealer, f /«,

Ladles1 
All Style«

W ARNING—Always look for the Mayer 
name and trade mark on the sole. If your 
dealer cannot supply you, write to us.

W e  m ake M ayer H on orb ilt  S h oes in  all sty les for  m en, 
w om en , ch ildren ; D ry -S ox  w et w eather sh oes; H on orb ilt  
C ush ion  Shoes, M artha W a sh in g ton  C om fort Shoes.

F. Mayer Boot &  Shoe Co., Milwaukee

Meo’«
All
Styles

H O N O R B I L T

Land clearing an 
easy,one-man job 
“ big stumps pul-

H A N D  P O W E R .

% S t u m p  P u l l e r
W orks on any land. Operated by hand I N o horses; 
no digging. Made of forged Krupp steel— guaranteed. 
Adopted and used by U.S. Government officials and many states. 
Send for free illustrated book on Land Clearing and special offer.

Drop a postal to
W. J . F IT Z P A T R IC K
Box ̂  182 Fifth Street

San Francisco, Calif.

gig EjBBflB

Make Your Own Drain Tile
T H E  F A R M E R S ’ C E M E N T  T I L E  M A C H I N E
Makes tile 3 to 8 inches in  diam., 12^ inches long. One man or boy operates it by  hand 
or power. 500 tile per day by hand, 1,200 by power. Tile thoroughly cured by patent 
process. No tamping or use of pallets. This machine and tile used by Experiment Sta­
tions o f Agricultural Colleges and the U. S. Dept, o f Agriculture. 5,000 farmers have 
doubled the yield of land by under drainage, and saved 75% of cost by using our Machine. 
Tou can do the same. Save cost o f hauling and breaking. Make perfect 
tile $3 to $5 per thousand. MACHINE SOLD DIRECT FROM FACTORY 
TO YOU. TEN D A Y S' FREE TRIAL. SEND NOW for 86-page Illustrated 
Catalogue. 'Tells you about great benefits of underdrainage, how to  take 
levels and get grades, make and lay your tile at low  cost.
FARM ERS* CEMENT TILE MACHINE C O . BOX 307 • S T . JOHNS, M ICH«

F O R D  J O K E  B O O K
f i 111 “ lia best tunny jokes, ana stories on
tne t  ORD automobile. Hundreds of them and all 
good ones. Also JITNEY jokes, Moving Picture, 
and Stage jokes. Laugh till you shake, A neat colored 
covered book by mail for only TEN CENTS.

[PIKE PUB. OO. BOX 382 
¿SO. N ORW ALK, CONN.

FARMERS
H A N D Y  
W A G O N

Low  steel wheels, wide tires, make 
loading and handling easier. W e fur­
nish S tee l W h e e ls  to  fit any axle, to  
carry any load. Plain or  grooved tire. 
Catalogue sent free,

EMPIRE MFG.C0., 389  Quincy, III.

Vou’ re paying more than you ought to pay 
for tires. Save 20%. Buy Riverside Tires.
5 ,0 0 0  Miles Q uaranteed  <

I i f  you use Ford sizes. 4,000 miles oil others.
I Send for free automobile book and get information 

on how to save money on a ll automobile aooessories ,
I Write for this book today—to house most convenient. '

Dept, c l  10
[ West T«r>. CM««,#, b u n  City, Ft, Werth, Parti,,4  '

S W E E T  C L O V E R
SIBBEST MONEY-MAKER KNOWN—INVESTIGATE
The greatest forage plant that grows. Superior to all 

aa a fertilizer. Equal to A lfalfa for hay. Excels for  pas­
ture. Builds up worn-out soil quickly and produces im­
mense crops, worth from $50 to $125 per acre. Easy to 
•tart, grows everywhere, on all soils. Don’t  delay writing 
fo r  our Big 100-page free catalog and circular giving full 
particulars. We can save you money on best tested, 
guaranteed, scarified seed. Sample Fvee. Write today. 
A. A. BERRY SEED CO., BOX 931 CLARINOA, IOWA

P h o sp h o ru s a t  i  th e  C ost
In other forms can be had in

Daybreak Finely Ground 
Rock Phosphate

By using It at acost of $1 .0 0 per acre 
per year you supply more Phosphorus 
than the crops use each year and per­
manently enrich your soil.

Rock Phosphate Pays
W rite us for the Book of Proof, prices 

and particulars.

FEDERAL CHEMICAL CO. 
Ground Rock Department 

12 Clark Street C olum bia ,  T en n .

Practical Science.
GASOLINE AND ALCOHOL. In chemical parlance the difference

---------  between gasoline and alcohol may be
b y  f l o y d  w. r o b i s o n . illustrated by showing their respective

The present high price of gasoline compositions in general. Gasoline is 
has brought into prominence again the 
possibilities of the use of substitute 
fuel. It will be recalled that a number 
of years ago, after severe importuning 
on the part of certain industrial inter­
ests, together with some general ac­
quiescence on the part of farmers essary that it be supplied with air, or 
throughout the country, Congress pass- with oxygen, and inflammable as it is 
ed a bill authorizing the use for indus- considered to be, the most effective 
trial purposes of a product which sub- means of stopping a conflagration of 
sequently became known as denatured gasoline is to shut off the supply of 
alcohol. ■ air or of oxygen. When gasoline takes

It has been assumed for some time fire it unites with the oxygen of the 
that alcohol was a perfectly feasible air and its carbon is thus burned to 
product to use as a fuel, but as is quite C 02, and its hydrogen is united with 
generally known the exceedingly high the oxygen to form water, the two end 
cost has made its use impracticable, products of the combustion of gaso- 
especially so because of the fact that line, carbon dioxide and water. When 
gasoline and kerosene are still used to alcohol burns, while it also draws up- 
a great degree as fuels. on the supply of oxygen it does not do

Certain men with foresight began to So to the extent that gasoline does. AI-

what we call , an unsaturated hydrocar­
bon, that is to say, it is a combination 
of the elements carbon and hydrogen 
only and when it burns it burns with 
a smoky luminous flame. In order to 
cause gasoline to burn at all it is nec-

realize, however, that the time was 
coming, in fact, apparently almost 
here, when the ordinary standard fuels 
would be very nearly exhausted, at

cohol will burn with a non-luminous 
flame which shows that it has a con­
siderable quantity of oxygen within it­
self which unites with the carbon con-

least the price would become so high tained in it, forming carbon dioxide
that unless other fuels were obtainable 
it would be a restriction upon industry. 
Alcohol as a Beverage is Losing Favor.

We have never been inetrested in 
alcohol in this country up to date, ex-

gas and also with the hydrogen, form­
ing water.
Alcohol is Produced from Starch and 

Sugar.
Alcohol is a feasible fuel but a great-

cept as a beverage, and there ha  ̂ been er incentive than exists at the present
a decidedly growing disposition on the 
part of our people to eliminate it from 
the channels of commerce insofar as 
its present usage is concerned. With 
this view we are very highly in sym­
pathy but we are appreciative of the 
immense value tó industry which al­
cohol may furnish, provided its manu­
facture is so regulated and adjusted 
that it will reach industrial channels.

time must be given before it can take 
the place of gasoline even at any­
where near the present prices. Alco­
hol is a product of fermentation. It is 
produced indirectly from starch and 
sugar; first from sugar and farther 
back from starch. One very abundant 
source of alcohol existing in the old 
country is potato starch. In that coun­
try, particularly in Germany, where an

The present price of alcohol per gallon abundance of potatoes have been 
is about $3.00, and the internal rev- grown, we understand alcohol is a very 
enue tax on this product is about $2.50, great commodity for industrial purpos- 
which makes the alcohol when tax es, including fuel. In our own country, 
free, marketable at about fifty cents however, with potatoes for food pur- 
per gallon. It is possible to use alco- poses at 50 cents to $1.00 per bushel,

CLOVER AT WHOLESALE
We save yonprices. ____ I

money. Boy now be-
_______________fore  advance. C r o p

shortest known. W e expect higher prices. Don’t  bay 
Field Seeds o f  any kind until you See our samples 
and prices. W e specialize on high quality, tested Clover, 
Timothy, Alfalfa, Sweet Clover and Alsike; guaranteed

Co., Dept. 181 43rd and Roby St., Chicago, Illinois.

tflTTS FIELD SEEDS
»Vet weather damaged nearly a ll seeds.C V lB .XF *~Wet weather damaged nearly a ll seeds. 

M ost are fu ll o f  blasted grains and weeds, 
_  Buckhora,Thistle,and Dock. Ours are not,

^ R  and are fa r  th e  cheapest to  bow. Soaroity or 
good seed makes early buying advisable. Ban- 
plea and instructions “ How to Kaow Goad Seed”  Free, 

Write today. 0.U.SC0TT *  SOUS CO„ 36 Mala SUMaryavlUe.O,

B O W S  HER
FEED MILLS

Crush ear corn (with or 
without shucks) and grind 
all kinds of small grain.

Handy to  operate—lig h t ­
e s t  r u n n in g . 10 sizes: 2  to  
25 h. p ., capacity 6  to  200 
bushels. C o n ic a l s h a p e  
Grinders. Different from 
all others. Also make Sweep 
Grinders.

W r ito  fo r  Co to  lo g  
and folder about the value o f 
different feeds and manures.

D . N . F> BOWSHER CO.
Booth Bond. Ind.

GROW
HEALTHY
STOCK

it is apparent that little progress will 
be made toward turning these stan­
dard articles of food into alcohol un­
less the waste products which have a 
definite sugar or alcoholic value can

30 DAYS F R E E  TRIAL
and fre ig h t prepaid  on the new 1>18 
‘ ‘ RANGER’ ’ blcycle. Write St one# 
f o r  our b i g  c a t a l o g  and t p e c i a l  o f f e r ,  

M a rvelous im pro ve m n ets. Extra- 
i ordinary values In our 191# price offer. 

Y o u  c a n n o t  a f f o r d  t o  b u y  without get* 
ting our la t e s t  p r o p o s i t o n s .

I Beys, be a “ Rider Agent”  and make 
big m oney taking orders fo r  bicycles 

l and supplies. Get ou r l ib e r a l  t e r m s  
on  a  sample "RANGER”  to introduce. 

1 Tires, equipment, sundries and 
everything In the bicycle line half 

[usual prices. A few  second-hand bicycles 
‘ (3.00 to  (8.00. to  clear.

M EAD  CYCLE C O ., O EP T.S -77 CHICAGO

hoi at fifty cents per gallon in certain 
industries, but as a fuel oil it is still 
too expensive.

, What is Denatured Alcohol?
When Congress passed the act per­

mitting the use of alcohol tax free un- be utilized for this purpose, 
der certain conditions for industrial A Commission of Scientists Needed, 
purposes, the purpose of the act was What is needed in this country at 
to furnish it at a price which would the present time on the fuel supply to 
encourage its use in the industries, really solve industrially for the people 
In so doing it became necessary as we of this country the fuel problem, which 
have intimated before, to place certain is certainly getting to assume mam- 
restrictions around its use so that the moth proportions, is that Congress 
product which was produced tax free should authorize the appointment of a 
could not be used for beverage purpos- competent, scientific commission to in- 
es. This called for the production of vestigate the reasons for the prevail- 
eertain dénaturants; in other words, ing high prices of gasoline, and to sug- 
the mixing with the grain alcohol, cer- gest remedies. This would involve an 
tain other ingredients which, did not investigation of the possibilities of al- 
materially alter its character as a fuel cohol as a fuel and for other industrial 
and for other industrial purposes, but purposes, and the conditions under 
which did make it undesirable to use which the production and manufacture 
as a beverage. The original denatur- of alcohol can be made profitable and 
ant which gained the most favor was its use economical, and the introduc- 
wood alcohol. Wood alcohol is very tion of other substitute fuels, such as 
similar in some respects to grain al- kerosene and the lighter fractions of 
cohol, but is regarded as poisonous crude oil, and the possibility of their 
and a dangerous product to use in a conversion into oils of the gasoline 
beverage. So similar is it in its var- type.
ious actions to grain alcohol that we The Fuel Problem is a National Non- 
have had to contend with it in manu- Partisan Problem,
factured articles of food, particularly These questions cannot be solved 
extracts, in previous years, but its ef- for the people by debate on the floor
fects have been such that it is consid­
ered an exceedingly dangerous product 
to use in grain alcohol except that

of Congress, It is absurd to assume 
that Congressmen and Senators can 
place themselves sufficiently in touch

Governmint Farmirs Wanted. QU°anÄ
W rite, OZMENT, 17 F. St. Louis.

some persons are so addicted to the with the scientific phases of these sub­
use of alcoholic drinks that even wood jects to legislate intelligently from 
alcohol is not a sufficient deterrent and their own information alone. A com- 
something decidedly stronger or of a mission of experts to advise Congress 
more disagreeable taste has to be us- is needed, and needed at once, if there 
ed, to discourage such use of the pro- would be conserved for the people the 
duct. Tobacco extract has been used .enormous fuel supply which this coun- 
and chloroform, and a great variety of try is producing and which It is capa- 
substances have been used as denatur- ble of producing in the way of sl­
ants. cohol, etc.
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Farmers’ C lubs 11  Grange.
OFFICERS OF THE STATE ASSO­

CIATION OF FARMERS' CLUBS.
Our Motto:—“ The farmer is of more 

consequence than the farm, and should 
be first improved.”

President—R. J. Robb, Mason. 
Vice-president—C. B. Scully, Almont. 
Secretary and Treasurer—Mrs. J. S. 

Brown, Howell.
Directors—Alfred Allen, Mason; C. 

T. Hamline, Alma; W. K. Crafts, Grass 
Lake; Edward Burke, St. Johns; Mrs. 
€. J. Reed, Spring Arbor; Roy E. 
Moore, Bellevue.

Address all communications relative 
to the organization of new Clubs to 
Mrs. J. S. Brown, Howell^ Mich.
Associational Motto:

“The skillful hand with cultured 
mind is the farmer’s most valuable 
asset.”
Associational Sentiment:

“ The Farmer: He garners from the 
soil the primal wealth of nations.”

YEARLY PROGRAMS.

At this season of the year many lo­
cal Clubs should have prepared their 
printed programs for the current Club 
year. One of the first of these has 
just been received by the editor of 
this department, and will be reviewed 
in an early issue. Copies of the yearly 
programs of other local Clubs will be 
welcomed for similar use. Let the 
other Clubs know what you are doing 
in this line by forwarding a copy at 
an early date.

CLUB DISCUSSIONS.
Will Work for County Agent'.—The 

February meeting of the Arbor Farm­
ers’ Club was held at the pleasant 
home of Mr. and Mrs. Lewis Nixon. 
After a social hour and dinner the 
meeting was called to order by Presi­
dent Chester Martin. The Arbor or­
chestra rendered several selections 
during the program. Rev. Parmand 
gave the invocation. Members re­
sponded to roll call by naming some 
beautiful place they had visited. Mrs. 
Jacob Hagen gave a fine paper on 
“ Health and Happiness.”  She said in 
part: “Happiness is not the result of 
luck, but rather of one’s own thoughts. 
Love others and others will love you. 
Encourage good and overcome fear 
and weakness and you will win the es­
teem of your fellowmen.” Louis Haas 
read a very interesting article on the 
farm tractor. He favored the tractor 
rather than the horse. The president 
then introduced Mr. Underdown, sup­
erintendent of the Huron Farms Co., 
who gave us a talk on the Huron 
Farms. Mr. Underdown also said that 
he had been requested to ask the Ar­
bor Farmers’ Club to appoint a com­
mittee of three who were to attend a 
county meeting of delegates to see 
what could be done towards a county 
agent for Washtenaw county. The 
president appointed C. Koch, W. S. 
Bilbie and P. L. Townsend. ThedClub 
decided to buy singing books. The 
meeting closed with the singing of 
“America.”  The March meeting will 
be held at “ Clover Blossom Dairy 
Farm,” with Mr. and Mrs. H. A. Staeb- 
ler.—Mrs. Ida B. Haas, Cor. Sec.

Discuss Taxation.—The Wise Farm­
ers’ Club met with Mr. and Mrs. J. H. 
Wilson in Clare for the January meet­
ing, with a large attendance. After a 
fine dinner, the Club was called to or­
der by President Jennings. Hon. D. E. 
Alward, of Lansing, being present, he 
was called on to talk a few minutes on 
taxation before his train left. He stat­
ed that the state tax did not cut any 
figure in making the taxes righer, but 
it was the township and county tax. 
But Mr. Alward would have a hard 
time convincing the average farmer 
that the state tax does not cut quite- 
a figure in taxation. ✓ All one has to do 
is to look at his tax receipt of five or 
six years ago and look at the receipt 
that he gets this winter. The Clare 
Orchestra dispersed some fine music. 
Rev. Large offered prayer. J. H. Wil­
son gave us a warm welcome for him­
self and family. J. H. Seeley respond­
ed and told Mr. and Mrs. Wilson that 
in welcoming the Club they welcomed 
the oldest Farmers’ organization in 
the United States today, as the first 
Farmers’ Club was organized in the 
township of Laurens, Otsego county, 
New York, in 1806. The question, 
“What effect will the war have on the 
American farmer?” was opened by P. 
M. Loomis, who gave a very good talk, 
followed by N. Elden and Rev. Large, 
who thought it would have a bad ef­
fect. Mrs. J. Duncan read a paper on 
“ How, to Benefit the Club.” A vote of 
thanks was extended to the host and 
hostess for their hospitality.

KENT POMONA MEETING.

Kent Pomona Grange met with Spar­
ta and Algoma Granges at Sparta, on 
Thursday, January 20. The forenoon 
meeting was a closed session. The 
morning session, at which there were 
71 members, was given over to Pomo­
na Master T. H. McNaughton, who se­
cured a report of Grange work from 
the reports given by the subordinate 
Granges.

The afternoon. meeting was open to 
all, there being a much larger attend­
ance than in the forenoon. Mr. Mc- 
Naughton also had charge of this meet­
ing. He announced that the State 
Grange would furnish a man free of 
charge to help any Grange organize a 
co-operative, creamery where such was 
wanted. All communities having a 
Grange and wishing to form such a 
company will profit by this as the 
State Grange sends out competent 
men only.

The budget system of taxes and na­
tional preparedness for war were two 
important subjects discussed. The sys­
tem was explained and two members 
of the Legislature present gave very 
able talks on this subject. Senator H. 
E. Powell, of Ionia, told of the present 
system, and stated that he was in fav­
or of the budget system. He said in 
part, that as long as the salaries of 
the state officers were being raised, as 
long as new commissions were being 
appointed, and as long as the state in­
stitutions were increasing and demand­
ing more money, so long would we 
continue to pay high taxes.

Mr. McNaughton told of the opposi­
tion- in regard to preparedness, taken 
by the National and State Granges. He 
said that we should look at the sub­
ject in a sane way and help do away 
with all unnecessary preparedness. 
This subject was discussed, with the 
result that resolutions were adopted 
sustaining the action of the National 
and State • Granges.

A chorus from the Sparta school 
helped to entertain the visitors. They 
showed good training and credit is due 
Miss DeOme, their teacher. In the ev-, 
ening Miss DeOme favored the Grange 
with two vocal solors, one of which 
the words were written by the State 
Grange Lecturer.

The fifth degree session was called 
at 6:30 p. m., at which time ten candi­
dates were shown into the mysteries 
of the degree of Pomona. After this 
session the grangers present and their 
friends listened to the report of the 
State Grange. The Sparta high school 
orchestra favored the Grange with a 
selection, and other music was fur­
nished.

Hon. H. E. Powell, of Ionia, gave the 
principal talk of the day, making a 
plea for a single standard of morality. 
He said in part: “ In the present Eu­
ropean conflict the plains of Mesopo-. 
tamia is a battlefield and a wireless 
relay station is located on Mt. Sinai. 
These conditions woqld not exist if we. 
had a single standard of morality. If 
an individual took lands it would be a 
great crime with heavy penalties, but 
m the case of a nation it is for the 
glory of the country. When this teach­
ing is done away with war will cease. 
It is a Grange duty to educate for a 
single standard of morality rather than 
for a glory of conquest, and thus con­
tribute to betterment of its members.

Mr. Powell then spoke of the mis­
sion of the Grange. He said, “ The 
Grange has three missions to perform 
for its members—financial, education­
al and social. The financial mission is 
the smallest, but more should be done 
for co-operation. The producer gets 
only 40 per cent of what the consumer 
pays. It should be that the producer 
would get some more than 40 per cent 
and the consumer should pay less, Ed­
ucation is most important for the 
schools of the state are taking more 
than half of the appropriations, and 
are only teaching people to know 
things when they should teach how to 
do things. The social mission is very 
important and should be more thought 
of. After education, care for the insane 
is the second item of expense, there 
being paid $1,752,283.48 every two 
years. Also the ratio of insanity is 
growing faster than the population. 
The superintendents of the state asy­
lums tell us that liquor is the greatest 
cause of insanity. Thus if society 
would eliminate the saloon, citizenship 
would be bettered and taxes would be 
less. Prohibition states are good ex­
amples of this.”  Mr. Powell’s speech 
was educational to all as he told the 
plain facts as they are and suggested 
remedies in n^any cases.

n

The Most in Building Materials S 
Your Money Can Buy

— the most in lasting qualities, because of our 
business policy and special process of manufacture.

— the most in practicability and variety o f product.
Years of experience, a great manufacturing plant and 
unlimited financial resources make this possible.

—-the most in service. An enormous stock and 
an efficient organization assure prompt deliveries.

This is what you get when you buy

c « n
' You’ll remember 

this brand”

G l o b e
D R A N O

M E T A L  P R O D U C T S
Roofings, Siding, Cluster Shingles, Silos, Garages, 
Culverts, Rat-Proof Corn Cribs and other interior 

and exterior uses
For 35 years we have been operating our own Steel Plant, 

Rolling Mills, Galvanizing Works and Roofing Factories.
This has enabled us to make “ Globe Brand”  the most in 

building materials that money can buy.
This is why, year after year, the United States Government, < 

practical farmers, big manufacturers and architects con­
tinue to use “ Globe Brand”  sheet metal products for all kinds 
of building purposes.

Send for our 1916 catalogue. Do it now. It will pay you to 
find out the many advantages of “ Globe Brand”  sheet metal | 
products.

Also ask for a copy of the Globe Handy Memo Book. 
mmr  You'll find it useful, just 

as the name implies.

Mail this coupon, write a postal or letter—do something— NOW  
The Globe Iron Roofing & Corrugating Co.

205. Newport St., Cincinnati, Ohio 
Send me your big 1916 Catalogue and Farmer’s Handy Memo 

Book, FREE, prepaid.
N A M E    ___ —---------- ——  --------------------------—  ------------------

S T A T E .__________ ____ _____ R . F . D . .__

Plenty Of Water For Your Dairy
Supply an abundance of fresh water for your dairy and milk 

house. More milk and healthier stock. Makes the dairy 
pay. Our experts will help you select the right pump 
from among our 300 styles. All rigidly tested and 
guaranteed by the largest manufacturer of pumps 
in the world. Backed by 65 years’ pump-making 
experience. They are strong, durable and reliable.

•OULDSPUMP*

W rite  
for this  

Book. J
VJlFO R EVERY SERVICE 

will furnish you plenty o f waterunder pres- 
sureforfireprotection. Get our freebook, 

“ Water Supply for  the Country Home.’ ‘ 
Plan now for sanitary plumbing in 

bathroom, kitchen and laundry. 
Writetoday. Address Dept. M.
The Goulds Mfg. Co*

Main Office and Works:
Sen eca F a lls, N . Y.

Branches :
Chicago Philadelphia 

Boston New York 
Pittsburgh 
Houston 
Atlanta

VATm.1
'c J W / r l

fo r fite  j
(Com rm
J fQ g fE

the Goulds Mf6. Co,

M R . F R U I T  G R O W E R  
M R .  F A R M E R KEEP BEES

Your orchards will produce more fancy fruit by so doing. Your berry crop 
w ill b6 increased in quality and quantity. Your Alsike and Sweet Clover crops 
Will be greatly benefited’ You really cannot afford not to keep a few colonies. 
Tons of honey go to waste each year,for want of bees to gather it. Progressive 
fanners and fruit growers everywhere now realize the value of bees.

We furnish complete equipment, Modern Hives, Pure Italian Bees, gentle and 
good honev gathers. Our booklet “ The Bee Keeper and The Fruit Grower" free 

Also our general catalog o f bee supplies. Beeswax wanted.

B E R R Y  B A S K E T S
Send for catalog. We furnish the best w ood berry basket made. Our wax 

lined paper basket is a cheap clean package. S p ecia l O ffe r —200 w ax lined 
paper baskets, post paid for $1.00.

M . H. HUNT & SON,
Box 525, Lansing, Mich.

T R E E S F r o m  K a l a m a z o o  
D i r e c t  T o  Y o u .

At W holssals Prices. Planting time is about here. Don’t  delay sending today for free Handsome 
Catalogue. Celery City Nurseries, Box 122. Kalamazoo, Mich.

2 Yr. Apple Trees, .6 to 7 ft. $12 per 100
Thousands o f  peach , pear, plum, cherry and qu ince  and 
all small fru its  at wholesale prices. Catalog free. 
J n o .W . F in n ’s W holesale Nurseries,’ Dansvllle, N. Y.

s e e n  A f T t .  Alexander. Awarded G old Medal fo r  
■ t t a  U stw r largest y le ld in  pedigreed Oat Contort 
fo r  M ioh ., F irst premium fo r  quality. "Potatoes* 
Late Petoskey. B light resisting, heavy yielding.

W a lla ce  B ro s .,  B a y  S n o re , M ich .
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BREEDERS’ DIRECTORY.
Change of Copy or Cancellations must reach us 

i Ten Days before date of publication.

AUCTION
Wed., March 1 st., 1916

A t 1 O ’c lo c k  P . M .
Big Heavy Boned Duroc Jerseys. 25 

Brea Sows due to farrow in Mar., Apr. 
and May also a few Fall pigs both sexes. 
6 younff Horses of the dual purpose type. 
Also 2 Shorthorn Bulls,-8 mos. old. Sale 
will be held at my farm 6 miles east of 
Lansing. Write ior Sale Bill.

M . A .  B R A Y ,
O K E M O S ,  ( I n g h a m  C o . )  M I C H .

CATTLE.

A B E R D E E N -A N G U S
H ERD ESTABLISHED Ilf 1900- TROJAN - E RIO AS and BLACKBIRDS only. 

Also breeders of Percheron, Hackney and Saddle Horses.
WOODCOTE STOCK FA RM . Ionia. Mich.

ABERDEEN ANGUS
i f  you are in need of an extra good bull or a few choice young cows or heifers, we have them for Sale. Our 
herd is: headed by the Grand Champion Black Monarch 3rd. We invite you to come to our Farm an-e 
see them. They are bred right and priced right. U. L. 
Clark, Hunters Creek, Mich, Sidney Smith, Mgr.

A h o r d o o n  I n a n e  Four young bulls Also young flD cI  U v t ll  r tliy  US cows and heifers. Extra good. 
Priced rasonable. Inquire F. J. Wilber, Clio, Mich.

C P u r e  bred Angus cattle. 'Some A  vs I  v a l e  extra good bulls. Prices reason­
able. ANDREW EITIL, Vermontville, Mich.

most eoonomloal milk producers. Calves 
for sale. White Leghorn oookerels; Duroo Jersey 
•wine. Miohimn Sohool for the Deaf. Flint.Michigan,

March 4 DUROC JERSEYS at AUCTION \ March 4
As Good as the Best at Your Very Door
B R O O K W A T E R  F A R M

Sells 4 6  bred Sows and Gills and two ready for 
Service Boars March .4.

A cordial invitation to attend this sale is extended to all breeders and farmers. The offering will be 
Closely Related to our State Fair Wlnnars. The only place where sows and gilts bred to the great 
boars The Principal IV and Brookwater Cherry King can be purchased. The only place in the 
East where the famous Golden Model strain of Durocs of the west call be purchased. Sand for 
Illustrated Catalog and plan to spend March 4 profitably at
B ro o k w a te r  F a rm , A nn A rb o r, M ic h ., R . 7 ,  D e p t. S .

March 4 1
You are invited to be our guests at Hotel Whitney the 

evening before the Sale. Free conveyance to 
the Farm Sale Day. March 4

Hie Two Greatest Bulls
KING OF IKE FONTIACS 

DE SOL 2d’s BUTTER BOY 3rd
I have young bulls from cows having high official 
records and Granddaughters of above bulls. Stock 
extra good. Prices reasonable.
BIGELOW’S HOLSTEIN FARMS,

BREED8VILLE. MICH.

H A T C H  HERD
Y P S ILA N TI, M ICHIGAN

^Registered Holstein-Friesian sires, grandson’s of World s greatest dairy sire, out of choice A. R, O. 
dams and King Pontiac Jewel Komdyke; Brother or 
K. P. Pontiac Lass 44.15; average record of 50 dams in his pedigree 31.25 in 7 days: average per cent of fat 
three nearest dams 4.37: of his own dam 4.93. Sires in 
first three generations already have over 600 A. R. O. 
daughters. A few females bred to “ King". Prices reasonable.

HOLSTEIN Bull Calf: Born Nov. 8th. f A nice indi­
vidual, well grown, about evenly marked. His dam 

and Sire’s dam have A.R.O. records that average Butter 
7 days 24.83 lbs. Milk 563 lbs. W. B. READER. Howell, Mich.

Far Celo- Big Holstein Bull 2 yr. old. Goodbreeding, rui usiti Reg. bulls and heifers 10 mos. old. 
Ferd. J« Lange, Sebewaing, Mich.

T H E  V IL L A G E  FA R M , 
Grass Lake, Michigan, 

G U ERN SEY C A TTL E .*

MILO D. CAMPBELL CHAS. J. ANGEVINE

BEACH FARM
GUERNSEYS

No Tuberculosis Or Abortion
We are offering a number of line Registered cows 
for sale. Some o f these cows have finished their 
A. R. test and others soon will with records from 
400to62Qib$. o f fat in one year .We also have Reg. 
Bull calves from A .R . cows for sale, also prie Bull 
old enough for service whose, Dam’s record is 
over 620 lbs. o f fat as a 4% year old.

CAMPBELL 6 ANGEVINE
Coldwater, Michigan.

For Sale at Farmers Prices:
Choice Guernsey Bull ¡calves sired by “ Langwater Witohester”  he by (Langwater Advocate & Langwater 
Daisy) and from excellent Dams, having A. R. records 
of 422 à 412 lbs. of B. F. ae(heifers.iiWrite, or call at
“ Sweet Orchard Farms”  Birmingham, Mich.

yearly records 720lbs. batter in Jr. 
4yr. o ld  clais to over 1000 lbs. in  mature class Breeding:Cross 
“ King o f the Fontiacs" and the “ Demmiclt blood.”  Cherry 
Creek Stock Farm, Hilliards, Mich.' M. E. Parmelee, Proprietor.

_ Holsteins.Contains aged c o w s  producing 32.94 lbs. of 
butter in 7 days: 4yr. olds producing 31.76: 3 yr. olds producing 26.37 and 2yr. olds 25.69 all officially 
tested. Sons and brothers of these high testing cows for sale. Qeo. H. Gillespie & Son, Mason, Mich.

t t  7  a* B6ts 2 mo. old Hazel-Let grandson of Maple- 
'*** , w  crest De Kol Parthenea and Pontiac Maid 30.21b. Dam s 5 nearest dams ave. 507.51b, milk 7 days. By a son of De Kol 2nd Butter Boy 3rd. Her danr 18.96 lb. 2 yr. At, L. McLaulln, Red ford, Mich.

Ilnlolain Dull eight months old thirty five dollars. nOISIglll DUII pure bred but not eligible. Perfect 
markings. A . R . G RAH AM , Flint, Michigan.

The All-Around
1 TAwec^Awristhe^zmtrr’ycow. She’shia 

friend and pride—the beauti­
ful,gentle,ever-paying milk machine that lifts 
the mortgage, builds up the fertility of the 
farm, and puts the whole business on a SQund, 
paying, permanent basis. She adapts herself 
to all climates and all feeds and does not 
need fancy care. She matures early and 
lives long. And she’s so sleek, clean cut and 
handsome, as to be the family pet and 

pride. She produces well 
and sells well. Learn 
about her in our fine, free 
book,“ About Jersey Cat­
tle." Write for it now.
THE AMERICAN JERSEY 

CATTLE CLUfi 
346 West 23dSt.( N.Y. Cit?1

Lillie Parmstead Jersey Cattle. Bull calves from R.
of M. Cows, also heifer calves and several bred 

heifers for sale. Colon C. Lillie. Coopersville, Mioh*

Jerseys. Bulls ready for service, extra quality sired 
by Jacoba’s Fairy Emanon, No. 107111, from high producing dams. SMITH A PARKER, Howell,Mich

THE WILDWOOD Jersey Herd. Registered Jersey 
Cattle of Quality. Forty head Tuberculin tested Majesty’s Wonder 90717 heads the herd. Bis daughters 

are producing from 400 to 500 lbs. butter in on&year as two year old heifers, and are bred to Majesty's Oxford 
Fox 134214 a classy Grandson of Oxford Majesty which 
combines type and production. Alvin Bal den, Capac,Mich.

I # eilall j  Qaritisj Holstein youngbullsof choicest breeding at $o0 and 
up. Ypsilanti, Michigan.

Holstein B u lls  Ready 
For Service.

Grandsons o f Friend Hengerveld DeKol Batter 
Boy and Pontiac Aggie Korndyke. From high 
record A. R. O. dams at farmers’ prices.

LONG BEACH FARM,
A u g u s ta , M ic h ig a n . (K a la m a z o o C o .)

I Have Holstein Bolls,
I can show breeding, records. Individuality and attrac­tive prices. L. E. CONNELL, Fayette, Ohio.

MAPLE Lane R. of M. Jersey Herd. Tuberculin tested by the U. S. Government. For sale bulls, cows, 
bull calves and heifer calves. The lowest record of any mature cow of this strain is 553 lbs. of 85% butter.

IRVIN FOX. Allegan, Michigan.
iereov Ru i« far Cale from high-producing dams, with JBIScj DUIIS lui saie testing Asso, records, also on 
semi-official test. 0. B. Weimer, R. 6, Allegan, Mich

HILLSIDE Farm Jerseys, yearling bulls, solid ootor.half brothers to ex-world’s-record senior 2yr old and from R. of. M. dams, with records from 400 lbs. to 800 lbs. O. and O. DEAKE, ypsilanti, Michigan.

23 Register«! Tuberculin Î Â i Â I L Â a i ' e 0«1'
HERMAN HARMS. Reese, Michigan.

IT  A «* A n i s e  ■ Registered and line bred Jersey *  u *  Cows and heifers. Tuberculintested. Chas. B. Cook Farm, Owosso, Michigan.

G U E R N 8E Y 81B SContaining blood of world champions. 
HICKS’ GUERNSEY FARM. Saginaw. W, S.. Mich.

reg. for sale, Watervliet, Mich. May Rose Guernseys Seven A. R. cows in herd.
Address J . K . B la tc h fo r d . Auditorium Tower, Chicago, 111.

A VONDALE Guernsey bulls all sold. ” Sorry to dis­
appoint those wishing ourstock. Only registered bull calves left. Avondale Stook Farm. Wayne, Mich.

f .im r n to v  R nlls of service age and calves from uuernsey DUIIS choice. Adv. reg. breeding. 
T. V. HICKS, Route 1, Battle Ceeek, Mich.

filiamomi Dull Calves from A. R. dams and whose QUSrnSBj Dull dams are running for A. R. One ready 
for service. CG. A. WIGENT, Watervllet, Mich.
finamaaua for sale from A. R. dams. 2 heifers bred to QUarnSsjfS freshen in June. 1 2-yr.-old bull and 3 bull 
calves. Geo. N. Crawford, Holton, Mich.

l  - M c ?  — 1 -  .  -  Registered yearling Guernsey M C_ra 9 c I l G .  Bull also Bull Calves. Write 
JOHN EBELS, HOLLAND, MICH. R. No. 10.

Choice Holstein Biril Calves
Ready for service, World's Champion Parentage
HILLCREST FARM - Kalamazoo, Mich.

Special Notice
Registered Holsteins for Sale.

Our present farm being more valuable for real 
estate than dairy farming, we are going to move 
our herd further out from the city. We have twelve 
hull calves which will be sold at prices from $36 to 
$150 according to breeding—A  rare chance to buy 
a hull calf at a low price.
Espanore Farm, Lansing, Mich.

“TOPNOTCH” Holsteins
By careful retention, for many years, of largest Tpro- 
ducing females, and use of superior sires, a breeding herd of wonderful quality has been established. We are selling young bulls of this“ TOP NÖTOH” quality, 
of serviceable age, at moderate prices. Information, 
pedigrees,etc., on application. McPHERSON FARMS OO., Howell, Michigan.

FOR SALE Registered Holstein Bulls
ready for service, and bull calves, also females. 
FREEM AN J . FISHBECK, Howell, Michigan.
RpoictareH Holstein heifer, 2 mos. old, mostly white, nCglolCI GU very nice individuality and breeding, $100 
delivered, safe arrival guaranteed. Write for pedigree. HOBART W. FAY. MASON, MICHl

A T  Farmers'¡Prices. Registered Guernsey Bull calves from  
A  A.|R. dams and dams being tested. I f inter. sted write for 
pboto, breeding and price* Byers & Barnes, Coldwater, Mich.

Choice Guernseys For Sale Co—Bimsifers
J M. WILLIAMS, NORTH ADAMS, MICHIGAN.

H erefords— 3 Bull Calves
ALLEN BROS. PAW PAW, MICH
UBDCVADnC Well developed, beefy bulls, best n C n L r " I U /J f  o f blood lines. Serviceable age. 
Registered. E. J. TAYLOR, Fremont,, Mich.

Do You Want A Bull?
Ready For Service.

From a grand daughter of Tho K ing  o f  the 
Fontiacs. Sired by a bull that is more than a half 
brother to the Champion Holstein Cow o f  the 
W orld, and whose dam is a 30 lb. 614 Jt fat daughter of Pontiac Aggie K orndyke who has more 30 lb. 
daughters then any other living bull. If yon do 
write for pedigree.
EDWIN S. LEWIS. Marshall, Mich.

8 Reg. Holstein heifers, 4 are 8 months old .and 4 are 5 
months, at $100 each. Also, 4 young bull calves at 

$30 each. Ernest A. Black, R. 3, Howard Oity.Hich.
D in h lon H  B onsl Composed of Pontiac Komdyke IMlIItldUU U t i l i  and Hengeveld De Kol Breeding. 
John A. Rinke, t.'Warren, Michigan.

B ID W E L L  S H O R T H O R N S
For "Beef and Milk" 
R eg istered  b u l ls ,  Scotch - topped roans, 
reds and white for sale. Farm at N.Y.O. Depot; also D. T. & I. R’y.
BIDWELL STOCK FARM 

Albion Stamp 352670 801 B- Tecumseh, Mich.

Shorthorn Cattle of both Sex fo r  Sale
W . W . KNAPP. HeweU. Michigan.

Shnrlhnrnc—D airy o r  b eef bred. Breeding stook all 
em u IIIUI IIS ages fo r  sale at farmers prices. C. W. Crum, 
Secy. Cent. Mich. Shorthorn Breeder.' Aten. McBride. Mich.

i „  olio n Sale Mar. 1st, 1916.25 head shorthorns,7 males, 
■liCHOn at “ Locust”  on D. U. R. between Almont & 
Imlny City. W AR N E R  BROS. A lm ont, Mich.

Wyandotte Cockerels. Collie puppies S. G . BELCHER. R, No. 5, Hudson, Michigan.
Shnrlhnrns Herd bull. Bright Sultan roan 4 yrs. no 
Oil III IIIUI lid fault, am retaining his heifers also one 
roan ready forservice'. W. B. McQuillan, Howell.Mich.
DOB Sale—18 Reg. Short Horn Bulls by Maxwalton X  Monarch 2nd,a son of Avondale, from 2 to 13 mos. old John Schmidt, Reed City, R. No. 5., Michigan.

3 Choice Shorthorn Bulls For Sale
H. B. POSTERS, Garland, Mich.

Mary Family, .Price $75 and 
$200. W. F. BARR, ALOHA, MICHIGAN.

POLLED Durbams for sale, pure Short Homs, bred hornless. Rose of Sharon and Young Mary, 2 bulls 
12mo.l0young cows and Helfers.L.C.Kelly, Plymouth Mich.

H oas.

FOR Sale—Registered Holsteins, 3 Bull calves sired 
by a 30 lb. bull, 1 fron a 28.58 lb. dam. Also 2 heifers 8 

andlo months old. Wm. Griffin, R. No. 5,Howell. Mich.

$150 Buys two high grade, richly fired, light colored 
Holstein heifers, fresh soon from 26 lb. Bull. B, B. Re  AVEY, Akron, Michigan.

A n  A  D  f t  A I M  ~A beautiful purebred AO ■» wd #0 I Iw four year old Holstein 
cow, nearly white, good size and large persistant milker, bred to freshen this fait.

GEO. D. CLARKE, VASSAR, MICH.
Registered Holsteins at half Prict. f c & V r i d ”
Oow two years old, calf by side. Heifer one year old 
bred bull world’s record breeding. 28 lb. dam. one 
year old. Sold separately or the six head for $500.00. Also 8 high grade cows for $550.00.
J. C. BUTLER, Portland, Mich., Bell Phone.

R«g Holsftin Bill! '’ lnos-old. Dam made546lbs. milk_ 18.46 lbs. butter 7 days. Nicely
marked and well grqwn. E. It. Cornell, Howell, Mich,

Royalfon Brad Berkshirss «exes,
Emperor, registered with papers at fair prices. Write 
to D. F. Valentine, Supt., Temperance, Michigan.

I  have started thousands o f breeders on the road 
to success. I  have a very large and fine herd. Ev­
ery one an early developer, ready for market at six 
months old. I  want to place one hog in each com­munity to advertise my herd.
C. S. BENJAMIN B. No. 10, Portland, Michigan

r h n e f o r  l i /h i fn s  Bred sows and Fall pigs forsale v D C alC r W ill ie s  also 9 months Holstein Bull. 
F . W . Alexander« Vassar, Michigan.

Capitol Herd D .J. Swine. » Ä T
press prepaid J. H. BANGHART, Lansing, Mich

HKselar While«- Long, type prolific kind. Orders tlllllelSi nnilOSi booked for spring pigs. Write your 
wants. Meadow View Stock Farm, R. STHoUand, Mich.

Onr Duroc Jerseys blpoS 1 inesfThe Professor«
Kant Again, Ohio Chief, Good E Null, Orion, Perfec­
tion. Ira D. Jack, Pilot Wonder, both sex. Prices rea­
sonable. Send for pedigrees. THE JEN NINO’S FARMS. R .I ., Bailey. Michigan,

DUROC JERSEY BOARS
not akin. W. C. TAYLOR. Milan, Michigan.
flume lore ave- Fall and spring pigs either sex. from uuroc Jerseys Choice strains. 8, 0. 8TAHLMAN. 
CHERRY LAWN FARM, bhepherd, Michigan.

J . W. KEENEY, Erie, Mich. s t t A X i f i a S :
D. M. & T. local from Monroe or {Toledo, Keeney Stop.

bred to É. D’s. Defender Col. 
N o.¡72975. Inspection invited. E, D. Heydenberk.Way laud, Mich.

A n n  Ani*il |2|lt bred for Apr. farrow and Six *1 W H  June gilts bred for .June farrow. Price $25700. Weight 160 lbs. to 180 lbs.H. G. Keesler. - R. No. 5.« Cassopolls, Mich.

DUROO Jerseye. Yearling Sows & giltsbred for Apr.
farrow to a son o f Orion Cherry King the greatest Boar o f his 

breed. Also fa ll pigs either sex. F. J. D rodt.B .l. Monroe, Mich.

Iliirnn Jerseys for sale—a few choice fall pigs of either llUiUb sex. Fancy Buff Rock cockerels. JOHN 
McNICOLL, Station A,' Route 4, Bay City, Mich.

DUROO Jersey, Mar. gilts breed for April. Sept.pigs 
either sex and Holstein bull calves & 4 Register»! 

Holstein cows, B. H. MORRIS, Monroe, Mich.
niTRnr. IPRCFVQ Boars and sows all sold. Some DU nU U  J L K J C I J  good fan pi«, either sex for 
sale. Wm.W. Kennedy, R. pi. Grass Lake, Mich.

DUROO Gilts bred for Apr. farrowing, Aug. Boars.Booking orders for Spring Pigs. Barred Rock Cook, 
erels. £. J. A LUKICH, B*- L, Tekonaha. Calhoun Co., Mich

D U R O C  J E R S E Y S ~ g u u etai \ li£Carey (J. Edmonds, Hastings, Michigan.

I T n w  C a 1 a ~A few of those big bone Duroo 
*■ ^  a * “  Gilts, bigger and better than ever.Safe in pig to an Orion boar. Prices from $25 to $40. Also tried sows and a few boars cheap. F. Af. LAMB 
& SON, CASSOPOLIS, MICHIGAN.

O .  I .  C .  B r e d  G i l t s
Choice 100 lb. Pigs $16.

J. CARL JEWETT. Mason, Mich.

O l  SPRING BOARS of good type an«
• ■ • Red Polled bull celves.John Berner and Son, Grand Ledge, Mich.

0 1 1» choice serviceable boars; bred gilts for April and ■ I, V.May farrow: Fall Digs not akin. Write for low 
prices and photo. A . V. Hatt, Grass Lake, Mich

O f  All sold except one Julyboai
• and a few Oct. pigs.C. J . THOMPSON, R ockford, Mlohigan.

Way Brothers Stock Farra. ^ a Lc .H Ó g s ^ s t^ ?
for sale. Registered free. J. R. Way, Three Rivers, Mich.

0 1 p serviceable boars, tried sows, gilts bred for 
• It w-Marchand April farrow, summer and fall pigs. I pay express. G. P. ANDREW S, Dansville. Mich

O l  Gilts bred for March, April and May
■ ’ * w e  farrow. Recorded in buyer’s name. H , W . MANN, Dansville, Michigan.

0 . I. C s . Strictly Big Type. f^ u0?
July boars, 25 Spring gilts, four fall yearlings, four tried sows, all bred for Spring farrow. Also fall pigs not «kin 
Extra good ones. As I am crowded for room, this good 
stoek will be sold at Farmers’ prices. They are good 
enough that I will send themC.O.D. & record them free 
Newman’s Stock Farm, Marlette, Mich. R. i *

■ a . L . | > g m a c  of best oreeding. Special price B c r R S n i i C S  on two SpringBi
D. W . SM ITH,

on two Spring Boars. 
W ixom, M ichigan.

SWIGARTDALE FARM
BREEDERS OF

HOLSTEINS AND BERKSHIRES
Stock for sale at all times, Berkshires of unsurpassed 
quality and breeding, at reasonable prices. A choice 
bull calf, nicely marked, five months old, sire’s Jam 
with record of over 27 pounds. Dam of calf a grand 
daughter of Hengerveld De Kol, Price $50.00.
Swigartdale Farm, Petersburg, Mich.
Bn«*|#o|||wAcof best breeding,of various ages,either DCs n a iu i c a  Rex, all registered stock, no akin, 
•pedal reduced price. Write your wantB quick. 
Mitchell’s Lakeside Farms, R.2, Bloomingdale, Mioh.
Radelereil Chester White males and females. Reg. ntJglllBI lu  Holstein male calves, herd bull and cows. 
Parham ’s Pedigree Stock Farm. Bronson, Mioh.

0 . I. C. and CHESTER WHITE SWINE
B ig type with quality. Wehave the undefeated breeders young herd at seven State fairs this yehr. They were 
sired by Abo 2nd, one of our many good herd boars. 
Special prices on all boars for the next 30 days. Get 
a G ilt bred to the Great Schoolmaster, the highest 
priced boar o f the breed, Champion over champions. 
Write for our big catalogues with history of the best 
herd in the whole country. Oomeland see them.
Rolling View Slock Farms, Cass City, Mich.

Choice Spring boars and bred Gilts. ' • We pay Express and Register free. Glenwood Stock Perm, Zeeland, Michigan.
Da nie fa rail A I fi’ e  Attractive prices on fall pigs ntgISTSn0 If. I. Il S. and last spring gilts. All from 
large litters- Elmer B. Smith, Bedford. Mlch^

0 1 M e  ®0 bred sows for is le . 8 last April gilts averaged 270 
• It W »-lbs.Jan.10.1916. They are a verygrowthy lot. Have 

some May gilt* and last fall yearling*.also a few sendee boars 
and plentyof last fall pigs. Otte B. Schulze, Nashville, Mich.

O f  I* Choice gilts bred for April and May farrow. • *• Also last fall pigs at excellent quality. A. J. BARKER, ADA, MICH. R. No. 3
( I I P  Sows bred for March and April farrow. Priced w. I. u, to sell,, from best of stock. Write forphoto and 
pedigree. E.*B. MILETT. Fowlervllle. Michigan.

Breeders’ Directory—Continued on page3o3.
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Veterinary.
CONDUCTED BY W. C. FAIR, V. S.

Paralysis.—My four-year-old cow is 
down and unable to get up, but sue 
eats and drinks as well as usual so far 
as I can tell. Her fore parts are all 
right. She is due to freshen some 
time next month. Mrs. L. A. T., Fe- 
toskèy, Mich.—Rub her back with mus­
tard and water every day or two; it 
her bowels are not open give her 1 lb. 
of epsom salts as a cathartic, also 
give her 1 dr. of fluid extract of nux 
vomica and 1 dr. potassium iodide at 
a dose in a pint of water as a drench 
three times a day. Try and help her
to get up. , ,  ,Warts.—My 12-year-old mare has 
two hard lumps in mouth, one in front 
of grinders, the other on upper lip, 
each about the size of a hickory nut. 
M C Shepherd, Mich.—-Have bunches 
cut out. Dissolve 1 oz. borax in a pint 
of water and apply to sores twice a

Heaves.—My six-year-old horse has 
heaves, but not the common kind, as 
he does not have as much motion in 
flank as usual. F. C., Osceola County, 
Mich—Feed no clover or musty, dus­
ty badly cured fodder. Give him 1 dr. 
fluid extract lobelia, 1 dr. fluid extract 
nux vomica and % oz. of Fowler’s so­
lution at a dose in damp feed three 
times a day. Careful feeding and 
avoiding feeding of much bulky dry 
food, will help him. You can safely 
try any of the commercial heave rem­
edies that are regularly advertised in 
this paper. , .. .Chronic Cough.—I have a horse that 
has had a dry hacking cough for the 
past three months and I am somewhat 
alarmed about him having heaves. H. 
A. H., Sebewaing, Mich.—Rub throat 
with one part turpentine and three 
parts camphorated oil once daily. Give 
% oz. powdered licorice, 2 drs. ginger 
and % pt. black molasses at a dose in 
feed two or three times a day-

injured Sow.—My Poland China sow 
passes some blood with urine, caused 
perhaps by an injury, but she is in 
good health. G. W. B., Hastings, Mich. 
—She is not in need of any treatment 
and will soon be all right.

Contagious Abortion.—-Four of my 
cows have lost their, calves during the 
past six months and nearly all these 
calves came six or eight weeks before 
time and were dead. Two of them 
lost their calves on grass in mid-sum­
mer. I feed clover hay, silage and oat 
straw, and I would like to know if the 
feed caused miscarriage. W. G., Palms, 
Mich.—I am inclined to believe that 
your cows suffer from contagious abor­
tion and if they are now in calf they 
may carry their calves full period, es­
pecially if they are aged cows. Clean­
liness and thorough disinfection of 
your stables, giving each cow 30 drops 
of carbolic acid well diluted in water, 
and mixed with feed daily for ten days, 
each month for three months, might 
help them. Any of them that are not 
in calf and has a vaginal discharge 
will be benefited by injecting them 
daily with the following tepid lotion, 
made by dissolving 1 dr. permanganate 
of potash in three quarts of clean tep­
id water.

Indigestion.—I have a heifer that is 
out of condition, very thin and not 
thriving and our local Yet. asks $10 to 
treat her. F. S., Mayfield, Mich.—In 
my practice I am very often called to 

. prescribe a remedy that will fatten 
thin, hide-bound and emaciated cows 
and upon investigation I invariably 
find the stable filthy, badly ventilated 
and thé food supply either of poor 
quality or non-nutritious or else they 
are stinted in food allowance. Poorly 

, fed cattle are too often turned out of 
doors and exposed to too much cold 
and stormy weather for them to thrive 
or lay on flesh. Give your cow a ta­
blespoonful of ground ginger, a table­
spoonful of cooking soda and a table­
spoonful of ground gentian at a dose 
in ground grain three times a day. 
Keep her warm, well bedded and in 
the stable.

Calf Has Sore Foot.—-I have a calf 
three weeks old whose bowels and kid­
neys do not move properly;- now his 
left foot or pastern is swollen, causing 
him to drag this leg and I have thought 
he was a little tender in flank. He re­
mains down most of the time, but has 
a fairly good appetite. D. T. P., Web- 
berville, Mich.—Paint swelling with 
equal parts tincture iodine and spirits 
of camphor every day or two. Give 
him 10 grs. of acetate of potash and 1 
oz. of olive oil two or three times a 
day.

Sore Throat.—I have a cow that 
came fresh two weeks ago. Has lost 
considerable flesh since, but drinks as 

. if throat was sore. H. H., Ravenna, 
Mich.—Apply one part tincture iodine 
and two parts, spirits of camphor to

throat every day'or two. Give her a 
teaspoonful of salt, a tablespoonful of 
cooking soda an a tablespoonful of 
ground gentian at a dose In feed three 
times a day. •Garget.—I have a cow that freshened 
June 15, 1915, and soon began giving 
stringy milk, with some blood from 
right hind quarter. Local Yet. treated 
her, but quarter went dry. She is to 
freshen soon; can I expect to redeem 
that quarter? Not long ago her four- 
year-old heifer freshened and the same 
quarter of her bag went wrong. B. B. 
C., Ithaca, Mich.—In my practice I 
have sometimes succeeded in opening 
up blocked quarters with air pressure, 
but invariably it is unsuccessful in 
chronic cases. Gentle hand-rubbing, 
using some belladonna ointment will 
perhaps do some good. _■

Loss of Appetite—Chickens Eat 
Eggs,—j have some cows that have not 
a very good appetite. They are fed 
good corn fodder, clover hay and corn 
silage. I would also like to know what 
can be done to prevent chickens from 
eating their eggs. J. J., Berrien 
Springs, Mich.—Mix together equal 
parts of cooking soda, ground ginger 
ground gentian and powdered charcoal 
and give each cow two tablespoonfuls 
at a dose in feed two or three times a 
day. To guard against the formation 
of the egg-eating habit, fowls should 
be fed plenty of lime, oyster shell, bone 
or similar substances to insure a firm 
shell upon the egg; furthermore, if 
you know the “egg-eater,” better, cut 
her head off. This will prevent her ed­
ucating a class.

Yeast Treatment.—Will you please 
publish a yeast treatment for cows? 
Several years ago I clipped formula 
from the Michigan Farmer, but have 
mislaid it. L. F., Ithaca, Mich.—The 
yeast treatment is effective in curing 
barrenness in cows and mares, when 
the disorder is due to an acid condi­
tion of the genital tract. The solu­
tion is made as follows: Put two heap­
ing teaspoonfuls of yeast in a pint of 
boiling water; set the solution near 
the stove and maintain it at a tempera­
ture of about 70 degrees for five hours. 
Add three pints of boiled water and 
keep it warm (house temperature) for 
another five hours, then flush the parts 
with warm water first, then inject the 
yeast. The animal should be mated 
from two to eight hours later.

Feeding too Much Salt.—What ef­
fect would refuse salt, or the salt 
which is used to sow on land, have on 
dairy cows, if fed in large quantities, 
and how would it affect the offspring 
of cows? E. A., Walled Lake, Mich.— 
Feeding cattle too much salt creates 
an abnormal thirst, irritates and in­
flames mucus membrane of stomach 
and bowels, retards digestion, destroys 
the appetite and usually purges the an­
imal; besides, it has a tendency to 
abort or dwarf foetus.

Stocking.—The hind legs of my hors­
es are inclined to stock when they are 
not working, or not exercised. H. S., 
Brant, Mich.—Every horse should have 
exercise every day, unless they are 
sick or lame. If this rule was followed 
farmers would meet with fewer losses 
and their stock would keep nearer 
sound. Mix together equal parts of 
powdered nitrate of potash. Cooking 
soda, powdered charcoal and ground 
gentian—give a tablespoonful at a 
dose in feed once a day.

Breeding Questions.—Is it advisable 
to breed a filly to her sire? Our local 
breeders tell me this is the proper way 
to obtain the best colts. To what ex­
tent are a majority of the imported 
stock horses inbred? What is line 
breeding? R. H. N., Weidman, Mich. 
—Unless both the filly and her sire 
are unusually rugged and well devel­
oped and perfectly sound, I do not be­
lieve it the best way to breed. I have 
known of so many disappointments 
that I speak from experience. Of 
course, you understand a great deal 
can be said both for and against such 
close breeding. The results are sure 
to be either fairly satisfactory or high­
ly unsatisfactory. The majority of im­
ported stock horses are not closely in- 
bred. A typical line-bred animal may 
be the result of a cross between a filly 
and colt out of the same sire, but with 
different dams. If you carry back the 
pedigree of a truly inbred animal for 
more than three generations, you will 
generally find that almost the entire 
pedigree rests in a single pair of an­
cestors, and line breeding is supposed 
to have most of the advantages of in- 
breeding without being dangerous. 
Line breeding provides for the intro­
duction of some outside blood, while 
at the same time a certain strain of 
desirable ancestors is being constantly 
concentrated. I have always thought 
that extreme inbreeding is dangerous 
and as a rule line breeding is to be 
preferred. The idea in both line breed­
ing and inbreeding is to increase the 
proportion of a certain desirable bicod 
strain, but in line breeding the ani­
mals are not so closely related as in 
inbreeding. Perhaps many more words 
should "be used to make this statement 
plain enough to be well understood.

“ I Thought She Would 
Never Amount to Anything”

Many cow owners all over the 
country know what it is to see a 
cow that they were about ready 
to sell to the butcher become one 
of their best producers through a 
judicious use of the 
great cow  
medicine

There !■ nothing mysterious 
about Kow-Kure; it is simply a medicine for 
cows that stimulates and builds up the vital 
organs and makes them perform ■ properly. 
It has been found especially effective for the 
prevention and cure of such diseases as Abor­
tion, Barrenness, Milk Fever, Scouring, Lost 
Appetite, Bunches, Retained Afterbirth.

GET THIS FREE BOOK
W h en  a cow is sick, first aid is most 

valuable, and to know just what to do 
may save the life of a valuable ani­
mal. Our free treatise,“ The Home^
Cow Doctor,”  has been very 
carefully prepared and ought I 
be in'every. farmer’8 library..
W rite us today for you r” 
copy.

Oxford Down Sheep. at present.
M. F. GAN88LEY, Lennon, Michigan,

I —Yearling and ram lambs from Champion
LIlGVsltrS flock of Thumb of Mich. Also select Berk­
shire swine. Elmhurst Stock Farm, Almont, Mich.

HORSES

DUNHAMS
Percherons

For Fifty Years The Best
Send for fine Photographic 

Catalogue.

Dunham s.
Wayne, Dupage County, Illinois

P e rc h e ro n  O p p o rtu n ity

Kow-Kure is  sold by f  ted  dealers 
and d, uggisti in  60c and $l*QO 
‘packages.

HOGS
O .  I .  C .  S W I N E  '„fflcFaB
strictly O.JL O. type bredto farrow the forepart of May, also fall pigs price right. Stock registered in pur­chaser’s name free of charge. A. J.Gorden, E.2, Dorr, Kick,

0 . I. C . Choice Boars pay express and regis­
ter fees. JULIAN P. CLAXTON, K. 8, Flint, Mich.

P O L A N D  C H IN A S
From our thousand pound Grand Champion Boar 
and Big Stretchy Sows of best breeding. Spring 
Boars at a bargain. Bred Gilts and Brood Sows.
Hillerest Farm, Kalamazoo, Mich.
Dfll I I I  pu ll!i gilts bred for March and Apri rULARU uni HA rQw. Fall pigs, satisfaction , 
anteed. G. W. HOLTON, Kalamazoo, Mich

April far- .ion guar- 
Michlgan.

nm tun PUIU 1C Of the big type. Spring boars. Gilts rULMU UnlNAo bred for April farrow.- 
A .  A .  W O O D  A  SON, S a lin e , M ich ig a n .

I ., • !„ !_  B f* a few choice boars of spring andLargo 01 lain r . u . early summer farrow. A choice lot 
o f  spring Gilts bred for spring farrow sired by Big 
Defender the boar that every body goes wild over. 

H. O. SWARTZ, Schoolcraft, Michigan.
.. B (i Gilts and sows. Bred for Mar. and JR r . V, April farrow. Sired by Big Des 

Moines, Big Knox Jr.,ahd Giant Defender. Bred to Big Knox Jr. Smooth Wonder 3 and Big Jumbo, four great­
est boars in state. Come or write. W.E.Livineston,Parma,Mich.

Largt Typ
Moines, Bli

Big T y p e  Boars all sold. Have several good Gilts 
bredto Smooth Jumbo, Jr. Top Boar of J. D. 

Collin Sale. Priced right to go quick. A.D. Gregory. Ionia, Mich.

For Salt Poland Chinas thing gooct at a**tow price.
P. D. Long, R. F. D. No. 8. Grand Rapids, Mich.
U „ __  n „ _ .  j  Poland Chinas. Both sex and all agesatHesvy Honed bargain prices. Also, B, P. Bock 
Cockerels. ROBERT NEVE* Pierson, Michigan.

POLAND Chinas—Big and medium type. Gilts bred 
to big type boars for April farrow. Fall pigs, eithe-  sex L. W. Barnes & Son, Byron, Michigan

B ig  T y p e  P . C.
w. j : h a g e l s h a w .

Bred sow sale, Feb. 18th 
Write for Catalog. 

Augusta. Michigan
BIG type Poland Chinas—Western bred, long bodied 

e x tra  large bone, pairs or trios not akin. We have 
Peter Mouw, H. Fesenmeyer and Geo. Marshall breed­ing. Calior write, W. Brewbsker & Sons, Elsie. Michig

K EGISTERED Poland China Spring Boars and Sows 
at $15 each. Making thisspecial price to make room 

for others. A . G. Meade, Stanton, Mlch-.Colbys Ranch

COOK

, G ilts bred for spring —1 farrow. Service  
ages. Prices Reasonable. W. C 

Route No. 1, ADA, MICHIGAN.
La rg e  Y o r  k sh i re s  *
boars. Figs all ages. Prices Hi

Y o r k s h i r e s  G i l t s
For March & April farrowing For Sole. W aterman & W aterman. Ann Arbor, Mich

M U L E F O O T  H O G S . Just a few
scie.

, _ _ _ _ _____$ ------   ̂ left yet for
C, F. BACON, R. 3, Britton, Michigan.

i, i > Nothing for sale but Apr. Boars,nampsniri nogs Taking orders forspring pigs. Write 
Vour wants. John W. Snyder, St. Johns, R, No. 4, Mich

70 must be sold to close estate.
Purebred Percheron .mares at $250-1600. 
American bred Stallions $800-$1000 few 
higher. No salesmen need apply, we 
deal direct and give terms to respon­
sible parties.

A. A. Palmer, Estate
(R.R.) Orleans. (P. O.) Bolding, M ich.

F O R  S A L E
The trotting bred and registered stallion, ‘ T H E  
CONQUEST" 2:0914 pacing and 2:16 trotting, bred by Geo H. Ketcham of Toledo, O., owner Oreosns 2:02, sure foal getter and w illd rive  anywhereageldingwill. 
His record 2:09H. world’s record for a 4year old, over 
a half mile track when made and held 4 years by him. Overstocked and will sellat a price that he will pay 
for himself In 30 days In sevioes In any good locality. 
Is not afraid of autos or street cars. Can be used as a 
business horse and always has his AMressE m . Starkweather, Northvllle. Mien.

20 Head of Percheron 20
Stallions and Mares 

As good as can be found. Royally bred, some o f  
tnem by the great $10,000. Champion Camot( 66666). 
All recorded in P. S. A. Studbook. If you .want 
good ones coinè and see me • They will be 
priced right. ; _ „  m „  , . . .
H. A. ROHRS &  SON, R. 0. No. 4. Napoleon. Ohio..

99“ FOR SALE OR EXCHANGE
Registered Percheron Stallion. IHe is a grey, sound 
and in the Ton class, works well on the farm. He is a Grand Son of the Great Bistque and a great mover. He 
is gentle and sure, this horse must go on account of fllHes Whitney Bros. Onondaga, Mich.

R e g is te re d  P e rc h e ro n s
2 rising two year old Percheron Stallions weight 1550 
and 1600 lbs. Priced to sell. Inspection invited 
L. C. HUNT. Eaton Rapids. Michigan.

Pereharons, Holsteins, Angus, Shropshire«, Durocs
DORR P. BUELL. Elmira. Michigan.

r n n  C i f  I?—Registered Peroheron Stallion Mare- r u n  uALEi and Fillies at reasonable prices. In-

*«„!_  of black Registered Percheron Mares in foal Pair weigh 1800lbs. Price $650.00. Also some colts. 
Joseph Parker. _______ Caseopolls, Mich.

a—.    <-» ■ — —Black Percheron Stallion.
I - O r  « 9 Q I C  3 yrs. old, wt. 1750, right every 
way. Extra good one, a bargain if taken soon.1 W m . Bird._________________ St. Johns, Mich.

L0ESER BROS.
We have 100 head of Belgian and Per­
cheron Stallions and mares. Imported and 
home bred. We have sold pure bred horses 
in Michigan for the last 25 years, and have 
the right kind, and at the right price. We 
can supply any numberof work horses, both 
geldings and mares. Get in touch with us.

UG0N1ER, INDIANA.
F O R  S A L E

One Pair of Bay Belgian M ares '
coming five and six years old, full sisters, blocky built, 
extra good bone, feet and legs; absolutely sound and well broken. Will weigh 3,000 pounds in good flesh, 
are In fair condition now. A high class pair of mares 
In every way. One high class shire mare 6 years old. 
Sound, weight-1625 pounds, very active. Here is one which will make a great brood and work mare. Has 
class enough to show at State Fair. One good 6 year old chestuut Gelding, weight 1550, sound, active, to go 
with the shire mare if you want a work team. Address 
Starkweather Stock Farm. North vllle, M ich.
FOR SALE—Registered Chestnut Belgian Stallion, 

seven vears old, soundand sure foal getter. W eight 
18001b. register No. 4576. Russel Harrison, MiUersburjr.Mioh.

U____ . • Pigs of both sex. Brefi Sows.ServlceHampshire »Wine, boars. Write for prices. Price to 
sell FLOYD MYERS, R. No. 9, Decatur, Ind.

HAMPSHTRE Swine. The great pasture hog. Select 
herd headed by a mammoth son of the Great Look Out.”  Have a few bred sows and fall pigs for sale. 

Booking order§ for spring pigs in pairs and trios, not akin, at 
reasonable prices. C3©o* E. Staff, Grass Lake« Mien,

SHEEP.

Kope Kon Farms
SHROPSHIRES and DUROCS. KINDERHOOK, MICH.

J A C K S
AND

M U L E S
Raise mules and , get rich. 200 
head fine large jacks, jennya 
and mules, 14 to 17 hands 
high. Large registered jacks 
and draft stall ions cheap now. 
Will trade for sheep, cattle or 
horses.Wrlte for prices today. 
Stock guaranteed. Address KREKLER’S JACK FARM West Elkton, Ohio

FOR SALE—2 Belgian Stallions one Imported 10 j 
old Bay, weight 2100 lbs. Colts to show. One i

yrs.
jl- uiu un.T, weight Z1U0 lbs. Uolts to show, one reg­
istered Home bred 3 years old Bay, weight 2200 both outstanding good ones, would consider an exchangelof one of them for another equaly as good, if interested 
write. OSCAR WOLF, St. Louis, Michigan.



quality.

»ks.sent Free and postpaid on re­
quest. They will save you money.

—H .C. PHELPS, Pres,

H igh  
G r a d e  
Vehicles 
D ir e c t
from the

me a p o s t c a r d  w i t h  
y o u r  nam e a n d  a d d r e s s  a n d  I ' l l  
s e n d  y o u  my b i g  new  1 9 1 6  B u g g y  
B ook— t h e  g r e a t e s t  v e h i c l e  
c a t a l o g  e v e r  p r i n t e d .  Show s 
1 5 0  s t u n n i n g  new  s t y l e s  a n d  
e x p l a i n s  my s p e c i a l  p r i c e -  

Srw s p l i t t i n g ,  m o n e y - s a v in g  o f f e r  
K f o ^ * t o  1 9 1 6  B u g g y  b u y e r s .  W r i t e  

"  £ * ^ t h e  P o s t a l  t o d a y .

Book for Buggy Buyers
from the My new Catalog offers you the greatest assortment
Makent^fiy of high grade buggies ever put out by any factory.- It is a big book qBfc
t o  'S* x, * ™ es) handsomely pnnted on fine paper, profusely illustrated and richly
YOU colored. Tells how well every part o f my famous SPLIT HICKORY BUGGIES are TgSiX

/S S f  . — shows more styles and bigger bargains than you will find in 20 stores. A  penny postal VsS* 
brings this wonderful display right to your own door. No matter when you expect to buy send ’

*or my book now, I want you to have a copy o f this big book right away. It will make you a 
better judge o f buggies and buggy values. It will convince you that Phelps will not only sell you a 

. better buggy—a genuine Split Hickory—but that I can and will save you $20 to $40 by my direct 
from factory, special price-splitting offers for 1916. Write for this big, free book today.

SPLIT HICKORY

President

Vehicles are famous the world over for beauty o f style, excellence o f workmanship, light running, 
riding and long service. Nearly a quarter of a million of them are now rolling over 
the roads. Everybody knows that the name “SPLIT HICKORY” on a buggy is a 
mark of me highest quality. For 16 years I have been putting into these vehicles 

«1 finest materials and the most expert workmanship I could find. I have made 
Split Hickory a name which my customers are proud to show. My new 1916

plan cuts prices more than ever. Gives unequaled bargains in 150 new styles. Saves you $20 to 
$40 on your new rig. My free catalog tells how it is possible to sell you a genuine Split Hickory this 

1 year as low as only $39.25; And remember that on every Split Hickory I give—

30 Days Free Road Test and 2-year Guarantee
You take no chances. I let you pick out the rig you want and drive it 30 ----- |

your own roads under your own conditions—before you decide. I prove the 
l prove the value. You test the rig for comfort, light running, style and work»
> from top to tires at my risk. Be sure to write for my big free 

Buggy Book before you buy. A  postal will bring it free, post- 
' t  Send today. See for yourself the money youcan save, Address

H* C. PH ELPS, President

&

The Ohio Carriage M fg. Co.
Station 56 Columbus, O.
If you are interested in a new Farm Wagon or 

a new set o f Harness, be sure to ask for my 
► Special Catalogs o f Split Hickory Farm Wagons

and Ohio Brand Oak Tanned Harness. Both

Write for F R E E  
 ̂Catalog now— 

fSlay


